
Family Files Index  

*= On microfilm 

 

A 

Abbott (2 files) File 1: Copy of family crest and history of George Abbott and others of Massachusetts. 
File 2: John Jr. - Newspaper article: Madison, Indiana, October 12, 1881, Marriage of Robert T. F. Abbett 
and Miss Agnes Pattie.  Cemetery records.  Marriage certificate: John Abbott Jr. and Sally M. Reynolds, 
December 25, 1823.      

Abernethy (1 file):  Dr. William and Lola – family unit sheet for Dr. William A. Abernethy and Lola May 
Tupper; burial information for both. 

Abrams, also: Smith, Fox, George (1 file) File 1: Newspaper article: The Daily Evening Courier, August 17, 
1861.  Newspaper article: The Daily Evening Courier, August 19, 1861, death of George Smith.  
Newspaper article: The Daily Evening Courier, May 3, 1862, death of Charles F. Smith.  Family unit 
sheets: Theodore R. Parker and Dosa Ellen Smith, Clisby B. Smith and Margaret Abrams, Joseph Fox and 
Clara B. Smith, King Solomon Smith and Sally A. Riley, Joe Devore and Nettie Smith.   

Ackerman (4 files) File 1: Registration Affidavit of Alien Female, Amelia Ackerman.  File 2: Family history 
research of Ron Ackerman and genealogist Janice Barnes, includes photos, newspaper articles, death 
certificates, family history records, and charts. Includes Meyer Family connections. File 3: 
Correspondence between Delores M. Jackson and Martha Ackerman Miller on family history research.  
Michael Ackerman and Elizabeth family unit. File 4: Mathias – census records, obituary for Mathia and 
wife, Mary (1928/1920). 

Adair, Phelix (A.J. Grayson) and Duplicate (1 file): List of newspaper articles by Phelix Adair. Newspaper 
excerpts. Marriage License, Andrew Grayson to Matilda Lawrence, Aug. 1861 

*Adam (1 file): Family unit sheet for Thomas Adam and Barbara Glauber, and Fredrick Holzer and Eliz or 
Marg. Bettinger 

Adams (4 files): Adams Family File1: April 18, 1986, Madison Courier newspaper article photo – 5 
generations of Adams’. File 2: 1880 Census records for Eliza Adams household, 1850 Census record of 
David Adams household, 1870 census records of Eliza Adams household, research correspondence, 
Family unit page for john Adam and Catherine Holzer. File 3: James W. – research notes. File 4: Andrew – 
family unit sheets, death certificate for Mary Hoffman, census records, probate record; obituary for 
Andrew Adams, 1882; Daily Evening Star announcement of funeral Sept. 27, 1882; Sept 26, 1882 DES 
obit.  

Aich (3 files) – File 1: Johannes Aich immigration information and land ownership information. File 2: 
Image of Marriage between Lena Mary Aich and Frank Shure(?) April 30, 1910, Newspaper article Oct. 



18, 1986 regarding German Aich genealogical research. File3: 3 copies of full Johannes Aich family 
lineage, correspondence regargin Aich-Gilligan-buhmiller family and JPG area (2 from 1995), 
correspondence regarding Aich family from 2001. 

Aimes, Aron H. (1 file): April 12, 1826 Marriage license for Aron and Franny Lanborn(?) 

Albertson, also: Granz (1 file): 1830 marriage license 

*Alcorn (3 files) – File 1: Merritt, D-Day reminiscence written by Merritt O. Alcorn, 1997. File 2: 
newspaper article from Madison Courier – 2/21/1974 regarding Dr. Alcorn. Oct. 18, 1986 Alcorn 
prosecutor campaign ad. File 3: Alcorn family genealogy, family unit sheet for William Alcorn and Julia 
Gowin (Judy Goin).  

Alexander (4 files) – File 1: Meredith Alexander and Permelia Smith, Family unit sheets for Meredith and 
Permelia (Amelia), Images of Meredith’s headstone and portrait, Family unit sheets for Angus Alexander 
and Dorothy Taylor. File 2: James Alexander 1843 Will. File 3: Family trees and information for Arthur 
Harry Alexander, Jared William Hall and Mary Katherine Salyers. Family information of Edward Merritt 
Alexander and Velma Skaggs Alexander. Genealogical information regarding Alexander-Padgett line. 
Pedigree chart and sources for Arthur H. Alexander and Marjorie Claire Lyle. Pension for widow of 
Warren Alexander (1886), Civil War enlistment information, General Affidavits. File 4: Warren P. 
Alexander genealogy and father (Rufus) family unit sheet.  

Allen, also Allan (5 files) – File 1: Allen Owens, 1850 census record of John Allen household, 1850 census 
of Josiah Allen household, Madison Courier obituaries, Jeffersonville Land Entries, Sampson Allen and N. 
Owens Matrimony record. File 2: Hare Family- Madison Courier Dec. 15, 1879 Obit., Wills of Jeff. Co., 
Will of Bertha Hare, Allen-Kent information. Article from Jeffersonville about Capt. Allen, Naturalization 
record for Rolandus Hare, Ralph and Wayne Miller WWII newspaper articles, Cemetery records, funeral 
home records, marriage records. File 3: Will of William Allen, 1858. Will of Josiah Allen, 1858. Deed to 
John Allen, son of Josiah. File 4: Descendants of William Allen File 5: Fesler, Salyers, Posey Marriages, 
Helen Posey DAR records,  

Alley  (2 files) File 1: Family unit sheet for Thomas Alley and Harriet Sheets, Joseph Alley and Susannah 
Neal, Joseph Sheets Alley and Luvena Haskell, Lewis B. Alley and Minnie, Lewis B. Alley and Anna Belle 
Hall, James William Lutjen and Hazel Alley, Harold Lee Barnes and Hazel (Alley) Lutjen, Lee Alley and 
Bettie Jenn Weigler, Lee Alley and Carole Gaffin, Lee Alley and Beverly Haley, Lewie Lee Alley and Daria 
Lungren Thomas Alley Obituary, Photograph of Bushy Fork School, 1897. File 2: Delores Jackson 
Collection – Various records and locations for Alley, Smith, and Tull family, research regarding Smith, 
Tull, Phillips, and Anderson lines. 

Allfrey (1 file) – Register of Deaths from 19th century. 

Alling (3 files) – File 1: Howard – Obituary, 8/17/1900. File 2: Charles Newspaper articles from 1800s and 
1900s. File 3: Obituary of Harriet S. Alling, Photograph of Charles Alling Family, 1880, Obituary of Maria 
Alling, 1889. Contact information regarding Alling Family.  



Alphree, also: Holmes (1 file): Marriage Record. 

Ames also Thom, Lanham, O’Neal (1 file): Family Bible record, John L. Ames Obituary, Aug. 24, 1932, 
Obituary of Charles Ames Jan. 10, 1935. Lanham Amer. Rev. Oath document, three early newspaper 
announcements, marriage record, Lanham and O’Neal research notes, Elizabeth Craig Thom and 
descendants.  

Anderson, also: McClanahan, Hoagland (9 files): File 1: Elijah – research notes, includes novel excerpts, 
census information, headstone and family record of Elijah Whitaker Anderson, a white man. File 2: 
William – Newspaper article Oct. 10, 1987, Obituary, Anderson – Cotton Family Bible info, William Geo. 
Anderson Pedigree chart, descendants of Andrew Anderson. File 3: William J. – Family unit sheet for 
Wm. J. Anderson and Sidney Baptist, 1850 Census record, 1860 census, local paper notices, Wiki page 
info, Life and Narrative, marriage license – Wm and Julia. File 4: Craig Cemetery records, research notes, 
marriage record, 1850 census, 1860 census. File 5: Anderson – McClanahan – W.H> Anderson Obituary, 
1957, death cert., 1840 Jeff. Co. Census, marriage license. File 6: Edis and Lolas – newspaper articles, 
50th anniversary and vaudeville. File 7: Anderson – Hoagland – 1821 marriage record. File 8: Woodson H. 
– Family unit sheet for Henry Anderson and Mary Ellen McCasland; marriage record; ‘McCarland’ 
Jefferson County land information; obituary for W. H. Anderson, 1957. File 9: Woodson H. – family unit 
sheets, plat maps and land records, census records, Wierton Daily Times May 23, 1957 W. H. Anderson 
obit.  

Andrew (1 file): Madison Courier 1/12/1972 article about her antique dealing. 

Angell (1 file): J. B. – Madison Courier article, JB Angell killed by Harry King (1895). 

Anger (1 file): family unit sheet for Charles Anger and Walburga Aich and line, Family unit sheet for Louis 
Henry Anger and Katherine Burhard, L.H. Anger obituary, Mary Anger obit., 1870 census info, marriage 
record, wills, directory listings, Aich family connection 

Anselm (1 file): Springdale Cemetery, Madison Courier Feb. 23, 2002 “The search for Brother Anselm”, 
The Criterion Feb. 15, 2002 “Couple uncovers piece of religious history” 

Anthony, also: Baker (2 files) - File 1: Anthony – Baker marriage license, File 2: Family crest and other 
genealogical information.  

Antill (1 file): Pension from Virginia, 1836 

*Arbuckle (8 files): File 1: Capt. James, newspaper articles from Indianapolis, family unit information, 
land survey, Thomas Arbuckle pension, correspondence, certificate from James Madison, 1812, deeds 
from 1850 Jeff. Co. census, Thomas Arbuckle will, research notes. File 2: family history, pioneer 
reminiscences. File 3: Capt. James lineage information. File 4: research notes, correspondence, “Fatty” 
Arbuckle genealogy. File 5: correspondence between Arbuckle ancestors. File 6: Early Arbuckle 
information, newspaper article 5/31/1986 about Sonja Arbuckle winning homecoming queen of Indiana 
State. File 7: John – Judith Ann Nighbert research and sources, marriage license, birth certificate, 



warranty deed, Dallas A. Noell Obituary, 1941, Alice Noell Obit. 1929, 1900 census, history of Coffee 
Creek Baptist Assoc. File 8: Lewis – research and sources. 

Arion (5 files) – File 1: C. biographical information about Copeland P.J. Arion. File 2: Further Information 
on Copeland. File 3: John Lodge connection information, family unit sheet for J. Lodge and Rebecca 
Kimberlin. John also married to Susannah Arion, Jozabad Lodge cemetery record, probate records, 
newspaper articles, and correspondence. File 4: Arion family history. File 5: Copeland – Madison Courier 
Oct. 27, 1962 article recollecting early Madison (mentions Copeland).  

Armand (1 file): John A. Armand obituary, 1926, Mary Ann Armand obituary, 1953, Samuel Armand 
Obituary, 1931, John W. Armand obituary, 1927, marriage certificate Christian Armand and Lela 
Bucknell, Katie Armand obit 1947, Marriage certificate John W and Ida Wilson, marriage ccertificate Otis 
Bucknell and Victoria Armand, marriage certificate David Spurgin and Mary Armand, 1900 census, 
Mickey B. Armand obituary, 1982, Sam B. Armand Obituary 1981, Mary Armand obit., further obituaries, 
newspaper article about Fred Armand indictment.    

*Armstrong (11 files) – File 1: David – newspaper article, 1990. File 2: Capt. John – photograph of Capt. 
And wife, Harriet, newspaper article Madison Courier Jan. 30, 1877 about Capt. John “The Last of the 
Bargers.” File 3: John – newspaper article 1938 about barge, Capt. Obit. File 4: Story of John, Armstrong 
– Gale family, further research notes. File 5: Bio research. File 6: family crest and early genealogical info. 
File 7: John – same as File 3. File 8: Thomas – Marriage certificate, Atlanta Gale. File 9: newspaper 
article, Jan. 12, 1984, David Armstrong Attorney General. File 10: Thomas – biographical sketch and 
family unit, Madison Courier, 1910, about the family and boating. File 11: Photograph of Thomas 
Armstrong family, newspaper articles written by Thomas and Obituary. File 12: Abel Armstrong marriage 
record. 

Arnold (1 file): early genealogical information 

Arrison, also: Swope (1 file): 1827 Elizabeth Swope and B. Arrison marriage record 

Ash (1 file): George – story of George Ash from the Indiana Republican Feb. 24, 1830, George Ash 
research by T.A. Lanstroth 

Athearn, also: Alling (sp?) (1 file): marriage record for William Athearn and Sarah Ailling 

Athey (also spelled Atha) (1 file): 1827 will, obituaries.  

Atkinson (also: Young) (2 files) - File 1: correspondence, family unit sheet for Joshua and Mary Forbitt, 
marriage records, 1850 census. File 2: Samuel Atkinson and Mary young  marriage record. 

Augustin (3 files) (one folder misspelled “Augustine”) – File 1: John Augustin research. File 2: Mary – 
obituaries, registration affidavit of alien female. File 3: correspondence. 

Austermuehle/Austermuhle/Austermiller (1 file): obituaries 



Austin, also Wright (2 files): - File 1: Nathaniel and Matilda Wright (Austin) – correspondence, family 
unit sheet, death certificate, research notes and sources. File 2: Rev George and Harry - obituaries 

Auxier (1 file): Earnest – newspaper article about military work, obituaries, census information  

Ayres, also: Minor (3 files) – File 1: Isaac N. – correspondence, pension and military records. File 2: Ayres 
– Miner – marriage record. File 3: Ayres – Minor – permission from Minor to marry Ayres. 

B 

Bachman (3 files) – File 1: Alois O. Jr. – school report biography. File 2: obituary, military information, 
census, newspaper articles, directory page, family unit sheet Alois and Emily Thiebaud. File 3: Alois O. – 
memorial information, research, novel excerpt, newspaper articles, reproduction portrait,  

Bacon, also: Brown (1 file): probate record, marriage records, cemetery records, family unit sheets and 
research notes.  

Baglan/Boeglin (1 file): research on Ignance “Enos” Boeglin line.  

*Bagot (1 file): Thomas Bagot story and lineage information. 

Baier (1 file): Lambert Baier obituary, Madison Courier Jul. 14, 1897 

*Baird (1 file): David – Beard/Baird genealogical information. 

Bailey, also: Tull (1 file): obituary and family unit sheets 

Baker (7 files) – File 1: Frank – obituary Madison Courier May 21, 2005. File 2: Benjamin F. (Sophronia 
Whitney) – marriage record. File 3: 1870 census record, 1900 census record, 1880 census record, birth 
record. File 4: Bakers of Virginia genealogical info. File 5: Nathan Baker jr research, Adams family 
connection, Isaac H. Baker obit., Charles Baker info., Hager family connection, further Baker 
research.File 6: Baker – Horner – Marriage record. File 7: William Henry – family unit sheets, find a grave 
page.  

Baldwin (1 file): 1928 pamphlet on family line, Tousey family connection, Philemon Baldwin research, 
Clark Baldwin research, earliest relative John Baldwin (b. 1470), Baldwin family tree.  

Ball (2 files) – File 1: Ball Bros. Muncie, IN – George Alexander (Ball Brothers Company), Father Lucius 
Ball from Canada, Edward Arthur Ball, biographical information, novel excerpt, reproduction image of 
brothers, glass manufacturers. File 2: Ball brother’s mother obit, 1891, Spencer, William W.H. obituaries.   

Ballard (1 file): Donated by Dolores Scott, Photographs of Ballard church pew and home, James Ballard 
family unit sheets for wives Ann Rhodes and Isabella Montague, Original American Ballard Family 
information, family unit sheet for Omar Ballard and Margaret Walker, 1900 Census of Joseph M. Ballard 
household, various other family unit sheets 

Balenovitvh (1file): Theresa – registration affidavit of alien female.  



Ballintine also Kinney (1 file): marriage record David Ballintine to Sarah Kinney 

Baltimorians (1 file): information on early settlers in Madison from Baltimore: McIntire, White, Hainey, 
Abbott, Canby, Robinson, Ritchie, Taylor & more. 

Bandy (Bundy) also Bergen (Bergin) and Van Nyes (Vannice) (1 file): family unit record for John Bandy 
and Mary Vannice and line, correspondence, War of 1812 pension, Revolutionary War pension, Bundy’s 
of KY information, Bergen family history information,  

*Banks (3 files) – File 1: Banks family of N. Carolina and Southern Indiana history and lines. File 2: Banks 
Family, Compiled by Robert W. Scott, 1981; Death certificate of Nellie Mae Banks, 1967. File 3: Willard – 
death certificate and obituary (1995).  

*Banta (3 files) – File 1: Van Arsdale – Dutch settlements of KY, Family tree of Jacob Banta Vanosdol 
(1788 - 1872), correspondence, Simon Van Arsdale cemetery records, military records, family 
information, 1830 census; Hendrick Banta cemetery records, family unit sheets; marriage record Isaac 
vanAivier and Mary Van Arsdale. File 2: Rachel – biographical information, 1751; Demaree line. File 3: 
newspaper articles about reunion and golden wedding anniversary, Banta family information, 
descendants of Hendrick Epke Jaconse Banta, family bible family information.  

Barbour (1 file): Lucien – newspaper article, no date given. 

Barber (1 file): Weatherford – marriage records David Barber to Patsy Weatherford, Warner H. Barber 
obituary, Elenor Leonard Barber Obituary. 

*Bare (3 files): Bare Hearn – marriage record Jacob Bare and Lucretia Hearn. File 2: Abner – pioneer 
reminiscence, 1987 newspaper article about Mamie Lawson, daughter of John Wesley Bare. File 3: Bare 
– Banister – Michael Bare line, William Banister line, Burrell Banister line, Laban – Banister line. 

Barker also Gaddis (1 file): marriage record Isaac Barker to Charity Gaddis 

Barkhurst (1 file): Cleo – obituary.  

Barmore (1 file): David Barmore biographical info, Nancy Barmore information, newspaper article 
Madsion Courier Apr. 12, 1985, correspondence, newspaper articles. 

Barnard (19 files) Mostly Geroge Grey. File 1: Joseph H. (father of George Grey) – Biographical 
information, Springdale cemetery records, obituary 1926, and wife’s obit. 1919. File 2: George Grey – 
lots of fragile, old newspaper articles, reproduction photograph of his statues at the entrance of the 
Capitol building. File 3: old, delicate newspaper articles. File 4: article from The American Magazine. File 
5: photographs of work, ephemera, newspaper articles, book excerpts. File 6: newspaper articles, book 
excerpts. File 7: newspaper articles. File 8: newspaper articles. File 9: newspaper article Brooklyn Daily 
Eagle, May 24, 1933. File 10: newspaper articles from Madison, reproduction images, book excerpts. File 
11: information on George Grey Barnard’s Abraham Lincoln statue. File 12: newspaper articles on 
Lincoln statue and Rockefeller difficulties. File 13: newspaper articles about Let there be light and 



Lincoln. File 14: four newspaper articles about George’s work and former home of his parents. File 15: 
Obituaries of George Grey Barnard. File 16: newspaper article about Let There Be Light, sculpture for his 
parent’s grave in Springdale Cemetery. File 17: various articles about George’s life and work File 18: 
article about George’s chapel in New York, book excerpt. File 19: 1931 article about the artist. 

Barnes (10 files): File 1: Chesley Barnes family line. File 2: research notes File 3: also Brooke and McKay – 
research notes and sources. File 4: Janice – Governor’s Award and photographs, newspaper article, 
2010. File 5: Janice – Governor’s award program copies, newspaper articles. File 6: John William – birth 
certificates, death certificates, research and sources, marriage records, Noell family connection, 
Arbuckle connection. File 7: Barns – Barns – Woodford Barnes and Eliza Barns marriage record. File 8: 
Newspaper article June 24, 1969 – Clarence Barnes Funeral director at Hanover, dies. File 9: Chester Lee 
and Maxine – Louisville area death obituary for Chester Lee Barnes, 1984; obituary for Maxine L. Barnes, 
1997. File 10: Ray Dean – death certificate, marriage record to Thelma Jatlock (1977). 

Barnum (1 file): correspondence and research notes/sources.  

Barrar (1 file): Anna – registration affidavit of alien female  

Barriger (2 files): File 1: Barriger and related families. File 2: copies of various records 

Bartholomew (1 file): Carrol – 1820 revolutionary war pension information.  

Barton also Brown (1 file): Barton/Brown connection. Barton/Sauer connection, death certificate, 
various family unit sheets, research notes. 

Barton, Newton, Jeptha (1 file): Newton Barton records, Jeptha Barton Civil War records. 

Bassett (1 file): Dictionary of American Biography excerpt.  

Bates (2 files) – File 1: Bates Family – William George Washington Bates line information, research 
notes, correspondence, John Nathan Bates cemetery records, various other cemetery records, family 
unit sheets, pedigree charts. File 2: (see McKinney-Bates) cemetery records. 

Baumgartel (2 files) – File 1: images of five generations, descendants of Henry Baumgartel. File 2: Rev. 
Louis Baumgartel – full biography and images. 

Baxter (4 files) -  File 1: Baxter – Donic(g)a, James Baxter line and information. File 2: newspaper article 
Madison Courier Sept. 3, 1920. Walter Baxter Obit. File 3: other names mentioned in this file: 
Cummiskeys; Reed; Schoolcraft; Chambers; Berry; Stevenson, newspaper articles, photo reproduction, 
James Baxter sources, Baxter brothers article about civil war veterans. File 4: R. Strand – research notes. 

Bayless (2 files) – File 1: Bayless – Goodman – newspaper article about Bayless farmland, Marriage 
record of Andrew Bayless and Ellen Goodman. File 2: Bayless – Wheaton (Whedon) – Marriage record 
Nathaniel Bayless to Mary Wheaton, 1824. 



Baynes (1 file): family unit sheets for the family of Perry Bayne and James Buchanan Bayne, census 
records for Perry Bayne.  

Beach (4 files) – File 1: Beach Ancestry complied by John M. McSparin, 1982. French origins, pedigree 
charts, correspondence and research notes. File 2: Beach family research notes. File 3: Walter Amos – 
Family group record – Walter Amos Beach and Kathleen Bray Beach, marriage records, cemetery 
records, birth certificates, obituaries, death certificate. File 4: Wilson – obituaries for William Wilson and 
Shirley Wilson Beach, death certificate.  

Beall (1 file): Stella – newspaper article, Madison Courier, 1974 about cookbook collection.  

Bear also Bair, Barr Bare (5 files) – File 1: newspaper article, Oscar C. Bear turns 90, Obituary, Oscar C. 
Bear, 1975. Census information, obits, biographical info Perry Bear. File 2: Bear/Bare Children of John 
Bear – newspaper article about pioneer John Bear. Genealogical info, Michael Barr.Bare.Bear, Thomas 
Bear. Cobb Family connection, Bear branches. File 3: Bear – Green – correspondence for DAR 
membership. File 4: Perry E. – research notes, correspondence, obituary Donald Bear, old postcard with 
genealogical information, 1945, DAR and CAR correspondence. File 5: Descendants of Jacob Bear 1800 – 
1852, complied by Louise G. Erekson, 2004.  

Beard (1 file): Lucien – marriage records, obituary (1891), census records.  

Beatty (11 files) – File 1: The Harper’s Ferry connection – article about Hiram A. Pease property; grave 
records; obituary for Henry C. Beatty, 1931; census records. File 2: descendants of Adam and Lydia Rose 
Beatty; law suit Aug. 1899 Beatty vs Beatty about real estate; slave narrative of George Beatty; census 
records. File 3: Hanover Township family – Henry Clinton Beatty Sr. family information, census records, 
Elijah Beatty property information, correspondence, The Christian Messenger May 1, 1945 Madison, 
Indiana Missionaries to Oregon; Henry Beatty obituary; 1912 will of Henry Beatty; Jefferson County 
“Register of Negroes and Mulattoes”; probate records; African American Rural Settlements in Jeff. Co.; 
Madison Courier article The Colored Men’s Convention, Mar. 6, 1871; census info, death certificates. File 
4: Eliza Jane – family history record for Edward P. Cousins and Eliza Jane Beatty. File 5: Victoria – probate 
record, military record for Robert C. Fox, family history sheet for Robert fox and Victoria Beatty, census 
records, Louisville directory listings. File 6: Walter W. – family unit sheets, obituary and death cert. for 
Susan Beatty (1923), obituary for Walter (1891). File 7: Hanover Twn – family unit sheets for Adam Beaty 
family, James William Beatty family, census records, maps of Hanover, Henry Clinton Beatty family 
information, correspondence. File 8: Beatty Mats from JCHS – descendants of Adam and Lydia Roe 
Beatty, Beattys of Oregon, interview with George Beatty, census records for George Beatty, Beatty-
Copeland marriage announcement in the Madison Courier Dec. 1, 1899, Henry Beatty census records. 
File 9: The Harper’s Ferry connection – Copeland family connection. File 10: Eliza Jane – family history 
record sheets, census records, death certificate, marriage record. File 11: Victoria – Robert Fox military 
records, probate record, Robert Fox death certificate, census records.  

Beavers (4 files) – File 1: John W. – Newspaper articles about the anniversaries of the murder conviction 
and hanging of John W. Beavers, who killed John W. Sewell in 1877. File 2: John W. will, courier article 
write-ups about the murder, 100th anniversary article, only hanging in the county. File 3: Court 



documents pertaining to the murder. File 4: John – the hanging of John Beavers, newspaper articles 
pertaining to John W. Beavers, his death and a ghost visitation.  

Bechtley (1 file) – will of George Bechtley of Pennsylvania. And correspondence.  

 Becht (1 file): newspaper articles about Louis (Lewis) Becht and Edward (Eddie) Becht deaths, 
descendant charts. 

Beck (1 file): Madden Beck and Rebecca Hatley-Maiden Families, Winfield Pury Scott Beck and Elizabeth 
Ann Brown families, other family lines.  

Beckley (1 file): Beckley – Matthews – Marriage record. Simpson to Ruth Matthews. 

Beebe (1 file): genealogical information and family cemetery records.  

Beetem (1 file): John Beetem of Kentucky and descendants, revolutionary war information, Adam, John. 
Bio of Samuel Beetem Sr. early history of Beetems in England, army pension information.  

Bedell (1 file): George V. – article about Geirge Vincent, architect.  

Belcher (1 file): Madison Courier article about Ellen.  

Bell also Magruder (Macgregor) (2 files): Bell (Beall) and Magruder (Macgregor) 17th Century Scotland to 
Colonial and Revolutionary Maryland to Kentucky to Indiana. The final issue of The Harrison Post, 1995. 
File 2: William – family unit sheets, newspaper clipping detailing the arrest of William Bell in murder.  

*Bellamy (12 files) – File 1: biographical information, census records. File 2: Frank E. No. 1 proofs – J.F. 
(John, Frank’s father) CV - lawyer, lineage graph, Frank Elmer biographical info, reproduction image of 
Frank. File 2: Madison Courier article stating Frank is the author if the Pledge of Allegiance. File 3: 
research and chronology of events leading to the writing of the Pledge. File 4: Article about the Pledge, 
1975. File 5: 1936 article about the Pledge of Allegiance. File 6: Biographical information about Francis 
(Frank) Bellamy, The Rural Shopper paper with an article, 1909 Courier article about Frank’s mother’s 
death. File 7: Information on the original publishing of the Pledge in the Youth Companion.  File 8: 
ephemera, articles, article about the Bellamy family departure from Madison, census records, directory 
scans. File 9: recollection from Francis Bellamy, reproduction image, further articles. File 10: Copy of 
Clara Barton’s History of the Pledge, Newspaper article about Margarette S Miller accrediting the pledge 
to Bellamy. File 11: correspondence and information written to the Library of Congress about 
authorship. File 12: information about Lillian Hendricks, first written article about Frank as author.    

Belser (1 file): Family of William and Caroline information, correspondence.  

Benfiel(d) (6 files) – File 1: Benfiel(d) – Bailey Wilson – Curry (Biel) – Robert, John, William information, 
Rebecca Bailey to William, correspondence. File 2: ancestral chart - George of PA, William H. H. research 
notes. File 3: Benfiel – Ryker – John Ryker family information. File 4: Benfield, George -  Stewart family 
reunion article, 1983, 1985; article on death of James Bennefield, Robert McLeland and Ester Campbell 



Benefiel family, Buchanan family connection. File 5: Jesse Benifiel to Sarah Ann Huckstep marriage 
record.     

Benham (1 file): early settler Jesse Robinson Benham, Family chart of John Benham of England. Madison 
Herold , 1884 obit of Mrs. M. L. Benham.  

Bennett (4 files) - File 1: The bennet Family by Mintie Allen Royse, book. File 2: Judith Bennett to William 
Brown marriage record, Bennett/Miles chart, pension information. File 3: family group sheets. File 4: 
Mary Stoner – funeral service notes.  

Beresford (2 files) – File 1: article about a murder, correspondence. File 2:articles about John “Red” 
Beresford.  

Bentley also Ramsay (1 file): Marriage record Bafsil Bentley to Mary Ramsay.  

Bergen (2 files) – File 1:early family information, Van Nuys and Arsdale connections. File 2: Bergen – Van 
Cleve – William to Mary Van Cleve marriage record.  

Berger (2 files) – File 1: Charles – registration affidavit of alien enemy. File 2: Stella - registration affidavit 
of alien female.   

Bersch (2 file) - File 1: William Bersch descendant chart and obituaries. File 2: copy of chart. 

Berry (3 files) – File 1: Daniel and Percillah A. Logan marriage license. File 2: Rebecca Tilton Berry – 
biographic information and reproduction image. Berryhill. File 3: Wendell and Tanya Berry – newspaper 
articles. 

Bettens (1 file): Louise E. – biographical pamphlet.  

Beverley (1 file):  Beverleys of Virginia, American Genealogical info.  

Bevins (1 file): cemetery records, census information, Bivens, Reed connection.  

Beyer (1 file): Family Bible information, newspaper articles.  

Bice (1 file): genealogical information, Van Nuys connection.  

Bigger (1 file): Samuel – Governor Samuel Bigger, original pamphlet and copy. 

Bigham (1 file): the Last of the Bighams, novel excerpt. 

Bilger (1 file): Mary - registration affidavit of alien female. 

Billop (1 file): American Genealogical information 

Bilz (2 file) – File 1:Francis – Madison Courier article, 1972. File 2: Henry – 1983 article about Reverend’s 
amputation; 1988 obituary.  



Birck (Birk) (2 files) – File 1: The Johann Birck Family of Germany, descendants and family unit sheet. File 
2: Birk – Birck – correspondence regarding John Bir(c)k of Prussia.  

Bird (1 file): Frank L. – 1981 article about being a historian for the county; 1987 funeral notice.  

Birkle (1 file): Madison Courier newspaper article about the Birkle line, Birkle coat of arms and 
genealogical information.  

Birney (1 file): Bryan Barney – will and find a grave information. 

*Bishop (3 files) – File 1: correspondence, family bible record, 1850 census record, information on Job 
Bishop of New Jersey. File 2: Bishop – Haynes – Marriage record, William Bishop to Emma Haynes. File 3: 
family records from early 19th c.  

Bitterman (2 files) – File 1: family records from 18th and 19th century. File 2: family records, family 
information of Henry Bitterman and Sus(s)annah Bireley. 

Black (3 file) – File 1: also Burton and Prather – Descendants of Charles Newton Black. File 2: Black – 
Stewart – marriage record, 1824. File 3: Black – Warfield – Marriage records Edwin Black to Elizabeth 
Warfield, 1833. 

Blackford (3 files) – File 1: correspondence, excerpt from First Settlers of Ye Plantations of Piscataway 
and Woodbridge Olde East New Jersey. File 2: correspondence, and research notes. File 3: pedigree 
charts, family unit sheets, descendants of Samuel Blackford. 

Blackstock, also Sutton (1 file) – File 1: correspondence regarding Adeline Blackstock Sutton of Georgia, 
cemetery information, pedigree charts and family unit sheets. 

Blackmore (1 file): obituary of Dawson Blackmore, 1889; Samuel Blackmore of Maryland and line. 
Madison Courier article about Thomas Moore Blackmore being heir to English fortune. Newspaper 
articles, Dawson Blackmore information. 

Blake (1 file): Mary – newspaper article about Mary Blake’s 2,000 African Violets.  

Blair (1 file): reproduction photograph of Charles Blair, Charles Blair obituary, 1870 census, cemetery 
record, marriage record, obituary of David Blair.  

Bland (1 file): early American genealogical information.  

Blanton (1 file): obituary of Minnie Blanton, newspaper article about arrest of two in slaying of Minnie, 
newspaper articles about subsequent trial.  

Blankenship (1 file): obituaries for Rev. Isom Blankenship (1892) and his mother, Elizabeth James 
Blankenship (1888).  will of James Blankenship.  

Bliss (1 file): early American genealogical information.  



Blasingham/Blossingham (1 file): obituary of Leak L. Blasingham, Madison Courier newspaper mentions 
of Blossingham, 1850 and 1870 census, Cary Blasingham obit, marriage records, James Blasingham obit.  

Blaze (2 files) – File 1: marriage records, obituaries, George Blaze census information, May Blaze 
obituary. File 2: Blaze – Fahey: history of Blazes in Jefferson County, Family unit sheets for George and 
Albert Blaze families, directory entries.  

Bloom, also Augustin(e), Winkel, Bates, Baldwin(e) (5 files) – File 1: correspondence and information 
and family pedigree chart. File 2: Blum and Bates – Thomas (Blum) Bloom and Maria Katharina Bates 
family of Madison, IN. File 3: Carl – obit and cemetery record. File 4: Carl Bloom and Pauline Winkel 
family, Casey family research, records pertaining to Thomas Bloom, obit of Albert Bloom, marriage 
record Albert to Mary Voltz, obit, Mary bloom. Marriage records. File 5: Genealogical History of the 
Bloom Family of Indiana by Otis Casey Jr.  

Blue (2 files) – File 1: will of John Blue Sr., Blew/Blues of New Jersey information, Uriah Blue family line. 
File 2: Blue - Goble – correspondence, information on Joseph Goble and Ruth Blue line, Joseph Goble 
obituary, research and early family information.  

Blunke (1 file): Blunke – Griggs – Marriage record, David Blunke to Hannah Griggs. 

Bodem (1 file): WWII military service records of Walter, Roy and Lee Bodem.  

Boersig (1 file): census records, and catholic church affiliations.  

Boggs (1 file): census information, Rabourn – Boggs family information.  

Boicourt (6 files) – File 1: Felix and Anna Elliott family line. File 2: Felix and subsequent generation 
information. File 3: Nelson – newspaper article about cooking, 1973. File 4: Nelson – 1971 article about 
Dr. Nelson, podiatrist, cooking. File 5: Family ancestry info, correspondence. File 6: research and notes. 

Boldery (1 file): Multiple spellings of name including: Baldry; Boldrey; Boulry; Boulre; Boulder. 
Correspondance, Hugh Boldry line information, newspaper article about Luther Bolery, inventor. Early 
family records.  

Bolton (6 files) – File 1: Sarah T. – The Federation Song written by Sarah T. Bolton, newspaper article, 
1896 article about poem, The Life of Sarah T. Bolton, written by Fred L. Horton. File 2: Sarah T. extremely 
old, fragile article about Sarah. File 3: brief biographical information about Sarah. File 4: copy of book, 
The Life and Poems of Sarah T. Bolton. File 5: newspaper articles, copy of the Federation Song. File 6: 
The life of Sarah T. Bolton. 

Bowman (1 file): family bible record of Nathaniel Bowman and Mary Cosby family line.  

Bondurant (2 files) – File 1: Descendants of Noah Bondurant of Virginia. File 2: correspondence, 
newspaper articles, cemetery records, marriage records.  



Bonner also Windell (1 file): Wesley Bonner Civil War information, Samuel (Windle) Windell line, Wesley 
Bonner married to Catherine Windell, correspondence.  

Bonta (1 file): Family tree of Edward Eden Bonta. 

Boon (1 file): Mrs. Thomas Orrill, Great Granddaughter of Daniel Boon lived in Madison, newspaper 
article 1884. Will of Willis Boon.  

Boone (1 file): Squire – newspaper article about Daniel Boone’s brother, Squire Jr. 

Booth (2 files) – File 1: Griffith - Underground Railroad, formerly enslaved; obituary, Madison Courier 
1889. File 2: Griffin – Notes.  

Borcherding (1 file): obituaries, census records, marriage records, cemetery records, Gentrup 
connection, the Schmidlap(p) and Mouser families genealogy. Fewell connection.  

Borden (3 files) – File 1: Borden family line connections of Lizzie Borden, Marylin Monroe, Winston 
Churchill. File 2: Gail Borden Jr., inventor of condensed milk biographical information. File 3: Gail – 
newspaper article about resident of Jefferson County sparking the Texas revolution (re: Remember The 
Alamo); Borden ancestral line; photocopy of condensed milk information.  

Borman (1file): early family bible records. 

Born (1 file): descendants of Charles Born, Family group record of Charles Born, various Born family 
newspaper announcements. 

Boulton (2 files) – File 1: George – newspaper article about wind and watermills. File 2: newspaper 
article about the 50th anniversary of James and Mary Jane Boulton. 

Boutton (1 file): Sarah – 1891 article about Sarah T. Bolton poem.  

Bowen (1 file): Bowen – Bryant, marriage record William Bowen to Elizabeth Bryant 

Bower (1 file): early American genealogical information.  

Bowman (3 file) – File 1: Bowman – Huntley - marriage record, Elijah Bowman to Emily Huntley; family 
line of Elijah and Emily, Elijah Obituary, family unit sheet for Isaac Sweetland and Sarah Bowman and 
records, information on Joseph Bowman Sr. File 2: Mikesell and Smock family connections, records and 
sources, research notes. File 3: 1947 DAR correspondence.  

Bowser (1 file): Sylvanus F. – original booklet about liquid fuel handling pioneer Sylvanus F. Bowser.  

*Bowyer (1 file): Levi and Anna Bowyer descendants, 1773 – 1962. 

Boyd (3 files) – File 1: family unit of Jesse Boyd and Sarah Staples. File 2: 1886 obituary of Sarah Boyd, 
Jasper obit, census info. File 3: research information, family lines, civil war pension info.                                                                                                                                                                                                                                              

Boyer (1 file): Boyer and Consley family bible information. 



Boynton (1 file): marriage record, Charles W Boynton and Sarah Roy(?)  

Bradbury (1 file): Jacob – family information, Cotton and Sanders family connections.  

Bradford (2 files) – File 1: correspondence and research notes. File 2: early American genealogical 
information, articles on the 2000 shooting of Allison Bradford.  

Brady also Hyatt (1 file): permission for Elisha Brady to marry Mary Hyatt, 1822; John Brady census info, 
obituary; Michael Brady family unit info, census info. 

Bramwell (1file): John Bramwell cemetery information, 1859 meeting notes, Joseph Bramwell article 
write-up. 

*Brandeis (3 files) – File 1: Samuel – Dr. Samuel of Austria biographical information. File 2: newspaper 
articles about Louis Dembitz Brandeis. File 3: excerpt from Brandeis: A Free Man’s Life about Adolph 
Brandeis.  

Brandon (1 file): John – family information, 1812 pension information, record reproductions, family unit 
sheets.   

Brandt (2 files) – File 1: Felix – funeral statement of Abraham, infant son of Felix, 1822. File 2:excerpt fon 
Connections, Hoosier Genealogist magazine about Marie Ester Brandt’s Diaries.  

Branham (3 files) – File 1: excerpt from The Vawter Family in America, GEN COL 929.2 B. Hendricks 
family connection, excerpt from Forks of Elkhorn Church, GEN COL 286 D; marriage records, Spencer 
Branham family line. File 2: correspondence and research notes. File 3: Branham – Watson, marriage 
record of William H. Branham and Matilda Watson, 1834. Livia Jane Stow to William H. Branham, 1850. 
John Lyle Clough to Fannie C. Branham, 1886; William Hickman Branham family information.  

Brannen (1 file): letter with family notes.  

Braun (1 file): letter from M. J. Braun to M. Gans. 

Brawner (2 files) – File 1: Lonnie Brawner family tree and burial information. File 2: 1986 50th 
anniversary of Mr and Mrs. Douglas Brawner, Frederick Browner of France naturalization 1857.  

Branning (1 file): also spelled Brannon, Brannin – Delilah Branning family tree, Calkins family connection, 
Michael Brannon rev. war information, research notes.  

Bray (1 file): Carrie T. – newspaper article about Carrie T. Bray’s salt and pepper shaker collection. 

Breidenbach/Breitenbach (2 files) – File 1: Valentine – research and sources. File 2: Valentine family 
information, reproduction photographs of various generations.  

Breno (1 file): directory copy, marriage and funeral records.  



*Brewer (2 files) – File 1: early Brewer family genealogical information, starting early 17th c. File 2: 
directory, Madison; marriage records, funeral records, census records.  

Bridge (1 file): genealogical information, Hiram Bodine Bridge and John Bridge line.  

*Briggs (2 files) – File 1: George – family line. File 2: copies of original documents, early family 
information, and correspondence.  

Bright (7 files) – File 1: 1882 Castle – Bright wedding newspaper article, 1983 Obituary of Clyde Bright, 
1987 newspaper article of Bright family farm award winners. File 2: Families of Steele and Bright, 
starting with German ancestor. Griffin, Nichol and Korbly family connections. File 3: Jesse D. – records 
and sources. File 4: Jesse D. – newspaper article about early Indiana legislator, Jesse D. Bright’s Madison 
home. File 5: newspaper articles about Jesse D.’s house and career. File 6: Article about Jesse D.’s 
impeachment. File 7: M. G. – obituary and article about his life.  

Brinson (1 file): Mexican American War record, Zebulon(?) Brinson 

Brinkworth (1 file): Brinkworth – Lockard, marriage record, William Brinkworth to Jane Lockard. 

Brindley (1 File): family bible record, Albert Brindley and Sarah Elizabeth Todd family line.  

Brinson (2 files) – File 1: census records, research notes. File 2: Joseph – marriage license, funeral 
records, burial information, children’s poor home records, census records.  

Brisben (1 file): John to Nancy Paul marriage record, newspaper article Madison Courier 1900, Aug. 6; 
Robert to Margaret Howard Family line.  

Broadus (1file): Daniel F. census information, obituary; wife, Maetta obituary.  

Brook (1 file): Family bible information, Kendall and Coffin family connections.  

Brooke (1 file): original Brooke genealogical booklet, 1924.   

Brooks (8 files) – File 1: Noah – correspondence, family line record, family bible record, census records, 
1820/1830. File 2: William Brooks, Brook – family line chart, 52 different family unit sheets, William 
Brooks to Sarah Black line. File 3: connects to Vernon, George, Spann families, family ancestral charts, 
census records, family unit sheets, George family history write-up. File 4: family unit sheet, census 
information. File 5: F. O. and M. Sears – obituary of Frederick O., 1910; census information, burial 
information of Maria Sears Brooks. File 6: newspaper clipping about boat damage on the river after ice 
gorge. The Brooks family, also Vernon family information starting with Humphrey Brooks, newspaper 
article about Humphrey, an orphan, and his family line. File 7: Abraham Brook to Sarah Lewis marriage 
record, 1854. File 8: William, William C and W.C. Brooks obituaries, Mordecai Brooks, son of Humphrey, 
biographical information.  

Brough, John (8 files) – File 1: photo reproduction of painting of John Brough, Cravenhurst/Lanier land 
deed info, article about John Brough house. File 2: death notice of John, image of his locomotive, article 



1980, Dec. 13 The story of Brough’s Folly, biographical information. File 3: Biographical and Historical 
sketch by William Wesley Woolen, 1883. John Bough vs Michael G. Bright. File 4: article about Ohio 
University alum, John Brough, Ohio governor during the Civil War. File 5: correspondence and research 
notes from The Ohio Historical Society. File 6: excerpt from Governors of Ohio, Twenty-sixth, John 
Brough. File 7: Madison newspaper mentions, correspondence, Cleveland masonic library association. 
File 8: biographical sketch, John Brough. 

Brown (12 files) – File 1: Patrick - many various family unit sheets; obituaries; excerpt from Three 
Kentucky Pioneers: James, William, and Patrick Brown; copies of deeds, pensions, other documents; 
estate inventory; descendants of Patrick Brown. File 2: J. Graham – newspaper articles about connection 
to Louisville and Harry Lemen photographs. File 3: J. Graham – original photograph, newspaper clippings 
about his philanthropy, obituaries. File 4: Courier-Journal newspaper article. File 5: Donald – Vietnam 
Vet, obituary. File 6: Samuel – revolutionary war information, newspaper clippings. File 7: Brown – 
Wallace, Andrew Wallace to Rachel Brown, 1836. File 8: Johns(t)on Brown family line and newspaper 
article about the pioneer. File 9: Nathaniel Brown census info, records, Ephraim directory info. File 10: 
Nathaniel – cemetery records, obits, census records, marriage records. File 11: burial records, 1765 
marriage record, Katherine Brown to William Dick Ruth(?)n. census information, Brown – Chamberlain 
connection. File 12: Ada Owsley – murder trial newspaper articles.  

Browning (1 file ): family unit sheets, article Brawner – Browning, newspaper clipping.  

Broyles (1 file): Moses – family unit sheet for Moses Broyles and Frances Elizabeth Hill. Moses was born 
enslaved, small bio sketch. newspaper article “The Broyles Homstead” written after Moses’ death in 
1882.  

Bruker (1 file): Bruker – Mayer, marriage record John to Josephine Mayer, 1854.  

Bruner (1 file): Bruner – Crowe, marriage record - William H. Bruner to Eliza June Crowe, 1834. 

Bruning (1 file): obituaries 

Bruther (1 file): newspaper articles 1983/1985 family reunions.  

Bryant (3 files) – File 1: Constance “Connie” Bryant Hackman family line, Her father’s tree. Pedigree 
charts, correspondence, reproduction images of gravestones, family members, Lame family connection. 
File 2: Joseph Bryant pension information, marriage record, Woodfill-Bryant obits, Melissa Bryant death 
record, William B Bryant pension info, cemetery records, Carman family connection records, newspaper 
article about pigeon roost massacre, correspondence, Hughes family connection, Collings family 
connection, Pedigree charts, research notes, family unit sheets. File 3: Erby – obituary (1998). 

*Buchanan (16 files) – File 1: Hubie, a POW, returns to Madison, April 1973. File 2: George Buchanan of 
Ireland, in Jeff Co. In. family line information. File 3: Hicks-Buchanan reunion, 1930 newspaper article, 
Sarah J. obit, Asa G. obit, William Buchanan family, Mary Buchanan family. File 4: Wilson – Will of John, 
1847; George Buchanan family; Hill-Horn-Buchanan bible records, E. Buchanan. File 5: Hankins – 
Buchanan, marriage record, John Hankins to Patsy Buchanan, 1824. File 6: correspondence – Buchanan – 



Benefiel – McCarty – Beasley – Slay. File 7: Wilson Buchanan family and census information, Enoch 
Buchanan information. File 8: Benefield, White – George Buchanan family. Buchanan Family Cemetery 
records. File 9: Benfiel(d) – Buchanan grave stones, census information. File 10: Hubert “Hubie” 
Buchanan returns from N. Vietnam newspaper articles; Mr. and Mrs. Hubert Buchanan 50th wedding 
anniversary newspaper clipping, Hubert, funeral home operator, obit; Walter White, artist, newspaper 
article, family unit sheets, pedigree charts. File 11: Eliz. Cunningham – John (Benjamin) Buchanan family. 
File 12: Mary A. Sheets – William B. Buchanan records, Georges’ Benfiel and Buchanan article Rev. War. 
File 13: Charles – census information, grave records, family unit sheets, death records. File 14: George – 
fort Buchanan article, Enich family bible record, Wills. File 15: research notes, pioneer family article. File 
16: Enoch – family bible record, platt map barbersville, marriage and cemetery records.  

Buck ( 4 file) – File 1: Matthews, registration affidavit of alien enemy. File 2: Christina – Registration 
affidavit of alien female. File 3: Jacob Buck descendants, Family group Matthias Buck, Friedricka Wurst. 
File 4: article about Buck family at Hanover College, 1974. 

Buchele (1 file): Elmo – article (1974) about her honorary title of Canaan Mayor, parade, Martha 
Washington dress.  

Buckhannon (Buchanan) (1 file): Buckhannon – Hankins, marriage record; William to Edna Hankins.  

Buckingham (1 file): John E. – excerpt from “A Hotbed of Spies and Seditious Plots” about John E., a 
ticket taker and curtain caller at Ford’s theater in Washington DC; burial and census records, family unit 
sheets, directory page.  

Bullock (1 file): article about a military family. 

Bumen (2 files) - File 1: Gottlieb Bumen and Amelia Franz family, newspaper article about Gen Louis 
Bumen retiring, correspondence, research notes, reproduction photographs. File 2: correspondence, 
descendant charts, family unit sheets, reproduction photographs, research notes.  

Burchfield (1 file): also Hill; Meredith; Anderson; Steinmetz – rev. war pension of Robert Burchfield and 
bio. information, Anthony Steinmetz family.  

Burk (1 file): George Burk pension record. 

*Burke (1 file): reproduction photographs, obituaries, marriage records. 

Burditt (1 file): Burditt – Robinson, marriage record, William Burditt to Mary Ann Robinson, 1834. 

*Burns (2 files) – File 1: James T. – Mary Wise, marriage record, 1841; James Burns bio sketch. File 2: 
James – pioneer reminiscence.  

Burnside (1 file): Burnside – Willard, Marriage record; John Burnside to Nancey Willard, 1834.  

Burton (5 files) – File 1: Burton – Hunt; records, descendants of George Burton and Rebeckah Lee, 
census information, research notes. File 2: census information, article, marriage record. File 3: 



descendants of Harold Jennings Burton. File 4: genealogical history of George and Rebecka Lee family. 
File 5: correspondence, the Lee Family of Jeff. Co. Ind.  

Burr (1 file): early American genealogy information.  

Burris (1 file): research notes, correspondence, census information, Douglas family connection, records.  

Burrit(t) (1file): research notes, Zalmon Burritt information and family, census information, record 
sources.  

Burrows (1 file): Burrows – Brown, marriage record – Abel Burrows and H(?) Brown, 1829. 

Busby (1 file): Thomas and Isaac – Buzby, monthly meeting records, research notes.  

Bush (2 files) – File 1: Bush – Loughridge, George Bush and Pamelia Loughridge, 1838. File 2: Bush – 
Meyers, Michel Bush to Kate Meyers, 1877. File 3: obituary for Martha Bush, 1926. 

*Butler (7 files) – File 1: correspondence and census info. File 2: Butler and Farley Families of Trimble Co. 
Ky. File 3: Noble – 1882 write up from Courier article. File 4: newspaper articles about Amos Butler, early 
settler, and Noble Butler, educator and pastor, 1983. File 5: early English ancestry information, Margaret 
Butler ancestry. File 6: obituary of William F. Butler, dairyman, 1974; early American genealogical 
information. File 7: Patrick – information on a man who died in a railway accident.  

Butterfield (2 files) – File 1: marriage record, 1863 – John S. Butterfield to Mary E. Westgate. File 2: 
correspondence and research notes.  

*Butts (2 files) – File 1: Noah Butts descendants, File 2: Butts family of Thomas Butts of Norfolk County, 
England; Samuel Butts to Phebe Brown family, family unit sheets, information.  

Buxton (1 file): family unit sheets, family of Moses Buxton, family of Edmund Buxton. 

Byfield (1 file): research notes, correspondence, newspaper mentions.  

Byron (1 file): research notes and correspondence.  

 

C 

Cadwallader (1 file): 1888 newspaper ad for photograph cabinet cards.  

Cain (2 files) – File 1: Cain – Cope, marriage record – John Cain and Minerva Cope, 1834. File 2: Martha – 
1974 forestry award newspaper article.  

Calhoun (1 file): James and Frederick Calhoun, Miles Moylan, Civil War and Western Indian Wars; 
newspaper articles and census information; James Calhoun biographical information, Sanxay family 
connection.  



Callaway (1 file): Ella – census records, family unit sheets, death certificates, obituary for W. W. 
Callaway (1896), city directory pages, grave marker found in yard of house on Main; The Callaway 
Journal Volume XLVII 2022.  

Calvert (1 file): early American genealogical information.  

Cambron (1 file): many family trees, no dates. 

Campbell (4 files) – File 1: Angus Campbell – Martha Jane Hillhouse family unit sheet. File 2: William 
Campbell burial information, SAR and bio notes. File 3: 1877 newspaper article about John Campbell. 
File 4: John L. – Wabash College professor, newspaper article about the American Centennial.  

Canby (1 file): Israel – early settler, Doctor, his accolades, a courier write up about his home and 
acquaintances.  

Cantrell (2 files) – File 1: Cantrell – Stucker, marriage permission, John Cantrell to Elizabeth Stucker 
1830. File 2: William “Wild Bill” – speed boat racer in Madison, articles with him racing, and injuring 
himself. 

Capito (1file): Capito – Cravens: excerpt from Settlers By the Long Grey Trail, 1935.  

Caplinger (2 files) – File 1: marriage record of Sollomon(?) Caplinger to Mary Nay Roth, 1839; census 
information, funeral and marriage records. File 2: obituaries. 

Cardin (Cardon) (1 file): burial records, correspondence, census records.  

Cardinal (1 file): John Cardinal, death records, pension information, census records. 

Carey (1 file): Carey – Henderson, marriage record 1834, Greenbury Carey to Hannah Henderson.  

Cargile (1 file): early American genealogy information.  

Carlaw (1file): Bogart, obituary of slogan ad-man.  

Carley (Carly) (1 file): also Hollenbeck, correspondence.  

Carlisle (1 file): early Madison settlers from England, newspaper article.  

Carlow (1 file): Paul – retirement from mail carrying, 1990.1992 newspaper articles.  

Carnagey (1 file): Revolutionary ancestor form, Thomas F. Carnagey. 

*Carnine (5 files) – File 1: early family lineage information of New Jersey. File 2: Carnine – McCarty, 
marriage record, Allen Carnine to Lydia McCarty, 1834. File 3: Carnine family history. Pedigree chart and 
family unit sheets. File 4: correspondence, family unit sheets, census information. File 5: many family 
unit sheets of various family lines, all different names. 



Carpenter (3 files) – File 1: early American genealogical information. File 2:marriage record, George 
Carpenter to Rebecca Hooker, 1824. File 3: census, family line information, Massachusetts.   

Carr (1 file): John Carr, Underground Railroad fame, bio sketch in newspaper; obit and census 
information, wife’s death record.  

Carrel (1 file): correspondence.  

Carson (1 file): Turner – Carson family members. 

*Carter (6 files) – File 1: Carter-Heal, early Carter line information, Olive carter to William Heal. File 2: 
newspaper articles about Jimmy Carter ancestors, Alfred Carter exposé, Alfred and Gladys Carter 45 
anniversary. File 3: History of Isaac P(erry) Carter Family and their descendants, by Howard Carter, 1905 
full book. File 4: John Sr., John Carter to Anne Moore marriage record, 1830; newspaper article about a 
Black man’s House torn down, 1892, John Carter. Newspaper articles about his life in Madison. Census 
records, information about his son, Morgan. Burial information. File 5: obituaries, directories, census 
records, Sumler family connection, cemetery record, correspondence, letter to the Evening Courier, 
1883; court of common pleas record. File 6: pertaining to a letter written by Morgan Carter, son of John 
Carter; reproduction of the letter, newspaper articles, write up about the Carter family, letter to friend 
Charles reproduction, newspaper articles about Morgan’s arrest in 1869. 

Cary (1 file): early American genealogical information. 

Casper (1 file): census information, Adam Casper obituary, cemetery record, marriage record. 
Correspondence. 

Caswell (1 file): Emma Lamont – death records, draft card for Jesse Quackenbush, burial information, 
Census records, Selig connection, marriage records. 

Cassidy (2 files) – File 1: Judge Bernard – 1986 obituary. File 2: Bernard – 1979 article about award 
presented. 

Cates (1 file): 19th c. Cates family Genealogy.  

Causing (1 file): John Henry – registration affidavit of alien enemy. 

Cavanagh (2 files) – File 1: obituaries. File 2: Michael – death certificate, burial in St. Patrick’s Cemetery.  

Cavett (1 file): John S. Cavett family, other allied family sheets.  

Chadwick (1 file): Samuel W. Chadwick family and descendant sheets.  

*Chaffin (1 file): Chaffin – Shorb line, pedigree charts, and family unit sheets. 

Chambers (1 file): family history write up. 

Chance (1 file): reproduction image of Lura Chance, Chance family history.  



Chancellor (1 file): early American genealogy. 

Chandler (1 file): 1906 golden anniversary of Robert and Eliza, reunion newspaper clipping (1978), early 
American genealogy. 

*Chapman (7 files) – File 1: obituaries, correspondence, Christmas story articles (1917), Alonzo Sylvanus, 
editor of the paper, Obit. File 2: john – original Johnny Appleseed booklet. File 3: Mariah Johnson 
Chapman descendants. File 4: Elijah Chapman biography sketch. James W. obit, article about John 
Chapman as new justice. File 5: John – 3 original Johnny Appleseed pamphlets, Swedenborgian church 
information. File 6: biography, records, soda fountain invention information and articles. File 7:  Stephan 
D. – reproduction images of Stephan Decator Chapman, correspondence, pedigree charts, family unit 
sheets, pleasant hill, Louisiana connection, census records.  

Chardevoine (1 file): early genealogical information, family name. 

Chasteen (3 files) – File 1: Joseph Chasteen – Sarah Woodward family line. File 2: Chasteen – Wise, 1838 
marriage record I. V. Chasteen to Jane Wise. File 3: Chasteen – Sickles, Charles Chasteen to Susan 
Sickles, census records, marriage records.  

Chauncey (1 file): early American genealogy. 

Cheatham (2 files) – File 1: correspondence, obituaries, census records, 1986 article Four generations of 
Cheathams. File 2: David G. – interview transcript by Ben Baumann, Indianapolis March 30, 2022. 

Childs (1 file): May S Childs, library board secretary, award; newspaper mentions, article about David 
Wallace Springer in Wyoming.  

Chief White Eye (1 file): excerpt of Indian names in Indiana, articles about his murder, article about an 
art tile with his depiction.  

Chitwood (4 files) – File 1: copies of early documents. File 2: original photographs and negatives, original 
1856 document, copies of documents, correspondence. File 3: original photographs, original 
correspondence and marriage record (1823). Ephemera. File 4: newspaper articles, Amos Chitwood, 
wills and probate records.   

Chowning (2 files) – File 1: Edward C. – census information, historical sketch, obituary, newspaper article 
about painting revealed in Shooters bar (2010). File 2: Charles Clifton – death certificate, family unit 
sheet, census records.  

Christie (1 file): Isaac and Susana – West Fork Baptist Church record scans, correspondence.  

Christman (2 files) – File 1: probate/will record of Therese Christman, Selig connection, census records, 
correspondence. File 2: descendant chart for Jacob and George F., census and wills.  

Church (1 file): 1932 correspondence.  

Cisco (1 file): bio of John. M, early mayor of Madison.  



*Clark (10 files) – File 1: newspaper mentions, research notes, article (1889) mentioning George Roger 
Clark. File 2: Marston G. – family line and marriages, biography of Marston Green, a general; factoids of 
his life. File 3: Clark – Baird, 1823 marriage record of David Clark to Maria Dudley (signed by Baird). File 
4: Clark – Cunningham, marriage record – Thomas Clark to Sarah Ann Cunningham, 1854. File 5: The 
Clark Clarion: research aid for the Clark family. File 6: Phebe Clark family includes Oatman; Winters; 
Schofield; Einsel families. File 7: Clarke - reproduction image of J. R. Gorgas; William Clarke Family, 
James Clark census info. File 8: 1976 article about the Clark Brothers, woodworkers. William O. Clark, a 
man of temperance and business. File 9: information on Maria Mariah Hortsman Clark, family unit 
sheets, Capt Samuel Clarke information from Find a Grave, Steamboat disaster article from Natchez, MS; 
John Jones Death certificate, Catherine Jones death certificate. File 10: Frank W. – death certificate, 
census records, family unit sheets.  

Clarke (1 file): Maria Mariah Horstman Clarke – Ryker family connection, family units sheets, Custer 
family connection, article MC April April 15, 1913, correspondence, death certificates for Catherine 
Jones and John H, Jones, husband is Capt. Samuel Clarke (d. 1838)  

Clashman (2 files) – File 1: Carrie Clashman’s corner, story by Mary Clashman, Map of land and names of 
people who lived there. File 2: Avery – pedigree charts, census records, family unit sheets, obituaries.  

Clay (2 files) – File 1: John H., Black Civil War soldier, newspaper articles, funeral announcement, census 
record. File 2: Henry, James, John, William – Beatty family connection, family unit sheets.  

Claybrook (1 file): newspaper excerpts, census information.  

Clements (1 file): 1907 Sarah, obituary. 

Clemmons (1 file): Charles and Emma – family unit sheets, article about two people drowned in river 
Aug. 13, 1918 (Cameron Clemmons and Jeannette Woodfill); obituary for Emma Clemmons, 1938.  

Cline (1 file): John and family – census information, wills. 

Clinese (1 file): Clinese – Anderson, Marriage record John C. to Nancy Jane Anderson, 1854 

Clock (1 file): Martin Luther – census records, correspondence, family unit sheets, research notes.  

Close (2 files) – File 1: Henry Close Montgomery tree. File 2: census records. 

Clower (1 file): Henry – 1820 pension record.  

Cloyer (1 files) – File 1: Cloyer – Sangbridge, 1837 marriasge record Worden Cloyer to Elizabeth 
Sangbridge. 

Coates (1 files): John L. – family unit sheet, Jefferson County tax records, marriage record for Mary Craig 
and John Coates (1852), advertisement in the 1860 directory for grocery store,  

Cobb (1 file): John Cobb research notes in an email. 



Cochran (1 file): Cochran – Richie, marriage record -1829 James Cochran to Harriet Ritchie; newspaper 
mention of Samuel Cochran.  

Cochrane (1 file): biographical information in a letter, 1955. Descendants of (Laird) John Ralston and Ann 
Crawford Ralston.  

Cockerham (1 file): land deed records, family unit sheets, pedigree charts, regarding William Cockerham 
b.1808.  

Coffin (1 file): Hiram Coffin and Elizabeth Kendall family information.  

Coffman (1 file): Coffman – Williams, Marriage record (1836) Dan Ferdinand to Isaphena Williams.  

Cofield (1 file): Margie Hancock – autobiography, correspondence, obit of George W. Cofield. 

Cogley (1 file): Thomas J. – obituary census information, family unit sheet. 

Cohen (1 file): Louis – variety store owner in Madison, burial information for his father and mother and 
newspaper announcements of their deaths. Burial info for his sister and census records.  

Colbert (1file): Kirk and Storm family connections.  

Coleman (2 files) – File 1: Newspaper article, 1977, John H. Coleman hospital program head in Toledo. 
File 2: Mary A. – family unit sheet, census record, death certificate.  

Colgate (2 files) – File 1: Richard E. – newspaper article about being appointed a leader at Du Pont. File 
2: William B. – newspaper article about a promotion, and two obituaries.  

Coldwater (1 file): family unit sheets. 

Cole (1 file): Phil – race announcer, articles, obituaries, original photographs.  

Collier (2file) – File 1: Steve – 1974 Basketball cartoon. File 2: Early American Genealogy.  

Collins (7 files )- File 1: W.W. Collins obituary, other obits, research notes, family unit sheets. File 2: 
William Andrew – biographical sketch, 1900. File 3: Collins – Finnegan: Collins family bible notes. File 4: 
obituaries and life sketches of Collins family. File 5: Napoleon – bio sketch and letter with research notes 
about Admiral Napoleon Collins. File 6: Napoleon, Sketch of his life, newspaper funeral announcement 
and info regarding his remains. File 7: William Andrew – book excerpt, The boy surgeon for the Madison 
Courier.  

Com(m)ingore (2 file) – File 1: Comingore – John Comingore and Eliza Higgins family. File 2: Commingore 
– Richardson: research notes and correspondence.  

Commiskey (2 files) – File 1: John, research and correspondence. File 2: Commiskey – Dodson, 
Descendants of John Commiskey. Polly Dodson descendants, map, census info, death records.  

Compton (1 file) – Compton – Woodburn, Marriage record, William to Sarah Woodburn, 1826 



Conant (1 file): Conant – Smith, Marriage record – 1854 Andrew to Frances Smith.  

Condra (1 file): correspondence with notes. 

Conewago (1 file): tabulated Conewago families according to male parent 1769 – 1780 

Conner (1 file): correspondence and research notes.  

Connett (2 files) – File 1: obituary information, Capt. A. W. File 2: more infor on A. W.  

Condrey (1 file): Condrey – Reiley, Marriage record, 1847 Nancy Reiley to William Condrey. 

Conover (1 file): Family Bible information. 

Consley ( 1 file): cemetery records.  

Conway (1 file): Daniel (Capt), obituary. 

Cook (3 files) – File 1: Indiana burial information, Gregory Cook of England family information. File 2: 
Cook – Cosby, Mary Cook to David Cosby, 1903. Amos Cook to Amelia Richardson, 1877. Hattie Cook to 
Thomad Jo(?), 1903. Amelia obituary, David Cosby obit. Descendants of Amos Cook. File 3: Cook – 
Comly, 1823, John Cook and Mahola Comley.  

Cooper (5 Files) – File 1: Cooper Genealogy starting in 1533, William Cooper. File 2: James Cooper family 
and descendants. File 3: Joseph M. – 1974 newspaper article about his legal career. File 4: further about 
Joseph M.’s legal career and death. File 5: Eugene – newspaper articles about legal career and death.  

Cooperider (1 file): Dr. Jefferson obituary. 

Cope (2 files): cemetery records, census records, obituaries, book excerpt. File 2: correspondence, 
research notes.  

Copeland (3 files) – File 1: obit, correspondence, notes. File 2: Copeland – Salyers, marriage record – 
1837 James Copeland to Jane Salyers. File 3: marriage record, James Copeland to Polly Phillips, 1824. 

Cordery (1 file): census information, obituaries.  

Corey (1 file): Francis E. life sketch.  

Cornett (3 files) – File 1: William – autobiography of dr. William T. S. Cornett. File 2: copy of life sketch of 
William. File 3: Life sketch of William.  

Cosby (6 files) – File 1: Richard M. – descendants of Richard Minter Cosby, newspaper article about 
estate, marriage info. File 2: cemetery records, copies of records, marriage records. File 3: Jason F. and 
Tina – 1990s newspaper articles about Jason in basketball and Tina, a news reporter. File 4: family of 
Henrietta DuVall and Richard Minter Cosby. File 5: Robert – obituary (1985). File 6: information for the 
family of David and H+John David Cosby, CD of images scanned from the personal collection of Wanda 
Lacey.  



Costigan (4 files) – File 1: Francis – book excerpts and a short biographical sketch. File 2: Francis – A 
Stylistic Study from 1975. File 3: family information, correspondence, maps of Madison, and essay about 
Francis. File 4: 1930s newspaper articles about architecture, Costigan letter, diary entries of Isaiah 
Rogers, architect of Madsion Hotel near Mulberry; obituaries, excerpt from journal of architectural 
historians, short bio.  

Cottman (6 files) – File 1: 1942 newspaper article about Evans Cottman and a blood testing chemical. 
File 2: George S. – obituary, article about him. File 3: Evans W. – obituary, articles about his scientific 
work. File 4: George S. – original book 1917, original letter 1927 by G. S. Cottman. File 5: George S. – 
newspaper article, 1932 and obituary. File 6: Evans W. – newspaper articles.  

Cotton (5 files) – File 1: obituaries. File 2: correspondence, DAR information. File 3: Laura – article about 
4-H. File 4: William – bio of William and family, Family Bible information. File 5: newspaper article 1939.  

Covert (1 file): early family bio. 

Cowen (3 files) – File 1: census records, obituaries, Supreme Court decision. File 2: research notes, 
family information, marriage records. File 3: Family bible records.  

Cox (4 files) – File 1: correspondence, Asa Cox will. File 2: Cox – Bacon: original 1833 marriage record. 
George Cox to Martha Bacon. File 3: census information, Cox – Bacon record, 1835. File 4: Lorenzo D. – 
excerpt from Forks of Elkhorn Church book, obituary of Charles Cox, marriage record or Lorenzo D Cox 
and Mary Ryker, 1838. 

*Craig (10 files) – File 1: bio sketch of George Craig and family, descendants. Craig family newsletters, 
later Craig genealogy, obituaries. File 2: original letters and DAR information. File 3: Mary Elizabeth (nee 
May) – Master’s thesis about Mary Elizabeth May Craig, a home economist. File 4: Rev. Charles – article 
about returning to Madison to lead church. File 5: Craig – Heberhart – family bible information. File 6: 
Christopher – newspaper article about deacon, church pamphlet. File 7: Fred – obituary and copies. File 
8: James and Family – records, family unit sheets, census information. File 9: Samuel – pioneer of 
western Pennsylvania story and family info. File 10: Dickie – Vietnam soldier, obituary.  

Craigmyle (1 file): newspaper article about Sheldon, a B52 bomber pilot.  

Crane (1 file): Simeon H. – cemetery records, biography sketch, obituary and funeral announcement.  

Cranford (2 files) – File 1: directory scans, and obituaries. File 2: original family record booklet, census 
records, cemetery records.  

Crandell (1 file): obituaries.  

*Cravens (35 files) – File 1: Rockingham County Deeds, newspaper articles. File 2: obituaries of John 
Paul, William, Robert and Drusilla. File 3: Miss Drusilla – original photograph and newspaper article. File 
4: legal papers, correspondence. File 5: Judge John Robert Cravens family line info, pedigree charts, 
census information. File 6: Drusilla – 1956 death notice. File 7: Drusilla – various newspaper articles from 



her life, Order of the Crown in America certificate. File 8: newspaper articles referring to Drusilla. File 9: 
Drusilla – socialite newspaper article and other clippings. File 10: Drusilla Lanier – Family line, Margaret 
Dyer and John Cravens. File 11: Judge Cravens, John R. – newspaper clippings. File 12: article about 
Robert Cravens medical school journal, family info for Robert Cravens and Sarah Grover Paul. File 13: 
Will of Drusilla. File 14: Family Bible record copies, Maj. John Oscar article. File 15: correspondence, 
military telegraph, Family line information for Drusilla. File 16: Lincoln V. – Masons information for 
Grand Master Lincoln V. Cravens. File 17: Davidson – Cravens marriage article, Sage – Cravens wedding 
announcement. File 18: Family unit sheets, correspondence, descendant chart, 1824 marriage record, 
Goode – Cravens. File 19: Drusilla – newspaper article about Drusilla, article about her 90th birthday. File 
20: Dr John – married 60 years newspaper article. File 21: newspaper articles about the 1939 death of 
Judge Joseph Cravens. File 22: Will of Charles Cravens, Excerpt from The House of Cravens, bio sketch of 
Joseph Cravens. File 23: Obit and Bio of Joseph M. Cravens. File 24: Dr. Joseph Craven 1842 death notice 
and obit. File 25: obituaries. File 26: correspondence. File 27: Joseph M. – correspondence, obit. File 27: 
Will of D. L. Cravens newspaper article, J. R. Cravens notebook copy. File 28: Rev. Thomas and John G. – 
cemetery plot payment record, correspondence. File 29: will, correspondence, obit. File 30: Margaret – 
copies of newspaper articles about her death in Paris, article about her friendship with Ezra Pound, poet. 
File 31: Craven Medical Building Tour of Homes blurb. File 32: James H. – Medieval Hymn collector, 
article. File 33: Drusilla L. articles. File 34: J.K.- Judge Cravens Obituary. File 35: newspaper articles, 
cemetery records, genealogical information.  

Crawford (10 files) – File 1: Jane Todd - newspaper mentions of ovariotomy patient. File 2: family bible 
record and correspondence. File 3: Jane Todd memorial article and Miss Dell Crawford 98th birthday 
article, 1953. File 4: William, John, Sally Crawford family, Suddith and Averitt connections. File 5: land 
tract and census records. File 6: marriage record, William Crawford to Mary Betsy Crawford, 1832. File 7: 
marriage record, William Crawford to Izabella(?) Crawford, 1832. File 8: Thomas – copy of a letter 
announcing death, 1821. File 9: marriage record, 1846 Jeremiah Crawford to Betsy Ann Payne. File 10: 
marriage record, Thomas H. Crawford to Clementine Eloise Martin, 1831.  

Crawley (1 file): birth record or Marie Josephine Crawley Barkham, and record of farmland now a golf 
course.  

Cross (1 file): marriage record, George W. Cross to Mary Ellen Sering, 1840; obituaries, genealogy of 
John J. Cross and Dorinda Deacon.  

Crowe (1 file): Original 1984 pamphlet on Crowe-Garritt house, 1824 in Hanover.  

Crozier (1 file): John Crozier and Leah Bitterman family information and pedigree chart. 1939 article 
about John Andy Crozier, civil war.  

Cruzan (1 file): family of Benjiman Cruzan book excerpt.  

Culbertson (4 files) – File 1: descendants of James and Janet James Culbertson. File 2: cemetery records, 
correspondence, research notes. File 3: obituaries, research notes. File 4: family bio sketches, land tract 
info.  



Cull (1 file):  2003 article and obituary, Herman Brooklyn Cull. 

Cummins (3 files) – File 1: Cummins, Braham; correspondence. File 2: probate and real estate records. 
File 3: marriage records, obits, james and david. Census information.  

Cunningham (4 files) – File 1: Irish ancestor family information and descendants. File 2: James H. house 
and will information. File 3: marriage record, David Cunningham and Nancy McClaine, 1831. File 4: 
marriage record, James A. Cunningham to Mary Jane Payne, 1857. 

Currie (1 file): descendants of James Corrie. 

Curry (1 file): descendants of Thomas Curry. 

Curtis (2 files) – File 1:  early American genealogy. File 2: marriage record, Stephan Curtis to Ann Hibbert, 
1854. 

Cushing (1 file): Courtland Cushing bio sketch in letter (April, 1901) to Miss Cravens in Washington DC by 
his child, funeral notice of Sarah, wife of C. Cushing 

Custer (7 files) – File 1: A. S. – 1927 article about giving $700,000,000 to Madison schools, to be payed in 
500 years. File 2: 2011 article about A. S. Custer’s legacy, Custer Prize winners 1912-1915. File 3: 
correspondence, Arnold Scott Custer will. File 4: Arnold – short bio. File 5: marriage record, Coo(?) 
Custer to Hanah Craig, 1834. File 6: book excerpt, census records, ancestry of Arnold Custer, Rev. War 
veteran and pioneer, obituaries.  

Cutler (1 file): Obit of Arthur D, articles about land owned by Culters for sale.  

Cuttle (1 file): obituary and research notes for Matthew C. Cuttle, Madison Philharmonic Director.  

 

D 

Daily (4 files) – File 1: letter with sources and included excerpts. File 2: historic sketch of M. E. Church. 
File 3: Phillip Martin Daily, motel owner, obit. File 4: Dennis – Rev. War pension information. 

Dalhover (2 files) – File 1: newspaper articles throughout the mid-late 1930s about Rhule James 
Dalhover, a heistman, and his arrest, execution and funeral, funeral record. File 2: Rhule James – fax of 
robbery list.  

Damm (1 file): 1977 article about Damm Theater, oldest family operated in the state.  

*Daniel (1 file): early american family genealogy, will of Coleman Daniels and Sara M Daniels, Family 
records marriages and deaths. Cooper family connection.  

Daniells (1 file): bio of Deacon A. Daniells. 



Danner (3 files) – File 1: census records, newspaper death mentions. File 2: Samuel Danner and Anna 
Steiner/Stoner family tree and Bible records. File 3: copy of file 2. 

Daringer (1 file): McFatridge connection. Correspondence.  

Dasta (1 file): Tony – newspaper clipping and reproduction photograph of store front, produce.  

Dattilo ( 2 files) – File 1: Molly – newspaper articles about disappearance, original photobook from Run 
event, 2010. File 2: descendant chart. 

*David (2 files) – File 1: copies of letters, genealogy records, family unit sheets. File 2: Isaac N. – family 
unit sheets. 

Davidson (4 files) – File 1: Andrew and family – marriage, 1831 and census records. File 2: Zuck and 
Tague connections, pedigree chart, obituaries, marriage records, cemetery records. File 3: William – 
biography of Dr. William Davidson of Scotland. File 4: obituary of William R. son of Dr. William. Bio of 
William Sr.  

*Davis (17 files) – File 1: Solomon – family unit sheets. File 2: Solomon Davis Family, Tull connection. File 
3: Fred “Rack”- Article about can collecting. File 4: family unit sheets. File 5: Abijah Davis family. File 6: 
census records, land entries, Abijah research notes. File 7: correspondence. File 8: Robert Davis and 
Lucinda Harris family line. File 9: Brooks – obits and retiring article. File 10: Davis – Lawrence, marriage 
record  James Davis to (?)ericy Lawrence, 1823. File 11: Lewis – original pioneer bio sketch. File 12: Davis 
– Rice, marriage record, Benjamin Davis to Sylvia Rice, 1838. File 13: Davis – Thornton, marriage record, 
Harvey Davis and Mary Thornton, 1838. File 14: Davis – Comingore, marriage record B(?) Davis to 
Elizabeth Comingore, 1834. File 15: Mrs. Susie E. – death certificate, obit. File 16: family unit sheet for 
family of Marion Ansel Davis and Inez Meredith, death certificates. File 17: Lucy – correspondence and 
information on Mexico orphanage, family unit sheets, census records. 

Day/s (4 files) – File 1: John M.- newspaper articles,” first colored man to join the Union army.” File 2: 
Harriet E. Day (nee Temple) census records, marriage record. File 3: Capt. William T. Days – census and 
burial records. File 4: William Allen – family unit sheet, death certificate for Allen Day, 1928. 

Deal (1 file): Abraham Deal obituary and family unit sheets. 

*Dean (2 files) – File 1: Argus – stonecutter, bio sketch, d. 1890. File 2: obituaries, records, research 
notes. 

Dearing (1 file): Dearing – Neff, Marriage record Mariah Neff to (?) Dearing, 1853. 

DeBaptiste (1 file): newspaper article about George DeBaptiste’s house, endangered landmark; will and 
obituary, life sketch. Free Black man, abolitionist, conductor on the Underground Railroad.  

Decar (1 file):  Louis DeCar, article about sport fan, and Lemen collection.  



Demaree (2 files) – File 1: lawsuit transcript, newspaper articles, James H. Obituary. File 2: research 
notes, correspondence.  

Denmead (1 file): Robert – obituary July 22, 1850 Madison Courier. 

Denny (2 files) – File 1: Dr. George E. – census records, bio sketch, family information, burial 
information. File 2: William – obituaries, census records, research notes.  

Diederich (1 file): Johan Conrad family. 

DeJonneth (1 file): marriage record, 1830 John Dejonneth to Elizabeth West. 

DeLancey (1 file): early American genealogy.  

DeLoste (1 file): descendant chart. 

Denton (2 files) – File 1: Howard – attorney, sculptor, newspaper article about prize, articles about his 
wife’s floral arrangements. File 2: Howard – Grace Denton articles, original Women’s Club of Louisville 
magazine. Photographs.  

Deputy (1 file): correspondence and research notes, Grover family connection.  

Detraz (1 file): Louis Detraz lineage.  

Devin (1 file): Alexander – excerpt about a pioneer. 

*Diahamer (1 file): George W. – family lineage.  

*Dickerson (1 file): Ester obit, 1881. Amelia Ann Moore Dickerson family records.  

Dierkes (1 file): wedding announcements, obituaries, marriage certificate for John Dierkes and Anna 
Doeste, descendant chart. 

Dickinson (1 file): reproduction photographs, family unit sheets, obituary, Seymour family connection. 

Dickson (2 files)- File 1: death notice, Elizabeth Dickson, 1873. File 2: Jackson Dickson bio sketch.  

Dieken (1 file): Joh Dieken, baker, bio sketch and family information.  

Dietz (2  files): J. Walter – award artricle and tribute, obituary, obit for his sister Martha , pedigree chart. 
Book, Walter Dietz Speaking in GEN COL 921 D. File 2: book review, tribute copy.  

Dilk (1 file): obituaries, census records, marriage records, cemetery records.  

Dillow (1 file): Dillow – Jobe marriage record, 1835 

*Dike (1 file): Dike/Dyke/Van Dyke early ancestor in Massachusetts, Anthony Dike.  

Dillinger (1 file): John H. – newspaper articles about the gangster, resting place. 



Distel (2 files): George Distel to Aura E Austermuter(?), 1852 marriage license. File 2: George A. – former 
baseball player, photograph and obituary.  

Ditmore (1 file): Henry McGrath – death certificate, prison records, civil war pension information, burial 
record.  

Ditzler (1 file): early family bio sketch and family information. 

Dillahunty (1 file) – early American genealogy bio. 

Disbrow (1 file): genealogy compiled in1971, Zalmon Disbrow bio sketch. 

Dismore ( 1 file): correspondence, William, civil war soldier information. 

Dittgen (1 file): John DIttgen’s death, newspaper article, 1891; George Dittgen’s murder newspaper 
article, 1920.  

Dixon (1 file): Margaret L. Dixon, Funeral service pamphlet and photograph, 1937. 

Dobbin (1 file): marriage record, Liam Dobbin and Elizabeth Wilson, 1837. 

Dolhover (1 file): see also Dalhover; futher articles about Brady gang, Bertha Craig obit and her mother’s 
obit (Sarah Black), census records, marriage records.  

Donahue (2 files): Geore W. – marriage and death certificate, obituary. File 2: Michael – family unit 
sheet, death notices, census records, Kimmel family connection. 

Donat (1 file): correspondence and research notes. 

Donner (1 file): Jacob Donner, of the Donner party, once lived in Jeff Co.; census records, article, 
correspondence. 

Danlan (1 file): family obituaries, Patrick, Thomas, Margaret.  

Dorton (1 file): Cecil – newspaper articles about Major Gen. Cecil Dorton death, 2000. 

Dorsey (1 file): descendants of Thomas Arundel-Howard. Ancient lineage.  

Doty (1 file): correspondence and research notes, John Doty and Nancy Wingate line. Also, Dotee. 
Abbott and Thorn family connections.  

Douglas (3 files) – File 1: Ashahel, Amzi, and John Douglass information, family line information and 
descendants. File 2: Douglass – Reddinbaugh marriage record, 1825, Jerimiah Douglass and Catherine 
Reddinbaugh. File 3: Joseph formerly enslaved – 1879, death notice/obituary in the paper. File 3: 
Douglas/Douglass – further information on Asahel and Amzi Douglas families.  

Douthitt (1 file): Thomas – revolutionary soldier and descendants.  



Dowell (2 files) – File 1: Lee Dowell newspaper article about community service award, 1978. Article 
about Walter’s retirement. File 2: Paul Freeman (judge) – family unit sheets, Find A grave pages.  

Dow (3 files): William Scott Dow, DAR war service record, original photographs of house on Fairmount. 
Obituary for Margaret H. Dow. File 2: William Dow certificate from James Monroe for land granted and 
land plot divided schema. File 3: copies from file 2 and an E.K.G. from US Army, 1942. 

Downs (1 file): marriage record, Richard Downs and Dicey(?) MCartney, 1838. 

Doyle (1 file): Frank Doyle service enlistment information and records from Nat’l Archives.  

Drake (1 file): marriage record for W. E. Drake and Emma Gehl, 1893. 

Driggs (2 files) – File 1: family research, correspondence, family unit sheet. File 2: Marriage record, 1838, 
(?)Jonathan Driggs and (?)yra Driggs. 

Drehobl ( 1 file): The Drehobls and LEnzes family pilgrimage report.                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                              

*Dryden (4 files): also Lewis and McGannon, Original documents. File 2: original documents. File 3: 
original photographs. File 4: John and Thomas legal paper.  

Dubach (1 file): Hannibal, MO articles and obituaries. F. L. Dubach.  

DuBois (1 file): Early American bio sketch. 

Duenisch (2 file): Aquilin – registration affidavit of alien enemy. File 2: Louisa – registration affidavit of 
alien female 

Duffy (3 files) – File 1: descendants of John Nelson Duffy in Jefferson County, IN. File 2: marriage record, 
1838 James Duffy and Jane Thompson. James obit. File 3: Sarah Litson – obituary, 1932. 

Dufour (1 file): John James, wine maker from Vevey, Switzerland. Newspaper article.  

Dugan (2 files) – File 1: also Dungan, research notes, correspondence. File 2: Samuel – family unit sheet, 
correspondence, Samuel Dugan death notice in the paper, 1849, Madsion city tax records, 6 

Duggan (1 file): Agnes Brown – namesake of Hanover library.  

Duncan (3 files): Carl Clifford – census records, registration card copies, death certificate, burial 
information. File 2: Jennie – former teacher obit and tribute article. File 3: Walter – Vail funeral records 
for Walter and 2 children.  

*Dunn (11 files) – File 1: family unit sheets for Carl Bright and Gladys M (nee Land), photo 
reproductions, obituaries, research notes. File 2: William McKee – General W. M. Obituary and bio 
sketch, original Memorial card for Lanier Dunn. File 3: Judge Williamson Dunn information and bio 
sketch, photo reproductions, research notes. File 4: Williamson – 1882 newspaper article about his life. 
File 5: Williamson – stock transfer record, article mentions, research notes. File 6: George G. – bio 



sketch. File 7: file copies. File 8: Lanier – correspondence and obituary. File 9: Samuel – pedigree chart, 
rev war member information. File 10: Thomas – revolutionary war veteran bio sketch. File 11: Dunn’s 
Rangers, rev war. 

Dunne (Irene) (18 files) – File 1: newspaper articles. File 2: Show Boat program cover. File 3: Ladies 
home journal soap ad, mother’s obituary, RoundAbout article. File 4: photographs from newspaper. File 
5: article about a gate donated funds, photos from newspaper. File 6: newspaper article about visit to 
Indiana. File 7: newspaper article about Irene’s family in Madison. File 8: newspaper clippings about 
films. File 9: newspaper articles, father’s death certificate, Kennedy center honor’s article, yearbook 
images. File 10: newspaper clippings. File 11: research on Irene’s life. File 12: newspaper clippings. File 
13: newspaper article about tampa air field films, 1913 Midsummer Night’s Dream production. File 14: 
article about her father, other articles. File 15: articles about films. File 16: 1931 article. File 17: articles 
about later career. File 18: early career articles. File 19: genealogy research for Irene Dunn, obituaries, 
and census records.  

Dupontavice (1 file): regarding Hippolytus, obit and lineage.  

Durie/Duree (1 file): Kentucky and Indiana branch, 1700s. 

Durrant (1 file): marriage record, George Durrant and Or(?)sua McCasland, 1838.  

Dutton (1 file): William – Will abstract. 

Dwyer (1 file): Jack – History of St. Anthony’s in China, In. 

 

E 

Eades/Eads (4 files) – File 1: Harry R. – newspaper article about song writing, song lyrics. Obituary for 
Freda Hord (nee Eades). File 2: Jonathan – Civil War record, burial information, family information, 
marriage record, correspondence. File 3: correspondence, newspaper mention about injury in war. File 
4: John W. Eads – family unit sheets for the family of Asher Bailey and Maria Louisa Coffee; census 
records; family unit sheet for the family of John W. Eads and Mary Bailey; census records.  

Eaglin (1 file): 1850 census records, correspondence from Robert Higgins, Higgins family unit and 
pedigree charts, John T. Eaglin certificate of Death, 1810 Jeff. Co. KY census records, 1860 Gallatin KY 
census records, 1870 Gallatin Co. KY census records, Glays Eaglin Obituary – 1987, article about bar fight 
and death of Si Eaglan, Eaglin marriage records Jeff. Co, Obituary for Jennie Eaglin, obituary for Estelle 
Eaglin – 1940, 1934 obituary for Thomas Eaglin, death certificate for Francis Bell – 1917, marriage 
license for Frank Beall and Mary Lee – 1867, obituary for Tobe Eaglin – 1930, obituary for Mart Eaglin – 
1923, death notice for child of Frank Eaglin – 1891, family unit sheet for Francis Bell ( Eaglin) and Polly 
Anna Kiger-Morris & marriage license, 1880 census records,  Kiger family records, ibituary for Mahalia 
Grubb – 1936, Gallatin CO. KY land records, deed and marriages,  



Earhart (2 files) – File 1: family group records. File 2: marriage record, George Earhart and Elizabeth 
Whitsitt, 1838. 

Earley (1 file): research notes. 

Eastman (1 file): William W. - correspondence, family unit sheets, burial information. 

Eaverson (1 file): Emma and Hester Ann obituaries.  

Eccles (2 files) – File 1: genealogy sketch report. File 2: family group sheets.  

 

*Eckert (10 files) – File 1: Christ – registration affidavit of alien enemy. File 2: William – biographical 
information. File 3: William D. – newspaper articles about Air Force General. File 4: Kate – registration 
affidavit of alien female. File 5: John and Serena family bible record. File 6: William D. – newspaper 
article about baseball commissioner. File 7: William D. – newspaper articles about baseball 
commissioner. File 8: Wm D. – articles about death. File 9: Henry - registration affidavit of alien enemy. 
File 10: Joe – article about copper boat models.  

Edens (1 file): Elias – Revolutionary war record.  

Edwards (2 files) – File 1: Bartholomew – will, marriage census records. File 2: Frank – article about 
Indianapolis author.  

Effinger (1 file): descendants chart. 

*Eggleston (18 files) – File 1: Edward – Madison Author newspaper articles. File 2: Edward – newspaper 
article and wife’s lineage information. File 3: Edward – newspaper article copies. File 4: Edward – 
newspaper article about author. File 5: Edward – magazine excerpt about Hoosier Schoolmaster film, 
newspaper articles about home. File 6: Edward - original short story booklet. File 7: Edward – newspaper 
articles. File 8: Edward – newspaper articles, copies. File 9: Edward – 1965 article. File 10: Edward – 
article copy. File 11: article about Judge Miles C. Eggleston. File 12: article copies. File 13: centennial of 
Edward’s birth. File 14: article about Eggleston home in Vevay. File 15: articles related to real life 
person’s characters were based on. File 16: copy of Eggleston’s book. File 17: Eggleston Family – records 
and book excerpts. File 18: Eggleston – Goode, marriage record – Samuel Goode to Eliza Ann Eggleston, 
1846. Book excerpt on Judge Miles Carey Eggleston.  

Eisan (1 file): Frances K. – Article about River Village: Gateway to the West, book. 

Elam (1 file): Charles Wheaton and Almeda “Morehead” and descendants.  

Elenbaas (1 file): Timeline for Pieter Elenbaas, and family unit sheets for his line.  

*Elliott (6 files) – File 1: family bible record, sketch for Robert Elliott Sr. of Virginia. Family unit sheets. 
File 2: reproduction photographs of Elliott men, George family connection. Descendants of William 
Elliott Sr. File 3: Elliott family story, 2007. Patton connection. File 4: Monroe Township Elliotts, Patton 



connection. Cemetery records, marriage records, obituary for Mrs. James Elliott, 1892. File 5: marriage 
record, Alexander Elliott to Esther Cunliffe, 1869. File 6: bible record, Glass and McClure connection.  

Ellington (1 file): Nelson – probate record, marriage record, census records.  

Elms (1 file): death notice of Rozie Elms, 1863. 

Elwell (2 files) – File 1: Marriage record, David Elwell to Catherine Medlock, 1824. File 2: Marriage 
record, same marriage as File 1, different record.  

Engle (1 file): Wayne – 1998 newspaper article, Courier staff receives award.  

*English (2 files) – File 1: early American bio of English family, Indiana History Bulletin cover, William 
Hayden English pictured, 1963; compiled history of the English family, William Hayden’s line. File 2: 
Joseph William and William – family unit sheets, Find a Grave pages, obituary in the Madison Courier for 
William Eastin English, Apr. 30, 1926.death notice for Joseph English (1917). 

Ennis (1 file): family unit sheets and sources, Morton family connection.  

Eppley/Epley (2 files) - File 1: correspondence, The Generations of Rogerses, Buchanans, and Andersons: 
Ancestors and Descendants of Clarence and Bess Rogers Anderson, compiled 1991. File 2: Jacob and 
William Epley census records.  

Ernst (2 files) – File 1: Fritz – original booklet of short story Small Town Boy goes away to College, 
Brunner family connection. Obituary for Anna Marie Bruner and Magdalene Ernst. Newspaper clipping 
celebrating Robert Sering Ernst’s 85th birthday, 1983. File 2: Fritz – obituary, 1959, original booklet for 
story Across the Pacific in a China Clipper, 1937. 

Etherton (1 file): 1870 census of Jefferson Co., obituary for Vernie T, 1963; obituary for Everett “Dab,” 
1965; obituary for Joseph, 1945; marriage records; obituary for Napolean B, 1893; 1860 census; 
Jeffersonville land entries;  

Ethington (1 file): family unit sheets for Theresa Ethington and Jordan Kidwell family and Ethington line.  

EuDaly (1 file): family of Isacc EuDaly and Polly Briggs, family unit sheets; Notes from Pioneer History of 
Madison aticle in newspaper, 1889; 96th birthday of Isaac article, 1887; marriage records.  

Evans (1 file): also Litchford - 1881 article about potential lynching; Mrs A. A. Evans family obituaries, 
father, son. Census records.  

Eversole (1 file): 1994 newspaper article about Darrell Eversole, Madison Cubs.  

Evertson (1 file): Lineage and Revolutionary service sheet, families: Bloom, Matthews, Phillips, Sarlis, 
Merrill nad Perry connections.  

Ewing (1 file): Ellsworth – 1995 obituary. 



 

F 

Faber (3 files) – File 1: Adam – Registration affidavit of alien enemy. File 2: Caroline - registration 
affidavit of alien female. File 3: Michael – registration affidavit of alien enemy.  

Fairfield (1 file): family bible record for family of Noah B. and Amelia (Robinson) Fairfield.  

Faith (1 file): correspondence, research notes on John and Elizabeth Faith. 

Farrell (2 files) – File 1: census records, St Patrick’s Cemetery record; death notice of Michael Farrell, 
1877; 1880 Mary Farrell census recird, 1870 Mike Farrell census record, obit, 1936 for Elizabeth Farrell; 
Obit, 1935 for J.F. Farrell; obit, 1930 for John Farrell; obit, 1935 for Margaret L. Schumacher; marriage 
record of Michael and Mary Golder, 1852; marriage record for John Schumacher and Maggie Farrell, 
1883; obit, 1966 for Edward Schumacher; death notice for Mary Farrell. File 2: copies from file 1. 

Faught (2 files) – File 1: marriage record, Sandford Faught and Nancy Salyers, 1833. File 2: 
correspondence, copies of deeds for land for Sanford and William Faught, estate of William Faught, 
research notes on Henry Faught family, Olive Branch Cemetery record, Kavenaugh cemetery record, 
marriage records.  

Faulconer (2 files) – File 1: James Faulconer and Joseph Wilkerson: American Patriots and Pioneers, 
compiled 1992. File 2: Descendants of James Faulconer, compiled 1987.  

Fearn (2 files) – File 1: George and Fearn Hill, KY – burials in Fearn Cemetery, Milton , KY; marriage 
license of Samuel Fearn and Betsy Owen, 1826; Will of George; 1867 Madison Directory for George Jr.; 
National Register of Historical Places, George Fearn House. File 2: Fearns of Hunter’s Bottom – compiled 
1992                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                         

Feeny (1 file): marriage record, Luke Feeny to Mary Coil, 1854.  

Fehr (1 file): Nicholas and Family – correspondence and research notes, Madison directory listings, 
family unit sheet, marriage record, 1872; passenger list, obit for Kathrina Fehr, 1941, Will of Nicholas 
Fehr. 

Fenton (4 files) – File 1: family unit sheet for James Fenton and Anna Margaret Turner Taylor family and 
descendants. File 2: family unit sheet for George G. Fenton and Ella/Ellen Howard. File 3: 
correspondence with research notes. File 4: marriage record for Samuel G. Fenton and Mizella Te(?)ol, 
1830; descendants of James Fenton and Anna Margaret Turner Taylor; Fenton Family Newsletter; family 
unit sheets; correspondence, 1962; obituaries.  

Ferguson (2 files) – File 1: Joel Ferguson and Mary Anne “Polly” Booth Ferguson, marriage record, 1822. 
File 2: marriage of James Albert Ferguson to Mary Ellen Anderson, 1937. Information and research 
notes. Birth certificates.   



Ferris (2 files): descendants of Jacob Ferris, obit for Mrs. Charles Ferris, 1880. File 2: History of the Gale 
H. Ferris Rare Breed Poultry Farm in Canaan, Indiana. 2006.  

Feider (1 file): German certificate, family unit sheet for Mathias Merl and Margaret Feider, family unit 
sheets for family of Gottfried Feider and Elizabeth Denzer and descendants,  

Fewell (6 files) – File 1: family unit sheets for William and Margaret Lichlyter family and descendants. 
File 2: pedigree chart for Dr. Everett Bauman Fewell and family unit sheets for ancestors, Lemen 
photograph, obituary for E. B. Fewell, 1956; census records. File 3: Spencer Fewell/Fuel census records; 
Jefferson Co., 1860 census record; obit for Mary Fewell, 1933; obituary for Russell Fewell, 1939; May E., 
1929; 1790 Kentucky census record for Spencer Fewel; possible Fewells in Virginia marriage records. File 
4: Family unit sheets for James and descendants. File 5: early family history (beginning 1660s). File 6: 
Bennett – DAR lineage inquery, family unit sheets, Sarah Fewell obituary (1891), information on Everett 
B. Fewell, obituary for Paul E. Fewell (1981), Willis Sullivan life info, land info for Willis Sullivan.  

Fielding (1 file): early American genealogy bio sketch. 

Fields (1 file): marriage record for William Fields and Laura Tapp, 1884; 1900 Soundex records for 
Stephan and John. Marriage record for John Fields and Lydia Snyder, 1858.  

Finical (1 file): family unit sheet for Samuel Finical and Harriett Ramsey, 1829; census records for Samuel 

Finley (2 Files) – File 1: Dr. John Finley family and descendants. File 2: John and Mary – book excerpt 
detailing the family and descendants of John and Mary (Caldwell) Finley of Montgomery (Wythe) 
County, Virginia.  

*Firth (1 file): William – Madisonian moved to Moberly, MO, death notice.  

Fish (2 files) – Both files different records for same marriage of George W. Fish and America Evans, 1835. 

Fisher (3 files) – File 1: marriage record for Shayler(?) Fisher and Sally Daughtery (1826). File 2: census 
records. File 3: family unit sheets.  

Fitch (4 files) – File 1: correspondence, obituaries from the Madison Courier for Jonathan Fitch, 1875 
and O. A. Fitch, 1881. File 2: census records for Levi, John, Elizabeth Fitch; cemetery records for 
Jefferson county, Fitch and Royce family; Jefferson Co. marriage records; John Fitch will and probate; 
war of 1812 pension record. File 3: Royce/Roice. File 4: Mary Meldrum – 1873 death notice.  

Fitzhenry (1 file): William – 1976 newspaper article about family land inherited.  

Fitzpatrick (1 file): marriage record for Reese Fitzpatrick and Ruth Burns, 1834.  

Fix (2 files) – File 1: marriage record for Philip Fix and Sinthia Doverty, 1824. File 2: Notes and 
Speculation on the Jacob Fix Family, 1986.  

Flanigan (1 file): newspaper article about Doni, a country musician. 2009. 



Flint (1 file): newspaper clipping 1985 and 1986 family reunions, Adolphus W. Flint and Lucy Flint 
original 1842 deed.  

Floerke (1 file): correspondence, research notes, newspaper mention of Conrad Florka. 

Flora (2 files) – File 1: 1878 newspaper mention of O. V. Flora and a Texan saddle-stirrup invention, Info 
about Herbert M. Flora and father Orlando V. Flora. File 2: Herbert M. – 1952 obituary, 1909 mention of 
artistic photographer, 1919 newspaper article about 160 boat photographs.  

Flynn (1 file): Edward J. – family uinit sheet for Edward Flynn and Sarah Jennings, research notes, 
Edward Flynn immigration record, census records, madsion courier May 20, 1874 Death of Father 
Dupontavice, Madison Daily Democrat dec. 15, 1892 Edward Flynn died this morning, Madison Weekly 
Herald Dec. 1892 funeral of Edward Flynn; St. Michael’s Church Madison Indiana 1817-1937 by Rev, 
Charles F. Walsh excerpt about Father Dupontavice. Edward Flynn civil war records,  

Fong (2 files) – File 1: Theodore C. – 1972 article about honor of 50th year in medicine. File 2: 1974 article 
about Dr. Fong retiring.  

Ford (1 file): 1952 obituary for Carolyn E. Ford; 1982 article for family reunion; family information of 
Jarrett and Abner Ford; Notes on the Warner Ford Family; The Ford Family of Kentucky and Indiana with 
side lines of Underwood, Walker, Terrell, Lee, Hunt, Drake.  

Forthofer (1 file): 1917 obituary for George; Jacob census record and Soldiers Discharge record, Jacob 
civil war service record, 1919 article regarding Quaker Maid grocers, 1917 obituary for Peter Forthofer, 
1925 obituary for Louise Forthofer, 1870 census, 1880 mention of Jacob’s son dying of scarlet fever, 
Springdale Cemetery record, obituary for Blanche Margaret, 1931, obituary for Frederick, 1922.  

Forshee (1 file): 1884 article about Thomas Forsee, Veteran of two wars.  

Foster (5 files) – File 1: 1976, 1982 family reunion newspaper articles. The Foster family with information 
about Frank Gabriel Foster, Helen, Frank G., William and Jane Bannister Foster. File 2: family of Timothy 
and Bethia Howell Foster. File 3: 1844 Probate, revolutionary war pension record, death notice for M. L. 
Foster in 1887, obituary for W. J. Foster in 1883, newspaper mentions, 1883 John Foster death notice, 
Frank Foster death notice in 1883, B. F. Foster death notice in 1887, 1840 census of Madison. File 4: 
Foster family information, Hiram and Timothy.  

Fowke (2 files) – File 1: Gerard – articles and obituary for 1933 death of archeologist. File 2: Gerard – 
original 1929 booklet about Gerard Fowke, 1961 Indiana History Bulletin. 

Fowler (2 files) – File 1: Lester – 1974 article about clockmaking. File 2: Israel – bio sketch obit about 
courthouse dome clock maker, Captain Israel Fowler.  

Fox (3 files) – File 1: (Fuchs) – family of Michael Joseph Fox; Nicholas Fox, census records and 
descendants; Paul Harold Voelz family; Clarence John Joseph Volez family; Clarence Edward Volez 



family. File 2: marriage record for David Fox and Mary Cosby, 1854. File 3: Nicholas Fox burial record, 
1850 census, will abstract, Klein family connection.  

Fraley (1 file): Joann and Cynthia – birth and death certificates, photos from online yearbooks, obituary 
for Joann Fraley.  

*Francisco (4 files) – File 1: Calvin, Henri, Solomon and Jacob life dates, short bio sketch of Henri’s 
military service. File 2: correspondence with research notes, copies of letters from Polly Francisco, 
reproduction image and info of Hiram Francisco. File 3: Hiram – short bio sketch and family information. 
File 4: obituaries for Hiram Graham Francisco, 1963; Helen Francisco, 1963; Louise Horuff, 1963, 
daughter of Judge Hiram; Alice J. Francisco, 1983; Alonzo Francisco, 1891; newspaper article, 1940, 
about fire on Francisco property.  

Freeman (1 file): marriage record for Owen Freeman and Mary James, 1835. 

French (2 files) – File 1: Andrew, Rebecca, Fred – correspondence, burial information, census records, 
death certificate for Rebecca, 1915 newspaper mention of illness for Andrew, Death certificate for 
Andrew, marriage certificate of Louis French to Mabel Phillips in 1918, 1940 census for Fred ( in state 
hospital). File 2: The American Neptune excerpt, Daniel French and the Western Steamboat Engine.  

Fresh (2 files) – File 1: family bible records for Fresh – Turner family. File 2: research notes.   

Frevert (1 file): obituary for Elizabeth, 1886; census records for Bachman family; obituary for Capt. 
James Bachman, 1884 – brother of A. L. Frevert; 1887 newspaper article about charges filed against 
Henry Frevert; Madison directory scan from 1872; 1887 directory scan; cemetery records; 1859 
directory scan; Bachman family information; James Bachman census record; death notice for Alois 
Bachman, 1860. 

Friedersdorf(f) (2 files) – File 1: family unit sheet and notes for family of Johann Peter and Anna Maria 
Schmidt, m. 1818. Newspaper article, 1900, about a letter having travelled in the mail for 27 years. 
Obituary for Charles, 1918. Obituary for Col. Louis C., 1964. File 2: family unit sheet for Johann Konrad 
and Ann Elizabeth Muth, m. 1850. Family unit sheet for Johann Ludwig (john lewis) and Mary Amelia 
Scherff, m. 1853. Family unit sheet for Frederick Sr. and Bertha Chadwick, m. 1899. Family unit sheet for 
Louis Chadwick Sr. And Adelaide Wilson Campbell, m. 1936.  

Friedly (1 file): obituary for Henry, 1877; family history starting with Jacob and Elizabeth Moyer Friedly, 
compiled 1979 

Fritzler (1 file): Fred Fritzler DAR war service record, 1920. 

Froman (1 file): DAR application for descendant of Ralph Cotton, Paul and John Froman Cotton in 
lineage.  

*Fry (1 file): descendants of William Henry Fry and Lydia Daggett Butts; document of poor child given to 
William H. Fry, 1862.  



Frye (1 file): correspondence with research notes.  

Fuele (1 file): correspondence with research notes, Mary (Polly) Fuel Pearcy. 

Fugit (2 files) – File 1: map of family relocations; genealogy of James and descendants (immigrant 
ancestor); 2004 article about surnames; bio sketch of John Fugit. File 2: family unit sheet for Jesse Fugit 
and Leah McKay; 1820 census record for S(?) Fugit; list of old settlers, James;  

Furnish (2 files) – File 1: Lacey – family and descendants of Ella Furnish and James E. Lacey. File 2: 1943 
obituary for Irvin Furnish; 1938 obituary for Mrs. Gertrude Furnish; 1938 obit for Charles Furnish; 1932 
obit for Joseph Furnish; 1938 obituary for Alice Furnish; 1939 Alma Furnish body found; 1943 obituary 
for John Furnish; 1930 obituary for Anna Furnish; 1933 obituary for Susie Furnish; 1941 obituary for 
Mary Furnish; 1916 obituary for Doretta K. Furnish; correspondence, death certificates, burial records, 
census records.  

 

G 

Gaines (1 file): S. M. – 1957 newspaper article about Rev. Gaines 42nd Anniversary; 1971 newspaper 
article about Rev. Gaines winning Community Award. 

Gale (1 file): marriage record for Michael Lay and Matilda Gale, 1877. Marriage record for Rufus Gale 
and Harriett M. Sering, 1870. 

Gallagher (1 file): correspondnace. 

Gallaway (1 file): early American family bio sketch. 

Galusha (1 file): Hiram – 1864 discharge record.  

Gans (2 files) – File 1: John – 1989 article about Gans Funeral home combining with Lytle Funeral Home; 
1925 obituary for Edward Gans; obituary for Sally A. Gans; 1969 Golden Anniversary for John and wife; 
obituary for John Gans, 1977; 1959 article about John’s businesses, Farm Boy Develops Immense 
Business in Madison. File 2: Gans/Harris – Obituary for John Gans, 1895; 1890 obituary for Sarah A. 
Gans; 1862 for William Gans and Melinda Harris. Cemetery records, census records 1850. 

Gantzscher (1 file): marriage record for (?) Gantzscher anf Sarah Ann Robbins, 1837. 

*Garber (17 files) – File 1: Bess H. – widow of M. E. Garber, obituaries for Bess Hampton, 1983. File 2: 
Michael C. – obituary, 1930; Tribute From a Friend article, 1930; obituary for Mrs. M. C. Garber, 1922. 
File 3: A special edition of the Madison Courier celebrating the sesquicentennial of the paper, May 9, 
1987. File 4: Editors and Publishers of the Courier Since 1849, three generations of Michael Garber, 1937 
Centennial edition of the Madison Courier. File 5: original 1859 letter to Fanny Garber from Peter Schell; 
info on Joseph Siddall; 2004 article about Garber/Bright quarrel. File 6: 1949 article, Biography of M. C. 
Garber; The Compendium of American Genealogy excerpt, Garber Sr.; timeline of Madison Courier; 



Other Papers Failed To Survive in Madison, article. File 7: 1913 bio sketch of M. C. Sr. File 8: M. E. Garber 
– 1964 article about Garber Scholarship. File 9: Michael C. – death announcement of M. C. Sr., 1887 
article about Courier’s Golden Jubilee. File 10: Bess H – 1978 article, celebrating her 100th birthday. File 
11: bio sketch of Christian Garber. File 12: Ellen Schell – Original Book, The Ancestry of Ellen Schell 
Garber, 1898. File 13: obituaries for Col. Michael Christian Garber. File 14: 1894 obituary for Christian 
Garber, brother of Michael C. Sr. File 15: Elizabeth M. – daughter of Col. M. C. Garber, timeline, and 
obituary. File 16: Michael C. – 1924 M. C. Garber retires from the paper, two articles. And article about 
Col. Michael C. Garber, 1900. File 17: services for Col. Michael Garber.  

Gardiner (1 file) – marriage record, James Gardiner to Anna L. Thornton, 1840.  

Gardner (4 files) – File 1: Loretta M. – 2011 funeral service card. File 2: Gardner Family bible records, 
Samuel P. Gardner and Lydda Tower, m. 1810 and family. File 3: Worden family history over 300 years in 
America, Mitchell and Garnder family connections. File 4: Lloyd – obituary (1980).  

Garlinghouse (1 file): 1885 obituary for G. H. Garlinghouse; George B. Garlinghouse family information 
for Rev. War ancestor; correspondence with research notes, Ashley family connection; reproduction 
image of Fred Bartlet Garlinghouse; gravestone images; funeral announcement for Mary Elizabeth 
Garlinghouse, wife of John Francis Oscar Garlinghouse; reproduction images;1850 census records. 

Garrison (1 file): marriage record, (?)athan Garrison to Emily Haankin (1838). 

Garritt (1 file): original pamphlet for the John Finley Crowe and Joshua Bolles Garritt House. Garrett 
family history table of contents.  

Garrity (1 file): Jefferson Co. marriage record, 1888 newspaper announcement for funeral of Ellen 
Geraghty; 1887 death announcement of Martin Garrity; auction announcement for Martin Gerahty, 
1880; 1870 census for Edward Gerrity; 1870 death announcement of John Garrity; Fairmount Cemetery 
records; St. Partrick’s cemetery records. 

Garry (1 file): St. Joseph’s cemetery records; 1954 funeral service announcement for Caroline Garry; 
obituary for Michael Garry, 1959. 

Gasaway (1 file): life information of Nicholas, b. 1806. 

Gaul (1 file): 1860 census; correspondence; Marriage record for Henry and William Gaul; 1866 article 
about an accidental death – Christian Gaul, leader of the brass band; marriage record for Catherine 
Gaul. 

Gautier (2 files) – File 1: 1967 obituary for Charles W. Gautier; 1958 services for Martha Gautier; 
correspondence. File 2: 1986 correspondence with information on Gautier family in Germany; 1984 
lecture given to the Genealogy Club of the Long Island Historical Society, letters from Jalal Gohari. 

*Gavin (5 files) – File 1: newspaper article, 1920, about ‘oriental’ dance performance; 1986 obituary for 
Bob Harmon; program for Katcha-Koo: An Oriental American Fantastique, 1920; List of St. Patrick 



parishioners; repro. Image of Thomas Gavin; newspaper article, 1984, about Dennis Harmon outstanding 
employee honor by governor of Florida; Arthur Wilson obituaries, 1984; 1928 article about steamboat the 
Hattie Brown; Madison High School three act play program, 1915; photo of painting given to Hanover by 
Helen Gavin Wilson, painted by William Snyder; 1939 article from the Madison Courier about Thomas 
Gavin. File 2: bio sketch of Thomas M. Gavin; descendants of John and Bridget Gavin. File 3: obituary, 
1980, for Helen Gavin Wilson; image reproduction of Madison women on the steps of the Jefferson County 
Historical Society. File 4: copies of photographs: Mike Gavin, Andrew Gavin, William Clay and Mary and 
Ella Gavin. File 5: image copies of Thomas Gavin as a young man, and old with wife; Land-Dunn wedding 
announcement.  

Gavitt (1 file): 1897 obituaries for Marcus Aurelius Gavitt. 

Gebest (1 file): newspaper statement about Charles going to work in the circus, 1892; reproduction photo 
of Charles Gebest; newspaper article about fire averted at Gebest Hotel, 1913. 

Gehl (1 file): descendants of Peter Stephan and Margathe Appel, Bodem and Gehl connections. 

Genter (1 file): funeral announcement and obituary for Francis X. Genter, 1913; 1887 newspaper mention 
for Prof. Mas Genter; death of Emma Genter, 1920; copy of letter verifying identity of Louis F Genter, 
dated 1943; research notes; 1883 death of child, Charles Genter; St Josephs cemetery records; census 
records; 1879 Madison Directory; obituary for Fred Gewnter, 1939. 

Geile (1 file): Amelia – 1891 obituary. 

Geisler (2 files) – File 1: 1983 family reunion announcement, held at JPG. File 2: pedigree chart for Charles 
Geisler and descendants; German Geislers of Oberschopfheim family and descendants, image of Ignatius 
and Elizabeth Halpin Geisler; Death of George Geisler, 1907, and wife, 1908; family unit sheets. 

Gentry (1 file): 1897 newspaper articles about Prof. Gentry, animal trainer and exhibition. 1985 article 
about musical duo, Roy and Becky. 

*George (6 files) – File 1: family unit sheets for Thomas George and Betty Wren and descendants, Spann 
and Smith family; Humphrey and Samantha George Brooks bio, with image copies. Biography of Spann 
Family.  File 2: The Brooks family with Vernon connection includes family unit sheets. File 3: George 
Family Record, 1934. File 4: DAR application for Edmona George Hitz, descendant of Thomas George. 
File 5: John – letter from Kathryn Steinherser Gahan, 1985. File 6: Milton – page 2 of a letter by C.H. 
George about his grandfather Milton George.  

Gerber (1 file): 1912 newspaper article memorial to Lt. Col. John Gerber; death of Sam Gerber, 1913. 

Gerdes (2 files) - Clemens F. - registration affidavit of alien enemy. File 2: Emma L: registration affidavit 
of alien female. 

Gerrard (1 file): early American genealogy. 



Gertz (1 file): descendants of Charles August Gertz.  

Geisler (1 file): correspondence, newspaper mentions, directory entries, research notes, family unit 
sheet for George Giesler and Elanora Granner, marriage record and census records in JCPL collections. 

Geyman (2 files) – File 1: Paul – 1987 newspaper article about Paul, a man with a rare blood disease. File 
2: 50th wedding anniversary invitation for Roy and Lucille Geyman, 1993; copy of marriage certificate for 
Allie Geyman and Agnes M. Jacobs, 1911; reproduction photographs from St. Anthony’s cemetery in 
China, Indiana; family unit sheets for Joseph Geiman (geyman) and (?) Franzika, and descendants.  

Giboney (1 file): correspondence and research notes. 

Gibson (2 files): John (1740 – 1822) – 1822 obituary for General John Gibson, died in Pittsburgh. Indiana 
Magazine of History entries. File 2: more on John.  

Gifford (1 file): early American genealogy bio sketch. 

Gilchrist (1 file): The James Gilchrist and Mary Anderson Family. Anderson and Park family connections.  

Gilles (1 file): descendants of Peter Gilles and Catherine Raffauf. 

Gillespie (1 file): early American genealogy. 

Gilligan (1 file): 1880 census record for John Gilliagan. Mary Gilligan obituary, 1929; Madison directory 
entry. 

Gilpin (1 file): Samuel Nelson and family – family unit sheet for Samuel Nelson Gilpin and Mary Thomas, 
Family unit sheet for Rev Thomas Ebenezer Thomas and Elizabeth Robinson; family unit sheet for Curtis 
Gilpin and Huldah Higbee. 

Ginn (1 file): family unit sheet for John J. Green and Nancy Yarber, James Ginn family and bio sketch. 

Girty (1 file): Simon – booklet entitle, GIRTY: The White Indian, 1955. 

*Glass (3 files) – File 1: bio sketch of Glass family, Samuel and Mary Gamble and descendants; body of 
Louis Glass buried in Springdale Cemetery’ death of Lt. Col. Jacob Glass, 1865; 1886 newspaper blub 
about Fred Glass’s candy making, containing no gum; 1920 Frederick Glass obituary; 1880 Fredrick Glass 
obituary; Bob Glass honor for community service, 1993. File 2: George – Article about George Glass and 
murder trial, a man killed for praising Jefferson Davis in 1881.  

Glauber (1 file): 1892 obituary for Mary Glauber; 1914 obituary for A. C. Glauber; 1938 obituary for 
Albert W. Glauber; marriage license for Albert Glauber and Mabel Stottlebower, 1914;1868 marriage 
record for Matthias Glauber and Anna Kirchner. 

Glazier (1 file): Jacob – 1885 sudden death of Jacob J Glazier.  



Glenn (2 files) – File 1: descendants of David Glenn. File 2: 1926 article about scotch tapestry makers, 
referecing Thomas Cranston. marriage record of Thomas Cranston and Annie Glenn, March 7, 1867. The 
Glenn Family sketch. Shelby Twp. Land plat sketch. 

Glick (3 files) – File 1: Descendants of Johannes and Magdelena Glick 1749 – 1982, with Guthrie family 
insert. File 2: Genealogy of the Glick Family, published and copied 1918 by George H Glick. File 3: 
correspondence and research. 

Goebel (2 files) – File 1: article about the car accident and deaths of Billy Joe Shelly and Jane Marie 
Goebel, Feb 5, 1972. Obituaries. File 2: William Goebel descendants, obituary for William H Goebel, nov 
22, 1921; obituary for Helen Birck Goebel, July 30, 1953; obit for john Goebel nov 9, 1990; Drowning of 
William A Goebel Sr. Dec 1, 1981. 

Goese (1 file): correspondence and research regarding Johann F. Wilhelm Giese/Goese.  

Golda (1 file): Golda – Ringwalt, marriage record for Lewis Golda and Elisabeth Ringwalt, 1854. 

Golden (2 files) – File 1: family unit sheets for James a Golden and Anna Laura David. File 2: John M. – 
career info and obituary.  

Goldsborough (1 file): descendants of Mark Harmon Goldborough. 

*Goley (1 file): descendants of Fred and Mary Goley,  

Goode (2 files) – File 1: Rev. Wm. H. – Dec 22, 1879 death notice in paper. File 2: Nov 7, 1909 life sketch 
and genealogy of Dr S.M. Goode, son of Sarah Grover Paul and S.M. Goode Sr.  

Goodlove (1 file): marriage record for Joseph Goodlaw and Margaret H Miller, Feb 1836. 

Goodman (1 file): Deacon – original January 14, 1870 letter for the courier 

*Gordon (2 files) – File 1: descendants of William and Anna Pyon Warfield Gordon, probate information, 
obituaries for Robert Gordon, 1977; Lawrence Gordon, 1915; Valeria Gordon, 1990; Elizabeth Short 
Gordon, 1893; May Gordon, 1938Mrs Louis Gordon, nd. File 2: correspondence and research.  

Gorgas (3 files) – File 1: Joseph R. – family unit sheet and obituary, death certificate, 1871 directory 
listing for Gorgas photography. File 2: 1899 article about commission by Drusilla Cravens, excerpts bio 
sketches. File 3: Gorgas – Swormstadt marriage, Ferdinand Gorgas and Anna Swormstadt in 1858. 

Gossman (1 file): Family bible records – family of Frederick and Pearl Finley Gossman. 

Goth (1 file): Benjamin – 1942 article about Rivermen Society membership 

Gourley (3 files) – File 1: Helen – 1979 obituary and article about Who’s Who in American Women. File 2: 
descendancy chart, obituary for George D. Golay, 1881; obituary for Herbert Gourley, 1936; obituary for 
Clarence H. Gourley, 1938; obituary for Rachel Buck Gourley, 1949. Fout family connection, obituary for 
John Fout, 1917; obituary for Jacob Fouts, 1881; obituary for Alonzo Fouts, 1882; death notice for Bina 



Fouts, no date. File 3: Golay, Gorley, Goley – Marriage record for Clarence Gourley to Regina Fout, 1876; 
death notice for Clarence Golay, 1899. 

Gow (1 file):descendancy chart beginning with Peter Gow, 1792; census records. 

Grace (1 file): obituary for George Grace, 1912; marriage record for James Grace to Eliza Davidson, 1865; 
census records; funeral notice for Nelson K. Grace, 1920; death notice for Mrs. Fred Grace, 1913;  

*Graham (5 files) – File 1: Correspondence, Known Descendants of John Graham (b. 1784), death of 
Alexander Graham, 1908, in memoriam for Mrs. Mary H. Graham, no date; Griffin and Rogers family line 
(from family bible). File 2: Graston/Graham – pedigree chart James M. Graham and Helen Joyce More, 
George W. Graston bio sketch. File 3: death of Major Thomas Graham, 1901; Philips family connection, 
will for Nadine Bradley Phillips, Francis Graham bio sketch, small family bible records. File 4: obituary for 
A. M. Graham, 1948; Major Thomas Graham bio, William Peyton Graham, Death notice, 1885; Dr. Alois 
Graham article about gut health. File 5: James – In Honor of James Graham: Memorial Day Celebration 
at Lancaster, no date.  

Graley/Greely (2 files) – File 1: correspondence; the Graly Family of Galway, Ireland – Madison, In and 
Hannibal, Ms. 1852 naturalization record for John Graley. File 2: excerpt from The Famine Immigrants; 
1865 newspaper mention of Michael Graley; obituary for Michael Graley, 1927; marriage record of 
Jefferson county for Carl Dielenheim to Kate Greeley, obituary for Kate Dielenheim.  

Graves (2 files) – File 1: The Graves Family compiled by Jim Graves (2 copies). File 2: Eber and Martha 
Custer – Arnold Custer information, Article on a pioneer reminiscence (April 15, 1913), Custer family 
information, Eber Graves census records. 

Gray (10 files) – File 1: Gray Family History, starting with James Powell (d. 1816); census records, no 
date; Gen T. Gray obituary, 1922; correspondence, property of Elijah Gray to Mordecai Brooley, 1835. 
File 2: Andy – newspaper article about raising tulips, 1980. File 3: Eliza – death of Eliza Gray at age 100, 
1949. File 4: Lorraine Brooks Gray – Mrs. Harrold Gray newspaper article has 2.559 dolls, no date; Dr 
Whitsitt death at age 90, 1962. File 5: Lorraine Brooks – copy of article about dolls. File 6: Gray – Griffin 
marriage records: Moses Griffin and Julia Gray, 1839. File 7: Robert and family – correspondence, family 
ground sheet for Robert Gray and Dorothy Study; Robert (son) dies in car crash, age 16, 1969; Robert 
(father) obituary, 2012; marriage record for Larry Hardman and Tracy Gray, 2005. File 8: Gray – Stout 
family: The Long Gray Line, research aid; family bible records. File 9: My Family Tree by Mary Ellen Gray, 
1984. File 10: James – family unit sheet.  

Grayson (4 files) – File 1: Andrew Jackson (Alias Phelix Adair): A bio sketch, A.J.Grayson obituary1913; 
article from 1913, The Lt. Last Unfinished Letter. File 2: John – obituary, 1882; small bio sketch of Mrs. 
Permelia Grayson. File 3: 1897 article on the Grayson – Winnifeld marriage; Matilda Grayson obituary, 
1899; 1915 Mr. S. Grayson leaves employment of 63 years to move to Ill; birthday of Salathel Grayson, 
1907. File 4: article, Reminiscences of Hon. Joseph G. Marshall, no date; The Old Sexton Death of Father 
John Grayson, no date.  



Grebe (2 files) – File 1: four generations to honor the 94th birthday of Ellen Grebe, 1983; obituary for 
John F. Grebe, 1887; census records; 1877 newspaper mention of the death of Mrs. Jacob Grebe, 
daughter of one of the first Swiss settlers in Switz. Co. 1877, death of Mary A. Grebe; 1881, death of 
Jacob Grebe; 1870 death of Charles Grebe; death of John Buehler, 1862; obituary of Jacob Grebe, 1881; 
will and cemetery records. 

Green (7 files) – File 1:  descendants of Arthur Green. File 2: Green Family History. File 3: Green – Barns 
Marriage record for James H. Green and Emily Barnes, 1847; Copied from the Green Family Quarterly, 
1991; death certificate for Adolphus Ulysis Green; The family of Soverign Green and the family of David 
M. Munns. File 3: family unit sheets for the family of George Albert Green, John David Green and Rachel 
Gertrude Horton; Jefferson County records, death certificate Francis Green, Carl Green obituary, no 
date; Francis Green obituary and photo of gravestone; Death Certificate for John David Green; photo 
reproductions; information about the crash that killed John and Rachel Green; gravestone photos for 
their children and obituaries. File 4: Green-Law marriage record for John Green and Cloe Law, 1825. 
1880 article about a surprise party for the 79th birthday of Mrs. David Green; Green Family reunion 
article, 1983. File 5: Green/Yarber – family unit sheet for John J Green and Nancy Yarber. File 6: family 
unit sheets; death certificate for Corda Wiseman; death certificate for Willard Wiseman; 1896 marriage 
record for Willard and Cords; photo reproductions from their wedding and them later in life; articles of 
anniversary celebrations; obituaries; marriage record for David Wiseman and Alice Buskirk, 1877; family 
bible scans. File 5: obituary of Adolphus Ulysis Green, no date; descendants of Fredrick Green; will of 
Henry Green, 1748 from Lunenburg County in Virginia. File 6: descendants of Fredrick Green. File 7: 
Green, Storm, Loos families – correspondence with family information, obituary for Mary L. Green, 
1971; obituary for Martha Loos, 1987; death notice of Lena Storm, 2002; obituary for Charles Loos, 
2997; marriage record for John Robert Green and Mary Lenfestey. 

Gregory (1 file): descendants of Jesse Gregory (b.1795) 

Greiner (1 file): obituary of W. A. Greiner, 1954;  

Greyble/Grayble (2 files) – File 1: John – newspaper article (1900) Indiana’s Oldest Veteran Soldier, 1877 
wedding announcement, Joseph Emmerson and Florence Greyble. File 2: Lambert – obituary for civil war 
vet.  

Griffen (1 file): William – 1879 obituary 

Griffin (5 files) – File 1: Descendants of Ralph Griffin. File 2: William – photograph reproduction and 
family info. File 3: Griffen, Rogers and Graham family descendants. File 4: Griffin – Taylor marriage 
record for James A. Griffin and Paurina Jane Taylor, 1838. File 5: except from The History of Jefferson 
County about Ralph Griffin, Ralph Griffin’s will, 1838; death certificate of James Griffin, 1900 

*Griffith (3 file) - File 1: obituaries for Francis Marion Griffith, no date; DAR application for Stella Griffith 
Brown related to William Griffith. File 2: Joshua – bio sketch of the life of Elder Joshua D. Griffith from 
the Minute of Long Run Assoc. in 1893. File 3: Dr. Martha Hutchings – newspaper article about a 1996 
portrayal of Dr. Hutchings Griffith; excerpt from a book on Montgomery Co., Ind. About the first female 



doctor in Indiana (from Jefferson County); 1924 newspaper article about the doctor; 1924 obituary of 
Martha Hutchings Griffith. 

Grinstead (1 file): 1921 correspondence, xeroxed obituaries with no dates, bio sketch of Richard 
Grinstead (b.1788), The Grinstead Family beginning with William Grinstead (b.1656). 

Grossman (1 file): Jefferson County marriage records, burial announcement for John Grossman, 1900; 
death announcement for George Grossman, 1889; obituary for Samuel W. Grossman, 1920; 1880 census 
record. 

 *Grover (2 files) – File 1: original 1859 document, maybe a will of James Grover. File 2: correspondence, 
funeral announcement for Mrs. James E. Harris, 1926; obituary for Letitia D. Grover, no date; The Grover 
Family history.  

Gudgel,Gudgell (2 file): marriage record for Preston Gudgel and America Blake, 1834. File 2: obituary for 
Mrs. T. L. Moberly, 1966; The Grudgel Story, 1985; The Grudgel Family beginning with Harvey Grudgel 
(b.1823). 

Guerich/Guerick (2 files) -File 1: family member information, from family bible scans. File 2: obituary for 
Joseph G. Guerich, 1981; census information, obituary for Louis Gerrick, 1890; Jefferson County 
marriage for John Wilde to Rosa Guerich, 1885. 

Guerin (1 file): Mother Theodore: newspaper article about Catholic nun, 2007. 

Gulde (1 file): 1900 plat map scan, census information.                                                                          

*Gullion (1 file): correspondence, 1971 

*Guthrie (6 files) – File 1: family bible records. File 2: William A. – senator, obituary, 1936; bio sketch. 
File 3: Sarah L. – Newspaper article, 1938. File 4: Sarah L. – copy of file 3. File 5: William A. – article about 
a celebratory dinner, no date; newspaper article about nature study club receiving land for a sanctuary, 
no date. File 6: book excerpt about the Guthrie Trail; article series Auld Lang Syne, Madisonians of Sixty 
Years Ago, 1896; Tells of Senator Guthrie, 1948.  

Guthneck (1 File): Michael L. – reverend, book excerpt, Catholic Church in Indiana 

 

H 

Haack (1 file): cemetery records of Jefferson County. 

Haas (1 file): death notice of Major Jacob Haas, 1850. 

Habersham (1 file): early American genealogy bio sketch. 



Hackney (1 file): Allen – Madison born artist to help establish scholarship at Indiana State University, 
1972. 

Hagadon/Hagadorn (2 files) – File 1: fatal explosion news article, 1863 – killed Lewis Hagardorn; census 
records; marriage record for James (?)dall and Eliza Jane Haughridge, 1834. File 2: Carl Hagadorn 
Louisiana recipt; life info of Lewis Hagadorn and infor about the mill where he was killed; marriage 
record for Harry Hagedon and Theresa Wehuer, 1876; marriage record for Edward Hagedon and Katie 
M(?)dorff, 1882; marriage record for William Hagedon and Lizzie Curtis, 1873; marriage record for 
Charles Hagedon and Amelia Thurner, 1877; William L. Hagedon life info in excerpt of The Furniture 
Manufacturer and Artisan; Descendants of Minnie C. Hagedon; death certificate for Michael Cain; article 
about the death of Michael Cain, no date; death certificate for Johannah Schultz; marriage record for 
Adolph Schultz and Anna Folker, 1864; naturalization record for Adolph Schultz, 1868. 

Haggard (1 file): descendants of Edward Haggard; revolutionary war soldier, William Haggard. 

Haigh (1 file): obituary for Sidney E. Haigh, 1899; original business card. 

Hale (3 files) – File 1: Abel B. – citizens sign to allow Abel Hale to have a grocery store. File 2: research 
notes. File 3: Sara Josepha – poet of “Mary Had A Little Lamb”, life information 

Hall (12 files) – File 1: Martha – article about Martha Hall, president of the White Star bus line that went 
from Madison to Indy. File 2: marriage record for Albert Hall to Elizabeth McKinley, 1835. File 3: 
descendant bio sketches. File 4: correspondence and research notes for Wesley Charles Hall. File 5: Hall 
and Roseberry and related Families, descendants of Thomas Roseberry (b. 1752). File 6: Jerome – 
envelope with two original photos, and baby announcement, envelope is C/O White Star Bus Line; two 
applications for renewal of firearm license. File 7: family research notes, beginning with John Hall (b. 
1781). File 8: William – Rev. War pension application. File 9: list of Hall brides and grooms. File 10: The 
Hall Tree, descendants. File 11: William Hall Family and descendants.  

*Hallgarth (1 file): Joseph and Melinda Hallgarth descendants.  

*Hamilton (2 files) – File 1: Pauline – obituary for Mrs. Guy Hamilton, 1937. File 2: census records, 
research notes; descendants of Silas Hamilton (b. 1794). 

*Hammond (3 files) – File 1: Samuel Hammon and Mary Jane Roberts – marriage in 1864. File 2: 
Hammond Family Ancestors, starting with Colby Hammond (b. 1806); Descendants of William Hammond 
(d. 1632). File 3: Hammond, Green, Hinton – research notes, correspondence, death notice for Mrs. 
Johnathan Hammonds, 1893; census records, family unit sheets.  

Hampton (2 files) – File 1: Mark – Ex-Hoosier Decorating White House, 1977. File 2: Hampton – Willis 
marriage record for Nancy Willis to William Hampton, 1834.  

Handlon (1 file): Handlon Family Line of Jeremiah Darby Handlon (b. 1765). 



Hankins (5 files) – File 1: obituary for Francis Hankins, 1932; obit. For Louis A Hankins, 1927; census 
records. File 2: research notes, family unit sheets, correspondence. File 3: Joseph and allied families: 
Cain, McCarty, Peak – descendants beginning with Lavinia Barnes and George Grove (1793), family unit 
sheets, research notes, bio sketch of Joseph Hankins. File 4: Joseph Hankins Family. File 5: Hankins – 
Hawkins – marriage record for Reese Hawkins to Bertie Leonhard, 1906; obituary for Bertie Hawkins, 
1954; obituary for Reese Hawkins, 1964; obituary for Joseph Hawkins, 1928; Death od Charles Hankins, 
1927; census records. 

Hanly (1 file): J. Frank – newspaper article about Governor J. Frank Hanly. 

Hardenbrook (1 file): Louis – obituary for Louis H. Hardenbrook, 1864 (Civil War death); photo 
reproduction; letter written by Louis’ father, Lewis.  

Harding (1 file): marriage record for Samuel J. Harding and Scynthia Warfield. 

Hargan (1 file): James – excerpt from Memoirs of the Lower Ohio Valley Vol 1 about James Hargan, 
business man from Ireland lived in Madison; published haiku by James Hargan.  

Harger (1 file): correspondence, family unit sheets, census records. 

Harman (1 file): obituary for Frank H. Harman, 1937, death certificate.  

Hardy (5 files) – File 1: allied families: Shephard, Graves, Arbuckle, Pierce, Boles – death of Himes Hardy, 
1924; obituary for Dallas Hardy, 1996; census records, obit. For Julia Hardy, 1932; Barnes Cemetery 
records, obit. For Jonathan Herschell Hardy, 1898. File 2: Hardy Family by John A. Hardy, 1942. File 3: 
obituary for James A. Hardy, 1919; life info. File 4: articles about the family and religion, 1983; obituary 
for Claude Hardy, 1983. File 5: article about Claude Hardy, 1983; Elizabeth Hardy Memoirs article, 1983; 
Willie M. Hardy obituary, 1984.  

*Harper (11 files) – File 1: stained glass depicting names: William Franklin (b. 1796), Rachel, Emma Kate, 
Jane C. Miller, Frederick Harper; 1899 Golden Wedding Anniversary article; Died Frederick, son of 
Frederick and Emily Harper, no date. Marriage announcement Fred Harper and Emily Garner, 1849. 
Family unit sheets, obituary for Nicholas Harper, 1947; obit. For Florence Harper, 1947; family research 
notes, Robert R. Rea obituary, 1956; obituary for Laura Rea, 1959; William Franklin Rea obituary, 1887. 
Obituary for Nellie Harper, Jefferson County librarian, 1938; Rea- Harper wedding article, 1881; Emily 
Rea obituary, 1889; death of Frank Harper, 1923; obituary for Emily Garner Harper, 1912; obituary for 
Elizabeth Rea, 1933. File 2: J. E. C. F. and Other Harpers, newspaper article 1970 (John Edward Collinson 
Franklin – d. 1917). File 3: family records for the Harper beginning with William Harper (b. 1741 in 
England). File 4: John Harper, sign painter, is drowned in Ohio River, 1957; obituary for Ellen G. Bagley, 
1979; family records; obituary for City Clerk-Treasurer, George F. Harper, 1928. File 5:  research notes, 
family unit sheets, correspondence. File 6: scans of handwritten history of the Harper – Gardner family. 
File 7: Harper genealogy beginning with Samuel Harper (b.1700). family bible records, Harper-Garner 
family genealogy. File 8: Frevert and Bear family connections, various obituaries. File 9: original 1867 
note, obituary for JECF Harper. File 10: receipt from Jeff. Co. Asylum for the Harper Wholesale druggist.  



File 11: correspondence and obituary for Delia C. P. Stodghill, no date; obituary for W. R. Johnson, no 
date.  

Harr (1 file): Oldest Active Barber, 1937.  

Harrell (4 files) – File 1: copies of The Harrell Family legacy, newsletter. File 2: obituary for Josephine B. 
Harrell, 1855; obituary for Alfred De Harrell, 1910; obituary for Noah Harrell, 1937; cemetery records, 
census records. File 3: The Harrell/Voris Story booklet. File 4: newspaper clipping 1984 Golden Wedding 
Anniversary for Margaret Jean and Joseph Emmerson Harrell; The Harrell Family Legacy copy.  

Harris (7 files) – File 1: from The Sun paper, 1915 – American False Estimates of Greatness by Frank 
Harris. File 2: correspondence with research notes. File 3: Chapman – excerpt from “The Negro in 
Indiana;” newspaper mention celebrating his 80th birthday, 1882; article about an interracial marriage, 
1884; Courier Journal (Louisville, KY) newspaper mention, 1854; The Underground Railway – William 
Wesley Woollen’s Recollections  of Chapman Harris – The Rugged Justice that was Meted out to a 
colored traitor, 1880; Brave Chapman Harris – A Negro Hero of the Old Days of Slavery, no date; 1968 
newspaper article; obituary for Rev. Chapman Harris, 1890. File 3: Chapman Harris Family – family unit 
sheet, death certificates, 1903; census records, marriage record for youngest son, David Evans Harris. 
File 4: Chapman – 1882 newspaper clipping, “Letters from The People;” obituary for Patsy Ann Harris, 
1881; Charles Harris (son) had leg crushed, 1867; 1879 newspaper mention of Chapman’s mare; 
newspaper article recollecting the underground railroad, 1880. File 5: Charles Walker Harris – family unit 
sheet, marriage record, Liberty, Texas connection, death certificate, census records. File 6: The 
Underground Railway – William Wesley Woollen’s Recollections of Chapman Harris – The Rugged Justice 
that was Meted out to a colored traitor, 1880 with mentions of Charley; obituary, 1919. File 7: Harry M. 
– 1965, book on sale, former resident of Madison.  

*Harrison (19 files) – File 1: Benjamin – President Benjamin Harrison and Our Country’s Flag booklet, 
1953. File 2: Benjamin – booklet “Mrs. Benjamin Harrison: The First President-General of the National 
Society of the Daughters of the American Revolution, 1908; newspaper clipping “Hoosier Passion for 
Politics Produced National Leaders,” no date. File 3: newspaper article, “Benjamin Harrison: Indiana’s 
Forgotten First Son” no date. File 4: Christopher – First Lt. Governor of Indiana from Madison, 1964; 
Distinguished Men of the County, no date. File 5: Christopher – Baltimore Royal Marital Sensations 
Anew, by Robert Lee Williamson, no date. File 6: Christopher – Newspaper article, “Harrison settled on 
bluff now Hanover in 1808” 1987. File 7: Christopher – research notes. File 8: Indiana Magazine of 
History, June 1920 article about Christopher Harrison. File 9: Christopher – bio sketch, correspondence, 
newspaper article, no date by George S. Cottman about Christopher Harrison “The Hermit of the Ohio;” 
New York Herald Tribune Books, 1937 clipping “No Hearts to Break” by Susan Ertz, talks about the 
history of Christopher Harrison. File 10: Christopher – copy of letter by Christopher Harrison about Lot 
78 in Madison given by John Dunn in 1815, written Jan. 25th, 1821. File 11: Christopher – Logan Point 
written by George S. Cottman in Indianapolis News, no date. File 12: Christopher – Biographical and 
historical info. File 13: Harrison Family – letter to Miss Cravens, 1930, about Benjamin Harrison. File 13: 
Harrison Family – letter to Miss Cravens, 1930. File 14: 1926 letter to Miss Cravens. File 15: William 
Henry – 1941 newspaper article “Indiana’s First Hero Inaugurated President” File 16: William Henry – 



Indiana Heroes for Young Hoosiers article, no date; newspaper clipping”Just two descendants attend 
reunion”, 1987. File 17: Indiana Heroes for Young Hoosiers article, no date about William Henry 
Harrison. File 18: newspaper article “William Henry Harrison Lives Again in Biography,” no date.  

*Harsin (1 file): coat of arms, family info and descendants.  

Hart (1 file): newspaper article about the death of Frederick Schober, husband of Phenie Hart, no date. 
1868 newspaper mention of the funeral of Capt. John Hart. Excerpt from “The Ralph and Edward Hart 
Family.” Family bible records. John Hart married Sarah Reeves, 1843.  

Hartwell (1 file): marriage record for Lewis Hartwell and Nancy Earhart, 1838. 

Harvie (1 file): American Genealogy history Biography. 

*Haskell (1 file): obituary for Hunnewell Haskell, 1892. Newspaper article about the death of Hunniwell 
Haskell. The Haskell Family history. Genealogy of John Fritzler for SAR.  

Haumesser (1 file): 1973 Courier article about the Haumesser family. 1978 article about the family.  

Havey (1 File): 1885 newspaper mention of John Havey stricken with paralysis. The next day an article 
mentioning he passed away. 1911 obituary for Mrs. Sarah Havey. Obituary for Kate Schuler, 1945. 
Newspaper article about a fire at the Millar Saddletree Factory, 1897. Obituary for William Havey Sr., 
1927. Obituary for Henry Havey, 1918. 

Hawkins (1 file): Reese – obituary for Reese, 1964. Obituary for Bertie Hawkins, 1954.  

Hay (1 file): descendants of Robert Hay (b. about 1742) 

Haycox (1 file): family chart beginning with Thomas Haycox (b. 1815) 

Hayden (1 file): research notes, census records, 1867 newspaper mention of the death of John Hayden.  

Hays/Hayes (6 files) – File 1: Samuel – raubach-pierce family chart, family unit sheet for Samuel Hays 
and Bridget or Biddie Thompson, bio sketch for Samuel Hays, Esq. File 2: Jefferson County marriage, 
newspaper article for Greenberry Hays post mortem examination, 1883. Brushy Fork Cemetery record. 
File 3: John Jacob – The First Known Jewish Resident of Fort Wayne by Joseph Levine booklet, 
newspaper clipping about Anne Hay of Scott County and her coverlets, 1922. File 4: correspondence and 
research notes, resources. File 5: mortuary newspaper mention of  Greensburg Hays 1883; Baxter Family 
connection, Gelvin Family connection, census records, Jefferson County cemetery and marriage records.  

*Haynes (1 file): Thomas Jefferson Haynes – Cynthia Wheeler: genealogical data (Parents and daughter 
died in the cholera epidemic of 1849 in Ripley County. 

Hazel (1 file): pension affidavit for Indian Wars for John A. C. Hazel. 

Heath (3 files) – File 1: family unit sheets for the family of John Heath (d. 1825). File 2: Heath – Sheets – 
Brooks: for the family of William Heath (b.1835); family unit sheets. File 3: descendants of Samuel Heath 



(b. 1762); pension for Francis A. Heath, 1899 for the Civil War; Kansas Probate affidavit for Virginia A. 
Heath; will of William Heath; Oath of Identity for Hiram Heath for the Civil War.  

Heazlitt (1 file): John Wilbur – hospital birth certificate. 

Heberhart (2 files) – File 1: Charles E. – obituary for Charles E. Heberhart, 1943. File 2: F. C. – William E. 
Heberhart at the Mission Inn in Riverside, CA, 1912; obituary for William G. Heberhart, 1932; copy of 
original patent for improved meat chopper by F.C. Heberhart, 1862.  

Heck (1 file): Conrad – funeral services for Anna E. Heck, 1926; China Cemetery records, pedigree chart 
for Richard Tevis Heck (b. 1924); Who’s Who in the Midwest – Richard T. Heck bio sketch; obituary for 
Conrad Heck, 1936; obituary for John H. Heck, 1908; Heck – Tevis marriage notice, no date; Ruth Irwin 
and Richard Heck marriage in the paper; Conrad Heck and Annie Richert marriage in the paper, 1891; 
1891 mention of Cooney Heck and bride. Bio sketch of John Richert; registration affidavit of alien female 
for Anna Heck; Registration affidavit of alien enemy for Conrad Heck; 1891 obituary for millionaire 
brewer Frank Fehr; obituary for Katie Heck; obituary for Jacob Heck, 1951; death certificate for Susan 
Heck, and obituary; Obit. For Joseph Heck; death certificate for Joseph Heck, correspondence with 
research notes.  

Hedges (1 file): copied from Des Moines paper, no date obituary for Thomas C. Hedges.  

Heflin (1 file): marriage record for Morgan Heflin and Elizabeth Moncrief, 1838. 

Heid (1 file): Lizzie – registration affidavit of alien female. 

Heikes (1 file): West Pennsboro Heikes Farm Graveyard record.  

Heilman (1 file): descendants of Gregor Heilman (b. 1839) 

Heitz (2 files) – File 1: family of Adolph Heitz of China, Indiana. File 2: family of Geyman – Heitz, family 
information, family unit sheets, short history beginning with Valantin Heitz. Family and obituary for 
George Alban Heitz, will of valentine Heitz. 

Helm (2 files) – File 1: Emily Todd – half sister of Mary Todd Lincoln, bio sketch. File 2: Emily Todd Helm – 
newspaper article about a book on The Todds. Marriage record for George Helms and Elizabeth Hillis, 
1836. 

Helman (1 file): marriage record for Haywood Helman and Eliza Nicholson, 1839. 

Henderson (1 file): Springdale Cemetery records. 

*Hendricks (23 files) – File 1: Thomas A. – Political essay. Filw 2: Thomas – 1940 newspaper article 
“Original Notification Address to Thomas A. Hendricks Preserved. File 3: Who’s Who from Madison: 
Thomas A. Hendricks, VP, Senator, Governor, Representative in Congress. File 4: Hendricks – Ford family 
– letter from Paul Schnaitter for taxes on property, 1948; deed for land William Hendricks Jr and wife, 
Margaret Hendrick to Alden B. Smith. Property deed for Carolyn Ford, 1948. File 5: Hendricks – real 



estate – copies of old deeds. File 6: Abraham – A sketch of the family of Abraham Hendricks of Ligonier 
Valley Westmoreland County, PA by William Parker Hendricks, 1892. File 6: Eliza – First Ladies of Indiana 
and the governors, excerpt, Eliza Morgan Hendricks, married to Thomas A. Hendricks. File 7: William – 
2002 article about new headstone for Lt. Col. John Abraham Hendricks; bio sketch of Gov. William 
Hendricks; newspaper clipping about Indiana’s First Congressman. File 8: William – 1949 newspaper 
article “Historians will pay tribute to Hendricks.” William Hendricks published The Eagle, in Madison 
second paper in Indiana after the Vincennes Sun. article about widow of William Hendricks and family, 
no date. File 9: Hendricks family – Weekly Herald Oct. 24, 1889 Article about William Hendricks. File 10: 
William – marriage record for Paul Henricks to Frances M. Crawford, 1855. 1948 newspaper article 
about William Hendricks and a plaque dedicated in Fairmount Cemetery. File 11: William – biography in 
the Western Star Dec. 23, 1881. File 12: William – third governor (1822-1825) pamphlet with biography, 
page from Tour of Homes 1982 Deitrich House was originally Mr. and Mrs. William Hendricks Jr. house. 
File 13: Hendricks Genealogy from German origins – beginning with Rutger Hendricks and Gennetze 
Beeckman (m. 1470). File 14: Hendricks family tree and Stapp Family tree. Newspaper clipping “Their 
efforts to entrap Mr. Hendricks”, no date. File 15: Additional Hendricks Items. File 16: public invitation 
for Mary, daughter of William and Ann Parker Hendricks, funeral. Article 1900 on Thomas A. Hendricks. 
File 17: 1964 article about Ann Paul Hendricks, sister of Sarah Paul Goode, wife of William Hendricks 
Indiana’s third governor. Newspaper article from 1983 about Hanover grad, Thomas a. Hendricks; 
Marriage record for Joseph Hendricks to Sarah Ann Hendricks, 1840. File 18: newspaper clipping, 1885 
about the vice president Hendricks, ripped at bottom. File 19: Indiana University library acquires the 
library of William Hendricks, no date. File 19: A Hoosier listening post by Kate Miller Rabe, 1937 article 
about Ann Parker Hendricks; 1922 article from the Madison Courier “Portrait of Gov. Hendricks and 
Sketch of one of Madison’s Earliest and Greatest Citizens. File 20: more on William Hendricks. File 
21:1944 article “Senator Hendrick’s Franked Envelope Links Pioneer Families of Indiana”; 1886 in 
memoriam of Paul Hendricks, served on Alois Bachman’s post.  

Hennessy (1 file): Daniel – family unit sheet for Daniel Hennessy and Sarah M. Martin; redogree chart for 
Mary A. Hennessy; family unit sheet for Dr. William Daviess Hennessy and Mary Elizabeth Ancrum; 
obituary for Mary Hennessy (1987); newspaper article about Sarah M. Hennessy and daughter death, 
1927; obituary for William D. Hennessy. 

Henry (3 files) – File 1: William - information about William Henry and his two marriages, Boyd and 
Blankenship connections. File 2: Charles (Grandfather of Irene Dunn) – 1878 newspaper mention for 
boat where boiler was made by Charles Henry; newspaper article “The Madison Marine Railway), 1878; 
census records; obituary for Charles Henry (1920); 1896 obituary for Adeline Henry Dunn, mother of 
Irene Dunn. File 3: 1976 article “Area Family Receives Award for Homesteading” and 1977 anniversary or 
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Henry; Descendants of Barton W. Henry (m. 1835);  

Hensley (9 files) – File 1: Joe L. – twenty books in twenty years by Joe L Hensley, lawyer and former 
circuit court judge. Various articles about Judge Hensley. File 2: Joe L – local attorney is writer of sci-fi 
books, articles. File 3: various articles about Joseph L. writing. File 4: article where Joe Hensley talks 
about Madison, 1998. File 5: Hard Boiled Dicks no 4, Joseph Hansen and Joe Louis Hensley, in French 



about the two writers; articles and profiles on Joe Louis Hensley. File 6: family bible records. File 7: 
articles about Joseph L. Hensley. File 8: record for Sarah Boon, 1846. File 9: articles for Joe Louis Hensley.  

Hentz (2 files) – File 1: marriage record for Peter Hentz Jr and Sophia (?)ttsfeach (1874); obituary for 
Minnie Hentz (1971) and Charles Hentz (1989); newspaper article about opening a museum at Hentz 
Bakery site, 1991; descendants of Peter Hentz Jr. File 2: Chris – newspaper article “Art work of Chris 
Hentz is praised” (1977) 

Herbig (1 file): research notes. 

Herin (1 file): marriage record for Lydia Devon and Isaac Herin, 1823. 

Hern (1 file): also Herndon – correspondence, 1855 deed transferal, research notes.  

Herndon (2 files) – File 1: Charles and William – census records, death certificate for Alma Mae Corley, 
1969. File 2: William and Family – information on William and wife, Elizabeth, both died in 1861.  

Hertz (5 files ) – File 1:marriage record for Peter Hertz and Barbara A. Schlereth, 1909; Well Known Shoe 
Man Dead, obituary for Peter Hertz, 1929; obituary for Louise Hertz, 1988; obituary for Norma Hertz, 
1981; memoriam for Charles Hertz, no date; descendants of Peter Hertz; family unit sheet for Nicholas 
Hertz and Elizabeth Augustin. File 2: Peter – registration affidavit of alien enemy. File 3: Nicholas – 1880 
Declaration of Intention; marriage record for Nicholas and Lizzie Augustin, 1885; obituary for John Hertz 
Sr., 1962; obituary for Genevieve Layton, 1964; obituary for Catherine Gunn, 1977; registration affidavit 
for alien enemy. File 4: Elizabeth – registration affidavit of alien female. File 5: registration affidavit of 
alien enemy.  

Heuse (1 file): obituary for Otto Heuse, Sr., 1891; obituary for MRs. Louise Heuse, Jr., 1891; city directory 
pages. 

Hews (1 file): Dr. Benjamin Bruen – research notes, new jersey marriage record, 1814; Find a Grave, new 
jersey census enumeration 1789, Quaker meeting record 

Hiatt (1 file): will of John Hiatt from Hampshear County, Virginia 

Hibbert (1 file): family unit sheets for John Hibbert and Sarah Siddal; will of (?)co Hibbert; cemetery 
record for Newton Cemetery in the old part of Greendale Public Cemetery in Lawrenceburg, Ind.; 
Jefferson county early marriages, Shaw and Wells family connections.  

*Hicks (2 files) – File 1: notes on the descendants of John Hicks from Vermont. Hicks-Craig family of 
George Hicks of England. File 2: Solomon – 1949 newspaper article about Dr. Solomon Hicks, 
veterinarian. Obituary for Solomon Hicks, 1941. 

Higgins (1 file): obituary for Lawrence Higgins, 1977; obituary for Margarite Higgins, 1979; obituary for 
George Higgins, 1975; obituary for George Higgins, 1945; obituary for Mrs. O. D. Fry, 1915.  

Highland (1 file): marriage record for Conley Highland and Sarah E. Huston, 1854.  



Hildreth (1 file):  Sam F. – funeral of Capt. Samuel F. Hildreth, 1882 and obituary. 

Hill (19 files) – File 1: original photograph of Patricia Hill. (Started at library March 1. 1946. April 21. 1946 
Easter Sunday Patricia Hill [asst. Lt. Blue 2-piece dress). File 2: correspondence with research notes. File 
3: Louis J. – obituary for Louis J. Hill, 1956, obituary for Janet Hill McCall, 1876; obituary for Louis Hill, Jr., 
1977. File 4: Mary – obituary for Miss Mary Hill, 1966. File 5: Parley: short bio sketch. File 6: marriage 
record for Charles Hill and Cintha Bayles, April 5, 1824. File 7: information on Dr. Parley Hill Jr. (b. 1806), 
Elder Thomas Hill, Sr. (1763-1848). File 8: James – bio sketch of James Hill (d. 1912) File 9: James and 
Mary – obituary for Mary Hill, 1862; will of James Hill, Probate 1860-1869. File 10: Kathryn and Joseph – 
India Women in the World War, short bio sketch Kathryn Tuttle Hill, married to Joseph Hill manager of a 
battery service. Both buried at St. Patrick’s Cemetery Madison. File 11: James W. Hill reminiscence “A 
Resourceful Man.” File 12: Descendants of John Hill and Katherine. File 13: family bible records, Logsdon 
family connection. Family of Joseph Hill. Munier family connection. File 14: Nicholas Hill information: 
marriage record to Hannah Clever, 1859; obituary, 1889; obituary for Caroline hill, wife of Leonard Hill, 
1935; obituary for Lawrence J. Hill, 1986; obituary for Leonard Hill, 1941; obituary for Joseph F. Hill, 
1937; Obit. For Kathryn Hill, 1973. File 15: James – 1936 W. l. Hill celebrating his 99th birthday, DAR 
record for James Culbertson Hill. File 16: Frank and Lana Hill family, obituary for Paul Hill, 1986; John P. 
and Catherine Hill family. File 17: descendants of John and Katherine Hill (Jean Hells) File 18: copy of 17/ 
File 19: family unit sheets. File 20: James – obituary for James Hill, 1912.  

*Hillis (9 files) – File 1: family information for David Hillis (b. 1785) in PA; book excerpt with bio sketch of 
David Hillis; bio sketch of D. B. Hillis born in Madison; Hillis Cemetery records; family unit sheets. File 2: 
life events of David Hillis; information about Lt. Gov. David Hillis; article about FL Gov. honor to Dennis 
Harmon (7th Great Grandson of William Hillis); information about Glen Raymond Hillis. File 3: David 
Burke Hillis, M. D. bio sketch. File 4: Mathew Hillis Pennsylvania military record, family unit sheet for 
Hugh Blizard and Elisabeth Catherine Hillis. File 5: Hillis – Etherton family records. File 6: War of 1812 
Matthew Hillis; early newspaper mentions. File 7: generation charts. File 8: William Hillis Rev. War 
record, correspondence. File 8: Welch and Allied Families. File 9: marriage record for Hiram Hillis and 
Louisa Etherton, 1831, marriage record for William D. H. Taylor and Nancy W. Hillis.  

*Hills (1 file) 

*Hinds (2 files) – File 1: Solomon – family unit sheet for James W. Hinds and Ruth Cook; family unit sheet 
for Solomon Hinds and Mary Ward; census records. File 2: descendants of Francis Hinds 1966 newspaper 
clipping about a gravestone used as a hearthstone found in First Christian Church; newspaper article 
about astronaut Dr. Janice Voss, 1990. 

*Hinkle (1 file): family information for John Justus Hinkle, builder of Hinkle’s Fort in Pendleton Co., WV.  

Hirst (1 file): family file for Raymond Alonzo Buchanan and Helen Pauling Hirst, family file for Cooper 
Hirst and Maggie Krue. Census records, obituary for Cooper Hirst, obituary for Maggie Hirst, obituary for 
Mrs. Raymond Buchanan, accidental death, 1950.  

Hite (1 file): marriage record for Hite and Bane, no date. 



Hitz (1 file): L. E. – obituary for Emma R. Hitz, 1976; Frazier Hitz, Jr., 1987; newspaper article about the 
first automobile in Madison owned by L. E. Hitz, 1933; photograph of Hitz Greenhouse E Second and St. 
Michaels Ave; Jos. Hitz obituary 1938; John G. Hitz obituary, 1928; Henry Hitz, 1908; Stephan T. Hitz, 
1919; William Hitz, 1935; Chester Hitz, 1948; Rev. Stephan Hitz, 1883; Frazier Hitz, 1958; Benjamin F. 
Hitz, 1935; Emma Hitz, 1976; George Hitz, 1930; Harry C. Hitz, 1937; Jesse E. Hitz, 1940; L. E. Hitz, 1944. 

Hoagland (1 file): marriage record for John Hoagland and Adaline Cook, 1868. 

Hobbs (1 file): marriage record for Joseph Hobbs and America Oglesby, 1827. 

Hodges (1 file): Willis – life history and copy of receipt.  

Holiday (1 file): Joseph – 1970 newspaper article about Hoosier Artist Joseph Holiday. 

Hollingswoth (1 file): correspondence.  

Harding (1 file): family bible records, obituary for Elias Abrams, no date; obit. For Martha Jane Stillman 
Harding, no date.  

Hoard (Hord) (1 file): John – Also Boyd, Baxter, Henry – death notice (1891), family units, family 
information.  

Hoefling (1 file): Carl – newspaper article about Carl Hoefling, barber, recollections, 1974. 

*Hoffman (7 files) – File 1: story of Nicholas Hoffman, pedigree chart for Harold Keith Gossman. File 2: 
information for Christopher Hoffman and Seena Ann Furnish family. File 3: newspaper article about 
Herman Hoffman for Madison Mayor, 1971; Mr. and Mrs. Matthew J. Hoffman, Sr. celebrate 
anniversary, 1976; 1996 article about land where the State Hospital is owned by Hoffmans and HItzes. 
File 4: reproduction photographs. File 5: Clarence – 1976 article “Hoffman still goes to fires after 59 
years” File 6: Clarence and Lorene – death certificates, directory pages, census records. File 7: Clarence – 
newspaper article about Mr. Hoffman keeping busy in retirement with making replicas out of tin.  

Hoffstadt (8 files) – File 1: obituary for Julius Hoffstadt, 1883; Mathilde Hoffstadt, 1909; reproduction 
photo of store fronts downtown Madsion; obituary for Henry Hoffstadt, 1894. File 2: Juliet – Weekly 
Herald article about Juliet and sister, Etta, making about 600 dolls, 1972. File 3: Interview with Juliet 
Hoffstadt, 1951. File 4: Julia interview. File 5: Etta – 2 original receipts of Henry Hoffstadt paid Hall Rent, 
Etta young author prize, no date. File 6: Etta – excerpt from Mabley and Carew’s Young Authors, story 
“Our Dog Bowser” File 7: obituary for R. Hoffstadt, 1899; newspaper clippings about the doll collection.  

Holcraft (1 file): Jefferson county marriages, census records, obituary for Dorothy Lee, 2001; obituary for 
Helen Royce, 1985; obituary for Kansas Holcroft, 1900; obituary for Abram Holcroft, 1893. 

Holden (1 file): death certificates, probate record, marriage record for Floyd Sutherland and Isabel 
Holden, 1851; marriage record for Floyd Sutherland and Mary B. McDonald, 1875obituary for John 
Sutherland, 1930; marriage record for Shirley Nighbert and Lula Sutherland, 1901; obit. For Lula 



Nighbert, 1943; obituary for Shirley Nighbert, 1948; marriage record for Lee Nighbert and Sarah Noell, 
1939; genealogical research notes.  

Holstein (2 files) – File 1: Charles L. – short bio sketch. File 2: correspondence. 

Holzman (1 file) – Louis H. – newspaper article about the career of Louis H. Holzman in the railroad 
industry.  

Hood (1 file): Bill – obituary for Bill Hood, 1881. 

Hoole (1 file): William E. – bio sketch for William E. Hoole (1808-1873) a cabinet maker in Cincinnati. 

Hoover (1 file): correspondence. 

Hopper (4 files) – File 1:  2 photographs, correspondence, family unit sheets. File 2: research notes and 
family information for the family of William Hopper (d. 1850). File 3: information about Moses Hopper, 
Hopper family history. File 4: Levi – Levi Thompson Hopper (b. 1792) pedigree chart, family unit sheets 

Hornback (1 file): marriage record for Henry Hornback and Bailey Rose, 1838.  

Horner (3 files) – File 1: newspaper article John E. and Anne Horner leaving Hanover, 1987. File 2: bio of 
John Horner (b. 1777); cemetery records; family unit sheet for James Higgins and Sally Skillman; will 
record,  File 3:pedigree chart for Wanda Juanita Horner (b. 1920) 

Horton (1 file): early American genealogy, Lt. Robert Horton serves in Italy, 1944, family info for John M. 
Horton (b. 1836) 

Horuff (1 file): 1913 Golden Wedding Anniverary for Mr. and Mrs. N. Horuff. 

Housefield (2 files) – File 1: family unit sheet for Charles F. Housefield and Nancy Anne Kiser Housefield; 
services for Lester Housefield, 1972; descendants of Charles and Nancy Ann Housefield; John R. 
Housefield bio sketch; Louis Housefield bio sketch; Arthur Housefield bio sketch; Florence Housefield bio 
sketch; Herbert Housefield bio sketch; Minerva Housefield bio sketch; Jesse Housefield bio sketch; 
Clarence Housefield bio sketch; Lester Housefield bio sketch; Frank Housefield bio sketch. File 2: facts 
gathered from John Housefield in 1955. 

Houston (1 file): research notes 

Hovey (1 file): Horace C. – 8/16/70 Indianapolis Star newspaper article about Horace C. Horvey 
“Indiana’s Spelunking Clergyman” 

Howard (1 file): marriage record for (?)ver(?) Howard and Delilah Lawtern, 1837. 

Howell (1 file):  

Howes (3 files) – File 1: John – obituary for Dr. John Howes; obituary for Capt. S. Q. Howe, no date. File 
2: old documents. File 3: copy of 1817 letter, copy of 1906 letter. 



Hoyt (5 files) – File 1: obituary for Asenath Whipple Hoyt, 1897. College Hill Cemetery records, Hoyt 
cemetery records in Lancaster Township, New England Families: Hoyt. File 2: The Hoyt Family Meeting: 
Stamford, CT June 20 and 21, 1866. File 3: copy of David Webster Hoyt’s record of the Hoyt family and 
descendants of John Hoyt of Salisbury and David Hoyt of Deerfield, Mass., 1857. File 4: William – 1922 
newspaper clipping about Hoyt and Cathcart Patents for Cog Engines; newspaper article “Dupont Man 
was First to Invent Steam Calliope, no date. 1828 newspaper clipping written by William Hoyt; Delta 
Queen steam Calliope article, mentions William Hoyt. File 5: copies of patents.  

Hubbard (5 files) – File 1: Harlan – articles about him being bitten three times by a poisonous snake, 
1983. Article about the Hubbard Cabin1990 excerpt about Kentucky’s Thoreau, Harlan Hubbard by 
Wendell Berry. Smaller file of articles about Harlan Hubbard and solitude in nature, life as a n artist. 
Obituary for Harlan Hubbard, 1988. Obituary for Anna E. Hubbard, 1986. Brother of Harlan was Lucien 
Hubbard, an early film maker, and winner of the first Academy Award for Best Picture. File 2: Harlan – 
articles about Harlan Hubbard; 19898 Payne Hollow newsletter, article about retrospective art exhibit; 
File 3: Harlan – articles and clippings about Harlan Hubbard, artist and naturalist. File 4: Articles and 
newspaper clippings about Harlan Hubbard. File 5: last will and testament of Eliza Boone Hubbard, 1905. 

*Hubbs (1 file): death notice for Horace Hubbs, 1875; Bessie H. Woolford, 1915; Family bible records; 
Obituary for Hon. Joseph H. Oglesby, no date; obituary for William C. Hubbs; Obituary for Benjamin 
Hubbs, Jr. 

Hubek (1 file): Samuel – marriage record for Samuel Hubek and Susanah Thorn, 1824.  

Huck (1 file): The Karl Huck and Magdalena Lothspeich Family of China, Jeff. Co., Ind. 

Hudnut (1 file): marriage record for Theodore J. Hudnut and Martha Griffin, 1843. 

*Hudson (2 files) – File 1: David – bible records for the family of David Hudson, beginning with a 
marriage in 1783 for David Hudson and Anna Horton. David Hudson (b. 1761) File 2: marriage record for 
Zoulda Hudson and James (?) Kelly, 1834. 

Hufford (1 file): newspaper article – The Bucks and Huffords of Patriot and Hanover: A tribute from 
Hanover College to a Switzerland County Family, no date. 

*Hughes (8 files) – File 1: full text of “Hughes family of Kentucky and Virginia” File 2: Hughes / Denny – 
generation pedigree chart of Richard Hughes (b. 1943) File 3: History of the Hughes Family beginning 
with Thomas Hughes (b. 1768); family unit sheets; DAR record for Robert Crittenden Hughes; DAR 
record for Bayard Hughes; DAR record for Roger Hughes. File 4: research notes. File 5: DAR lineage 
record for John Warner Hughes. File 6: Will of David Hughes. File 7: Ancestors of Janice Sue Holycross. 
File 8: obituary for Neva Hughes, 1975; E. W. Hughes obituary, 1919; 1937 newspaper article about new 
construction on a tobacco warehouse, to be owned and operated by Bayard Hughes. 

Hume (1 file): early American genealogy  



Humes (2 file) – File 1: Willie – newspaper article about Willie Humes 1970 “5th in Nation. File 2: Luke 
and James Matthew (formerly enslaved): interview, census records, MC article Aug 10, 1939, family 
information,  

Hummel (1 file): obituary for Barbara Hummel, 1918; census records; obituary for Louis Hummel, 1953; 
obituary for Mrs. Catherine Hummel, 1959. 

Humphrey(s) (3 files) –File 1: census record for Woodford Humphrey, marriage in Jeff. Co. to Elizabeth 
Anderson. File 2: photo reproduction of the family of Woodford and Elizabeth Anderson Humphrey. File 
3: correspondence.  

Humphries (2 files) – File 1: James H. – life records and obituary for Capt. James, 1887. File 2: family 
reunion 1983 for family of John R. Humphreys and Malinda Wright. Marriage record for James M. 
Humphries and Nancy P. Moore, 1836. 

*Hunger (1 file): newspaper bio sketch for Rev. Henry C. Hunger, June 21, 1911 Courier; Ancestral tree 
of Dr. Oscar Carl Alfred Hunger Family; 1894 death of Dr. Oscar Hunger; obituary for C. G. Hunger, 1937.  

Hunt (1 file): Nathaniel – bio sketch; correspondence; original 1819 deed;  

Hunter (2 files) – File 1: family bible records. File 2: Frank Baldwin Hunter (seaside pools) – WPA project, 
various locations and information.  

*Huntley (1 file): family bible records beginning with Andrew Huntley (b.1757) 

Hurlbut (1 file): 1851 marriage record  

Hutcherson (1 file): marriage record for William Hutcherson and Mary Ann Durall, 1824 

*Hutchings (12 files) – File 1: William – newspaper article about Historic Madison Inc opening Dr. 
William Hutchings office to the public, 1973. File 2: family bible records. File 3: William – 1969 
newspaper articles about the Doctor’s office and garden; Historic Sights Getting US Protection, Funds. 
File 3: newspaper articles, Wedding of Agnes Hutchings and John Zulaut, 1896; wedding of Charles 
Frederick Hutchings to Henrietta Helm, 1901. Excerpt for Louisville Medicine article about Dr. William 
Hutchings Office; William Hutchings came to Madison from Lexington Sept 4, 1875. File 4: William – life 
sketch, article Horse and Buggy Doctor, 1976. File 5: William – certificate copies. File 6: newspaper 
mention of Hutchings buying three properties ion Madison, life sketch, 1892 from Cincinnati Commercial 
Gazette, Dr. R. K. Hutchings and Emma Lake romance. File 6: Horse and Buggy Doctor in the Indiana 
State Board of Health Bulletin, 1976. File 7: information about the Doctor’s house. File 8: 1985 article 
copy about the museum building. File 9: The Journal of the Indiana State Medical Association, A Horse 
and Buggy Doctor in Hoosierland, 1971. File 10: newspaper article from file 1, another about the 
relatives that gave the building to Historic Madison Inc. File 11: about the building. File 12: The 
Hutchings-Koehler Family – William Davies Hutchings papers compiled. The Hutchings-Koehler Family 
Papers (1800 – 1916) on Microfilm at the Jefferson County Public Library. 



Hutchinson (3 files) – File 1: J. B. – Courier 4/3/08 obituary for Homeopathic Doctor James Bingham 
Hutchinson, early ad for the doctor (1852), Walton – Hutchinson wedding Gertrude Hutchinson to John 
W. Walton, 1885. No date for death mention of Mrs. Margaret D. Hutchinson, widow of John F. 
Hutchinson. File 2: Newspaper article Hutchinsons earn Homestead Award, 1976; Obit for William 
Hutchinson, 1986; marriage article for William Hutchinson and Pauline Lutz, John F. Hutchinson for 
Sheriff; obit. For Anna Hutchinson Jones, obit for John F. Hutchinson. File 3: Joseph – real estate deed.  

Hutton (1 file): Jefferson County marriages, 1870 census record for Elizabeth Hutton. 

Hyatt (2 files) – File 1: Jefferson County marriages, obituaries for Clara Hyatt, Martha Kuhn, Oliver P 
Bush. Marriage record for Charles Hyatt and Estella May Hand, 1907. File 2: marriage record for Andrew 
Hyatt and Elizabeth H. Talbott, 1823. File 3: Sons of the American Rev. app for Marvin Hyatt, Sr. 

Hyde (1 file): family chart 

Hyden (2 files) – File 1: newspaper article trying to locate a portrait of James Daniel Hyden, Sr. in Spanish 
American War uniform. File 2: correspondence.  

I 

Imel (1 file): burial information of Mary Elizabeth Leatherberry Imel, Rev. Robert Newberry Imel, and 
Peter Monroe Imel. Folder contains a CD of photographs.  

Indian Joe (1 file): Skeleton in Smithsonian Collection, apparently a giant died in 1878 and was part of 
collection of William A. Collins of Madison. “Indian Joe” lived and worked in Madison. 

Irwin (2 files) – File 1: Irwin-Anderson – family infor for Richard Vawter Oliver Irwin, Richard Joseph 
Irwin, Ronald Vawter Irwin, Catherine Ruth Irwin, Richard Gregory Heck, Rebecca Jeanne Heck, family 
bible records. File 2: early American genealogy. 

Inglis (1 file): obituary for Marly B. Inglis, obituary for J. M. Inglis, owner of Inglis Drug Store. Early 
American Genealogy. 

Isom (1 file): article about Frances Eisan writing a book about abolitionist, Delia Webster.  

Ives (1 file): early American genealogy. 

J 

Jackman (1 file): family genealogy beginning with Robert Gerald Jackman (b.1739); census records; 
obituary for Henry Jackman (b. 1800), 1869; obituary for Mrs. Eliza M. Stockdale, 1931.research notes. 

Jackson (9 files) – File 1: Wayne C. – born 1913, obituary for Isabell Jackson, 1971; obituary for Wayne 
Jackson, 1998; obituary for Pearl Jackson, 1991; family unit sheets. File 2: Jackson-Thomas-Miller – 
excerpt from History of Morgan, Monroe, and Brown Co. Indiana – Harry Jackson. Correspondence; 
family unit sheets, Jefferson County records. File 3: James Richard – divorce sear4ch from Patsy Jackson 
between 1820-1829. File 4: Solomon – a story of a pioneer and revolutionary soldier, from North 



Carolina, came to Jefferson County, Indiana in 1814, copied from the Madison Courier Nov. 15 and 22, 
1873. File 5: Joshua – descendants of Andreas Himelick. File 6: James – Arbuckle family connection, 
excerpt from Bio and Hist. Souvenir for the counties of Clark, Crawford, Harrison, Floyd, Jefferson, 
Jennings, Scott, and Washington Indiana. Newspaper clipping article about the life of Hazel Jackson, 
1998; obituary for James A. Jackson; census records; James Jackson and Martha Brown married 1838; 
bio sketch; military records; James Jackson Sr. obituary, 1879. File 7: Howard – retirement article of Dr. 
Howard Jackson, 2011. File 8: Thomas Jackson Family. File 9: Jackson research data.  

Jacobs (2 files) – File 1: marriage record for Andrew Jacobs and Josie Bans, 1881. File 2: Sara Loew 
Jacobs – Family unit sheets, census records, death certificate for Achilles Jacobs, newspaper clippings 
about Sarah Jacobs’ arrest in 1916. 

Jahrries (1 file): Charles A. – bio sketch  

James (3 files) – File 1: census record for Mary James; family unit sheet for John James and Mary Ann 
Terwilliger; Will of Mary James; Madison city directory page, marriage record for John James and Mary 
Terwilliger, Warren Co. Ohio. File 2: correspondence. File 3: family unit sheets for the family of William R 
James and Marry Ann Webb. 

Jameson (1 file): Colonial Militaman Revolutionary Patriot and Pioneer Thomas James and Family. 

*Jamison (2 files) – File 1: obituary for physician Dr. Patrick Henry Jamison, 1910, family bible records. 
File 2: Jamison Family history.  

Janes / Jaynes (1 file): correspondence and research notes 

Jefferson County Women (1 file): short accounts of Pioneer women. 

Jeffrey (1 file): Edward – obituary for Edward H. Jeffrey, 1976; 1940 newspaper article :Will Restore 
Colonial Inn to Original Beauty” 

Jeffries (1 file): pedigree chart for Lenora Catherine Disbro; Pedigree chart for Janet Diane Jeffries and 
James Richard Carter family.  

Jefferson County Black Families (1 file): Amos Augustus Cook burial info; Minnie Burnice Jordan 
Whittaker burial info; pedigree chart for Tunisia Whittaker Bradley; family unit sheet for Amos Augustus 
Cook; death certificate for Minnie Burnice Whittaker and Obituary, 1973; obituary for Charles Turner, 
1943; burial info for son of Amos Cook, James V. Cook; burial info for Mary Cook Cosby and David Cosby; 
burial info for Herbert Clay Jordan.  

Jehiel (1 file): marriage record for Jehiel Barnard Law and Josephine Farnsworth, 1854. 

Jenkins (2 files) – File 1: Ellsworth – 1972 newspaper article about Ellsworth ‘Deacon’ Jenkins. File 2: 
family unit sheets for the family of James B. Jenkins, Sr. and Sarah Handblew (m. 1842) 



Jennings (2 files) – File 1: information on Solomon Jennings from the Kentucky Historical Society, applied 
for pension in 1820. File 2: family unit sheet for Ozias (b.1766)  and Elizabeth Brown Jennings (b.1771) 

Jessup (2 files) – File 1: early American genealogy, obituary for Asa Raymond Jessup, Sr., 1986. File 2: 
Jessup – Denny – obituary for Robert Jessup, 1951; obituary for Sarah Isabelle Jessup, 1954; obit. For 
Hannah Jessup, 1932; Thomas Denny, 1913; Asa W. Jessup, 1925; John J. Denny, 1937Effa Denny, 1951. 

Jester (1 file): 1949 newspaper article about Herbert H. Johnson and his wife selling their home 
“Hermosa Vista” to Major Jester. 

Jewell (3 files) – File 1: family birth records, money lent to John Jewell in 1814; letter from William J. 
Jewell to his sister Susanna Beeler. File 2: copies of file 1. File 3: death notice for Sarah Jewell, 1868; 
1860 census records; marriage of John Jewell to Sarah Davidson, 1819; obituary for Charlotte Jewell 
Wood, 1908; descendants of John Jewell, 1913. 

Jines (1 file): Obit for Walter S. Jines, 1896; Will of Walter Jines; obituary for Nathan Jines, 1896. 

Jobe/Job (1 file): William Bede Kirkendall married Elizabeth M. Jobe 1839, obituary for Elizabeth 
Kirkendall, 1895; obituary for W. B. D. Kirkendall, 1987. 

Johnson (9 files) – File 1: James – lineage of Julia Ann Thomas. File 2: William – lineage of Catherine 
Johnson. File 3: Richard M. – newspaper article about the retirement of Richard M. Johnson 1975. 
Newspaper article “Johnson gives land to city” 1974. File 4: Richard – wedding of John Johnson and 
Laura Kinkler, 1885; Green Johnson child birth announcement, 1886; Greeville Johnson and Lula Hargan 
marriage announcement, 1884; 1886 newspaper article about a trial “The Gold Brick Case;” death of 
Mrs. A. S. Caldwell, 1887; newspaper announcement of a gathering at the home of Richard Johnson, 
1886; wedding announcement for William James Johnson and Ida M. Grenier, 1886. Newspaper article 
copy about the monument in Springdale Cemetery for Richard Johnson; obituary for Ida Grenier 
Johnson, 1953; obituary for Richard Johnson, 1997; obit. For William James Johnson, 1918. File 5: 
Richard – newspaper mention of C. R. Johnson placing invention of power noodle glue cutter in three of 
six glue factories in the US, 1895; bio of Richard Johnson. File 6: Samuel S. and Mary Bergen Ryker – 
Samuel S. Johnson death notice in the paper, 1849; 1850 census record; Samuel probate. File 7: obituary 
for Maria Johnson, 1922. Fairmount Cemetery records; research notes; obituary for Mrs. Johnson, 
mother of Louis Johnson, 1922. File 8: family unit sheets, marriage record for Hiram Johnson and Mary 
Melton, 1834. File 9: Ezekial Johnson and John Snider – probate records. 

Johnston (1 file): marriage record for Nathaniel Johnson and Sarah Arbuckle, 1839. Marriage record for 
Stewart Johnson and Kisanna Jane (?), 1847.  

Johonnet (1 file): Jackson – original booklet 

Jones (12 files) – File 1: John Paul – report on claims of heirs of John Paul Jones. File 2: David – research 
notes for the family of David Jones and Susanna Cline (m. 1822); 1971 newspaper article “More about 
ancestors, River Boats;” Ryker and Green family connections. File 3: information for Thomas Jones and 
David Jones. File 4: James – correspondence, 1820 census record; probate records. File 5: marriage 



record for James Jones and Mary Tull, 1836. File 6: information on the family of Daniel David Jones and 
Mary Margaret Simpson (d.1876); obituary for Thomas Jones, no date; daily banner sept. 29, 1851 death 
notice for Daniel D. Jones, senior editor of the Banner; 1860 census record for Mary M. Jones. File 7: 
newspaper articles about an accident that killed a family in June 1998, scholarship established in the 
memory of family, 1998. File 8: autobiography of Dorothy Darnell Jones. File 9: correspondence. File 10: 
William Woods – information on the family of William W Jones (b.1815)  

Jordan (2 files) – File 1: Arthur – bio sketch for business man from Madison, worked in Indianapolis, dies 
in New York. File 2: Whitney Parish Church records, marriage record for William B. Darsey(?) and 
Margaret Enaz(?), 1838. 

Judge (1 file): census records, naturalization record, obituary for Thomas Judge, 1887; directory page for 
Thomas Judge.  

 

K 

Kaag (1 file): family unit sheets for the family of Johann Jacob Kaag and Julianna Eitel, John Conrad Keller 
and Louisa F. Long, George Keller and Katherine Kaag. 

Kahn (2 files) – File 1: obituary for Henry Kahn, 1925; Lilliam Kahn, 1969; Ralph E. Kahn, 1979; Phillip 
Kahn Sr., 1971; Albert Kernen, 1910; Mary Stephan, 1934; Joseph Kernen, 1977; Raymond Bodem, 1985; 
Peter Bodem, 1975; Ada Bodem, 1977; Charles Bodem, no date; Joseph Bodem, 1971; springdale 
cemetery records, Catherine Stephan, 1927; Flora Stephan, 1941; Albert Stephan, 1910. File 2: John – 
naturalization record.  

Kalb (2 files) – File 1: Margaret – photograph reproduction, with Maragret Dixon, former JCPL librarian. 
File 2: descendant chart. 

Kampe (2 files) – File 1: Cecelia – registration affidavit of alien female. File 2: Edward – registration 
affidavit of alien enemy. 

 Kasper (2 files) – File 1: reproduction photograph of Kasper Family (1930); from Lemem scrapbook, a 
1927 article about J.J. Kasper and family moving to Tenn.; descendant chart beginning with Nicholas 
Kasper (d. 1904); death of Elizabeth Kasper, 1941; obituary for Joseph Kasper, 1918; obituary for J. J. 
Kasper, 1929; Kasper family tree starting 1779; reproduction photographs. File 2: J. J. Kasper – 
councilman and grocery store owner, life info and reproduction photos. 

Keel (1 file): family bible records.  

Kennedy (1 file): family unit sheets, will of Jeremiah H. McNew; family of Richard McNew and Elizabeth 
Hoke (m. 1806); obituary of Ephriam Kennedy, worked on the Underground Railroad (d. 1886); militia 
enrollment for Shelby Township, Jefferson County for 1862 includes Ben F. and William E. Kennedy; 



Shelby Township vote 1860; census records; obit. For Ben. F. Kennedy, 1910; account of Canaan in the 
19th century; Jefferson county marriage records.  

Keyt (1 file):  Captain William H. – Oct. 10, 1883 article about syrup production, Keyt is superintendent; 
July 20, 1877 newspaper mention of Keyt’s death (Madison Courier); census records; Feb. 24, 1866 
Nannie Byers story.  

Keller (3 files) – File 1: obituary of George Keller, 1917; George M. Keller, 1937; Anna Krum, 1910; 
Barbara Keller, 1941. File 2: newspaper announcement attending the funeral of John Keller, 1891; obit. 
For John Keller, 1891. File 3: family unit sheets for George Keller and Katherine Kaag, John Conrad Keller 
and Louisa F. Long.  

Kelley (4 files) – File 1: Kelley-Lamb – information searching the burial location of Susan Lamb Kelley and 
Mary Catherine Morrison Kelley. File 2: 1977 newspaper article about Kelly brothers leaving Ace 
Hardware. Newspaper article about the families of the brothers who sold Ace Hardware, 1977. File 3: 
1972, Kelly Families live, work harmoniously: Kelly Brothers are Dick, Tom, Louis. Clipping of an inquiry 
looking for info on the Kelly family, 1969. File 4: correspondence, Kelly-Bradford. 

Kelso (1 file): research on the family of Johnathan Kelso and Elizabeth White. Reproduction photos of 
Kelso ancestors. 

Kernan (1 file): 1896 newspaper announcement of the death of Jacob Kernan. Springdale Cemetery 
records. 

Kerns (1 file): marriage record for John Kerns and Sidney Smith, 1830. 

Kerr (1 file): Sarah Margaret Kerr’s mother – family of James Kerr (b. 1770), research and census records.  

Kidwell (2 files) – File 1: obituary for Louise Kidwell, 1994; 1981 newpaper clipping five generations. File 
2: Grover C. – inventor, two articles about iceless jackets for shipping ice cream (1928) and Meese Ince 
(1937).  

Killcannon (1 file): correspondence.  

Kikendall (1 file): history of the Kirkendall family. 

Kilgore (1 file): information on John Kilgore (b. 1790) family. 

Killian (1 file): the history of the Killian family in North Carolina.  

Kimmel (2 files) – File 1: April 12, 1953 newspaper article Henry Kimmel is missing; May 12, 1953: Henry 
Kimmel’s body found in the Ohio River. File 2: obituary for Columbia Kimmel, 1925; research notes, 
correspondence; Heck family connection; obituary for Joseph Heck, 1895; Simon Schmidt life info; death 
notice for Sylvester Kimmel, 1879; obituary for George Kimmel, 1929; death notice for Mrs. Joseph 
Heck, 1897; obituary for Henry W. Schmidt, 1924; obituary for Peter Kimmel, 1930; obituary for 
Amandus Kimmel, 1929; 1870 newspaper article about Deputy Marshall Peter Kimmel being shot by 



Constable James H. Hinds, Feb. 15, 1876; death notice for Martin Kimmel, no date; census records; 
obituary for Joseph Kimmel, 1948; obit for Mary Schmidt, 1935; obit for John Adam Kimmel, 1881; 
dissolving of copartner ship of Zeller and Kimmel saddletree makers, mention in the paper, 1852. 

Kindel (1 file): Family unit of William Kindel and Elizabeth Webb and life info for them. 

*King (9 files) – File 1: John Lyle and Jones – November 18, 1885 newspaper article: a letter from John 
Lyle King; obituary for John Lyle King, 1892; correspondence. File 2: Donald of Lamb, Indiana – 
newspaper articles about a disabled man who creates figurines out of gourds, and opened a museum 
between vevey and Madison to showcase his “whatnots,” 1972. File 3: Jacob F. – death certificate and 
research notes. File 4: John and Jean King of County Tyrone, Ireland and American Descendants. File 5: 
marriage recod for James King and Rebecca Layton, 1833. File 6: Paul – newspaper clipping, 1976 – Paul 
King Enjoys Carving Wood Figures; four generations newspaper clipping, 1986. File 7: descendants of 
George King (b. 1751) File 8: Caroline and Terry – newspaper article Jan. 23, 1995 Madison woman 
receives heart transplant Saturday; pedigree chart for Carolyn Ann Furnish, married Terry Lee King; 
newspaper article, Jan. 21, 1995 Couple boosted by area spirit. File 9: Jan. 7, 1897 newspaper bio sketch 
of John Lyle King; obituary for Mary Toler King, 1926, short bio sketch of John Lyle King, Diary entry, 
Mar. 19, 1920 funeral of Capt. Richard King; newspaper article about John Lyle King’s will, May 11, 1892, 
research notes, The King Family.  

Kinman (1 file): Harold – newspaper article 1/6/78 Kinman’s song heads for Top 40 on country charts. 
Newspaper article about Harold’s son on a LDS mission to New Zealand, 12/23/1988.  

Kinnear (2 files) – File 1: family history document, family unit sheets, descendants’ chart; family of Aaron 
Rowlison II and Martha Ann Kinnear Rowlison. File 2: Aurelius – marriage record for Aurelius Kinnear 
and Eliza C. Lefeber, 1854. Family unit sheet for Columbus W. Marshall and Mary Jane Kinnear.  

*Kinnett (2 files) – File 1: descendants beginning with Samuel Kinnett (b. 1780). File 2: The Kinnett 
Family 1800 to 1961.  

Kinney (1 file): George W. – Civil War soldier, information on his wife, America, and family.  

Kirby (1 file): Also Kerby – correspondence, research notes. 

Kirk (1 file): John – From the Madison Courier June 20, 1883 Capt. John Kirk His Life and Work; bio 
sketch, bio sketch of William Kirk, excerpt from the obituary of Capt. John Kirk.  

Kirkendall (1 file): marriage record for Samuel Kikendall and Lovica Smith, 1824; information on 
Coykendall family, obituary for W. B. D. Kikendall, 1897; obituary for Mrs. Elizabeth Kikendall, 1895. 

Kirkpatrick (1 file):Madison Courier Nov. 6, 1950 newspaper article about a multiple car accident, John 
Kirkpatrick injured; Newspaper article nov 10. 1950 Injuries fatal for Kirkpatrick.  

Kirkwood (1 file): early newspaper items from Jefferson County, early Jeff. Co. marriages, will of Susan 
Kirkwood.  



Kistler (1 file): marriage record for Emanual Kistler and Minta Jones, 1824.  

*Kite (1 file): family bible records.  

Klein (4 files) – File 1: research notes beginning with John Klein (b. 1798); death notice in the paper for 
George Klein, 1884; St. Patrick’s Cemetery records for Klein family; obituary for John Klein, 1899; 
obituary for George Klein, 1880; death of Herman Klein in Cincinnati, 1899; death of John B. Klein, 1882; 
Ferdinand Klein, 1896; Jacob Klein, 1891; John Klein, 1893; death notice for Nicholas Fox, 1870; Gregory 
Klein, 1878. File 2: June 24 27 28 29, 1893 newspaper mentions about the assault and death of William 
Klein, son of Mr and Mrs Michael Klein. July 1, funeral of Wm Klein; July 7 8, 1893 article about the 
coroner’s investigation. File 3: obituaries for John Klein, 1882 and Rosa Klein, 1886; death certificate of 
William Kay; June 12, 1960 Oakland Tribune article about Kay painting; article The Young Man West 
West, 1978; Morning Oregonian newspaper June 14, 1930 spread about floral parade floats; copy of 
newspaper article about Paul Klein art. File 4: Nicholas – Gregory Klein life information, 1917 obit for 
Mrs. Elizabeth Klein; marriage record for Elizabeth Fox and George Klein, 1850; 1916 obituary for George 
Klein; obituaries for Mrs. Frederick Wolfe, 1918 and Susana Wolff, 1918; onit for Nicholas Klein, 1937; 
Catherine Klein, 1945; Charles Klein, 1951; Margaret Klein, 1958; Nicholas Klein buried in St. Joseph’s 
Cemetery.  

Kloepfer (1 file): Shirley – 1986 newspaper article about PeaceCorps reunion.  

Knoebel (2 files) – File 1: descendant chart be3ginning with John J. Knoebel (d. 1896). File 2: James F. 
Knoebel Texas divorce from Blanche A. marriage record for James F. to Miriam Soller; 1937; birth 
certificate for James Franklin Knoebel; information on the killing of Officer Frank Knoebel; death 
certificate for Rosa May Knoebel, 1915; Dec. 30, 1930 newspaper article about the death opf Frank 
Knoebel. 

Knoll (2 files) – File 1: obituary for Chris Ramsey, 1918; obituary for Mrs. Chris Ramsey, 1914; obituary 
for Grace Ramsey Parson, 1958; obit for Frank Knoll, 1982; obituary for Dorothy Still, 1980; Donald G. 
Still, 1985; Mildred Knoll, 1980; Nettie C. Knoll Denzinger, 1968; Nicholas Barrar, 1937; census records, 
Jefferson county marriages, death mention for John Knoll, 1882;  Catherine Knoll, 1990; Valentine Knoll, 
1892; Kate Noll, 1941; Catherine Knoll, 1886. File 2: Frank Valentine – correspondence, find a grave page 
for Frank V. Knoll, Marilyn Olson Knoll Mildred Still Knoll, funeral announcement for ? Still, 1940; death 
certificate for Marilyn kNoll, obituary for Lucy Still, 1937; obit for Kathy Knoll, 1961; marriage record for 
Frank Knoll Jr and Ruth Padgett, 1946; death certificate Frank V. Knoll. 

Knowlton (1 file): marriage record for Joshua Knowlton and Eliza Holms, 1821. 

Koch (1 file): descendants of Johannes Koch  

Koehler (2 files) – File 1: excerpt from Connections magazine including Aurora Koehler. File 2: Charles E. 
– obituary, 1908. 

Konkle (1 file):  pedigree chart for Dennis Konkle, copies of Konkle newsletter, original photographs 
from 1999. 



Koontz (1 file): Jacob S. – Paternal family line and descendants related to Virginia Tattershall (nee 
Monroe), death certificate of Grace Handlon, death certificate of Anna Koontz, marriage record for 
Jacob S. Coonce and Ann Sanders, 1864; obituary for Jacob Coons, death certificate for Anna Koontz, 
1929; widow pension 1890. 

Korbley (1 file): jan. 8, 1914 newspaper article about Bernard Korbley, Chairman of Democratic State 
Committee.  

Kremer (1 file): descendants of John Peter Kremer and Catherine Reiter, obituary for Margaret Kremer, 
1935; obituary for John W. Kremer, 1927; reproduction photo of William amd Margaret Jacobs Kremer; 
obituary for Nicholas Kremer, 1928;  

*Krom (1 file): history of the Krom Family. 

Kreuger (11 file) – File 1: Walter – newspaper articles about Colonel Walter Krueger in the second world 
war, articles from 1946; due for retirement in 1946, May 3; Dec 31, 1952 Army to try daughter of Gen. 
Kreuger; obituary for Walter’s step father, Rev. E. C. Schmidt, 1925. File 2: newspaper articles about five-
star general Walter F. Krueger, 2/5/46, reproduction photo of young Walter. File 3: newspaper article 
4/6/46 5.000 attend freeman field army day; boyhood chums greet Krueger at Madison, no date. File 4: 
11/6/69 newspaper clipping about Kreuger Lake, Fort Sam Houston Museum website page about 
Kreuger House, letter from Walter Kreuger to William S. Dow. File 5: no date article Former 6th Army 
Commander cheered by San Antonians; Parade features welcome and photos from paper. File 6: April 
54, 1946 article Doughboy to General in Four Major Wars; served half century. Madison Courier. Alamo 
Scouts page from Fort Sam Houston Museum. File 7: copy of File 3. File 8: articles from Madison Courier 
4/5/46. File 9: 6/16/41 Indiana’s Only Lt. General has Served in Every Army Branch. File 10: aug. 21, 1967 
Gen. Walter Kreuger dies. March 1946 Army Day Committee Hears Reports of Progress – Reservations 
are made. 3/38/46 Rea Remembers Kreuger as Boy. File 11: photo copy of the family of Carl Hasse, 
photos og young Walter Kreuger, obituary of John W. Kreuger (brother), 1937; life sketch, info on 
daughter Dorothy Jane Kreuger Smith.  

Kronenberger (1 file): census records, august 6, 1919 newspaper about fire at Kronenberger building 
109 E Main; early Jefferson county newspaper mentions, Jefferson County Death Records for 
Kronenberger family, marriage ecord for David Hessauer and Eunice Kronenberger, 1875, obituary for 
Lehman Kronenberger, 1895; obituary for Max Kronenberger, 1905. 

Krum (3 files) - -File1: Lena – registration affidavit for alien female. File 2: Casper – Registration affidavit 
for alien enemy. File 3: Michael – descendant chart.  

Kugler (1 file): Mike – 7/31/1971 newspaper article History Lured Madisonian to Building Steamboats.  

Kuhns (1 file): Marvin – original booklet on the life and crimes of Marvin Kuhns. 

Kunkler (1 file): feb 14. 1855 newspaper mention of Dr. Kunkler tending to wounded. Obituary for Dr. G. 
A. Kunkler, 1879; January 17, 1863 letter in the paper from Dr. Kunkler.  



Kurtz (1 file): marriage record for George Kurtz and Margaret Houck, 1838. 

Kuntz (2 files) – File 1: 3-6-81 newspaper article Mrs. Lula Kuntz to celebrate her 104th birthday. File 2: 
George – born 1762, Germany. Died in Jefferson County, IN.  

Kyle (3 files) – File 1: services for J. R. Kyle, 1929. File 2: descendants of James Kyle (b. 1663); research 
notes; family unit sheets for the family of Joseph Kyle and Agnes Salisbury; descendant chart for Robert 
Kyle; life sketch of Thomas Kyle. File 3: copies of records from Virginia; 1810 census of virginia includes 
David james and Jerimiah Kyle; 1850 Rockingham County census record; correspondence, research 
notes; will of James Kyle in Jeff. Co. Ind.; James and Sarah Kyle life info.  

Kyser (1 file): Frederick – revolutionary war soldier, military information, grave marker information, Sons 
of the American Revolution application record.  

L 

Lagrange (1 file): J. W. - family unit sheets, information on the family of William H. Lagrange family, 
family unit sheet and information on the family of Jasper Wesley Lagrange.  

Lakeman (1 file): Pee Wee – newspaper article about Harold Lakeman’s life of service 10-2-04 

Lame/Laim (3 files) – File 1: Compressed pedigree of Nancy Lame, descendants of Nancy Lame. 
Marriage record for Abel Lame and Frances Cox, 1826. File 2: probate record, pedigree charts, 
genealogical inquiries, research notes. File 3: correspondence, family unit sheets, family historical info.  

Lanham (3 files) – File 1: July 14, 1984 article with details about Preacher James Lanham, marriage 
record for William Lanham and (?)ester Wallace, 1837. Newspaper clipping, cemetery tours, no date. 
File 2: census record for minister Charles N. Lanham, newspaper article about fatal injuries to John C. 
Lanham, aug. 8, 1945; obituary for Clara Lanham. File 3: obituary for George Adama, 1918; funeral 
announcement for Rev. James W. Lanham, 1919; obituary for Mance Lanham, 1945. July, no date, 
newspaper article about J. W. Lanham’s life work.  

Landon (1 file): obituary for Malinda Zenor Landon (d. Apr. 22, 1894). Obituary for Crozier Landon (d. 
May 9, 1895).  

Lane (1 file): lineage of Jacob Callaway, marriage record for Granville Lane and Percilla Townsend, 1853; 
obituary for sallie Thomas, 1892; obituary for Elizabeth Lane, 1999; obituary for Floyd Lane, 1995; obit. 
For William W. Lane, 1925; obit. For Fanny Manford, 1926; obituary for Nancy Lane, 1892.  

Langhorne (1 file): early American genealogy bio.  

Langsdale (1 file): Robert – 11/24/1984 article about paintings.  

Langton (1 file): early American genealogy bio.  

*Lanier (34 files) – File 1: Forum, The Reader’s Corner by Frank L. Bird Indianapolis Star article Dec. 12, 
1976 about the Lanier family in Madison and the state of Indiana. File 2: Last will and testament of Mary 



McClure Lanier, New York State. File 3: Madison Courier June 28, 1917 Lanier Mansion described, a few 
early family life dates. File 4: early Lanier family record sources from North Carolina. File 5: family bible 
record copy, April 25, 1917 Charles Lanier gives mansion to the historical society. File 6: Lanier 
newsletter, 1995; 11-3-1986 newspaper article about the mansion. File 7: family bible records, book 
excerpt about James F. D. Lanier Home. File 8: excerpt from Indiana Magazine of History: The Lanier 
Family and The Lanier Home by Blanche Goode Garber, Madison. File 9: Deed from James Lanier to 
William Whittenton, deed book 3 page 177, 1746. File 10: report on Lanier family by Candace Tingle, 
Courier Journal spread Feb. 13, 1927. File 11: 1927 booklet The James F. D. Lanier Home an Indiana 
Memorial; deed 1728; descendants of Nicholas Lanier (d. 1612). File 12: omage of Fanny Lanier 
Applegate, 1919; mansion pamphlet. File 13: 1851 deed copy, book excerpt New Light on the Ancestry 
of Sidney Lanier by Lena E. Jackson and Aubrey Starke. File 14: bio sketch of J. F. D. Lanier and family. 
File 15: obituary for Alex C. Lanier, no date; letter from Jefferson County Historical Society; letter to 
Drusilla cravens from Ohio State Archeological and Historical Society; newspaper article about Charles 
Lanier, June 17, 1927. File 16: 1927 newspaper clipping, Lindbergh connection; letter to Drusilla Cravens 
from Lanier McKee. Lanier family information, obit for J. F. D. Lanier. File 17: research notes from 
Drusilla Cravens, and a letter. File 18: copy of early document sources. File 19: newspaper articles: July 1, 
1939 Joseph Cravens; list of Daily Banner by J. R. C. Aug. 14, 15, 16, 18, 20, 23, 26, 27, 1851; Madison 
Herald June 30, 1939 obit for Joseph Cravens; Madison Courier June 10, 1939 obit for Joseph Cravens. 
File 20: Madison Courier front page article March 13, 2000; newspaper article, no date, History of the 
Lanier Home; Madison Courier 4/17/2000; no date magazine spread about mansion. File 21: highlight of 
Shrewsbury and Lanier homes in Madison, no date. File 22: Will of John Lanier, 1803 book 1 p. 419. 
Newspaper clipping 2.7.1932 Valuable data is given on Laniers. File 23: original letters. File 24: 
2/21/2000 Lanier Site Receives Washington Portrait, 1817 and 1819 letters, The Harrison Post Sept. 7, 
1995. File 25: 1921 letter from North Carolina genealogist to Drusilla Cravens, original pamphlet The 
Lanier Home State Memorial, Indiana Republican July 10, 1819 Brigade Orders, info in Joseph Street. File 
26: copy of 1865 letter from Winslow Lanier, magazine article Town and Country July 1927 about 
Charles Lanier Lawrence. File 27: constitution of Lanier descendants, 1761 deed from Arthur and E 
Williams to James Lanier Pitt Co., NC, book A page 105. File 28: newspaper articles, no dates. File 29: 
Lewis Lanier (1756-1839) record sources, genealogy done by The College of Heraldry London. File 30: 
deed copy. File 31: 10/27/1931 article about Lanier Mansion, research notes. File 32: 6/23/1917 article, 
1927 articles. File 32: Burwell – bio sketch.  

Lantry (1 file): correspondence. 

Lapham (1 file): early American genealogy bio 

*Lard (1 file): Charles K. – excerpts from the diary of Charles K. Lard, Hammond family connection 
research.  

Larimore (4 files) – File 1: James Larimore, revolutionary soldier bio sketch. File 2: lineage of Andrew 
Jackson Larimore. File 3: golden anniversary clipping. File 4: The Larimore Family. 



Lathrop (1 file): Lyman – marriage record to Susan Wilson, 1821. Marriage record for Augustus Lathrop to 
Luca Hillis, 1825. Madison Courier July 14, 1896 obituary for Margaret Lathrop; 1887 obit. For Lyman 
Goole Lathrop. Obit for William W. Crozier. 

Lattimore (1 file): October 7, 1874 Madison Courier Golden Wedding, bio sketch of Zephaniah Lloyd.  

Latta (1 file): Robert – census 1860, regiment history, soldier history. 

Law (6 files) – File 1: excerpt of The Laws of the Land, descendants of William Law. File 2: descendants of 
William Law (b. 1693), correspondence. File 3: marriage record for John Law to Sarah Eastin, 1837. File 4: 
marriage record for Jesse Law to Jane Staples, 1825. File 5: Notes for Jesse Law, family members list. File 
6: Descendancy chart beginning with William Law.  

Laws (1 file): marriage record for Stephan Law and May Davis, 1836. 

Lawler (2 files) – File 1: Martha – obituary, May 22, 1918. File 2: Joseph L. – family unit sheet, death 
certificate, death certificate for Lillian Lawler (1910).  

*Lawson (3 files) – File 1: Robert Lawson (b.1818) notes, newspaper article about L.G. Lawson making 
barrel chairs 4/10/1972. File 2: early American genealogy bio. File 3: Mark – information on the death of 
a child in the 1974 tornado.  

Layton (1 file): info on Gabriel Layton (b.1802).  

Laythrop (1 file): descendants of Hannah House, marriage record for Augustus Lathrop and Susan (?) or 
Lucie Hillis, 1825. 

Leach (1 file): Jefferson OCuinty record sources, Madison city directory pages, obituary for Mary A. 
Leach, 1932;  

Ledgerwood (1 file): 1996 newspaper article about the death of Don LEdgerwood, 50th wedding 
anniversary clipping, April 19, 1953; Nov. 27, 1971 article WCTU tribute paid to Mrs. Ledgerwood; 
obituary for Elizabeth Ledgerwood, 1971; June 5, 1945 article about Donald W. Ledgerwood  

*Lee (15 files) – File 1: Jefferson County court records, census records for James C. Lee, family unit 
sheets. File 2: November 25, 1967 Madison Courier newspaper article about Lee genealogy and Hall’s 
Ridge. File 3: Madison Courier newspaper article Nov. 11, 1967 on Lee genealogy and Hall’s Ridge and 
Bear Wallows. File 4: Robert E. and Virginia Lodge – local gunsmith in 1840s, census record 1850, 
research notes. File 5: family unit sheets for the family of Hugh Jamison Lee and Lucy W. Short and 
Elizabeth Mathias. File 6: family unit sheets for the family of John Lee (b. 1761) and Keziah Moberly. File 
7: Lee Family History beginning with Gershom Lee (b.1706) and Thomas Lee (b.1650). newspaper article 
Nov. 30, 1905 about Rudolph Manford tearing down house. File 8: Jefferson county record source lists. 
File 9: 9/7/1978 Rev. Lee, honorary Canaan mayor, has served many churches in area. File 10: interview 
transcript with Herbert T. Buchanan, Oct. 29, 1971 with Delores Jackson. Mercer and related families, 
Lee, Short, Manville, Atkins; copy of 1812 letter from George Shannon Sr. File 11: marriage record for 



Charles Lee and Nancy Margison, 1834. File 12: Nathaniel Lowery – family unit sheet, cemetery records, 
research notes. File 13: William – excerpt from African Americans in Jennings County, 1833 “free 
negroes: index from Shenandoah, pedigree chart, War of 1812 military records, William “Billy” Lee Rev 
war records, Indiana death certificate (1901), Will and proof of probate of William Lee (1896), 1833 Jeff. 
Co. tax record, 1840 cenus, 1850 census, 1860 census, marriage record for Sarah Lee and Edward 
Pettifoot (1878). File 14: Lee/Ford – The Ford Family of Kentucky and Indiana, John Lee of Jefferson 
County father of Mary E. Lee. File 15: descendant of Gershom Lee Jr, family unit sheet, obituary for Mary 
Catherine Roberts, 1905. 

Lefeber (1 file): Jefferson County record sources, correspondence, research notes.  

Lehnert (1 file): coat of arms and history of the family in Madison 1862-1996. 

Leineweber (2 files) - File 1: The Mathias Leineweber family of Germany to Madison, In. File 2: 
naturalization records, census records, St. Anthony cemetery records, family unit sheet. 

Leland (2 files) – File 1: Stanley J. – 1983 California article about former assistant surgeon general from 
Madison. File 2: will of Edwin Leland (1891), family unit sheets for the family of Simeon Lelnad and 
Rhoda Hill, index to probate records for Viola Leland, obituary for S. E. Leland (oct. 28, 1935), will of 
Elbridge Leland, Index to will of Hattie Leland, Sept. 24, 1891 obituary for E. G. Leland.  

Lemen (4 files) – File 1: oral history transcript with Hiram Lemen, April 16, 1951 Death claims Harry 
Lemen after stroke; obituary for Hiram Lemen, marriage record for Harry Lemen and Erna Galusha, 
obituary for John C. Maddox, 1925. File 2: Harry Lemen – bio sketch. File 3: funeral announcement for 
Eugene Lemen April 4, 1910; obituary for George W. Lemon, no date; obituary for Albert Lemen, dec. 
1949; will index for Augustus Lemon, 1829, marriage record for Samuel Lemen and Z. David, 1837. File 4: 
census record for John Lemon, obit for Lucy Lemen, no date; obituary for Margaret Lemen, 1925; obit 
for Bernard Lemen, 1981; Erna Galusha Lemen, 1970. 

Lemon (1 file): research notes.  

Lepper (2 files) – File 1: wedding announcement for Sarah Bradbury, Dec. 27, 1995; Dec. 24, 1890 body 
of young Lepper found on farm. Dec. 26, 1890 mention of Capt Ed. Lepper and Nephew William; Dec. 22, 
1890 Capt. Ed Lepper looking for missing nephew; Dec. 19, 1890 Clew to the missing man; obituary for 
A. F. Lepper Dec. 31, 1890; Dec 16, 1890 newspaper mention; Aug. 31, 1893 W. O. lepper in the paper; 
Will C. Lepper arrives home from the Klondikes, no date; Dec. 15, 1898 Will C. Lepper in the Klondikes; 
family of Benjamin Clinton Lepper and Sarah M. Copes; May 26, ’53 – machinery of Charles Hammond 
was set up in the ship yard; May 28, 1853 – The Union Line; May 20, 1852 Emma Dean boat mentioned; 
Feb. 11, 1863 Shrewsbury shot in the knee?; Daily courier May 16, 1853 Michael Mullen newspaper 
mention; May 5, 1863 ; Down memory lane with Billy Lepper; Death claims capt Lepper in St. Louis, 
reproduction photo. File 2: Life of Billy Lepper from newspaper articles, obit for Ben. C. Lepper, census 
records, obit for David K. Lepper, 1935; Oct. 25, 1898 newspaper mention about failing health of Ben C. 
Lepper; Sept. 20, 1893 Clerk Ben Lepper at fair in Chicago with family; reproduction photos; Frank 
Vawter married to Lilliam Lepper, 1894; obit for wife of W. C. Lepper; Aug. 3, 1896 Wm. Lepper mention. 



Lewis (13 files) – File 1: marriage record for Cosby Lewis and Uzillah Mayberry, 1827. File 2: DAR military 
service record for William Oliver Lewis. File 3: Howell - copy of letter. File 4: marriage record for Preston 
Lewis and Anna West, 1866; obit for Mary Lewis, 1957; June 28, 1940 M’Nary named Willkie Mate in 
presidential quest. File 5: Archie – information on late citizen of Madison, Lemen Collection. File 6: info 
on Howell Lewis, census records, list of children, cemetery records. File 7: marriage record for John 
Lewis and Rachel Dumint, 1837. File 8: George – Telegraph Aug 20, 1886 George B Lewis is an operator 
in the employ of this company in good standing and has been given 30 days leave of absence. File 9: 
Lewis family reunion held 10-12-1982. Marriage record for Jesse Taylor and Nancy Salyers, by Abraham 
Lewis, 1837. File 10: family unit sheet for William Turner and Mrs. Turner, The Parkison Family, excerpt 
from History of Washington County, Pennsylvania James Rodgers famil, History of Butler County 
Pennsylvania Parker Township, Excerpt from The Old and New Monongahela Scott Family, Mayfield 
family record sources. File 11: correspondence, census records.  

Lichliter/Lichlyter (3 files) – File 1: land info for Frederick Lichlyter, ancestor chart. File 2: family unit 
sheets, record sources. File 3: family information beginning with Jacob Lickliter (b.1777). 

Light (1 file): Russell – June 23, 1973 Madison man directed Bangladesh harbor work. 9-10-1977 Light’s 
salvage business keeps him busy all around the world.  

Lilly (1 file): Josiah Kirby – death notice, 1948.  

Linck (1 file): John W. – bio sketch, 1883 obituary.  

Lind (1 file): Jenny – Apr. 10, 1937 Former Madison man recalls date of famous concert.  

Lindley (1 file): Oliver and Acenath – land information, early census records, Find a Grave pages.  

Ling (1 file): Aug 18, 1908 William Ling probate newspaper article.  

*List (3 files) – File 1: The List Family, compiled in 1938. File 2: Notes on History and Lineage of List 
Family in Europe and America. File 3: List Family research and sketches.  

Little (2 files) – File 1: correspondence, Feb. 27, 1882 obituary for Rev. Henry Little D. D. bio sketch of 
Henry Little. File 2: obituary for Samuel Little, 1914; death certificates, Samuel William Little life info, 
William S. Little info, obituary and death certificate for William Little, 1919; death cert. for Rhoda Little; 
census and marriage records for Louise Little, info for Jesse Little.  

Littlejohn (4 file): marriage record for Lemuel Littlejohn and Ann Bice, 1825. File 2: marriage record for 
Elijah Littlejohn and Jane Jones, 1834. File 3: John – history of Methodism in Kentucky by W. E. Arnold, 
pg. 157 John Littlejohn. File 4: John – Revolutionary Archives Washington, D. C. Oct. 1947 Pension 
Application #6851.  

Littleken (1 file): marriage record for John Littken and Eliza Lunsford, 1837.  



Lloyd (2 files) – File 1: bio sketch of Zephaniah Lloyd, Golden anniversary newspaper article for 
Zephaniah Lloyd and Ann Lattimore, Oct. 7, 1874. File 2: Lloyd – Carpenter family About Our Ancestors 
newspaper clipping, no date. Obituary for Oliver Lloyd, son of Zephaniah and Ann died 1922.  

Lochard (2 files) – File 1: Joseph – bio sketch of Revolutionary War veteran. File 2: Thomas C. & family – 
information on Thomas Coagley and Louise Mary Kiser Lockard.  

Lockridge (1 file): Chas and Inez – 3/19/1979 71 years, marriage on leap day; obituary for Bernard 
Lockridge, 1979; David Lockridge, 1949; Apr. 7, 1920 Lockridge Fined $500 for assault and battery. 

Lodge (4 files) – File 1: marriage record for Nelson Lodge and Rebecca K. Lamond, 1826. Death notice of 
William J. Lodge Oct. 8, 1864. Obituary for James Lodge, 1905; death notice for wife of Josabad Lodge, 
1890. File 2: obituary for Bill Lodge, 1978, Obit for Caleb Lodge, no date; 9-26-1978 Lodge named editor 
of Mass. Weekly; 1952 death claims Robert Lodge; obituary for Drusilla lodge, 1987; obituary for Gavin 
Knox Lodge II, May 31, 1969. Older info on Lodge family.  File 3: Gavin Knox – obituary in the Madison 
Courier, June 1, 1969. File 4: John – Madison Weekly Courier Nov. 15, 1815 railway accident that killed 
John Lodge newspaper article, records and census for John Lodge. File 13: Edward H. “Eddie” – 
correspondence, marriage record for Edward Lewis and Shelia Kay Gordon ?, obituary (1980), family unit 
sheets, information on United Shoe Corp.  

*Logan (5 files) – File 1: newspaper clipping October 15, 1992 deed for Logan’s Point in Hanover, 
Genealogy of Margaret Harrison Logan, newspaper article 2/21/1981 on George Logan (bought land that 
became Logan’s Point in 1816). File 2: marriage record for James Logan and Mary Alexander, 1829. File 
3: marriage record for Thomas Logan and Elizabeth Ann Bell, 1847. File 4: marriage record for Francis 
Logan and Elizabeth Ireland, 1843. File 5: information related to Francis Asbury Logan and Elizabeth 
Ireland. 

Long (4 files) – File 1: lineage of Cordia D. Long. File 2: Alan W. – pamphlet of art pieces. File 3: Linda 
(French) – Sept 24, 1977 Authors and Musicians. 11/4/1994 New Book discussed by author. File 4: 
Homer – census records, former principal of Madison High School.  

Lorenze (2 files) – File 1: Emma – registration affidavit of alien female. File 2: Henry – Registration 
affidavit for alien enemy.  

Loring (2 files) – File 1: family of David Loring. File 2: marriage record for Richard Loring and Cinthia 
Rector, 1823.  

Lory (2 files) – File 1: David – January 11, 1973 Retired Madisonian tells of Hollywood film making. File 2: 
Milo – Local Native is winner of Oscar Award, editing for Ben-Hur.  

Losey (2 files) – File 1: family unit sheets for the family of Solomon Losey (b. 1792), census records for 
James Locey. File 2: information on Solomon Losey. 

Lothspeich (5 files) – File 1: The descendant families of Johann Lothspeich and Katharina Rudolf of 
Schutterwald (Baden) Germany, Early settlers in China, Jeff. Co. Ind. File 2: family unit sheets for the 



family of Antone Lothspeich and Walburgia Bly. File 3: Andrew – registration affidavit of alien enemy. 
File 4: family unit sheets. File 5: Lothspeich Heritage 1850-1985. 

Lott (1 file): Jesse and family – Henry C. Lott bio sketch (1879 McLean Co. History), Oct. 5, 1871 Another 
Murder, Oct. 7, 1871 Further particulars of the Lexington Murder. Ancestor chart for William Joseph 
Roop; Bloomington Ill. Feb 25, 1902 Sold a Farm; estate of Jesse Lott, families of Abner and John Lott of 
Virginia. Family unit sheet of Jesse Lott and Elizabeth Heaton.  

Lotz (1 file): Helen Lotz reproduction of Lemen photo, obituary for Helen Lotz, Life sketch, 1976 obituary 
for Dr. Benjamin G. Lotz.  

Louden (2 files) – File 1: Angela Nan – death certificate, obituary, died in car exhaust accident. File 2: 
William – family death certificates, marriage record.  

Loveland (1 file): early American genealogy bio. 

Lovell (1 file): marriage record for William Lovell and Hannah Tilley, 1838. 

Lowry (2 files) – File 1: Bard – newspaper article, no date young cartoonist. File 2: 1896 obit for Peter 
Hentz, obituary for Michael J. Lowry, no date; early wills of Jefferson County; obituary for Mary Lowry, 
1929; obit for Patrick Lowry, 1936; will of Catherine Lowry, census records, St. Patricks cemetery 
records.  

Luebke (1 file):  

Ludeker (1 file): correspondence. 

Lucht (1 file): descendant chart, obituary for Jacob Lucht 1936. 

Lund (1 file): Jeferson OCunty marriage record list, Lund Graveyard record, obituary for Allen Wiley 
Lund, 1894; 1894 burial of A. W. Lund; May 7, 1862 volunteer dead in Civil War, Thomas B. Lund; 1910 
death notice of Elizabeth Esterline. Ann Lund obituary, no date; will of John Lund. 

Lyle (1 file): family unit sheets, charts, family information.  

Lyon (3 files) – File 1: Johnathan bio sketch, obituary for William Lyon, 1990; Western Eagle Sept. 1813 A 
Proclmation by Johnathan Lyon, sheriff. File 2: Georgine and Family – Sept. 4, 1952 Georgine Lyon killed 
in schoolroom by suitor, next few days the Madison Courier has articles about the killer. Census records, 
find a grave pages for family. File 3: research notes, newspaper clipping April 5, 1972 Mr. and Mrs. Glenn 
Lyon Golden Wedding anniversary. 

Lytle (5 files) – File 1: Obituary for Ruth Lytle, no date; funeral handout for Ruth Lytle; newspaper 
clipping 1982 Lytle Mortuary. File 2: Markt – oct. 6, 1966 nespaper clipping Brooks David named City 
Mayor Pro-Tem after death of Markt Lytle. October 7, 1966 newspaper clipping Council Passes Lytle 
Resolution. File 3: obituary for Andrew Lytle, 1948; article on death Markt Lytle, Oct. 10, 1966 Funeral 
for Markt. File 4: copy of article in File 3. File 5: copies of Ruth Lytle articles.  



Mc 

McAuliffe (1 file):  

McBride (2 files) – File 1: correspondence. File 2: census records, Madison cirectory pages, marriage 
records, 1925 funeral for Dennis Manion, death notice for Ella Manion 1888, funeral of Catherine 
Manion 1915, obituary for Ida Manion 1958, obituary for Zoe McBride 1970, obituary for Charles 
McBride 1957, Lillian McBride 19661, Anna McBride 1986, George McBride 1947, Jeff Co. Cemetery 
records, Wills of Jeff co.  

McCain(e) (1 file): correspondence and research notes.  

McCartney (1 file): family unit sheets. 

McCasland (1 file): marriage records for Henry W. McCasland and Harriett H. Miller, 1854.  

McCaslin (1 file): marriage record for William M. McCaslin and Elizabeth Emily Roseberry, 1854.  

McCartney (1 file): probate records, life info for James McCartney, early newspaper mentions, early will 
index for John and James McCartney, cemetery records.  

McCarty/McCartney (3 files) – File 1: Jeff. Co. record source list, correspondence and research notes. 
File 2: marriage record for James McCartey and Mary Benefiel, 1815. Obituary for W. W. McCarty, M. D., 
1910. File 3: Thomas – revolutionary war pension for Thomas McCarty. 

McCarty (1 file): William James - family unit sheets, article about cane incised with Civil War battle 
record (1955), descendants’ chart, West Fork Baptist records.  

McCauley (3 files) – File 1: Philip W. – June 12, 1979 newspaper article Indiana Banker Elect McCauley as 
President; half page ad, congratulations to P. W. McCauley. Weekly Herald, newspaper article, no date, 
Ann Landers Steals the Show at Meeting of Indiana Bankers. File 2: Philip W. – 11/25/1986 McCauley is 
honored by chamber; 9/2/1970 McCauley to Speak at 9 IBA Meetings; 6/12/1970 honor given to 
McCauley. 4/2/1081 Golden wedding anniversary for Philip and Ida McCauley. File 3: marriage record for 
John McCauley and Jennett Eliza Reed, 1838. 

McClanahan (2 files) – File 1: L. A. – 10/16/1976 Dr. McClanahan busy in retirement after leave 
chiropractor practice. Obituary for Dr. L. A. McClanahan, 1986. File 2: Robert – descendants of Robert 
McClanahan, will probated in 1791.  

McClelland (4 files) – File 1: family newsletter, 1990; DAR military service record for William Oliver 
McClelland, The McClelland Family sketch. File 2: marriage record for William E. McClelland and 
Elizabeth Wilkinson, 1836. File 3: information on James and Sarah Ewing McClelland in Jeff. Co. File 4: 
information on William McClelland, pedigree chart, census records, family of Hazel Reed Havens 
descendant of James McClellan, census records for Richard McClelland, info on Johnson Brown a Rev. 
War soldier, marriage record for William McCLelland and Lucy McCasland in 1839, information on 
William Porter McClellan (d.1915), History of the Carson Family.  



McCluggage (1 file): Jan – 1-20-1979 Hydroplanes, racing are subjects of book by Jan McCluggage wife of 
Miss Madison boat crewman.  

*McClure (7 files) – File 1: May 14, 1924 Capt. Robert McClure in Fox News Movies; no date Heart Attack 
takes life of Gen. McClure; life sketch of Major General Robert Alexis McClure; Presidential papers of 
Dwight David Eisenhower #814 mentions General McClure; Feb. 6, 1952 Frank L. Eckert dies in Florida; 
Sept. 16, 1812 Frank Eckert and wife take son Robert McClure Eckert to military school; letter from 
Robert McClure in the paper Nov. 23, 1923; *newspaper article about service in Africa, no date. File 2: 
obit. For Catherine McClure, 1864; cemetery records, early newspaper mentions, Jeff. CO. marriages; life 
sketch of Carles Heberbart, son of Charles and Jennie McClure Heberhart; obituary for David L. McClure 
1892; early wills ion Jeff. Co. index; obituary for Mary Elizabeth Garlinghouse daughter of Jonathan 
McClure, 1927; obituary for Ebenezer Rodgers, 1885. File 3: McClure family sketch, Jan. 11, 1900 Col. 
William S. McClure sketch in the newspaper. File 4: information on Jonathan McClure, a Revolutionary 
War soldier, and family information. File 5: William – obituary for Martha McClure, 1880; letters from 
William McClure, 1830s; 8/2/1985 McClure reunion in the paper. File 6: William – copy of Jan. 11, 1900 
write up of Col. Wm S. McClure in the newspaper. File 7: copy of letter dated 1843, William McClure to 
serve on the Indiana General Assembly in 1842.  

McCoy (4 files) – File 1: marriage record for William McCoy and Malindy Cline, 1824; ancestry sketch, 
census of Lancaster township, 1850; 9/11/1928 newspaper clipping Cairo Woman Quoted As an 
Authority on Life of John McCoy. File 2: obituary for James T. McCoy, 1911; census record for James 
McCoy, 1880. File 3: marriage record for Wesley McCoy and Isabel McClelland, 1837; newspaper article 
about kidnapping of McCoy children, March 28, 1892; Theo McCoy v. W. D. Patton, R. M. Martin, John D. 
Sharp, William Goodwin and Maria N. McCoy, March 29, 1892; reproduction image of William Eli 
McLelland. File 4: Jefferson county records, obit. For Charlie McCoy, 1891; obit. For Isabella McCoy, 
1895; pedigree chart for Charlotte Marie McCoy, Rev. War William Hall service records; funeral for 
Charles McCoy, 1926; March 14, 1892 McCoy children taken by mother; March 18, 1892 The McCoy 
Case.  

McCreary (1 file): census records, Jan. 3, 1969 Donald Wayne Brown died in Vietnam; March 5, 1892 
School Superintendent elected. 

McCune (1 file): marriage record for Joseph McCune and Maria Redenbaugh, 1826. 

McCutcheon (1 file): family sketch and family unit sheets for the family of William McCutcheon and 
Susan Jane Richmond.  

McDonald (3 files) – File 1: marriage record for Ophraim McDonald and Lavinia Baker, 1837. File 2: 
William B. – married to Lucy Frederick in 1824, family information. File 3:funeral services for John 
Sutherland, 1935; obituary for Mrs. John Sutherland, 1930; marriage record for John A. Sutherland and 
Mary B. McDonald, 1875; obituary for William B. McDonald, 1916; Obituary for Mrs. W. B. McDonald, 
1923; marriage record for William D. McDonald and Mary Ann Johnson, 1854; death certificate for Sara 
Nighbert; and Sidney Nighbert; Nighbert recirds, obituary for Shirley L. Nighbert, 1948; obituary for Lulu 
Nighbert, 1943; marriage ecord for Shirley Nighbert and Lulu Sutherland, 1901. 



McElroy (2 files) – File 1: correspondence. File 2: excerpt from Weik’s History of Putnam County Indiana, 
Alumni record from DePauw University, Sinclair family connection; obit. For Joseph R. Hamilton, 1895; 
life sketch of James McElroy; Early Jeff. Co. records, Sept. 16, 1946 newspaper clipping about a probate 
mentions Robert McElroy; Probate records. 

McFetridge (1 file): obituary for John L. McFetridge Jr., Dec. 28, 1883.  

McGannon (1 file): family unit sheets. 

McGaughey (1 file): marriage record for Daniel McGaughey and Frances Hiker, 1824. 

McGee (2 files) – File 1: marriage record for William McGee nad Margaree Ann Largo, 1824. File 2: early 
Jeff. Co. marriages, death notice for Ann M. McGee, 1888; census records, Halbert/Halbut family 
connection, Sheriff;s Sale Oct. 7, 1833; James McGee sketch from county souvenir book. 

McGill (1 file): correspondence and research notes.  

McGregor (2 files) – File 1:  biographical history of William McGregor (b.1828). File 2: census records for 
Thomas McGregor, obituary for Thomas McGregor, 1935 (living in Pasadena, Calif.), death notice for 
wife of James McGregor, 1876; obituary for James McGregor, 1899; newspaper article about Richard 
Johnson’s new cotton factory, Jan. 1, 1900; Funeral held for Mima McGregor, 1956; obituary for Marion 
McGregor, 1916, a teacher in Madison schools; obituary for Andrew McGregor, 1916. 

*McGuire (3 files) – File 1: descendancy chart for Jesse McGuire and son Ellison Dixson McGuire (b. 
1834). File 2: Michael – Civil War enrollment document, marriage record for Michael McGuire and Celia 
Burke, 1856; burial information, death certificate for Thomas McGuire, census records, immigration 
passenger information. File 3: McGuire and Rea families – list of mayors if Madison, including Ellison D. 
McGuire, McGuire and Rea family bio sketch, obituary for William McGuire, 1915. 

McHaffey (1 file): information on Fannie McHaffey, census of 1930, death certificate.  

*McIntire (1 file): obituary for John Oliver McIntire, 1850, descendants of John McIntire (d. 1836), family 
of William McLain.  

McKay (12 files) – File 1: marriage record for Sydney McKay and Mary E. Chambers, 1839. File 2: family 
unit sheets. File 3: early Jeff. Co. records, excerpt from county souvenir book, info on Robert McKay. File 
4: sketch of McKay Bros. store, lineage of Theodore L. McKay, Revolutionary War pension application for 
Robert McKay, 8/21/1936 newspaper clipping of Nancy McKay Carter, obituary for Stella Rausch, 1947; 
obituary for Mrs. George Kampe, 1953; obit. For T. L. McKay, 1954; obit. For Clifford McKay, 1952. File 5: 
five generations of Isaac McKay, newspaper article on McKay family, no date; correspondence, research 
notes, April 15, 1874 newspaper article in Madison Weekly about hunting. File 6: pedigree sheet, 
correspondence. File 7: lineage of Candace Taff Carr. File 8: obituary for Betty Dolby, 1947, obituary for 
Elizabeth McKay, 1919; 1947 obit for George McKay, 1952 funeral services for Clifford A. McKay, Nancy 
McKay, 1923; Grace McKay 1953, Opha McKay Joyce, no date; 1956 Dyer McKay. File 9: marriage record 



for George McKay and Mary Bain, 1838; McKay graveyard list. File 10: distribution of McKays in the 
United States in 1964. File 11: McKay Genealogy. File 12: correspondence.  

McKee (2 files): Alexander – immigration arrival record, family unit sheet, Aplotments, certificate of 
death for William J. Schmeich Sr., Madison Courier march 18, 1885 people who arrived to work in cotton 
mill. File 2: Also Moffett and Waugh – family unit sheets, family information.  

McKeehan (1 file): marriage record for John McKeehan and Eliza E. Sprout, 1838. 

McKenna/McKinney (1 file): family unit sheet for James McKenna, Census records, Leonidas Hudson 
census record.  

McKenzie (1 file): family list and birth dates, Bible records.  

McKim (1 file): Robert – three photos of the place where Robert mcKim was born, school and Methodist 
church; Jan. 30, 1883 McKim’s Observatory article; Feb. 10, 1869 to build a house on lot NW corner of 
second and Mill; 7/30/1994 newspaper article Irishman’s search for roots results in Madison connection; 
July 16, 1885 placing observatory at DePauw University; in memoriam Madison Courier May 9, 1887 life 
sketch.  

McKinley (1 file):  Early wills of Jeff. Co. index for McKinley family members, probate documents. 

McKinney (1 file): death certificate for Lillie Brown, family bible records, The McKinneys of North 
Carolina, census records.  

McLaughlin (7 files) – File 1: McLaughlin Genealogy History document beginning with Daniel McLaughlin 
of Scotland. File 2: copy of court documents on the naturalization of James McLaughlin, 1860. Court 
record for William McLaughlin of Galway, Oreland. Descendancy chart for William McLaughlin and 
Catherine Creighan. File 3: obituary for Ann McLaughlin, 1925; early Jeff. Co. marriages; obituary for E. 
B. McLaughlin, 1955. Recollection of family line. File 4: family unit sheet for William McLaughlin and 
Sarah (Sally) (m.1820s). File 5: census records for Philip McLaughlin, obituary for Philip, 1890. File 6: 
marriage record for John McLaughlin and Susanah Daniel, 1803; Who’s Who in American Education 
excerpt, Katherine Louise McLaughlin. File 7: descendants of George McLaughlin, ibituary for John W. 
McLaughlin, 1893; deathnotice for John McLaughlin, 1882; obit. For Lawrence McLaughlin, 1882; death 
notice for Michael McLaughlin, 1881; death notice for Mrs. McLaughlin, 1899; In Memoriam of Mrs. J. 
McLaughlin, 1896; article about a resort opened (Beech Grove Park), July 22, 1899; death of Andrew 
McLaughlin, 1883; article on sanitation, Jult 22, 1899.  

McLeland (1 file): correspondence, December 22, 1909 Springdale Cemetery made Association; Passed 
Dec. 6, 1839 Springdale Cemetery is established. Immigration list, April 26, 1879 reminiscences of People 
and Things Half a Century Ago; May 8, 1879 Pioneer History article. Sept. 11, 1888 Eagle Spring Grange 
mention. May 19, 1879 Madison History article in the paper. Livery Stable article April 5, 1883 Robert R. 
Rea;  March 22, 1883 sketch of two young soldiers. June 18, 1884 Eagle Cotton Mill Article.  

McMahan (1 file): Wilbur D. – find a grave page, marriage record, death certificate for Ada McMahan.  



McMillan (2 file) – File 1: Excerpt from Portrait and Biigraphical Album of Sumner Co., Kansas John T. 
McMillan. Obituary for John T. McMillan, 1894. 

McMoindes (1 file): marriage record for Isaac McMoindes and Mary Ann Dohoney, 1834.  

McNaghten (1 file): Jeff. Co. Cemetery records, McNaghtens in America, family sketch for Allen 
McNaghten, 1853 death notice for daughter of A.B. and Elizabeth McNaghten; Mr. A. S. McNaghten 
withdrawn from business 12/20/1851; early newspaper mentions; infant son of A.S. and Elizabeth 
McNaghten dies (8-18-1854) 

MacNaughton (1 file): family newsletter. 

McNeel (1 file): pedigree chart for Mary Harlow, descendants of William McNeel (b. 1810), descendants 
of Harrison Pogue (b. 1820).  

McNeely (1 file): McNeely-Redenbaugh Family – early Jeff. Co. tax records for John McNeely, records for 
the family of John McNeely and Margaret Ware Redenbaugh (m. 1819). 

McNutt (1 file): obituary for Anna McNutt, 1896; will of William McNutt, 1805 in Pennsylvania; family of 
Collin McNutt and Elizabeth Patterson; obituary for Ira McNutt, 1940; Fairmount cemetery record for 
Alex and Anna McNutt; Underwood Cemetery record for Amy K. McNutt; May 4, 1885 newspaper 
mention of Murder of Mrs. Ball by Dan Chandler; Bayless Cemetery record for Thomas K. and Elizabeth 
McNutt; Carmel Cemetery record; census records for Joseph McNutt.  

McNulty (1 file): records for Mararget Gill, Margaret L. McNulty.  

McPike (1 file): family bible records for the family of James McPike (b. 1790). 

McWilliams (1 file): Revolutionary War Pension application for James McWilliams North Carolina.  

McQuitha (1 file): Caleb – marriage record for Caleb McQuitha and Nancy Ann Slater, 1849. 

M 

Mace (1 file): Laurent and Family – family unit sheets, census records, 1871 death notice for Wyatt 
Mace. 

Mackeown (1 file): Early American Genealogy bio.  

Macpherson (1 file): Early American Genealogy bio. 

Maddox (1 file): pedigree chart for Walter Charles Maddox, family unit sheet for James H. Maddox and 
Frances Kemper, roll of Rev. War pensioners from Kentucky (Sherwood Maddox). 

Madison (1 file): Early American Genealogy bio. 

Mahoney (1 file): family reunion newspaper clipping 9/30/1986 



Maiden (1 file): family history beginning in Pennsylvania. 

Main (1 file): Thackery – correspondence and research notes.  

Major (1 file): Charles – 1972 newspaper article about Indiana Writer, romance novel.  

Malloy (1 file): record source list, for Catherine, Sarah and Peter Malloy.  

Mandeville (1 file): The Mandeville Genealogy, excerpt from Magazine of the Dutch Colonial Period in 
America, published by the Holland Society of New York; excerpt from The New York Genealogical and 
Biographical Record for the Van Blarcom family of New Jersey (July 1968); Ecxerpt from The New York 
Genealogical and Biographical Record for Gerretson-Garrison, Van Wicklen, Hardenbergh, and Wiltsie 
Descendants of Gerret Lubbertsen of Jamaica (July 1985); Excerpt from The New York Genealogical and 
Biographical Record for early Dutch Smiths and Van Boerums (April 1972). 

*Manley (1 file): family history beginning with James Manley and Hannah Marsh of Vermont (1774). 

Manuel (1 file): marriage record for Washington Manuel and Sarah Heath, 1834. 

Manville (1 file): obituary for John W. Manville, 1922; Excerpt from Pioneer Women of Southern Indiana 
about Martha Manville.  

Marks (1 file): Edward – obituary for Edward Marks, 1905. 

Markwell (2 files) – File 1: source list and notes. File 2: census records, article from the Herald July 15. 
1886 about the Sisters of Providence. Article about John Schnable’s vineyard, July 15, 1886. Madison 
Courier article May 4, 1899 Kimmell.  

Marsh (1 file): 3/19/1974 Madison Courier article about Oveda Marsh, songwriter.  

Marshall (10 files) – File 1: written accounts, Decision of Character by J. Marshall, bio of Joseph Glass 
Marshall, legislator from Jeff. Co. File 2: Curtis – obituary, 1957; Judge Curtis Marshall bio sketch. File 3: 
Edison – original pamphlet. File 4: Isaac – pedigree chart. File 5: Joseph G. – biography, article from 
newspaper Courier Jan. 26, 1900. File 6: biography of Joseph Glass Marshall. File 7: essay by J. Marshall, 
funeral announcement, no date; article about J. G. Marshall by W. W. Woolen. File 8: Thomas W. 
Marshall family genealogy, family unit sheets. File 9: Thomas K. Marshall – cemetery records, wills, 
census records, research notes. File 10: Jacob – family of Isabel Rice and Jacob Marshall information.  

Martin (8 files) – File 1: Luther – May 16, 1910 death of Mr Luther Martin; May 18, 1910 burial of Luther 
Martin; both in the Madison Telegraph paper. File 2: Luther – Morgan’s Raid, Madison Courier article 
July 10, 1950 anniversary of Luther martin, telegrapher, warning Madison of Morgan’s Raid. File 3: 
8/16/1983 newspaper article for Luther Martin Day. File 4: Luther – 8/3/1983 Council votes to move 
mock battle back to Main Street and Martin Community Day events. Jan. 9, 1896 article about Mr. 
Luther Martin, telegrapher. File 5: marriage record for Cain M. Martin and Evline Ann Cutler, 1829. File 
6: Earle E. – Former Madisonian is editor for the Cleveland Times, no date. File 7: marriage record for 



Samuel R. Martin and Ruth Ann Bryant, 1837. File 8: Martin Family History, family of Joseph Martin who 
came to Jeff. Co. in 1833.  

*Marquis (4 files) – File 1: Robert – copy of deed, family info. File 2: Israel – family descendants of 
Samuel Marquis (came to America in 1749). File 3: Tree of the Marquis Family of Southern Indiana, Land 
patents for Jeff. Co., info on Robert Marquis. File 4: census record and research notes.  

Mashall (1 file): Orrin – biography of a long time steamboat engineer.  

Massing (2 files) – File 1: marriage record for Peter Massing and Louisa Holser, 1875. File 2: census 
records for Peter and Jacob Massing, obituary for Barbara Kramer Massing, 1951; obituary for Peter 
Massing, 1928; death notice for Jacob Massing, 1917; Joseph Massing, 1920. 

Mason (1 file): marriage record for Madison Mason and Mary Nettles, 1838.  

Matthews (6 files) – File 1: marriage record for William Matthews and Sophia Needham, 1854. File 2: 
Lillian R. – newspaper article 1/6/1979 Stroke victim hopes new club will help others ‘come back.’ File 3: 
Jefferson County sources list. File 4: death of Vinton A. Matthews, 1906. File 5: obituary for Della M. 
Vestile, 1981; Feb. 5, 1991 Hoosier Homestead Owners to Thomas and Virginia Matthews; family bible 
records for the family of John and Elizabeth Lee Matthews (m. 1831); lineage of Thomas Matthews; 
military service record for Vinton Hunt Matthews; memories of Vinton and Emma Matthews; Hunt 
Family bio. File 6: Pedigree charts.  

Maupin (1 file): correspondence.  

Mouser (1 file): descendants of Jacob Mouser/Mauser (b.1815); census records, SAR application for 
Benjamin Franklin Mouser; descendants of Ann Terwilliger/teweiger; July 8, 1983 article Early days of 
Ziar church; family reunion newspaper clippings: 9/9/1983, 9/3/1985.  

Mavity (1 file): marriage record for James Mavity and Kesiah Evans, 1832. 

Maxwell (8 files) – File 1: information on Caswell Finley Maxwell and family. File 2: David H. – family unit 
sheets for First president of the Indiana University Board of Trustees, David Hervey Maxwell. File 3: Jan. 
16, 1984 They Said and Did in West Jefferson newspaper article; list of surnames referred to in Maxwell 
History and Genealogy; copy of 1919 letter; reproduction photos of Maxwell house in Hanover, Jeff. Co.; 
short bio sketch for David Maxwell, son of Bezeleel Maxwell; obituary for Charles B. Maxwell, 1975. File 
4: copy of Maxwell History and Genealogy, 1916; Early American Genealogy bio. File 5: B. – newspaper 
article Jan. 12, 1984 about the historic home of Bezeleel Maxwell. File 6: John – marriage record for John 
Maxwell and Elenor Marquis, 1819. File 7: Bezeleel – pedigree chart for Mary Katherine Maxwell (m. to 
George Austin Kuhns); copy of 1821 affidavit releasing female child of color from service. File 8: John 
and Family – information related to family of Sarah Dunn Maxwell (married to John), family unit sheets, 
census records. 

Martin (1 file): The Ayersville Martins, descendants of Joseph (b. 1745) and Richard (b. 1758) Martin.  



May (1 file): John – pension application, death announcement for Mancy May, no date.  

Mayer (1 file): obituary for John Mayer, 1891; obituary for Mrs. John Mayer, 1896. 

Mayfield (2 files) – File 1: census records, information on Miller-Mayfield family, research notes. File 2: 
research notes.  

Maynard (1 file): Ken – 1973 newspaper spread about the passing of Vevey native, Ken Maynard, and 
obituary.  

*Means (3 files) – File 1: pedigree chart for Esta Means (married to Lewis Henry Owen). File 2: Means 
Family History, obituary for William Edward Means (1986). File 3: marriage record for James R. Means 
and Malinda Wallace, 1854.  

Meddock (1 file): Emanuel – Revolutionary War pension application.  

Meek (3 files) – File 1: Alexander A. and Fielding – Aug. 24, 1987 newspaper article Local Masons to 
Observe Tribute Day. Madison Weekly Courier Apr. 11, 1877: A Distinguished Madisonian. Newspaper 
article April 7, 1877 about Fielding Bradford Meek. Family unit sheet and information on individuals. Bio 
on Fielding B. Meek, paleontologist. October 27, 1899 large newspaper article about Alexander Meek. 
File 2: Tanner family connection, will of Alexander Meek, Fielding Bradford Meek Scholarship from South 
Dakota School of Mines and Technology Dept. of Geology and Geological Engineering. Information on 
the Megatherium Club, Nov. 27, 1917 newspaper article about 100 year old building with brick found 
bearing name Meek. Smithsonian Institute Fielding B. Meek Papers (1843-1877). File 3:  Indiana 
Republican April 3, 1819 Alexander Meek appointed by the president to be attorney of the US for the 
district of Indiana. Bio sketch of Fielding B. Meek, Papers of Joseph Henry of the Smithsonian Institution. 

Meeker (1 file): Early American Genealogy bio.  

Meekins (1 file): marriage record for Lewis Meekins and Charlotte Cope, 1834.  

Mellen (1 file): John, George and Granville – early newspaper mentions, Madison Weekly Courier Nov. 
28, 1846 death of Harriet H. Mellen, Madison Daily Courier Sept. 18, 1851 advertisement, MDC Sept. 13, 
1851 death announcement of John Mellen, death certificate for Granville P. Mellen, 1850 census for 
George MEllen, Madison City Directory page from 1859-60 for Mellen and Co.  

Melton (6 file) – File 1: research notes. File 2: Wade and William – correspondence and family unit 
sheets, Nove. 23, 1895 death announcement of Wade Melton, Nov. 25, 1895 obituary for Wade Melton, 
Dec. 5, 1895 obituary for Wade Melton, April 28, 1890 article in Madison Daily Courier about J. M. 
Melton horses. File 3: descendants of Robert Melton (b. 1763). File 4: marriage record for John Melton 
and Elizabeth Deney, 1824. File 4: word pictures and scribblings by Carrie A. Melton original booklet. File 
6: Samuel: correspondence, census records, civil war records, discharged from Indiana 146th. 

Menke (1 file): Jon – Feb. 22, 2011 Honoring a War Hero.  

Meny (1 file): My Memoirs by Rev. B. Hilary Meny, retired Pastor of St. Patrick’s Church in Madison, IN. 



Mercer (1 file): early American genealogy bio. 

Meredith (3 files) – File 1: Life Story of Mildred Phillips Meredith (1919 – 2007), An Autobiography; 
obituary, 2007 File 2: Early American Genealogy bio.  

Mermound (2 file) – File 1: family bible records and short genealogy bio. File 2: family record, updated in 
1986. 

Merryman (1 file): marriage record for Hockersmith Merryman and Elizabeth Smith, 1834. 

Mersdorff (2 files) – File 1: obituary for John E. Mersdorff, 1940; pallbearers at funeral, nov. 23, 1940; 
marriage record for Frank R. Selleck and Edna M. Mersdorff; marriage record for John Mersdorff and 
Mary Newman, 1849; obituary for Mrs. John Mersdorff, 1910; Jeff. Co. marriages J.E. Mersdorf, 1892; 
census record. File 2: 1885, death notice for John Mersdorff; newspaper mention of attendants of the 
funeral of Mrs. Mary Mersdorff, Feb 20, 1899; marriage listing for Katie Mersdorff and Edward Hagedon, 
1882; census records, obituary for Mrs. Mary Mersdorff, 1899. 

Messick (1 file): Johnny – excerpt from the Madison Courier about the youngest soldier in the Civil War, 
Johnny Messick, a drummer boy whose father was LT. Jacob Messick and captured at Chickamuga. 
December 5, 1864.  

Metcalf (1 file): and Hinds family, fact sheet for Sarah E. Metcalf, sources of Jeff. Co. info, 
correspondence.  

Metzler (2 files) – File 1: census records, marriage on Jeff. Co. for two John Metzlers to Minnie Johnson 
(1885) and Lottie Mock (1877). File 2: research notes. 

Meuser (1 file): Oct. 21, 1880 accident involving George Meuser; Nov. 26, 1880 article about raising 
funds for George Meuser’s accident benefit.  

Meyer (2 files) – File 1: Henry Hoppner – information on English printer and painter, married in Indiana 
and his son, also an artist. File 2: Louis – newspaper spread about the 50-year celebration for racer Louis 
Meyer.  

Meyerholtz (1 file): descendants of Christoph Diedrich Meyerholtz through his son Herman Hinrich 
Meyerholtz.  

Meyers (1 File): Paul – newspaper article dated Feb. 12, 1957 Paul Meyers is last of oil peddlers. 

Midcalf (1 file): marriage record for Uri Midcalf and Polly Hutchinson, 1826.  

*Middleton (7 files) – File 1: early American genealogy bio; Circus Historical Society, Middleton 
Monument about George Middleton’s life; article Jan. 15, 1909 about George Middleton’s career in 
amusement. File 2: research on Francis Middleton, married to Margaret Lichlyter; descendants of 
Abethran Francis Middleton and genealogical info; John Middleton of Georgia, carpenter; family group 
sheets, excerpt from British Aliens in the United States During the War of 1812. File 3: family bible 



records; obituary for George Middleton; jane Middleton, 1888; James Middleton, 1871; Mrs. Katie 
Middleton, 1921; young daughter of George, 1877; Joseph Rea, 1916; Newspaper article sketch of 
George Middleton, April 8, 1908; 4-26-2003 article about civil war monument by courthouse, paid for by 
George Middleton; Feb. 15, 1926 article about donating the monument; 12-11-1875 newspaper article 
about brothers Charles and George Middleton in show business; 1-28-2006 newspaper article about 
church window donated by George Middleton in the Christ Episcopal Church; photo reproduction of 
George; April 23, 1895 newspaper article George Middleton A Madison Boy in the Old World; April 5, 
1889 body of the father of Sheriff Middleton moved to Springdale Cemetery. File 4: George – newspaper 
article about the reading of his will, estate valued at $2 million in 1926, 33 million in 2022; copy of will 
on page 6 of the Madison Courier March 2, 1926. File 5: Feb. 27, 1877 Evening Star article about the 
death of daughter of George and Kate Middleton, Pauline Bailey Middleton; March 1, 1877 Evening star 
Mamie Middleton getting well from illness that killed her sister, Pauline; March 9, 1877 Mamie passes 
away; August 19, 1911 George Middleton sells out his Chicago Theater Interests; write up on the 
window in Christ Church. File 6: Lydia – Obituary, 1939; They Say and Do in the Country 5-15-1938, Lydia 
Middleton School Musicale lineup Friday, May 16th, 1924. File 7: Lydia – Lemen collection information, 
1930 obituary.  

Miles (1 files): marriage record for Richard Miles and Frances Cerolien 1851. Jeff Co. deed index; bio 
sketch of Isaac Miles, bio sketch of Francis M. and Allen W. Miles; obit. For Mrs. Gertrude W. Miles, 
1985; deed between James Miles and Geo. Washington Leonard; Madison directory pages, Jeff. Co. 
marriage 1831.  

Mikessel (1 file): research notes, copy of marriage bond, 1809; copy of letter 1807; Jacob selling land in 
Bourbon Co. Ky, 1823; probate records; Clark Co. Indiana indenture Cornelius Mikesell; Trimble Co. Ky 
record sources. Jefferson County Ind. Record sources; Clark Co. Ind. Court record sources; family life 
dates and burial info; family unit sheets; descendants of Lowry Dare Mikesell; descendants of David 
Mikesell (b.1810); Descendants of Peter Mikesell (b. 1832); descendants of Andrew Mikesell (b. 1722); 
newspaper article Madison Courier dated January 4, 1939; correspondence copies; family bible records. 

Miller (19 files) – File 1: marriage record for Franklin Miller and Sarah Rutherford, 1834; Five 
Generations article, June 1952. File 2: S.J. – 6-30-1979 June and George Miller in new home in Tampa; 
Dec. 15, 1984 Dad’s toy store will long be remembered by George Miller; Nov. 8. 1985 family tree article 
in Madison Courier; July 3, 1971 S.J. Miller was Great Influence; obituary for Silas Jacob Miller, 6-26-
1971. File 3: S.J. - Nov. 14, 1970 Dad is now 85; Birthday Card News; clipping 6-19-1965 feeding ducks. 
File 4: George H. – October 30, 1982 44 Years of Millers; obituary for George Miller, no date. File 5: 
lineage of Archibald K. Walker. File 6: Robert Harrison – biography. File 7: 10-5-1931 Photograph Millers 
Three Generations; 8-14-1957 birthday of W.H. Miller in the Lumbar business for 71 years; 12-7-1956 
W.H. Miller to receive Gold Hammer. File 8: April 23, 1969 Genealogy Reveals a Chimney Shaker. File 9: 
April 25, 1972 George Miller Honored as High-Level Educator. File 10: Early American Genealogy Bio. File 
11: obituary for 105-year-old W.H. Miller, 1964; Newspaper spread of W.H. Miller & Sons Lumbar. File 
12: correspondence. File 13: descendants of W. H. Miller; obituary for Earl Miller Jr. and Michael Miller. 
File 14: Jan. 12, 1970 Refinishing Mother’s Old Trunk. File 15: May 24, 1969 From Sardine Can to Shrimp 
Boat; 7-14-1973 Lost a Friend. File 16: marriage record for Jonathan Miller and Rebecca Shannon, 1824. 



File 17: marriage record for Lemuel Miller and Boza A. McCoy, 1837. File 18: marriage record for John 
Miller and Polly Whitsett. File 19: family bible records for the family of David Miller. File 20: research on 
the family of Robert Miller.  

Millican (2 files) – File 1: information on John M. Millican Civil War pension, obituary for Robert Millican 
(1984), Millican Family History compiled by Sandra Carter-Duff (1990). File 2: copy of the Millican Family 
History (1990). 

Mills (2 files) – File 1: Mills/Monroe/Runyan – information on Samuel R. Mills, reproduction 
photographs, obituary for Julia Ann Broadwell Monroe, obituary for George Monroe, excerpt from 
Gateway to the West Vol.1 entry for 11-22-1804 Peter Mills, family member information Hulick family, 
Genealogical records of the Gulick Family 1953-1960, life sketch of Jasper Crane, Will of George Monroe 
from Rutherford County, N.C. (1784), Benjamin Hancock life info, Geneaology of the Mills Family, family 
tree. File 2: Dwight – newspaper article 6-27-1943 “Typical Madison’s typical family – the ‘Speedy’ 
Millses.” 

Milton (1 file): marriage record for Alen Milton and Mary Smith, 1825.  

Minch (1 file): Charles – newspaper article no date, Hoosier haunts – Footsteps fill old Indiana house 
even when resident is alone.  

Miner (1 file): Early American genealogy bio.  

Mitchell (4 files) – File 1: the Mitchell Family History in Virginia and Kentucky. File 2: marriage record for 
Daniel K. Mitchell and Polly Copeland, 1823. File 3: obituary for James White Mitchell, 1957; early 
American genealogy bio. File 4: Samuel – information on a man who was in the state hospital. 

Mobly (1 file): marriage record for Elias Mobly and Rachel Hill, 1824.  

Moehlmann (1 file): newspaper article from Roundabout Madison, October 2009, Madison baker gets 
US citizenship. 

Moffett (5 files) – File 1: life chronology for Samuel Austin Moffett, obituary. File 2: stories from the life 
of Samuel Austin Moffett. File 3: Biographical information on Samuel Austin Moffett and Samuel Hugh 
Moffett. File 4: pedigree chart for Alice Louise Moffett, obituary for Robert B. Moffett (1935). File 5: 
Samuel – no date newspaper memorial for S. S. Moffett, newspaper funeral announcement for Mrs. 
Maria J. Moffett, lineage of John Hanna Moffett, old agreement and contract Moffett/Cravens.  

Moldridge (1 file): marriage record for John R. Moldridge and Moriah L. Branham, 1838.  

Moler (1 file): Isaac Newton – info on Civil War veteran.  

Moncrief (1 file): correspondence, pedigree chart for Ann (Vawter) Moncrief Excerpt from the Vawter 
Family in America.  



Montgomery (3 files) – File 1: research notes and correspondence. File 2: Jefferson county records, 
family unit sheets, census records. File 3: Early American Genealogy bio.  

*Monroe (7 files) – File 1: generations of the family beginning with Lyman Monroe (b. 1790). File 2: 
marriage record for Sollomon D. Monroe and Mary Chambers, 1823. File 3: Paternal Family Line of 
Virginia Tattershall (nee Monroe). File 4: correspondence. File 5: marriage record for Lyman Monroe  
and Rebecca Jane Miles, 1847. Marriage record for William Monroe and Juliet Williams, 1868. Marriage 
record for Lyman Monroe Jr. and Rebecca Jane Miles, 1847. File 5: descendants of William Monroe. File 
6: copy of a letter from Edith Monroe McKay. File 7: William Y. – 1889 obituary for Rev. W. Y. Monroe, 
bio information.  

Montz (1 file): Oliver – marriage record for Oliver Montz and Mary McCready, 1866.  

*Moore (9 files) – File 1: notebook full of research notes. File 2: family unit sheet for Joseph A> Moore 
and Mary. File 3: memorial pamphlet for Tina Gayle Moore. File 4: family unit sheets for the family of 
Roderick Moore and Mary Guthery. File 4: marriage record for Louis Edward Moore and Margaret Krum, 
1907; descendants of Henry Moore. File 5: marriage record for John H. Moore and Sophiah Thompson, 
1835. File 6: marriage record for Samuel Moore and Mary S. Smock, 1831. File 7: William and 
Brumbarger – William Moore life info, Louis Brumbarger family info, Brumbarger graveyard survey, 
census records, death certificates. File 9: record of the William Moore Family from Bible and Other 
records.  

Moran (1 file): census records, funeral record, 1895 funeral for John Moran in the newspaper (Aug. 17), 
1918 obituary for Ellen Moran, obituary for Frank Moran (1914), marriages in Jeff Co.  

Morehouse (2 files) – File 1: correspondence. File 2: Morehouse/Lodge/Payne – info on Ebenezer and 
Rebecca Lodge Morehouse, information on Elihu Rugg Payne, Madison Evening Courier April 21, 1864 
death of E.R. Payne, Madison Evening Couier Nov. 8, 1881 death of E.R. Payne, information on Lydia 
Godman Payne.  

Moreland (1 file): newspaper article Moreland reunion draws 91 persons, 9/13/1983.  

Morgan (2 files) – File 1: L. P. – original booklet, Hillbilly Morgan. File 2: original booklet Morgan 
Migrations, marriage record for Preston Morgan and Maria Hendricks (1854).  

Morgason (1 file): information on James Morgason.  

Morrison (1 file): bio of Andrew S. Morrison, cemetery records, early newspaper items, death notice 
1866 for Sarah Morrison, Gilbert Morrison bio, Jan. 6, 1844 Madison Courier letter from William and 
Rebecca Latta; descendants of Thomas Haynes. 

Morrow ( 2 files) – File 1: obituary for Jeptha D. Morrow, obituary for John W. Morrow, obituary for 
Jerry Morrow (1932). File 2: obituary for Boyce Morrow (1976), correspondence and research notes.  



Morton (3 files) – File 1: record notes, correspondence, information on James Morton. File 2: book 
excerpt A Story of the Scottish Settlement Jefferson County, Indiana, June 28, 1940 newspaper clipping 
M’Nary Named Willkie Mate. File 3: newspaper spread The Indianapolis Star Magazine (May 2, 1971) 
When A ‘Dictator’ Ruled Indiana about Oliver Hazard Perry Morton. 

Mosley (2 files) – File 1: lineage of Samuel Holmes, bio sketch of Samuel Mosely. File 2: Mosley and 
Deputy families, descendants of Sylvester Deputy, Jeff. Co. marriages, census records. 

Mould (1 file): Sydney P. – correspondence and family unit sheets, info on the Poor Farm.  

Mouser (1 file): Also Schmidlapp – Descendants of Jacob Mouser, Mauser; newspaper article from the 
Madison Courier June 17, 1983 about Jacob and Christian Mouser, Indiana Magazine of History excerpt, 
book excerpt genealogy Mouser-Schmidlapp beginning in Germany around 1593.  

Mountjoy (1 file): newspaper clipping about Herbert T. Mountjoy Madison Courier 4/2/1955. 

Moylan (1 file): bio sketch of Capt. Myles Moylan (b.1838). 

Muessel (1 file): Madison Courier article 3-15-1973 Mr. Muessel, Hensler earn chamber’s top 1973 
awards. Obituary for Anna Muessel.  

Muncie (1 file): E. O. – newspaper clippings June 26, 1961 Muncie Ending Four Decades; Muncie Feted 
with Thanks from ‘Family’ (1961); 2-20-1971 Muncie Holds New Honor; Sept. 21, 1973 Muncie honored 
b Rotary with donation in his name; 8-15-1983 obituary for Emery Muncie; 1948 obituary for E. M. 
Muncie; newspaper article March 23, 2002.  

*Mullen (13 files) – File 1: General Bernard F. Mullen Secretary of War Irish Republic of New York by 
Brother Andrew Mullen (1985); To The Fenian Brotherhood of America Official Report of the 
Investigating Committee of the Department of Manhattan, Fenian Brotherhood A full and Complete 
Report of the Investigation of the Management of Affairs, Financial, Military and Civil, of Officials at the 
Fenian Headquarters (Moffett Mansion) Union Square, N.Y. Statement of Monies Received and 
Expended, Bonds Issued Full History of the “Campo Bello” Fizzle., 1866. File 2: copies of newspaper 
articles about Bernard R. Mullen: Cincinnati Enquirer Oct. 3, 1860; Madison Weekly Courier October 10, 
1860; Madison Weekly Courier Oct. 31, 1860; Madison Weekly Courier November 7, 1860; Madison 
Weekly Courier November 14, 1860; Indianapolis Daily Sentinel January 25, 1862; Vevey Reveille January 
30, 1862. File 3: story of an image of Lt. Bernard R. mullen in the Civil War returning to the Mullen 
Family, newsletter of the Indianapolis Civil War Round Table. File 4: Dr. Bernhard F. Mullen biography. 
File 5: copy of article from Texas Catholic June 14, 1958 on the family Mullen Four Members chose 
religious vocations; information on the old Mullen Homestead in Napoleon, Indiana; family unit sheet 
for Col./Dr. Bernhard F. Mullen and Mary F. Mancourt. File 6: photographs of the Civil War photo of Lt. 
Bernhard Mullen; information on the Mullen House; newspaper article copies. File 7: research notes and 
correspondence. File 8: correspondence, Col. Bernhard F. Mullen bio, Madison Courier May 20, 1994 
family tree article; census information. File 9: correspondence. File 10: Alexander J. – St. Louis Post-
Dispatch obituary for Dr. A.J. Mullen Sept. 24, 1897; March 6, 1866 Madison Courier mention of B. F. 



Mullen; March 9, 1866 remarks from B. F. Mullen; August 7, 1866 mention of A.J. and J.W. Mullen. File 
11: biography for Dr. Alexander J. Mullen. File 12: cemetery recirds, family unit sheets, pedigree chart. 
File 13: John W. – marriage record for John W. Mullen and Andeline Prescitt, 1849; biography for Dr. 
John W. Mullen; obituary Madison Courier May 20, 1887. 

*Munier (3 files) – File 1: notes, obituary for Mrs. Anna Weber Munier Johnson 1964, bio sketch for 
Louiz Munier. File 2: Madison Courier May 28, 1914 Death of Louis Munier. File 3: family bible records. 

Murdock (1 file): Harvey – marriage record for Harvey Murdock and Nancy Milton, 1827.  

Murray (1 file): H.H. – April 4, 1924 Hope Star Journal, Hope Indiana 83rd birthday of H. H. Murray. 

Murtaugh (2 files) – File 1: Madison Courier May 5, 1930 from Terre Haute, IN on Sister Mary 
Josephine’s death. File 2: Excerpt from In God’s Acre Biographical Sketches Series One from Sisters of 
Providence Saint Mary-Of-The-Woods Indiana.  

Myers (1 file): family bible records of Andrew Myers or son James Myers.  
 

N 

Naden (1 file): Simeon – family unit sheet for Simeon Naden and Arnetta Stout, Roots and Branches 
Magazine of the Naden/Nadin Society, 1993.  

Naill (1 file): John A. – Madison Courier article 8-27-1971 John retires, obituary for John Naill 2-12-1974, 
image of house at 521 Jefferson st.  

Naumann (1 file): James Fransiscus – correspondence and life info.  

Nay (1 file): correspondence, bible records of Jeptha Allen Nay family, a record of the descendants of 
Jacob Nay of Virginia from 1723 to 1949.  

Neal (6 files) – File 1: ancestors of Jesse Neal chart, descendants of Daniel Neal (b.1794). File 2: Capt. J. 
Stutson – Madison Courier Oct. 30, 1908 obituary, biographical sketch A great Steamboat Captain, 1908, 
no other date. File 3: probate record for Jesse Neal. File 4: Pictorial and Biographical Memoirs of Marion 
County and Indianapolis Indiana about Captain J. Stut Neal. File 5: Lloyd G. – 1966 obituary for editor of 
the Madison Courier, obituary for Michael G. Neal 1986, 1979 obit for Mrs. Bess G. Neal. File 6: Pension 
record for Zephaniah Neal (Rev. War), War of 1812 pension record for Jesse Neal. File 7: Civil War record 
for William J. Neill, obituary for Ann Neill, obituary for Jane Neal, Erwin Family sketch, Irwin/Christy/Neill 
family connections, pedigree chart for Elizabeth Ann Lynch Boyer; early American genealogy bio sketch.  

Neaville (1 file): family bible records.  

Neville (1 record): marriage record for Samuel Neville and Elizabeth Fuel, 1836.  

Neill (1 file): Joseph – Civil War Soldier, no date long article from the newspaper.  



Nelson (1 file): Paul – short bio sketch.  

New (4 files) – File 1: marriage record for Jethro New and Elizabeth Ross, 1834. File 2: About Our 
Ancestors early American genealogy bio.. File 3: lineage of Otto Cope, Jethro New sketch. File 4: 
Jefferson county records, correspondence, notes. 

*Newell (3 files) – File 1: Abigail – funeral announcement for Abigail Newell (d. 1907). File 2: Henry P. – 
short bio sketch. File 3: marriage record for Andrew Newell and Martha Ann Orrill, 1854. 

Newland (1 file): June 7, 1864 Letter from the 38th Regiment in the newspaper, Madison directory A.J. 
Newland, April 17, 1852 Nancy Newland and John Curtis married, book excerpt from History of the Sixth 
Regiment: We Narrowly Escape Capture.  

Newport (1 file): About Our Ancestors Early American bio; Madison Courier 3-25-1976 article about 
Steele Newman art exhibit.  

Niccum (2 files) – File 1: census records for Henry Myer(s). File 2: The Niccum-Nickum Family in America, 
family info for Jonathan Nickum and Melinda Potts.  

*Nichols (13 files) – File 1: Harry E. – Madison Courier Feb. 17, 1972 winner of community award, April 
7, 1986 99th Birthday spread, Photo of Judge Harry E. Nichols (1987), 2-28-1972 Madison Rates Pat for 
Nichols Award. File 2: 7-16-1974 Harry Nichols honored by the Salvation Army, 2-13-1976 Nichols ends 
40-year term as Salvation Army Chairman, July 14, 2003 Harry Nichols’ life marked by success. File 3: 11-
15-1982 Madison Courier clipping with image of Harry, Weekly Herald Jan. 5, 1950 Mayor Marcus Sulger 
and Harry Nichols image. File 4: 4-3-1982 A salute to Uncle Harry, 4-9-1986 99th birthday article, 4-3-
1986 invitation to birthday at the Key West Shrimp House. File 5: 1931 Nichols to be Postmaster January 
2, 1941, 6-1-1931 Postmaster article, obituary after reaching 100 may 14, 1987. File 6: 3-2-1965 Judge 
Nichols is honored at Salvation Army Dinner. File 7: 4-28-1928 article about Harry Nichols’ life, 6-3-1930 
Nichols for treasurer of state, 2-27-1976 Nichols honored for work, File 8: March 30, 1972 Republicans 
Honor Former Judge Nichols. File 9: 100th Birthday of Judge Nichols April 8, 1987; memorial pamphlet for 
Harry Nichols. File 10: 3-27-1972 Lincoln Day Dinner honoring Harry Nichols at the Clifty Inn. File 11: 4-4-
1970 Memos from the cuty desk, 1-22-1971 salvation army honor. File 12: St Louis Star May 20, 1901 
William Nichols Banker obituary; bio sketch of Wm. Nichols; family unit sheet for John Nichols and 
Martha Dunn; family info for Luther Nichols and Mary Courtney. File 13: John W. – 5-31-1938 article 
about John W. Nichols, obituary for John W. Nichols (1941).  

Nicholson (3 files) – File 1: Jeff. Co. records, correspondence. File 2: letter and notes. File 3: information 
on Native family members, Dawes Rolls Census records, family unit sheets.  

Nicholsson (1 file): marriage record for Jesse C. Nicholsson and Ann Talbot, 1824. 

Niklaus (3 files) – File 1: E. G. – Family of Edward G. Niklaus and Mary Wharton. File 2: Madison Daily 
Courier December 11, 1879 burial vault finished for Niklaus family. File 3: death notice for wife of John 
Nicklaus, 1886; death of Mrs. Margaret Niklaus; city directory; deed of John Jacob Niklaus; Early family 



connection; obituary for John Niklaus, no date; 301 – 311 West Main Street building is Niklaus-Scott 
Block; 53-55 W Main E. G. Niklaus wholesale liquor dealer (image).  

Niesse (1 file): descendants of Anthony Niesse, April 26, 1915 obit for John B. Niesse; May 31, 1918 obit 
for Theresa Wenzler.  

Nigg (1 file): correspondence and notes.  

Nicholson (1 file): Meredith – Restoring the house of a thousand candles, newspaper clipping about a 
Denver home.  

Nighbert (2 files) – File 1: lineage of Judith Ann Nighbert, marriage certificate for Judith Ann Nighbert 
and James Michael Newman, 1965, Judith Ann Nighbert birth certificate, marriage certificate for Lee 
Nighbert and Sarah Noell, 1939, lineage of Sidney Lee Nighbert, 1948 death of S. L. Nighbert, funeral 
home record, 1943 obit for Lulu Nighbert, marriage record for Shirley L. Nighbert and Lulu Sutherland, 
1901, obituary for George Nighbert, 1929; marriage record for George W. Nighbert and Mary Dickey, 
1873; deed record, certificates of death for Sidney Lee and Sara Nighbert; genealogical summaries of 
individuals. File 2: Descendants of Thomas M. Nighbert (1813-1874) compiled in 1997, 7-12-1983 
clipping about family reunion, 7-19-1984 clipping about family reunion. 

Nodler (2 files) – File 1: obituaries: Oct. 26, 1869 – Ferdinand Nodler; March 13, 1882 – Mary Nodler; 
April 3, 1885 – Conrad Nodler. File 2: obituary: Jan. 28, 1871 Martin Nodler Sr, an old pioneer.  

Noell (1 file): Lee Nighbert and Sarah Noell marriage record, other Nighbert records, lineage of Sarah 
Alice Noell, deed records, certificate of birth for Bessie Olive Burden, obit for Dallas A. Noell (1941), 
excerpt from History of Coffee Creek Baptist Association Page 153 Marion Noell, marriage record for 
Dallas A Noell and Bessie Burden (1918), funeral record for Bessie Noell, obituary for Bessie Noell (1935), 
death announcement for Marion Noell (1903), will records. 

Nolan (1 file): 3-13-1985 article about a bust of Hitler taken from Germany 40 years ago, memorial 
pamphlet for Sally Cooper Nolan, newspaper article 8-24-1985 300 descendants from 71-year marriage 
of Chester and Sally Nolan.  

Norris (1 file): obituary for Frederick Norris, no date; Everett Norris and Carrie Gaines marriage record, 
1912; Charlie Norris and Lilie Shephard marriage record, 1891.  

Norten (1 file): marriage record for William Norten and Mary Cox, 1834.  

Noulton (1 file): marriage record for Jesse Noulton and Kitty Deputy, 1825.  

O 

Oakley (1 file): obituary for Nannie Oakley, 1934; Jeff. CO. marriages; Trimble Count KY 1870 census 
with mortality schedule; obituary for Sinnett Oakley, 1950; obituary for Homer Oakley, 1949; 1860 
census Trimble CO. KY mortality schedule. 



Oaks (1 file): marriage record for John Conrad Oaks and Rosina Fehner, 1838.  

O’Banion (1 file): obituary for Charles C., 2008.  

Ochs (3 files) – File 1: Anna – Registration Affidavit of Alien Female, Johann Konrad Ochs baptismal 
record (1811), passport 1836 for Johann Konrad Ochs, Cert. of Domicile for domestic servant 1818. File 
2: Henry – Registration Affidavit of Alien Enemy. File 3: Mary – Registration Affidavit of Alien Female.  

Ogle (1 file): census records, copy of obituary for Francis M. Mills. 

Ogden (1 file): Jeff. CO. records, obituary for Cornelius F. Ogden (1893).  

Oglesby (1 file): 1848 letter, obit for Hon. Joseph H. Oglesby (1888). 

O’Laughtey (1 file): marriage record for Joseph Laim and Polly Cope, William O’Laughtey and Hannah 
Bolin, Joseph Steele and Polly Wilson, 1824.  

Oldfather (1 file): correspondence from Urbana-Champaign, Madison directory, Hanover Faculty Helen 
Sidwell Oldfather(Latin and Algebra), census records.  

Oliver (3 file) – File 1: The Oliver Family. File 2: Claude M. – correspondence and biography. File 3: 
descendants of Samuel Oliver (1794-1843) and Obedience Alley (1801-1863).  

Olmstead (1 file): marriage record for James Olmstead and Ruth Brent, 1853.  

O’Loghlin (1 file): The Daily Press New Dominion Feb 27, no year – The Day The Roma Crashed And 
Burned! 50th Anniversary, William O’Lochlin was a Jeff. CO. native and a casualty of the crash.  

O’Nan (1 file): family unit sheets, Frankfort KY 200th Anniversary Brawner-O’Nan marriage – George W. 
Brawner and Nancy Ann O’Nan married 1873.  

Ong (1 file): Oct. 27, 1881 Ong-Graham Wedding announcement. Birth announcement of daughter born 
to Mr. and Mrs. Lou Ong, May 7, 1885 

*O’Neal (3 files) – File 1: marriage record for James O’Neal and Lidia McKay, 1839. File 2: John – bio and 
will, poor reproduction photo of John Lanham and his wife, Nancy O’Neal Lanham. File 3: 62nd Wedding 
Anniversary article June 6, 1987 for Mr. and Mrs. Tyrona O’Neal. 

Orem (1 file): cemetery records in Jeff. Co., census records, marriages in Switzerland Co., descendants of 
William Hall (b.1754), Madison Directory pages, Switzerland Co. Index of Persons and Firms, History of 
Switzerland Co. book excerpt mentions Simeon Orem, Jeff. Co. death certificates. 

Orndorff (1 file): Sept. 21, 1979 Madisonian newspaper article Communist country provides change of 
pace, attitude - Raymond and wife, Joyce Orndorff.  

Orr (2 files) – File 1: Charlotte Payne – wife of Arthur Orr, memorial card, 1868. File 2: marriage record 
for Joseph H. Orr and Elizabeth Frick, 1838.  



Orrill (3 files) – File 1: Bob – newspaper articles, 3-30-1961 Bob Orrill Honored at Convocation; 3-15-
1961 Bob Orrill Wins Lambert Trophy; 3-20-1961 Bobby Orrill Day Planned; May 10, 1889 Obituary for 
John D. Orrill. File 2: correspondence, June 9, 1884 article about Daniel Boone, mentions Thomas Orrill; 
census records; funeral records. File 3: Thomas – May 10, 1889 obituary for John Orrill; obituary for 
James B. Orrill July 19, 1886; family unit sheet for George Taylor Orrill and Loma Elenora Hawkins; 
marriage record for Thomas Orrill and Mary Boon (great granddaughter of Daniel Boone), 1836. 

Ott (1 file): Anthony – short bio sketch.  

Otter (1 file): marriage record for Edward Otter and Louiza Lyle, 1839.  

Owsley (1 file): no date newspaper article about woman, Ada Owsley (former Madisonian) under arrest 
for killing her husband, Benjamin S. Owsley (d.1914) 

Oyler (1 file): Pat – 1986 obituary for Pat Oyler, newspaperwoman.  

Owen (1 file): pedigree chart for Lewis Henry Owen (b.1891).  

Owens (2 files) – File 1: Larry – pedigree chart, pedigree chart for James August Owens (b. 1833), 
descendants of Crider and Nichols, Revolutionary War pension abstracts for William Owens. File 2: 
William – Pension in Pulaski Co. VA.  

 

P 

Page (2 files) - File 1: Coffin O. – invitation to funeral, 1857. File 2: Evening Courier June 15, 1872 
obituary for Capt. S. M. Strader; Mar. 7, 1884 obituary for Mrs. James Graham; Jan. 15, 1897 obituary for 
Julia Strader Graham; Dec. 11, 1893 obituary for Auditor James Graham; Nov. 13, 1935 obituary for S. S> 
Graham; descendants’ chart; family unit sheets.  

Paine (1 file): Mar. 21, 1895 obituary for Lotta Orr Brockenbrough; July 25, 1872 Daily Courier obit for 
Thomas L. Paine; Nov. 26, 1886 obit for Arthur Orr; census records, Jeff. Co. early newspaper items.  

*Park (7 files) – File 1: Moody – patent for a water filter, 1836. File 2: Moody Park and family bio sketch, 
obituary for moody park June 5, 1868; July 12, 1882 newspaper mention of Samuel Parks; reproduction 
photograph of Moody Park and Wife, Mary Ann; June 15, 1820 newspaper announcement of town 
meeting; deed record; Weekly Herald Sept. 26, 1889 Notes from the history of Madison about the Parks. 
File 3: 1922 letter, obituary for Mary Ann Fisher Park (wife of Moody, d. 1898). File 4: William – b.1750, 
father of Moody Park family info, death announcement of Mary A. Park. File 5: Some Park Families. File 
6: Alexander, James – Dec. 31, 1870 death announcement for James Park, graveyard burial survey for 
Scotland Graveyard, Will of James Park. 

Parks (1 file): Jesse – Blankenship Cemetery record, census record for Jesse Parks. 



Parker (6 file) – File 1: Albert G. – Courier 5-14-1957 Dr. Albert G. Parker, former president of Hanover 
College retires. File 2: About Our Ancestors, early American genealogy bio. File 3: Madison Daily Herald 
Oct. 15, 1904 color image of the Parker Family Four Generations. File 4: Hale Giddings – bio sketch for 
Hale Giddings Parker (1851-1925), Oberlin College Graduates, census records, “History of Negro 
Education in Madison, Indiana”, June 18, 1878 Madison Daily Courier the Parker Investigation article, 
June 26, 1878 Madison Weekly Herald article on education of POC children in Madison. File 5: marriage 
record for Stephan Parker and Laura S. Short, 1850. File 6: marriage record for James Parker and Maria 
Thomas, 1836.   

Parson (2 files) – File 1: family bible record. File 2: marriage record for John U. Parsons and Rosetta E. 
Hobard, 1833.  

Partlow (3 file) – File 1: discharge from the civil war for Jolin Partlow, letter, 1834. File 2: marriage 
record for William Partlow and Melissa Jane Fogleman, 1835. File 3: marriage record for Abraham 
Partlow and Amy Fields, 1834.  

Paswater (1 file): Marriage record for Joel Paswater and Sopronia Mace, 1834.  

Patrick (1 file): Robert – Pension application, burial info for William Patrick, census information for 
William Patrick.  

Patterson (5 files) – File 1: marriage record for Daniel Patterson and Nancy Cowden, 1838. File 2: obit for 
Wallace C. Patterson, 1964; obit for Elizabeth Patterson, 1979; auto crash killing Mary E. Patterson, 
1963. File 3: marriage record for James Patterson and Ann Tuttle, 1826. File 4: James H. – 
correspondence. File 5: Wallace and Elizabeth – obituary for Wallace C. Patterson, 1964; obituary for 
Elizabeth Patterson, 1979. 

*Patton (3 file) – File 1: Patton Mailing List. File 2: Matthew – Matthew Patton and Robert Rea bio 
sketch, pedigree chart for Estel Monroe Chestnut, family of Matthew Houston Patton, obit for Margaret 
H. Patton, descendants for Matthew Patton, last will. File 3: John N. – Major John N. Patton bio sketch. 

Paugh (1 file): obituary for Allie Paugh, 1979; Aug. 10, 1952 Monroe Family Holds Reunion.  

*Paul (24 files) – File 1: Paul family information and Grover Family information recounted, excerpt from 
Conquest of the Northwest volume 2 (1895), Madison Courier Aug. 19, 1959 Madison Founder had 
interesting life history. File 2: 1815 deed for land, invitation to funeral for Eliza M. Paul. File 3: 
chronology of events in the life of Col. John Paul founder of Xenia, Ohio and Madison, Indiana; Feb. 10, 
1958 article on destruction of John Paul home for new Post Office. File 4: research notes. File 5: article 
Madison Courier 1-8-1985. File 6: copies of 1811 letters. File 7: excerpt from Indiana Magazine of History 
vol. 13 issue 2, on John Paul; excerpt from Greene County 1803-1908. File 8: copy of file 3. File 9: the 
1827 diary of John Peter Paul, son of John Paul. Correspondence, Greene County Ohio book excerpts. 
File10: John H. – John Paul awarded Boys’ Club Honor 5-29-1977. File 11: deed records. File 12: Sketch of 
the3 Paul Family in America, image of John Paul house. File 13: letter copies, family bible records. 
Record of indenture. File 14: John Paul of Peter, cousin of Madison Founder. File 15: records for John 



Paul’s wife after his death, 1836. File 16: sketches. File 17: no date article about New Albany purchased 
by John Paul; Xenia Ohio Daily Gazette Nov. 28, 1985 Who Really built first count Court House?; sale of 
court house records; inventory of the estate of John Paul. File 17: Department of the Interior General 
Land Office record for the purchase of the land that is now Madison, life sketch, excerpt from History of 
Greene County Ohio (1918), January 2010 RoundAbout article about John Paul, article about Madison 
Founder for Ohio Bicentennial written by Fred J. Milligan, 8-19-1951 Madison Courier article Madison 
Founder Had Interesting Life History. File 18: Probate record, 1831; copy of will. File 19: Copy of will. File 
20: explanation of boundaries of Madison original plat. File 21: Paul Family starting with Peter Paul 
(b.1682). File 22: record source list for deeds, 3-2-1901 article about Col. John Paul, 5-3-1948 Madison 
Courier article about John Paul’s life. File 23: Feb 9, no year column A Hoosier Listening Post by Kate 
Milner Rabb. File 24: family bible records. 

Payne (2 files) – File 1: John Payne bio sketch, family unit sheets, 1915 obituary for Andrew Miller Payne, 
census record for Moses Payne. File 2: marriage record for Ellen B. Grace and Theophilus G. Payne, 
1846; newspaper clipping scan from 2-6-1986 five generations.  

Peabody (1 file): early American Genealogy bio.  

Peak/Peake (2 files) – File 1: research notes and correspondence, newspaper article 9-16-1976 Marriage 
of Trudy Ann Peak and Harry Steven Louden. Engagement announcement for Trudy Peak, 9-3-1976. File 
2: Peak family census records.  

Pearson (2 files) – File 1: Meshecke – pension records for Revolutionary War veteran. File 2: Shadrach – 
Pension records for Rev. War veteran.  

Peddie (1 file): Anna Laura – Interview transcript by Lee Rodgers.  

Pedenbaugh (1 file): marriage record for Philip Pedenbaugh and Fanny Arbuckle, 1824.  

Pender (3 files) – File 1: Moreland-Pender family connection, Carrol Hugh Pender Sr. family, information 
on William Guy Pender, obituary in the Courier-Journal for Betty W. Pender (1995), reproduction 
photos. File 2: Detroit PD Funeral for PO Ira G. Pender (d.1989). File 3: marriage record for Elias Pender 
and Nancy Sample, 1835; obituary for Mary A. Pender, 1985.  

Pendleton (2 files) – File 1: Leana Barnes – Sept. 29, 1977 Twins at 85 Leana and Leona Barnes; 9-27-
1982 Twins celebrate 90th birthday; obituary for Leana Pendleton, 1984. File 2: pedigree chart for Rennie 
Jack Pendleton, bio sketch of Isaac Newton Pendleton and descendants, information related to the 
death of Capt. William McCraken (1782), military records for R.J. Pendleton, obituary for Waldo 
Pendleton, August 13, 1957 article about the death of Vance Carlyle Pendleton; funeral announcement 
for Robert Pendleton, 1955; newspaper article from The Ohio County News about Dr. J. E. Pendleton; 
family bible records, Courier-Journal article May 19, 1976 about Squire Pendleton being first author of 
the Declaration of Independence, Leo Pendleton book excerpt, memorial for Sister Sallie Pendleton, 
records for John Pendleton (son of William and Elizabeth Tinsley Pendleton), bio of Robert H. Pendleton, 



obituary for Alene Pendleton, 1995; obituary for Louis Pendleton (1995); excerpt from Scott County 
Virginia and It’s People 1814-1991.  

Penn (2 files) – File 1: Benjamin – pension record for Rev. War, military records. File 2: family unit sheet 
for Ephraim and Mary Ann Warfield Penn, Carroll County, Indiana history book excerpt, descendants of 
Benjamin Penn Sr.  

Perkins (1 file): marriage record for Hiram Perkins and Elizabeth Thomas, 1836.  

Perry (2 files) – File 1: Henry – 1820 deed, family unit sheet for Henry Perry and Sarah Franks. File 2: Lou 
– 6-18-1977 newspaper clipping, 1973 newspaper clipping about Lou Perry headlining, 7-1-1978 
obituary for Lou Perry “singer with many bands.” 

Pettit (1 file): book excerpt History of Southeast Missouri. 

Peterie (1 file): March 31, 1887 newspaper announcement of internment, John Petery; August 21, 1883 
Madison Daily Courier Lizzie Petery death announcement; August 21, 1885 Mary Petery obituary.  

Peugeot (1 file): Herb – 3-3-1975 Courier article Madison man enjoys model railroading.  

Pfau (3 files) – File 1: Indianapolis Sentinel April 1, 1888 obituary for Sylvester Pfau. Indianapolis Sentinel 
March 28, 1892 Charlotte Pfau death notice. File 2: Madison Daily Courier April 2, 1888 Sylvester Pfau 
obituary and bio sketch; March 31, 1892 Charlotte Pfau obituary. File 3: newspaper mentions of the 
death of Peter Pfau, 1888. 

Pfister (1 file): obituary for Louis Pfister July 28, 1970; Funeral of Mrs. Fred Pfister March 29, 1925; Sept. 
7, 1926 obituary for Frederick Pfister; obituary for Frederick Pfister Jr. January 22, 1917.  

Pheasant (2 files) – File 1: obituary for A. G. Pheasant May 2, 1952; drowning death of A.L. Pheasant, 
1962; obituary for A. S. Pheasant October 15, 1952; obituary for James Richard Edward Pheasant 
November 9, 1912; obituary for Jimmie Pheasant, October 19, 1925; obituary for daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. John Pheasant, Bernice Clara, August 6, 1895. File 2: correspondence, obituary for Edna Pheasant 
May 2, 1973; obituary for Lemeth A. Pheasant October 14, 1970; obituary for George Pheasant August 
22, 1932; obituary for Alice Jane Pheasant March 3, 1915; obituary for Mrs. Jesse Pheasant (Alice) 
February 26, 1915; obituary for Jesse B. Pheasant April 12, 1915; obituary for Mrs. I. E. Pheasant April 
28, 1927; obituary for Charles Pheasant August 10, 1925; obituary for Charles T. Pheasant March 15, 
1933; obituary for C. T. Pheasant May 11, 1933; obituary for John L. Pheasant October 13, 1939; 
obituary for Ennis Pheasant July 29, 1936; obit. For Anna Pheasant June 7, 1935; obit. For Jeanette 
Bramwell October 27, 1916; obit. For Mrs. Josephine Bramwell July 30, 1942; obit. For James Davidson 
Bramwell October 15, 1932.  

Phelps (1 file): Luke – court records, 1826 and 1827. 

Phillips (26 files) – File 1: David Graham – newspaper excerpt from The Sun Feb. 21, 1915 American 
False Estimates of Greatness by Frank Harris about David Graham Phillips, novelist; New York Times May 



21, 1905 spread about D.G. Phillips; Madison Courier Madisonian D. G. Phillips never forgot hometown 
Oct. 22, 1981; The Man Who Made the Steel Trust by D.G. Phillips; funeral announcement, no date; 
Cosmopolitan December 1904 article about French Republic by D. G. Phillips; Shifting Party Lines by D. 
G. Phillips, no date; The Franco-German Crisis by D.G. Phillips; Hearst’s Magazine excerpt; Collier’s 
Baltimore Fire Extra February 13, 1904 The Great Baltimore Fire by David Graham Phillips; Sunday 
Magazine Feb. 23, 1908 and March 29, 1908 and Feb. 23, 1908; When The Lid Was On by D. G. Phillips; 
Saturday Evening Post June 17, 1905 and July 8, 1905. File 2: murder of David Graham Phillips January 
23, 1911; The Sun, June 17, 1905 Who Shakes the Plum Tree? File 3: newspaper clippings. File 4: March 
3, 1910 article in Madison Courier about D. G. Phillips. File 5: information on Anna Elizabeth Phillips and 
Charles Peter Phillips. File 6: original booklet The Life of Luella Morgan Phillips (1862 – 1944) by Jean 
Wilson; Original booklet Family History of the Phillips family descendants of Gabriel and Luella Morgan 
Phillips; descendants of Squire Phillips and Mary Eliza Cardinal, photos. File 7: information on Clements 
Phillips. File 8: Madison Daily Herald article 1932, poem by David Graham. File 9: bibliography for 
writings on D.G. Phillips. File 10: newspaper clippings, October 21 and 22, 1981 Madison Courier; no 
date article about murder of D.G. Phillips; obituary for Mrs. Harriet McLelland DuShane. File 11: Journal 
article from The Old Northwest Vol. 3, 1977 – The Young Phillips: A Study in Roots and Influencers. File 
12: Bible records, descendants of Philemon Phillips and Alexander Wilson reunion, 1914. File 13: census 
records. File 14: Madison Courier April 7, 1930 page 4 article. File 15: David Graham Phillips Sr. – 
reproduction photo, short bio sketch, article Madison Courier March 28, 1898; obituary for Mrs. M. J. 
Phillips, mother of D.G. P. Jr.; January 27, 1911 funeral announcement for DGP Jr.; Canaan Cemetery 
survey with Phillips family members. File 16: newspaper and magazine excerpts. File 17: marriage record 
for John Phillips and Sally Wells, 1824. File 18: marriage record for Allen W Phillips and Sarah Ann Tobias, 
1854. File 19: marriage record for James W. Phillips and Mary Jane Marquis, 1834. File 20: obituary for 
Harrison W. Phillips, journal staff on New York Evening Journal, 1927. Marriage record for William 
Phillips and Nancy Hearn, 1835. File 21: marriage record for John J Phillips and Elizabeth Hill, 1838; 
wedding announcement for Nannie Stanley and John L. Phillips, 1881 File 22: marriage record for John 
Phillips and Elenore Courtney. File 23: Charles – 8-14-1971 Early Courier Carrier Tells Of Old Times. File 
24: April 23, 1908 obituary for John L. Phillips; October 28, 1880 obituary for John J. Phillips; family unit 
sheet for John J. Phillips and Elizabeth Hill; family unit sheets for John L. Phillips and Nannie Stanley. File 
25: Alonzo – census records, obituary for Emma Black, daughter of Alonzo and Katherine Phillips. File 26: 
Emma and Anna – family unit sheets, daughters of Benjamin and Georgia Lewis Phillips, childrens home. 

Pickett (4 files) – File 1: Mirror article Nov. 24, 1966 Pickett Family First to Settle in Switzerland County. 
File 2: April 4, 1889 Old People in Switzerland County, Nov. 17, 1966 Mirror article about Pickett family 
in Switzerland County. File 3: Nov. 3, 1966 Mirror article about Pickett Family. File 4: The Pickett Family 
Story by Guy Waldon.  

Piedfourck (1 file): J. – bio sketch about J. J. JE Piedfourck and obituary.  

Pierce (1 file): early American genealogy bio. 

Pierson (2 files) – File 1: land office warrant 1820 for Charles Pierson/Shadrach Pierson. File 2: Pearl 
Herber – obituary and family unit sheet 



Pitschler (1 file): Lucie – naturalist at Clifty Falls and marriage to Herman Klenke. 

Pittroff (1 file: marriage record for Malinda Gray and John Pixley, 1825.  

Pleasants (1 file): early American genealogy bio. 

Plume (1 file): early American genealogy bio. 

Pogue (1 file): obituary for Thomas A. Pogue, 1899; census records; Jefferson County marriage records; 
cemetery records; Funeral announcement for Ellen V. Pogue, 1889; 1849 newspaper ad from T Pogue 
for wholesale saddlery; Sept. 14, 1868 death announcement for Capt. Tyree Pogue.  

Poland (1 file): Max – March 31, 1973 newspaper article about Max Poland’s retirement from Hanover; 
census records for Polen/Poland family. 

Polen (1 file): Polen – Cooperider family of Clyde Washington Polen and Hester Cooperider.  

Polke (1 file): Willian (1775-1843) – original booklet on an early Indiana pioneer who built the Michigan 
Road from the Atlantic to the Ohio River Valley.  

Pollys (1 file): Samuel – bio sketch for Capt. Samuel Polleys, and obituary 1884.  

Poore (1 file):  Jewett family and Chute connections, descendancy charts.  

Porter (6 files) – File 1: Gene Stratton – original booklet, 1964. File 2: Gene Stratton – newspaper spread 
from The Indianapolis Star Magazine January 9, 1977 Gene Stratton Porter: A Mind of Her Own. 
Indianapolis State Museum pamphlet celebrating her 120th birthday in July 1983. File 3: Cole – 
Indianapolis Star Magazine May 22, 1977 spread about composer Cole Porter written by his secretary 
Madeline P. Smith. File 4: Moses – family unit sheets for Daniel Wesley Morgan and Temperance Porter; 
June 1, 1880 article about Moses’ 70th birthday celebration. File 5: Cole – drawing. File 6: Jefferson 
County records for marriages, O’Neal family connection, census records. 

Posten (1 file): cemetery records, marriage records, family unit sheet for Levi Poston and Nancy Hicklin, 
court records, descendancy charts, biography of Elijah Poston.  

Poston (1 file): bio of John Poston, correspondence and research notes. 

*Potter (1 file): obituary for John Potter, 1922; death notice for James Potter, 1865; death notice for 
John Potter, 1852; marriage announcement for Capt. S. H. Crane and Mary E. Potter, 1865; lineage of 
John Potter; Will of Lewis Potter. 

Powell (6 files) – File 1: Nathan Powell gave a “Large Mound” as a funerary gift at the funeral of William 
Peyton Graham (son-in-law), 1885; Fairmount cemetery Powell plot record; Will of Nathan Powell in the 
newspaper August 7, 1882; Springdale cemetery records, writing about Gorgas photographer, Rev. 
Thomas J. Powell found dead in West Virginia Sept. 11, 1899; death of Mrs. John Ernst, last of the 
original Powell family Mov. 23, 1916; May 7, 1886 marriage announcement for Libbie Whitney and 
Bushrod Taylor; June 22, 1886 marriage announcement for Annie V. Gorgas and Edward E. Powell; 



obituary for Louis L. Powell, 1881; Thomas Graham and Co. manufacturing celebrates 75th anniversary, 
2-22-1941; Funeral of W. P. Graham, 1885; funeral of Louis Powell, Sept 2, 1881; Funeral of Mrs. W. H. 
Powell Sept. 22, 1913; 1849 death of William H. Powell; The Watts Family. File 2: Edward E and Anna – 
1950 obituary for Anna Gorgas Powell, 1915 obituary for Edward Powell, marriage announcement. File 
3: poor image of the Powell home (Jefferson County Public Library), October 17, 1860 Dr Watts 
improving his house, pedigree chart for Mary Elizabeth Scholl. File 4: William – May 26, 1879 Edward’s 
dogs get prizes in show; death of Mrs. M. F. Powell, 1886; Illness of Mrs. W. H. Powell December 30, 
1912; marriage record for William Powell and Nancy Mansfield, 1826. File 5: Howard Powell death 
announcement, 1866; Sept. 20, 1876 Hominy Mill new owners; census records; obituary for Capt. 
Nathan Powell, 1882; Sept. 19, 1876 Dr. Howard Watts newspaper mention; Capt. Powell’s Funeral July 
29, 1882; obituary for Dr. Howard Watts Sept 18, 1876. File 6: Funeral of Mrs. W. H. Powell, Sept. 23, 
1913; death of Mrs. Nathan Powell May 7, 1934; Milton Stapp information; Jan. 10, 1883 executors’ sale 
of real estate; March 20, 1885 William Graham obituary; July 31, 1900 Nathan Powell nominated for 
congress; book excerpt from Souvenir for the counties of Clark – Washington on Joseph Gorgas.  

Powers (1 file): census records, obituary for Capt. Oliver M. Powers 1906. 

Prather (1 file): information on Elizabeth A Watts Prather.  

Pratt (1 file): early American genealogy bio. Newspaper clipping retirement of Dr. Ralph Pratt from Kings 
Daughters Hospital Sept 29, 1990.  

Pray (1 file): family bible records. 

Prenatt (2 files) – File 1: family bio for the family of Francis J and Mary G Prenatt, Last will of P.J. Prenatt 
Jan 28, 1884; 1864 marriage of Francis Prenatt and Mary Cunningham, obituary for Frank J Prenatt 
marriage of Edward Prenatt and Lucy B Chandler 11/24/1887 in Indianapolis; obituary for Dr. Francis 
Prenatt 1964. File 2: reproduction image of Francis Prenatt from the History of the Catholic Church in 
Indiana, letter published in newspaper 10-3-1917, crucifix in Saint Patrick’s Cemetery Chapel donated in 
1878 by Prenatt family, obituary for Sister Mary Joan Prenatt, 1982. 

Preston (1 file): The Prestons of Smithfield and Greenfield in Virginia Descendants of John and Elizabeth 
Patton Preston, article from the RoundAbout Madison Venards to stage first of several new events at 
Watson’s Landing May 2000.  

Price (1 file): early American genealogy bio. 

Prindle (2 files) – File 1: obituary for Bruce Prindle civil war veteran; Jefferson county records; death 
notice for Joseph Thomas Oct. 11, 1892; census records; John A. Thomas Funeral Feb 13, 1945; marriage 
records, obituary for Merwin Prindle, Aug 4, 1880; obituary for Mrs. John Thomas, no date; death of 
widow of Merwin Prindle Dec. 7, 1910; obituary for Sarah Prindle Aug 16, 1898; Oct 11, 1892 newspaper 
mention for Capt. John W. Thomas. File 2: Sarah – obituary Aug 16, 1898.  

Puckett (1 file): marriage record for John Puckett and Caroline Puckett. 1836. 



Q 

Quigg (1 file): marriage record for Charles Quigg and Catherine Breen, 1875. 

Quigley (1 file): bio sketch of William A. Quigley, soldier. 

*Quinn (2 files) – File 1: Quinn-Withers family information. File 2: census and directory record for 
Charles Quinn, obituary (1911); obituary for Barbara Quinn, 1954; obituary for Patrick Quinn, 1914; 
obituary for Catherine Quinn, 1898; marriages in Jefferson County; obituary for Anna Quinn, 1927; 
obituary for Mary Quinn Schill, 1918; death notice for James Quinn, July 12, 1862.  

R 

Radabaugh (1 file): correspondence. 

Raisor (1 file): newspaper article about Harold “Jug” Raisor election, August 8, 1990 (Indiana Weekly). 

*Ralston (2 files) – File 1: Dr. William – will copy, family unit sheet, land records. Descendants of 
Witherspoons and Ralstons from Scotland to Jefferson County, plat sketch of William Ralston land.  

Ramsey (2 files) – File 1: history of Kent, Indiana; genealogical study of the Ramsey family. File 2: 
Thomas Lockhart and William Allen – family unit sheets, pedigree chart.  

Ramseyer (1 file): Switzerland County family register family of Daniel Ramseyer and Martha Hawkins 

Randall (2 files) – File 1: family of Shepard Randall and Liz Beth Smith. File 2: obituary for Pearl Randall, 
1955; obituary for John H Randall, 1912. 

Rankin (3 files) – File 1: obituary for James S. Rankin (1897), newspaper mention of James Rankin school 
desk Madison Courier Oct. 6, 1863. File 2: school desk patent description, James S. Rankin family 
information. File 3: Joseph – marriage record for Joseph Rankin and Lettitia Smith Brown, 1824. 

Rawlings (1 file): bio sketch of James V. Rawlings MD, family unit sheet for Elisha Page Rawlings and 
Elizabeth Ann Settle. 

Rayl (1 file): pedigree chart for Emil Cortise Rayl with life info of ancestors. 

Rea (9 files) – File 1: Ten Generations of Our Rea Family in America by Thomas W Rea, 1999. File 2: a 
brief sketch of Rea family given by Right Houston Patton, newspaper clipping obituary of brother and 
sister who passed away on the same day, Elizabeth Dillion Rea and Dallas Dillon, 1934. File 3: original 
certificate for the Governor’s Voluntary Action Program Older American Award for Margaret E. Rea. File 
4: family bible records, descendants of James Rea, 1852 death notice for Robert Rea (d. Nov. 4, 1852), 
marriage record for Jokee Rea and Sarah Jacob, 1874; Robert Rea pension information, family unit 
sheets. File 5 :obituary for Laura Rea, obit for William Franklin Rea (1887), death of CW Hunter, 1881; 
Margaret Patton, 1884; Feb. 26, 1881 Party announcement, May 4, 1881 Judith Bright’s party for Lizzie 
Harper, marriage announcement of Frank Rea son of RR Rea and Lizzie Harper Rea, no date; May 3, 1881 
Frank Rea marriage; Dec. 31, 1881 New Years women at home to meet acquaintances; Dec 23, 1881 



Besique Club met at Frank Rea’s house; Feb 4, 1887 Frank Rea $900; April 11, 1887 Fred Harper 
birthday; May 5, 1881 Rea Harper Wedding; May 6, 1881 WF Rea mention in The Journal; August 16, 
1878 Frank Rea Holds the Age; newspaper mention of the Columbus Republican about Frank Rea; Nov 
30, 1881 Frank Rea mention in the paper; William Franklin Rea death notice clipping and obituary 
(1887); Feb 19, 1886 Robert Right Rea Sr. 50th birthday; Oct. 1, 1886 Joseph Woolley looking for R R 
Rea’s livery; April 10, 1883 Fred Rea’s birthday; obituary for Elizabeth Rea Healey, 1978; obit for Mrs. 
Marion Rea, 1944; Matthew Houston Patton family information. File 6: Emily Harper Rea – life 
information, killed in airplane accident April 25, 1945. File 7: correspondence, R. R. Rea sworn in as 
sheriff Madison Courier Aug. 30, 1853. File 8: Robert R. Rea – ad in directory for livery, 1887-1888; 
census record, Jan 3, 1899 Miss Margaret Rea Entertains; Patton Probate records; life info; Ed Rea death 
notice, 1908; lineage of Andrew J. Rea; 1893 certificate for mass of Robert Right Rea at Protestant 
Episcopal Church. File 9: March 12, 1869 information wanted on old uncle R.R Rea; March 15, 1869 no 
leads in disappearance of Right Rea; March 19, 1869 R. R. Rea Jr is in town to ascertain information on 
father; March 22, 1869 no body found, friends are satisfied that he has been dealt with; March 24, 1869 
body found, not RR Rea; May 11, 1869 RR Rea body found, murder committed; May 12, 1869 funeral 
will take place; May 17, 1869 second body found, RR Rea definitely the first one. 

Rector (3 files) – File 1: newspaper article about a pioneer woman Elizabeth Hayes Rector, obituary 
October 1906. Descendants of John Kennedy Rector (b. 1800). File 2: Daniel – correspondence, family 
unit sheets, probate records. File 3: Nathaniel – obituary, 1882. 

Redinbaugh (marriage record for Henry Redinbaugh and Mary Douglass, 1823. 

Reed (4 files) – File 1: July 17, 1953 Clarence Reed Missing in Action in Korea; marriage record for Harry 
Reed and Dessie Eads, 1920; The Lawrenceburg Register July 23, 1953 Clarence missing in Korea; 
obituary for Mrs. Newton Reed, 1938; The Lawrenceburg Register August 6, 1953 Clarence Reed killed in 
Korea; obituary for Dessie Eads Reed, 1996; descendants of Ralph Griffin. File 2: Frederick William – Jan. 
20, 1864 in newspaper auction of estate of Frederick Reed; research notes, census records. File 3: 
Melvin Marling and Donna Reed marriage record, 1877, census record. File 4: marriage record for Cyrus 
Reed and Mary Taylor, 1839 

*Reeder (1 file): Jan. 23, 1945 Former Express Agent Promoted Ernest B. Reeder, Reeder family starts 
with Joseph Reeder immigrating in 1620.  

Reid (1 file): marriage record for Nathan T. Reid and M. A. Dungan, 1834.  

Reidel (1 file): Hester – Registration affidavit of Alien Female. 

Reindollar (1 file): Dotti – Indiana Horizons/Spring 1988 excerpt page; Madison Courier page about fire 
at Maywood house, January 31, 2000; Jan. 20, 2000 Dorothy “Dotti” Reindollar passes after fire; March 
4, 1994 Dorothy receives Vista Award for Lifetime Achievement newspaper article; 3/15/2000 cause of 
fire cited as heat lamp; 5-12-1998 Dorothy given hospitality recognition; January 28, 1988 ‘A deserving 
lady’ chamber of commerce award.  



Renfro (1 file): obituary for Mrs. John Renfro, 1931; Springdale Cemetery record, Death records of 
Jefferson County. 

Renschler (1 file): obituary for F.J. Renschler, 1901; census record; Charles Renschler obituary 1937, Mrs. 
Minnie Renschler death notice March 13, 1889; naturalization record for Fred Renschler; 1932 Fred 
Renschler obituary; obituary for Katie Brandtmeier, 1915; obituary for Jacob Brandtmeier, 1924, 
Jefferson County marriages.  

Rensch/Rentzsch (1 file): correspondence. 

*Reynolds (3 files) – File 1: family unit sheet for John Xavier Reynolds and Margaret Sheridan. File 2: 
family history sketch, excerpt from Souvenir book of Indiana Counties – Dr. John H. Reynolds. File 3: 
John H – bio sketch, pedigree chart for Ivy Lester Reynolds, family unit sheets.  

Rhodes/Rhoads (1 file): death certificate for Nelson Stanton; Jefferson County records.  

 

Rice (1 file): Rhys/Royce/Rice descendants of Robert Royce (b.1580), revolutionary war records for 
Ebenezer Rice; land records for Ebenezer Rice, The Westward Migration by H.H. Rice. 

Ricketts (1 file): family unit sheet for Oliver Cromweld Ricketts and Melissa Ella Klingensmith. File 2:  

Richards (1 file) early American bio sketch.  

Richardson (2 files) – File 1: correspondence. File 2: genealogy of three brothers Ezekiel, Samuel, 
Thomas Richardson.  

Riedel (2 files) – File 1: Andrew – bio sketch from Memoirs of the Lower Ohio Valley; Wiley Riedel 
obituary, 1986. File 2: John G. – Registration affidavit of alien enemy.  

Riker (3 files): Dorothy L. Riker recognized for 56 years of service to Indiana history, 1985 Indiana History 
Bulletin July-Aug; August 7, 1971 The Riker Graveyard in New York. File 2:  copy. File 3: diagram of Riker 
Cemetery on North Beach Long Island, NY with inscriptions. 

Riley (1 file): obituary for Clara Riley 1928, death of Alf Riley, Scott county cemetery records. 

Richert (2 files) – File 1: Original German certificate, school certificates from Madison Schools, John 
Richert bio sketch. File 2: May 5, 1915 obituary for wife of John Richert.  

Richmond (3 files) – File 1: The Richmonds of Trimble County newsletter Dec. 1994; family unit sheet for 
James McLaughlin and Jane Starling, James Richmond and Sarah. File 2: Robert – b.1935, obituary in 
2001, death certificate for David Alan Richmond, census records for Robert. File 3: The Richmonds of 
Trimble County index of descendants of James “Clete” and Sarah Richmond.  

Ringwald (6 files) – File 1: pedigree charts, descendants of Johann Ringwald (b. 1733). File 2: Geyman 
family connection, Descendants chart. File 3: reproduction photos, newspaper article clipping about 



Monsignor Ringwald 6-8-1981. File 4: Ringwald-Goley family – reproduction photograph of John 
Ringwald and Velma (1915); research notes and census records. File 5: Father – Leo, obituary 1994; April 
2, 1963 St Michael’s Rectory writing. File 6: descendants of Joseph Ringwald and Maria Anna Friederick 
of Baden, Germany.  

Ringwalt (1 file): Ringwaldt – Gosman, Colette Ann – funeral notice (1999) and family unit sheet.  

*Risk (2 files) – File 1: Carl Risk Sr. Family in the newspaper 4/9/1982; Diana Risk honored for 
community service 2/27/1986; Re-elect Carl W. Risk 10/16/1986; opinion Feb. 27, 1986; March 7, 2002 
Dianna Risk awarded Indiana middle school counselor of the year. File 2: Risk-Buchanan Reunion at Hicks 
Draws Members of Families from Many States 8-31-1930; newspaper article about Risk family, no date; 
Aug. 3, 1931 Risk Reunion article; family bible records; marriage licenses in Augusta County, VA.  

Ritchie (3 files) – File 1: John – Aug. 29, 1981 Ritchie Family reunion clipping; Aug. 26, 1983 Reunion 
clipping; bio sketch for John Ritchie. File 2: bio sketch for John Ritchie. File 3: census records, cemetery 
records, obituary for J. R. Ritchie (1893), obituary for Walter Richey (1938), obituary for Julia A. Ritchie 
(1918), obituary for John Ritchie (1877), obituary for Mrs. Walter Ritchie (1935). 

Ritter (1 file): July 29, 1999 article about coach Julius Ritter; July 28, 1999 Julius Ritter’s battle with 
Alzheimer’s article.  

Robbins (6 files) – File 1: family bible records, pedigree chart for Geraldine Lou Roller, Sept. 28, 1937 
Trace Family Tree in the Madison Courier. File 2: Robbins family starting with Jacob Robbins of England. 
File 3: Ogle family connection and long descendant document. File 4: Jefferson County Buchanan 
Cemetery survey, obituary for John Robbins (1994), obituary for William A. Robbins (1923), family bible 
records, obituary for Ryker Robbins (1891), census records. File 5: family bible records, family 
newsletter. File 6: family unit sheets, research notes, ancestors of Cynthia Conway Smith (1801-1868), 
Ryker family connection. 

 

*Roberts (7 files) – File 1: family bible records. File 2: Joseph – obituary, May 7, 1894; cemetery records, 
census records, obituary for John D. Roberts, 1932. File 3: Genealogy of the family of James B. Roberts 
and Martha Althea Cross. File 4: lineage of Frank Egelston. File 5: Early American bio, bio sketch for 
Clarence J. Roberts, the family of Colonel Owen Roberts. File 6: family unit sheets. File 7: Edward S. – 
Collection of statements from a scrapbook.  

*Robertson (4 files) – File 1: genealogy research notes, Golden wedding anniversary for Mr. and Mrs. 
David W. Robertson (January 5, 1940), RoundAbout article August 2000 about Ken Robertson’s 
Mayflower ancestor. File 2: marriage record for James D. Robertson and Caroline Smith, 1850. File 3: 
marriage record for David Robertson and Susan Gaddy, 1834. File 4: marriage record for David Robeson 
and Susan Gaddy, 1834.  

Robinius (1 file): records concerning Peter Robinius, marriage record for Peter and Magdaline Fox, 1848; 
census record; directory entry.  



*Robinson (6 files) – File 1: family history starting with Thomas Robinson (emigrated in 1630). File 2: 
William – funeral invitation, 1834. File 3: marriage record for William Robinson and Maria Gudgel, 1827. 
File 4: family information for Mary Wellman Fearson and William Robinson, Pioneer history from the 
Courier May 1879 – The Baltimorians; Saga of two William Robinsons in Madison history. File 5: 
correspondence and research notes. File 6: bio sketch of George Robinson, write up about his house, 
obituary for George F. Robinson May 12, 1831.  

Roch (1 file): obituary for John M. Roch, 1922. Obituary for Dr. Oscar Hunger, 1893.  

Rock (1 file): no date newspaper article about a diary telling of early days – mentions Charles Anthony 
Rock.  

Rockwell (1 file): Early American Bio.  

*Rockwood (1 file): correspondence with notes.  

*Rogers (15 files) – File 1: Nov. 27, 1914 wedding announcement for Rogers – Imel marriage. Nov 1, 
1917 obituary for James M. Rogers. File 2: William – Private Bill’s Sketch Book of the World War, 
obituary (May, 1973). File 3: Sondra – RoundAbout article 2011, about Actress from Trimble County KY, 
photo of her. File 3: descendants of John Rogers (b. 1793). File 4: excerpt from History of Washington 
County Penn., James Rodgers family information, excerpt from The Old and New Monongahela, 
correspondence, family information on William Turner. File 5: Stephen – lineage of Joseph Rogers, 
lineage of Ida Cora Smith, newspaper clipping family reunion 8-6-1986, newspaper clipping Hanover 
natives live in Thailand 7-21-1988, notes. File 6: Shirley – reminiscences of W. Shirley Rogers (b. 1905). 
File 7: Griffin, Rodgers, and Graham Family lines. Lineage chart. File 8: Nathaniel – lineage of John W. 
Senior. File 9: William E. – image of Will E. Rogers and description of his “sketch book”, July 18, 1973 
William E. Rogers remembered in the Madison Courier. File 10: Tribute to Dr. J.H.D. Rogers in Madison 
Courier June 8, 1886; family unit sheets. File 11: A. E – descendants of Albert Ellsworth Rogers, obituary 
for Neida Rogers (2008), newspaper article about Lee Rogers volunteer at Jefferson County Historical 
Society April 12, 2010. File 12: write up about Clarke Rogers April 3, 1899 in the Madison Courier. File 
13: About Our Ancestors by Eleanor Lexington Early American Bio. File 14: 8-28-1979 Golden 
Anniversary for W. Shirley Rogers and wife; love story about Rogers and Lorraine Rynerson, no date; 
obituary for Eligah Rogers, 1991; inscription on William Rogers grave marker stone; obituary for JHD 
Rogers, 1885; death notice for Ebenezer Rogers, 1885. 

Roll (1 file): Ann/James – concerning a murder in Trimble County.  

Rose (2 files) – File 1: Robert C. – Rose Family Association letter and records, 1-17-1981 newspaper 
article about MCHS graduate writing a book. File 2: marriage record for Wilson Rose and Amanda West, 
1835; Dec. 19, 18=986 Golden Wedding Anniversary article. 

Roseberry ( 1 file): Ollie – 1957 article, death certificate (1957) 

Rosecrons (2 files) – File 1: family Bible Records. File 2: Judge Charles – family of Thomas and Catherine 
Earhart Roseberry, obituary for Charles W. Roseberry, 1909. 



Ross (3 files) – File 1: Isom – bio sketch, obituary for Elizabeth New Ross, 1918; funeral for John J. Craig, 
1891; obituary for John Bullis Ross, 1921; Ross in Directory of Madison, Thomas Graham and CO. Inc 75 
years newspaper article Feb. 22, 1941; Family of Isom Ross and Eliza Robbins; will of Elizabeth Ross. File 
2: Revolutionary Patriot and Pioneer Isaac Ambrose Ross and Family, Family Bible records. File 3: 
research notes, census records, family unit sheets, correspondence, naturalization records, 
Revolutionary war pension information.   

Rossater (1 file): marriage record for Ignatius L. Rossater and Barbara Kleine, 1849.   

Roth (1 file): memorial to Heinrich Roth, Family unit sheet, telegraph copies, marriage record for Henry 
Roth and Anna Eckert. 

Rothert (1 file): Harold Rothert bio, pamphlet from Tulane.  

Rousch (2 files) – File 1: Charles H. – Magnolia tree newspaper article 10/28/1971; newspaper article in 
the Indianapolis Star Oct. 27, 1971 A Visit to Madison Reveals New Delights; obituary for Anna Rousch 
9/1/1984; Obituary fro Charles H. Rousch 11/9/1978; Leo and Lucille Rousch golden anniversary Feb. 25, 
1987. File 2: Elizabeth – Registration Affadavit of Alien Female; newspaper article about Elizabeth 
Rousch writing a second book Aug. 1, 1967.  

Rowland (1 file): marriage record for Jesse Rowland and Matilda Baxter, 1834.    

Rowlison (1 file): obituary for Herbert Rowlison, 1945; obituary for M.C. Rowlison, 1920.  

Rowlinson (1 file): correspondence.  

Royce (2 files) – File 1: correspondence and research notes. File 2: Walter – retirement newspaper 
article, 6/23/1979.  

Rucker ( 2 files) – File 1: family newsletter. File 2: obituary for Warren R. Rucker Dec. 14, 1995; Dr. 
Rucker presented Chamber award Feb. 3, 1984; Dr. Rucker for Mayor in the paper 1975.  

Rudd 91 file): David F. – cemetery record, 1855 

Ruddick (1 file): marriage record for Joseph L. Ruddick and Mary Sage, 1838.  

Rue (1 file): Richard Rue, Consley and Watson updated 1999.  

Rusk (1 file): obituary for Frank H. Rusk, 1955; obituary for Hulda Rusk, 1972; obituary for William Rusk, 
1914. 

Rutledge (1 file): marriage record for Joseph F. Rutledge and Sarah Laudon, 1849. 

Russell (1 file): Louis B. – Shawe Memorial High School information.  

Rusk (1 file): Bertha Irene – obituary, 2016. 

Ryan (1 file): George – Rev. War pension information.  



*Ryker (25 files) – File 1: Peter Ryker of Canaan and New Marion. File 2: More About Ancestors, River 
Boats (Oct. 9, 1971), Nov. 11, 1978 Manville musician made it big; Ryker Historical Society Inc letter; July 
19, 2002 Ryker descendants preserve family history; Marriage record for John Salisbury and Leah Ryker, 
1837; The Mississippi Rag September-1978; correspondence; March 8, 1980 A Visit with Doc, Norma 
Ryker. File 3: Pension Information – John Ryker. File 4: April 24, 1971 More Info On Demarests, Rykers; 
5-3-1986 Help From The Auction; 1-16-1982 Ryker Coat of Arms; 5-19-1984 Program For Junior 
Researchers; June 23, 1984 Ryker-Riker Madison hosts unique family reunion; lineage of Hannibal 
Danner; Ryker Family after the Civil War. File 5: descendants of Abraham Rycker (b. 1619); obituary for 
Bertha Keelty, 1976; 8-8-1983 Ryker family reunion. File 6: Ryker Register newsletters, marriage record 
for Jared Ryker and Bythinia Miller, 1834. File 7: Aug. 21, 1971 Rykers Fill Their Scrapbooks; descendants 
of Gerardus Ryker (b.1740); Indiana History Bulletin – May, 1949 Jefferson County Ryker Family excerpt; 
Jefferson County records. File 8: Ryker Register newletter, Genealogy of the Ryker Family – children of 
Gerardus Ryker, History of Switzerland County, Indiana From Their Earliest Settlement, 1895 excerpt-
various pages. File 9: Some Notes on the Dutch Settlements of Virginia’s Western Frontier presented by 
Larry M/ Voreis at the Ryker-Riker Family Reunion 2004. File 10: April 17, 1976 Another Ryker Family 
story in the Madison Courier. File 11: descendants of Abraham Ryker. File 12: correspondence and 
research notes. File 13: Jared – bio sketch and letter in the paper on June 1, 1880. File 14: 
correspondence, bio sketch of William Robbins, excerpt from The New York Genealogical and 
Biographical Record, Vol. 125 Number 3 July 1994 The Lent Surname: A Mystery Solved, pedigree chart 
for Diertie Beekman, July 1938? An Armory of American Families of Dutch Descent by William J Hoffman, 
F.G.B.S.; excerpt from The New York Genealogical and Biographical Record . Vol. 106 Number 3 July 
1975 The Wiltsie Family of Early New York; excerpt from Dutch Uncles and New England Cousins, 1977; 
Our Still Family Their Descendants and Ancestors compiled by Margaret (Still) Archer, 1981; excerpt 
from The New York Genealogical and Biographical Record, Vol. 6, No. 2, April 1888 – Some Records of 
the Beekman Family; excerpt from Contributions for the Genealogies of the First Settlers of the Ancient 
County of Albany From 1630 – 1800, 1976; New York Sun April 2, 193? The Magic Pear Tree of the 
Ryker-; Article from the Old-House Journal June 1986 Riker home in New York City; excerpt from The 
Dutch Settlers Society of Albany Volume 41 Yearbook 1966-1968. File 15: Ryker Register newsletters. 
File 16: Ryker Register 1999 newsletter. File 17: Riker homestead blueprint elevation images, July-Sept 
1999 Random Harvest Weekly June 23, 1999 Spencer Mourns Loss of Aimee Riker. File 18:  
correspondence, obituary for J.G. Ryker (1908), information on John Robert Lott, obituary for Phoebe 
Lott (1885); obituary for Rachel Lott (1898), information on Marcus D. Lott, information on Rachel D. 
Ryker. File 19: Ryker reunion articles 5-22-1982. File 20: Index of Ryker Register newsletters. File 21: 
Peter V. – Aug. 23, 1986 Ryker Family article in the newspaper; marriage record for Peter V. Ryker and 
Mary Ann Robins, 1837. File 22: Abraham – probate record. File 23: Abraham – marriage record for 
Abraham Ryker and Mary Smith, 1829. File 24: correspondence and information on Peter Ryker. File 25: 
Pearl M. - death notice Aug. 19, 1892, Vail Funeral Records, They Say and Do In the Country Dec. 17, 
1938; pedigree chart.  

S 



Sachleben (1 file): starts with Johan Friedrick and Margareta Schluter, naturalization record for Chris 
Sachleben. 

Salisbury (1 file): marriage record for John Salisbury and Leah Ryker, 1837.  

Salyers (1 file): census records, Jerimah and John on census, Ryker Genealogy,  

Sample (1 file): John L. – newspaper article on the death of John H. Sample with obituary, 1950; obituary 
for Virgil Sample, 1958; obituary for Sherley Sample, 1952; obituary for Hazel Sample, 1952; 10/23/1978 
newspaper article Sample awarded life membership in forestry, woodland association; obituary for John 
L. Sample, 1982.  

Sanxay (1 file): list of the children of Ann Elizabeth Park and Henry Campbell Sanxay, family unit sheets, 
descendancy chart, bio of Henry Sanxay, obituary for Henry C. Sanxay, 1888. 

Sarver (1 file): R.C. – newspaper article 3/27/1979 about R. C. Sarver’s trade in painting.  

Sandifer (1 file): marriage record for Waid Sandifer and Irene Davis.  

Saylers (1 file): marriage record for Martin F. Saylers and Rebecca J. Ryker, 1834, Solomon Saylor family 
information.  

Schaaf (1 file): Martha – no date newspaper article about the author.  

Schaf (1 file): Peter N. – death notice in the Madison Courier Aug. 1, 1893, family unit sheet,  

Schad (1 file): marriage record for Eberhart F. Schad and Mary Store, 1854; obituary for E. F> Schad, 
1909; obituary for Maud Schad, 1923; obituary for Mary Schad, 1925; obituary for Benjamin H. Scah, 
1928; obituary for Barbara Schad, 1920; obituary for William Schad, 1923; obituary for Nathan Schad, 
1937; obituary for Lily Schad, 1943; Lula Schad, 1939; Mary Schad, 1892; Almond Schad, 1884; Gertrude 
Schad, 1938; Ralph Lanham bio sketch; Jefferson County marriage records; Madison Directory pages; 
cemetery records. 

Schafer (5 files) – File 1: engagement announcement for Harold Tandy Jr. and Margaret Schafer, 
5/15/1979; June 24, 1989 Bernard Schafer wins Mercedes-Benz car; July 8, 1989 Madison Priest travels 
new path; March 16, 1982 Schafer family bingo; May 15, 1990 Bernard and Helen Schafer awarded 
family of the year by KofC; obituary for Bertha Schafer, 1982. File 2: family unit sheet for Valentine 
Schafer and Katharina Keifer. File 3: image of John and Velma Ringwald Rohman, family unit sheets, 
Rae’s School class of 1911; marriage record for Edward Wettick and Catherine Schafer, 1883; May 10, 
1873 death notice for Catherine Schafer; 50th anniversary of Douglas and Catherine Brawner. File 4: 
Schafer family info supplied by Catherine Schafer Brawner; What I Learned from my Mother about her 
parents by Agnes Elizabeth Schafer Bufka, 1981; 2/18/1987 Silver Anniversary of John and Sharon 
Schafer; lineage of Daniel Whitmore Schafer; family bio. File 5: family unit sheets; pamphlet from the 
ordination of Rev. Raymond Schafer, 1989; Final vows taken by Mary F. Schafer July 29, 1989; 
reproduction images.  



Scheik (1 file): cemetery record, census record, pedigree chart, obituary for Albert Scheik, 1910; obituary 
for Phillip Scheik, 1870; death notice for Lucy Scheik, 1874. 

Schell (1 file): Bedford PA obituary for Hon. Peter Schell Nov. 30, 1900; St Anthony School (China); 
Mathias Rohrman photograph reproduction.  

Schelke (1 file): descendants of Henry Phillip Schelke (b. 1780). 

Schilling (1 file): Fred – obituary for John Schilling, 1926; May 27, 1972 article Fred Schilling recalling 
Early days.  

Schirmer (1 file): Henry Clay – business cards; Dec. 1977 Clay Schirmer is published; a poem; article 
about his writings 12/5/1977; Vevay Indiana January 13, 1983 promotion of book.  

Scherling (1 file): marriage record for John Scherling and Elizabeth Loos, 1854.  

Schifferdecker (1 file): William John – marriage index, life info, death certificate, census record.   

Schlichter (1 file): reproduction photographs; census record; obituary for Mary Schlichter, 1915; 
obituary for Margaret M. Schlichter; obituary for Chella Schlichter, 1987; burial information;  

Schmidlapp (2 files) – File 1: descendants of Jacob Schmidlapp (b. 1593), Mason Tribute Day Aug. 24, 
1967. File 2: Caleb – family unit sheet, articles about Local Masons (Aug. 24, 1967) in the Madison 
Courier.  

Schmidt (4 files) – File 1: Henry W. – Registration Affidavit for alien enemy. File 2: family of Johann and 
Katherina Leopold Schmidt, august Schmidt death certificate; census records; death notice for Lottie 
Mooney July 14, 1874; obituary for Thomas Lane, 1882; obit for Katherine Schmidt, 1924. File 3: Leon – 
Registration Affidavit for alien enemy. File 4: descendants of Schmidt and Fredericka (d. 1877).  

Schnabel (2 files): John Schnabel records and information. File 2: obituary for Helen Schnabel, 1992; Tim 
Schnabel appears in TV show, Dec. 16, 1991.  

Schnaitter (1 file): Paul – 11-18-1981 Almost 22 years of dedication; 1/11/1985 Judge Paul R. Schnaitter 
editorial; obituary for Carrie Brook Schnaitter, 1970; 1/10/1985 obituary for Paul Schnaitter; Nov. 9, 
1976 Judge Schnaitter has a good time at party; 12/31/1976 Schnaitter leaves bench after 18 years.  

Schnebelt (1 file): The Joseph Schnebelt Family of Jefferson County, Indiana.  

Schneider (5 files) – File 1: July 15, 1886 Fred Foltz and Emma Snyder celebration; obituary for Emma 
Foltz, 1943; marriage of Fred Foltz and Emma Snyder, July 16, 1886; census records. File 2: registration 
affidavit of alien enemy – Henry Schneider; obituary for Henry J. Schneider, 1952; obit for Andrew 
Schneider, 1936; descendancy chart for Henrich Schneider (b. 1787). File 3: newspaper article April 8, 
1951 Centurion Anticipates Outlasting Another War; 2/7/1951 Henry Schneider Has Best Wishes from 
Miss Dunne; Feb. 3, 1951Madison Man is 100 Years Old. File 4: Henry – original photograph of Henry 
Schneider. File 5: bio of Henry J. Schneider.  



Schnitger (1 file): family of Charles Schnitger (b. 1808) 

Schoenstein (2 files) – File 1: information for Hubert Schoenstein and family, obituary for Hubert, 1909; 
obit for J.C. Schoenstein, 1942; Obit for Louise Schoenstein, 1970; obit for John Schoenstein, 1970; 
obituary for Lillian Short, 1982; descendancy chart for Hubert Schoenstein. File 2: Mary A. – Registration 
affidavit of alien female. 

*Schofield (5 files) – File 1: obituary for Joe Schofield, 1886; obituary for Johan H. Schofield, 1884; 
obituary for Joshua O. Schofield, 1935; obituary for John T. Schofield, 1897; obituary for Harry Schofield, 
1912; obituary for Dr. J.V. Schofield, 1922; obituary for John Thorpe Schofield, 1925; Marianna Schofield, 
1935; obituary for Mrs. J. O. Schofield, 1934; Obit for Samuel J. Schofield, 1925; obit for Samuel J. 
Schofield, 1924; obituary for Mrs. J.L. Schofield, 1932; obituary for William P. Schofield, 1913. File 2: 
Family unit sheets, obit for Ethel Schofield (1967); Obit for John Samuel Schofield (1955); obit for 
Florence Schofield (1972); Craig family connection; Descendants of Joshua Schofield; obituary for 
George Middleton, 1926. File 3: marriage record for John S. Schofield and Florence Rea, 1926. File 4: 
family bible records, Beebe family bio; Madison Courier newspaper items; Johnson-Schofield nuptials 
April 19, 1882; Death of Joseph H. Schofield – Oct 10, 1884; obituary for Henry Schofield 7/26/1957; 
newspaper clipping about Haigh and Schofield Mill, no date; obituary for Mrs. Rosa Winters Schofield, 
1924. File 5: obituary for John Singo, 1990; information on John Sering; obituary for Ruth T. Grover 
Sering, 1884; Feb. 28, 1887 newspaper mention of John Sering; obituary for Homer Sering, 1917; obit for 
Clara Sering, 1924; obituary for William H. Ratts; obituary for Charles Requet, 1991; obituary for Mrs. 
John Schoefield, 1933;  obituary for Hannah Middleton, 1899; obit for Sarah Sering Marshall, 1896; 
obituary for Myrtle Henry, 1971; obituary for John T. Hock, 1975; obituary for Hannah Elizabeth Hock, 
1959; obituary for Robert Hines, 1974; Dorotha Hines, 2003; Albin Koczergo,; Thomas Brown Dean, 
1899; Frieda Ford, 1996; Isaac M. Gray, 1911; Eliza Gray, 1949; Mary Ford, 1938; Nathan Ford, 1996; 
Frank A. Ford, 1944; obituary of Drusilla Cravens, 1956; Eugene Wolfschlag, 1977; Alma Wolfschlag, nd; 
Elizabeth Stanley, 1928; Harry Stanley, 1911.  

Scholl (2 files) – File 1: correspondence and notes. File 2: Revolutionary Patriots and Pioneers of Virginia 
and Kentucky – Scholl.  

Scholler (1 file): marriage record for John C. Scholler and Anna B. Hughes, 1864. 

Schoolcraft (1 file): obituaries for Jannie Mae, James H., Jon Michael, Clara, Gerald. Birth certificate for 
Doris M. Schoolcraft, Death certificate for Harvey Schoolcraft.  

Schrader (1 file): Christian – obituary, 1920 and information on his drawings.  

Schramm (2 files) – File 1: Indiana History Bulletin, Aug. 1955 Schramm Diaries; obituary John Schramm, 
1912. File 2: Nicholas Schramm family information.  

Schroeder (3 files): obituary for Benjamin Schroeder, 1909; obituary for Elizabeth Schroeder, 1919; Obit 
for Theresa Schroeder, 1897; Obit for Rose Louise Schroeder, 1915; Sept. 8, 1920 KofC council officers 
elected; Oct. 5, 1920 KofC meeting in the paper. File 2: marriage record for Aloysius C. Krumpelbeck and 



Pauline F. Schroeder, 1912. File 3:  obituary for Charles Schroeder, no date; obituary for Joseph 
Schroeder, 1972; Family unit sheets, descendancy chart.  

Schuck (1 file): James P. – burial information, civil war registration record, 0marriage record for James 
Presley Schuch and Rachel Roffin, 1905; other family marriage records; death certificates; census 
records.  

Schuh (1 file): life sketch of George Schuh in the Madison Courier July 3, 1913. Obituary for Lewis H. 
Jones, July 5, 1913. 

Schuler (1 file): Caroline – Registration affidavit of alien female.  

Schulz (1 file): DAR service record for Emile August Shulz. 

Schussler (1 file): obituary for Dr. Charles Schussler, 1874; Civil War pension record; early madsion 
newspaper mentions.  

Schwartz (1 file): Addie – directory listings and obituary for Sarah “Addie” Powell Schwartz (1898-1977) 

*Scott (7 files) – File 1: descendants of William Scott (b. 1758); lineage of Virginia Tattershall. File 2: 
Perin – ancestry chart, research notes. File 3: Perin – 2/4/1985 newspaper clipping Scot is area’s ‘Mr. 
Scounting’; newspaper clipping 2/26/1982 E. Perin Scott is presented important Rotary Club honor; Oct. 
22, 1975 newspaper clipping E. Perin Scott underwriter, copies of articles, no dates. File 4: Memoirs of 
the Lower Ohio Valley – bio for Elmer E. Scott; 1/4/1975 John E. Scott Sr., director to retire from First 
National. File 5: pioneer family of Kentucky and Indiana – John Scott. File 6: Descendants of William 
Scott (b. 1758) and Christiana Stonehouse (b. 1750).  File 7: Robert – obituary (1997). 

Searcy (1 file): Connie Susan – marriage record for Douglas Dwight Jacobs and Connie Susan Searcy, 
1970; Jacobs family info. 

Sebern (1 file): family history, Sering family connections.  

Sedam (3 files) – File 1: excerpt from The Annals of Newtown, in Queens County, New York by James 
Riker, Jr., 1852. File 2: information on Hendrick Rycken (Suydam), (B. 1663) and descendants. File 3: 
correspondence, excerpt from Genealogical and Family History of Southern New York and the Hudson 
River Valley, 1913; excerpt from New Jersey Historical Society Proceedings Vol. 54, 1936.  

Seeman (2 files) – File 1: Aug. 9. 1985 newspaper article on Father Raymond Seemann. File 2: image of 
Father Raymond Seemann on his 60th birthday, 1988.  

Sego (1 file): 3/27/2006 newspaper article Sego back in custody after escape from house arrest; 
3/28/2006 article Medical condition prompted Sego release.  

Seiwert (2 files) – File 1: Joseph – Registration affidavit of alien enemy. File 2: Kate – Registration 
affidavit of alien female. 



Selig (3 files) – File 1: correspondence, john Selig info, John Selig death certificate (d. 1916), obit for 
Herman Selig (1911). File 2: correspondence. File 3: correspondence, reproduction images, obituary for 
Blanche Marie Selig (1988), Four Generations (Sept. 24, 1988), wedding announcement card, obit for 
John W. Selig, 1973.  

Sellers (1 file): obituary for Charles Edward Dankers, no date; William Sellers obituary, no date; funeral 
card for Grace Ann Dankers; Obituary for James W. Sellers, no date; Mary Stewart obituary, no date; Hill 
family obituaries; Wyckoff family connection; Hunter family obituaries. 

Selmier (1 file): descendancy chart 

Senediges (1 file): marriage record for James Snediges and Pally Grimes, 1826.  

Senour (1 file): Adam Glore bio sketch, KY Senour family information, Philip Senour records, Elbert 
Senour records, James Fraizer Senour funeral record. 

*Sering (5 files) – File 1: Samuel B. – fairmount cemetery survey. File 2: marriage record for John G. 
Sering and Eliza Ann Mellen, 1841. File 3: obituary for Ruth T. Grover Sering, James Sering newspaper 
mention April 25, 1893. File 4: John Sering Pioneer newspaper article, no date. File 5: bio sketch for John 
Sering.  

Settle (1 file): family unit sheets, record lists, Fall family connection.  

Seymour (1 file): death announcement for Sarah M. Seymour, 1897; Will for Sarah Seymour; pedigree 
chart; census records, Kerr family connection, Abijah Seymour info. 

Shad (1 file): Oct. 4, 1895 E. Shad birthday celebration.  

Shadday (3 files) – File 1: family tree, index of first names. File 2: newspaper article about Rev. War 
soldier John Shadday Nov. 22, 1917. File 3: descendants of John Shadday (b. 1754).  

Shazer (1 file): correspondence. 

*Shannon (3 files) – File 1: George Shannon Rev. War Soldier bio sketch, service record for George 
Shannon, facts about Buckley Walker of Bedford/Campbell, VA. File 2: George Shannon information. File 
3: The Shannon Family compiled by Robert Shannon Moore beginning with Thomas Shannon (d. 1737).  

Sharer (1 file): list of Indiana newspaper search results.  

Shaw (3 files) – File 1: family unit sheets and research notes for Shaw family, family of Smith Shaw and 
Elizabeth McMinn. File 2: Joshua – census information, Civil War enlistment information. File 3: 
correspondence.  

Sheets (6 files) – File 1: obituary for Albert Sheets, nd; Lula Sheets, Bertie Earl Sheets; Souviner Sketch of 
Michael Sheets; Dec. 13, 1859 estate of Jonah S. Sheets in the paper; death announcement for Enos J. 
Sheets, Margaret Kramer obit, W.K. Buchanan obit; obituary for Helen A. Sheets; obituary for Peter 
Sheets (1939); Burton Sheets (1992); descendants of John Sheets (1797-1875); obituary for Catherine 



Sheets; Frank X. Sheets; Mrs. Jacob Sheets; 1953 obit for James Sheets; Maude Sheets; reproduction 
photos. File 2: John – newspaper article Life of John Sheets, 11/13/1931. File 3: service records. File 4: 
Anna – July 13, 1861 death of Mrs. Anna Sheets. File 5: pedigree chart, clipping from 6/28/1984 Sheets-
Fagg event draws crowd, marriage record for James A. Sheets and Sarah Jane Gilles, 1837. File 6: 
newspaper article Frank Sheets - A Boy Soldier from Madison Feb. 1, 1887. Shelton (1 file): William 
Hayden – Dec. 3, 1918 influenza death of V. O. Howard; report of internment for W. H. Shelton. 

Shelton (1 file): Lusby-Shelton, Florrie, census information, death information, Find a Grave page.  

Shepherd (1 file): Samuel J. – Sept. 15, 1891 death of S. J. Shepherd, painter; June 27, 1890 Death of 
Lizzie Shepherd; death of Mrs. Samuel Shepherd, 1897. 

Sheridan (1 file): marriage record for Hopsen Sheridan and Ellen Sherwood, 1854.  

Sherlock (1 file): Ernest J. – obit for Stella L. Wood, 1986; Frank Sherlock obituary, 1963; bio of Ernest 
Sherlock.  

Sherman (1 file): family unit sheet for Capt. Nathan Havens Sherman and Elizabeth Eldred; 1876 
newspaper clipping bio sketch; census records; ancestors of Brian Doig. 

Shimfessel (1 file): 50th anniversary for Mr. and Mrs. Henry Shimfessels, June 25, 1987.  

Shinness (1 file): obituary for Albert J. Shinness, 1916; obituary for Mrs. John Wilson, 1896; Obit for 
Frank H. Wilson; 1943; obit for George A. Shinness, 1937; obit for Mrs. George Shinness, 1920; death of 
George Shinness, 1920.  

Short (5 files) – File 1: Elisha – census record, Jefferson County marriage record. File 2: Elisha – obituary, 
1884. File 3: Jacob Short life sketch; Craig Township cemetery records; census records; obituary for Mary 
Short, 1889; Jefferson County Marriages. File 4: obituary for H.C. Short, 1913; Jeff. Co. Marriage records; 
census records; George Benefiel records; Willis E Short family. File 5: Short Family of MD-VA-KY and Jeff. 
Co. IN.  

Shrewsbury (5 files) - File 1: correspondence. File 2: marriage record for Sheldon Shrewsbury and 
JuliAnn Stewart, 1851. File 3: copy of letter from Woody Shrewsbury to father. File 4: newspaper article 
5/21/1927 Protest Razing of the Shrewsbury house; Obituary for John Windle, 1987; pedigree chart for 
Charles Shrewsbury; family unit sheets; Madison Homes write up; newspaper article July 27, 1855 on 
Palmetto Mills; Oct. 27, 1858 Palmetto Mills Fire. File 5: death notice for Lewis Shrewsbury, 1880; 
obituary for Samuel Shrewsbury, 1887; information about the River Block that Shrewsbury House sits 
on.  

*Shuck (2 files) File 1: will of Andrew Shuck of Shelby Co. KY; family information; Hoosier Journal of 
Ancestry Switzerland County. File 2: William – obituary for Dr. William Shuck May 12, 1987.  

Siebenthal (1 file): clipping on Siebenthal Mill 1/17/1935.  

*Sieferman (1 file): pedigree chart; obituary for Matthew Sieferman, 1920. 



Siefert (1 file): Madison Courier newspaper article Jan. 22, 2004 Chamber honors Seifert, Steinhardt for 
work in community.  

*Siersdorfer (4 file) – File 1: death notices: Charles Siersdorfer, 1927; William Siersdorfer Minneapolis 
Tribune Feb. 20, 1937; Elizabeth M. Aulenbrock Louisville Courier-Journal Sept. 8, 1953. File 2: obituary 
for Nicholas Siersdorfer April 15, 1895; July 22, 1863 Siersdorfer Business Ad. File 3: obituary for Mary 
Magdalene Siersdorfer, 1907; shoe store advert Jan. 31, 1871. File 4: family unit sheet, death notice for 
Theresa Zinser, 1967.  

Simpson (2 files) – File 1: death notice for Jonathan Simpson, 1863; early newspaper items; family unit 
sheets, Alexander Simpson and Rowena Clark. File 2: John D. – Thomas M. Simpson Jr. bio sketch; 
articles about Dr. John D. Simpson from various newspapers; early newspaper items; Madison Dollar 
Weekly Star Nov. 24, 1882 obituary; altercation with William Howard newspaper article; Nov. 22, 1882 
John D. Simpson dead in Evening Star; will of Jonathan Simpson; Jonathan Simpson bio; Oct. 17, 1879 
Evening Courier Simpson-Howard altercation; Oct. 18, 1879 update on altercation;Oct. 20, 1879 Daily 
Evening Star update on altercation and Judge decision; next day article; Oct 22 Oct. 23, Oct. 27, Dec. 15, 
1879 Daily Evening Star update; Dec. 19, Dec. 20,  

Sims (1 file): 11/20/1976 newspaper article Six Children, three jobs keep Gail Sims busy. 

Sisson (2 files) – File 1: correspondence. File 2: obituary for Sarah Adkins, 1920; Madison Directory 1927; 
obituary for William W. Brushfield, 1929; census 1880 Brushfield in Madison.  

Sizemoore (1 file): original booklet.  

Skaggs (1 file): Leonard – obit, June 1955/56. 

Skeen(e) (1 file): early Madison Wills; probate records. 

Skeldon (1 file): Golden – 3/19/1976 newspaper article ‘Skelly’ marks 57th year with Courier; obituary – 
8/24/1978; no date image of young Golden Skeldon in the paper.  

Slater (1 file): census records, directory page; obituary for Samuel Slater, 1926; obituary for William T. 
Slater, 1919. 

Slider (1 file): newspaper article about 100th birthday of Harriet Slider, 4/6/1956. 

Smallwood (1 file): descendants of Matthew Smallwood (b. 1584). 

Smart (2 files) – File 1: list of Schwarts school students, census records, obituary for Wilson Smart, 1968. 
File 2: obituary for George T. Smart, 1984; obituary for Mrs. Maria L. Smart, 1909. 

Smith (20 files) – File 1: correspondence with research notes, early newspaper items list, copy of old 
letter. File 2: family bible records of Mrs. M. F. Smith. File 3: family bible records, marriage certificate for 
Lowry W. Smith and Belle Stodghill, 1897. File 4: Thomas – 3-16-1974 article about woodworking and 
clock making. File 5: William – family unit sheets, census records, obituary for Benjamin F. Smith (1970), 



obituary for Howard Smith (1965), census records for household of Anderson Smith, obituary for Iva 
Watson (1971), obituary for Edgar H. Smith (1979), Prospect Cemetery Smith plot survey, Smith 
marriages in Jeff. Co. File 6: obituary for Abe Smith, 1884. File 7: marriage record for James Smith and 
Clance?  Colewaters, 1824. Marriage record for Isham Smith and Elizabeth Green, 1940. File 8: William 
D. – military record of death in 1862. File 9: family unit sheets for Archie Smith family. File 10: Dawson – 
Smith/Wright A Connubial Event at Belleview – marriage of Dawson Smith and Myrtle Wright, 
descendants of Dawson Smith. File 11: Bill – Cincinnati Enquirer July 11, 1971 Designing Hoosier New 
York Success. Indianapolis Star Magazine November 2, 1969 Bill Smith and Clifton Nicholson Jr. design 
high-fashion jewelry. File 12: George – cemetery and census records, August 19, 1861 Madison Courier 
Drummer boy drowns while bathing in the Ohio River, obituary for Hannah Smith March 14, 1881; Aug. 
18, 1861 newspaper mention of Mr. and Mrs. C.F. Smith. File 13: Oscaloosa – 1916 passport for Robert 
McClure; Capt. Oskaloosa Smith write up; New York Times Monday Feb. 5, 1899 article; Oskaloosa M. 
Smith photography album at the Indiana Historical Society; 1st Battalion 22nd Infantry; Twenty-Second 
Regiment of Infantry by Oskaloosa M. Smith; census records. File 14: Ruth B. – obituary for Ruth B. 
Smith, 1967. File 15: Vergil – information on James W. Smith (m. Opal Mae) and Virgil Smith (m. Elsie 
Conover); obituary for Virgil, 1976; death certificate for Virgil; census records; obituary for James Smith, 
1994. File 16: 1910 obituary for James H. Smith; pedigree chart for Barbara Ann Heckel (b. 1910); 
obituary for Catherine Smith, 1910; obituary for Dora Smith, 1886; death notice for Handy Tull, 1869. 
File 16: Vaton – census records, family unit sheets, death record for Hiram Smith, and Elvira Smith. File 
17: bio of David Smith (b. 1920). File 18: Samuel Elmer – family unit sheets. File 19: William F. – world 
war 2 casualty, census records, Ada Smith information. File 20: Mary Ann (Pratt) – family unit sheets, 
obituary for Ruth Pratt Bobbs, 1973, Baptism records, census records.  

Smitha (2 files) – File 1: correspondence, 2-24-1979 newspaper clipping about Smitha-Woodyard-Wolf 
family. File 2: Correspondence and research notes, will of John Smitha, History of The Westfork Baptist 
Church, Virginia tax information early 1800s. 

*Smock (4 files) – File 1: July 3, 1874 Pioneer reminiscences of John Smock in the Madison Courier; 
marriage record for David V. Smock and Margaret Ann Brown, 1835; Jeff. Co. marriages; descendants of 
James Mock; census records; excerpt from History of Switzerland County Indiana. File 2: Feb. 6, 1870 
Madison Courier article about Rev. D. V. Smock, Pioneer Preacher; The Smock Family bio; Hanover 
Presbyterian Church with information on Samuel Smock; Autobiography by Rev. David Van Cleave 
Smock; Smockville and Samuel Smock (Jefferson County Historical Society); Hanover College Bulletin 
Alumni Record 1829-1912. File 3: descendants of Hendrick Matthysaa Smock (b. 1639). File 4: Smock line 
starting with Hendrick M. Smock to Leah Smock in Jefferson County Indiana.  

Smythe (1 file): census records.  

Snell/Schnell (1 file): obituary for John Schnell, 1882; census records.  

Snodgrass (3 files) – File 1: Hugh Snodgrass family unit sheet, early newspaper items, census records, 
estate appraisal of Hugh Snodgrass, family bible records, descendants of Robert Snodgrass (b. 1735). File 
2: census records, family unit sheets, Jeff. CO. records. File 3: descendants of Hugh Snodgrass.  



Snyder (8 files) – File 1: Allena B. – 2-10-1934 obituary for widow of W. McK Snyder. File 2: William – 
1930 obituary for William Snyder, prominent artist; William McKendree signatures; Ad for Baker and 
Dipper Artistic Picture Framer; Dec. 2, 1882 article about oil painting shown at Calloway’s bookstore in 
Madison; March 11, 1882 Madison courier article about Snyder exhibition. File 2: William – sketches of 
oil and water colors of W. M. Snyder, 10-31-1884 short bio on artist, excerpt from Hanover, Madison, 
Vevay, Lawrenceburg Pioneer Painters of Indiana, Jan. 21, 1879 newspaper mention of finished 
paintings of Capt. Nathan Powell and his wife. File 3: William – brochure with information and select 
images from T.A. Langstroth, 1974; Jan. 4, 1999 AntiqueWeek Central Edition newspaper page; May 10, 
1877 Madison Courier Mention of Snyder’s newest paintings; Dec. 4, 1926 Mayor Eckert’s portrait 
mentioned in the newspaper; May 11, 1876 Snyder mentioned with his studio below the Gorgas photo 
studio; Louisville Courier-Journal Oct. 7, 1869 Snyder shot by another boy; Louisville Courier-Journal 
Sept. 23, 1875 Snyder mentioned; Jan. 28, 1885 Callaway exhibits Snyder painting; Madison Daily 
Courier June 21, 1872 page 4 Raspberry festival at Wesley Chapel and Art show; Feb. 10, 1877 Grecian 
inspired paintings; Jeffersonville Daily Evening News 8-9-1879 page 1 Gorgas and Snyder mentioned; 
Louisville Commercial Dec. 8, 1878 page 3 Snyder portraits mentioned; Louisville Courier-Journal 11-15-
1877 page 4 Madison Star mentioned with Snyder; Jeffersonville Evening News April 7, 1876 page 4 
Snyder photographs mentioned; Jeffersonville Evening News March 25, 1876 page 4 portrait of Col. 
Moore’s child finished; retrospective show pamphlet from the Jefferson County Historical Society, 1982. 
File 4: Snyder Family Tree starting with Kasper Schnieder (came to US in 1725); Madison Courier 
mention on May 10, 1877 Will M. Snyder; Exhibit of works at the opening of the art gallery Artist’s Alley, 
no date; bio sketch; Jefferson County Historical Society booklet of Madison Artists. File 5: July 11, 1877 
Will M. Snyder mentioned. File 6: A compiled history of Jacobs Chapel UMC; Sep 6, 1930 obituary for 
William M. Snyder. 

Soeder (1 file): Paul – registration affidavit of alien enemy 

Sommer (2 files) – File 1: reproduction photographs. File 2: family history starting with Gustav A. 
Sommer. 

Sommers (1 file): Elijah Summers bio; April 10, 1987 Sommers 40th anniversary.  

Spade (1 file): marriage record for Pleasant Spade and Mathilde Winer, 1854. 

Spalding (1 file): July 1, 1940 Wedding trip Lohring-Spaulding; family bible records; Spaulding family 
history beginning with William Spaulding (b. 1765). 

Spangler (2 file) – File 1: marriage record for Carlos Spangler and Feronica Kessler, 1878. File 2: George – 
family unit sheets, obituary for G. E. Spangler, 1899; obituary for George Spangler; census records; 
church records. 

Spann (1 file): family bio, reproduction photos.  

Spear (1 file): marriage record for Amos A Spear and Amanda Wilson, 1854. 

Speer (1 file): newspaper article about Sam Speer collection of postcards, no date. 



Spicer (3 files) – File 1: Myrtle – 8-18-1980 newspaper clipping ‘Reunion held at Harrell home’; 9-16-
1978 Mrs. Spicer is 100 today; June 19, 1946 John Spicer recalls Madison’s Golden Age; 8-26-1978 Five 
generations; 9-16-1976 Mrs. Myrtle Spicer is 98 today. File 2: Jerry – 10-8-1977 Jerry Spicer takes his 
sawmill on the road. File 3: correspondence, family unit sheets and Find A  grave pages. 

Spiers (1 file): Robert – bio and life info, from Little Rock, Arkansas. 

Spiry (1 file): newspaper clipping obituary for Alfred J. Spiry Sr., 2007. 

Spore (1 file): marriage record for Daniel Spore and Margaretha? Lunger, 1826.  

St. Clair (1 file): Henry H. – death certificate and notes.  

Stackhouse (2 files) – Files 1: Hershal and Effie Stackhouse information, census records, city directory 
entries; Hershal Stackhouse birth certificate. File 2: Gail Botts and Family – family unit sheet, death 
certificate, repro. Image of Hershal and Effie Stackhouse, and Noah Stackhouse, funeral record for 
Donald Gail, certificate of birth for Donald Gayle Stackhouse. 

Stanley (1 file): Early American Bio. 

Stanton (1 file): copied from the paper, funeral of Mrs. Charles A. Stanton; original old court document. 

Staples (1 file): research notes and correspondence.  

Stapp (5 files) – File 1: Stapp family chart on blueprint paper. File 2: Funeral of Mrs. W Stapp card; Letter 
to the Herald about Horace Stapp, formerly enslaved. File 3: obituary for Horace Stapp, 1892; Early life 
of Horace in the paper, Feb. 20, 1883. File 4: Stapp newspaper mentions, family lineage, 
correspondence, newspaper article about Milton Stapp, no date; Madison Evening Courier Jan 3, 1882 
General Milton Stapp article. File 5: marriage record for David A. Henry and Caroline Stapp, 1831; 
marriage record for William Edward Stapp and Isabelle Pool, 1945; information on the Stapp family 
reunion, 1890; early Stepp/Stapp Pioneers. File 6: excerpt from the history of Dearborn and Ohio 
Counties about the Stapp family starting with Joseph Stapp.  

Stark (1 file): correspondence and Jefferson county record list. 

Steele (9 files) – File 1: Feb. 6, 1911 remains of John S. Steele laid to rest; obituary for Humphrey Steele, 
1951; census records. File 2: correspondence and notes. File 3: Switzerland Co. marriage record Fletcher 
Steele, census records, Feb 1892 obituary for Pearl Steele; Oct. 27, 1888 Fletcher Steele’s daughter 
passes away, mentioned in the paper. File 4: information on Robert and Ester Jane Smith Steele; census 
records; Dec. 7, 1881 drowning death of Hattie Steele Jones; obituary for Capt. Albert Steele, 1897; Nov. 
21, 1894 obituary for Charles L. Steele; July 22, 1879 write up called Up in the West Virginia Hills; 
reminiscences in the newspaper of Charles Steele, Nov. 24, 1883. File 5: Diana, Matthew, Lemuel – 
Diana Steele’s parents are unknown, family unit sheet, correspondence, census records. File 6: marriage 
of Arabella Steele and John Taggart; Wells Steele shoots Robert Steele, Sept 3, 1897 article in the 
Madison Courier; Killing of Robert Steele, Sept. 7, 1897; Circuit Court Wells Steele on Trial, Nov. 2, 1897; 



Not Guilty, Nov. 8, 1897; Close of Trial, Nov. 6, 1897. File 7: Theodore C. – Original booklet in memoriam 
of Theodore Clement Steele, from the Indiana University News Letter, Dec, 1926. File 8: Outdoor 
Indiana, June 1973 T. C. Steele Log Cabin. File 9: Steele history written by Clyde Ruskin Steele, 1981.  

Step (1 file): Simeon – California voter registration, deed of land in Jeff. Co., IN.  

Stephan (1 file): Donald Keith family – family unit sheet, Find a Grace pages.   

Stephans (1 file): George – correspondence and notes. 

Stephen/Kimmel (1 file): correspondence, death certificate for Mary Magdalene Faulhaber (1934), 
death certificate for Andrew Steffen (1920), descendants of Andrew Steffen, descendants of John Adam 
Kimmel.  

Stephenson (1 file): D. C. – From the Indianapolis Star, 1966 death revealed, Sept. 18, 1978. 

Stevenson (1 file): bio sketch for Elder Robert Stevenson from the Minutes of the Long Run Association 
for 1894. 

Steinberger (1 file): profile on Bertha Zapp Steinberger on her 100th birthday, no date; family bible 
records; correspondence, notes, reproduction photos.  

Stevens (2 files) – File 1: Stephan C. – fifth justice of the supreme court of Indian; family unit sheet; 
census records; 1814 Roll of Capt William Phillips’ Company, Madison Tax records. File 2: Address 
delivered to the Presbyterian Church on Anti-Slavery in the Madison Daily Banner Oct. 30, 1851. 

Stevenson (3 files) – File 1: pedigree chart; family unit sheets. File 2: Benjamin C. – invitation to funeral, 
1831. File 3: Fanny – newspaper spread about the wife of Robert Louis Stevenson – Tiger and Tiger lily: 
the hoosier wife of R. L. S. File 3: Robert George Stevenson and Jennet Wallace of Scotland and Jefferson 
Co. IN and descendants.  

Stewart (8 files) – File 1: Nancy Jo – death certificate, article Hanover Girl, 6, Is Killed By Car; death 
certificate for Lindsay W. Stewart; census records;. File 2: marriage record for James Stewart and Sarah 
Whitsitt, 1834; Stewart Reunion clipping 1984. File 3: Hugh Patterson – census records. File 4: 
correspondence and notes. File 5: family bible records, ancestor pedigree chart, cemetery records; short 
bio of Stewart family. File 6: marriage record for John M. Stewart and Mary Conner, 1834. File 7: 
descendants of Isaiah H. Stewart (b. 1791). File 8: Hayes family connection, McLaughlin family 
connection, correspondence, John Walter Stewart and descendants, descendants of William H. Stewart.  

Stites (5 files) – File 1: marriage record for Lawrence H. Stites and Sarah Ann Phillips, 1834. File 2: Nov. 
13, 1987 75th anniversary for Charles and Jessie Stites; cemetery records, descendants of Jonathan Stites 
Sr.; descendants of John Stites, MD (b. 1595); 70th anniversary for Charles and Jessie Stites Nov. 19, 
1982; 73rd anniversary celebrated Nov 15, 1985. File 3: marriage record for Nathaniel Stites and Emaline 
Cordrey, 1834; obituary for Jonathan Andrew Stites, 1935; probate record. File 4: correspondnace. File 
5: Elizabeth and Alfred – marriage information, 1840 census for Alfred, Find a Grave pages.  



Stigler (1 file): lineage of Virginia Tattershall (nee Monroe) beginning with James Stigler (d. 1764/5), will 
of James Stigler. 

Stodgill (1 file): family bible records, census records, obituary for Robert W. Stodghill, 1914; Obit for 
William L. Smith, 1959.  

Stockdale (1 file): correspondence and notesStokes (2 files) – File 1: obituary for William Ston=kes, 1908. 
File 2: Sylvanus – will of Sylvanus Stokes from Pittsylvania County, VA; Jefferson County marriages; 
cemetery records.  

Stonehouse (1 file): correspondence and notes, William Stonehouse family, alphabetical index. 

Storck (1 file): family unit sheets and notes for the family of Paul Storck and Theresa Denie.  

Storey (1 file):c emetery records, marriage Jeff. Co records, obituary for Hazel Story (1928), obit for 
Robert Storie (1929), obit for William Storie (1922), obit for William Storie (1923), obit for Arthur Storie 
(1963). 

Storm (1 file): will of Coonrod Storms, 1849; obituary for Millie Firth Storm (d. 4-12-1918); article for the 
wedding of Carma Lee and Henry Storm, no date. 

Stott (1 file): William T. – biography of Elder William T. Stott, Extracts from his book Indiana Baptist 
History 1798-1906 pages 165-166.  

Stottlebower (1 file): Aleane – obit for Mike Stottlebower, 1934; Indianapolis Star Magazine 11-15-1970 
Splendor Afloat spread on Aleane, Painter; death certificate for Charlie Stottlebower and Lizzie 
Stottlebower, no name, and Emma.  

Stout (1 file): excerpt from Stout and Allied Families, family group sheets.  

Straub (2 files) – File 1: obit for George Straub, 1908; obit for Mary Straub, 1976; obit for George Straub, 
1881; funeral record for George Frank Straub. File 2: obit for Nora Straub, 1970; obit for William F. 
Straub, 1964; obit for Nettie Straub, 1965; obit for Harry J. Straub, 1961; obit for Stella Straub, 1944; obit 
for Joseph Downey, 1951; Vail Funeral records.  

Stow (1 file): Horace – Diary of Horace Stow. 

Streble (1 file): Norma – state license plate design by Norma Streble, article 3-28-1986 and 12-20-1986. 

Strohm (1 file): Carl E. – obituary 9-22-1971; Editorial article about Carl, educator, 9-23-1971. 

Strong (1 file): lineage starting with John Strong (b. 1605) 

Strother (2 files) – File 1: marriage record for George D. Strother and Nancy Jane Lockhart, 1837. File 2: 
census records, descendants of John French Strother, obituary for J. P. Strother, 1931; excerpt from 
History of Kentucky and Kentuckians (1912) bio on John C. Strother. Biography of Riley Gra. 



Stroud (1 file): June 10, 1926 Old Papers Found in Attic – one cent reward for “bound girl” Mary Ann 
Strowd.  

Stuart (1 file): David G. – obituary, Dec. 26, 1918. 

Stubbs (1 file): family bible records.  

Stucker (5 files): correspondence about DAR, 40th anniversary for William and Lucille Berry Stucker May 
7, 1987. File 2: family unit sheets for Eli Stucker and Esther Ann Plake. File 3: marriage record for Samuel 
Stucker and Elmina Carley, 1854. File 4: family unit sheet for Jasper Stucker and Mathildia Smith. File 5: 
Henry and Samuel – investigating if Samuel is the son of Henry and Mary Elizabeth Redenbaugh Stucker, 
census records, SAR application.  

Stutsman (1 file): descendant chart, biography of Grance Irene Stutsman Rode, list of first cousins. 

Sullins (1 file): correspondence, genealogy biographies, early taxes of Jefferson County.  

Sullivan (12 files) – File 1: July 23, 1884 article The City ‘Neath the Hills; Dec. 6, 1882 Daily Courier 
Letters from The People – Jerry Sullivan; Madison Daily Courier Nov. 6, 1880 article The Far West; Letter 
in the paper from Dr. Jer. Sullivan May 12, 1881 (no date when it was in the paper); August 26, 1890 
Madison Courier – obituary for Col. Thomas H. Harris. File 2: Judge Jeremiah Sullivan letter in the paper 
Madison Daily Evening Courier Dec. 6, 1870; 12/29/1863 letter in the paper from J. Sullivan; biography 
of Jeremiah Sullivan; book excerpt – Jeremiah C. Sullivan, Hoosier Jurist by Joseph Herman Schauinger; 
information on Mildred Hammond, niece of George Washington; reproduction image of George 
Hammond Sullivan and his mother, Mary Mildred Sullivan; Feb. 12, 1881 Evening Courier J. Sullivan 
observations in the paper; obit for Charlotte Sullivan, 1907; May 18, 1881 correspondence in the paper. 
File 3: correspondence, Evangelists, Educators, Ethnographers and the Establishment of the Hopi 
Reservation by Stephan C. McCluskey; excerpt that says Jeremiah Sullivan coined the name Indianapolis. 
File 4: excerpt from Biographical Sketches and Review of The Bench and Bar of Indiana; Indiana 
Magazine of History June 1924 Early Vevay; no date newspaper clipping Jeremiah Sullivan appointed by 
the Legislature of the state January 14, 1829. File 5: marriage record for Nathaniel Sullivan and Mary 
Jane Cox, 1838. File 6: History of South Carolina excerpt by Snowden and Cutler. File 7: Daily Courier 
Dec. 5, 1887 obituary for Algernon S. Sullivan; obituary for Byron Hollett, 1999. File 8: children of 
Jeremiah Sullivan. File 9: John H. Sullivan obituary Nov. 3, 1886; original booklet on Algernon Sydney 
Sullivan, 1893; original booklet Expressions of Appreciation of Mrs. Algernon Sydney Sullivan (Mary 
Mildred Sullivan) in her 85th year by “The Virginians” of New York 1921. File 10: Mrs. Hollett (Katherine) 
obituary March 22, 1971; Reginald Sullivan Visits Historic Home July 24, 1971; August 24, 1967 Local 
Masons to Observe Tribute Day. File 11: General Jeremiah C. Sullivan Junior Division Historical Paper 
Adam G. Terlinden, 1995. File 12: descendants of Willis Sullivan and Fanny Fewell; marriage record for 
James Sullivan and Luezy Sullivan, 1823; excerpt from Indiana Magazine of History June 2001 
Descendants of Thomas, son of Jeremiah Sullivan.  

Sulzer (4 files) – File 1: Elmer – obituary, 2/17/1976; Sulzer Gives HMI Rail Collection April 17, 1965. File 
2: Marcus R. – Largest Crude Drug Firm in World is Located in Madison, Indiana; 4/6/1957 image of 



Marcus Sulzer; May 11, 1927 Historic Old Trees in John Paul Park; Feb. 11, 1884 Marcus M. Sulzer article; 
newspaper clipping collection, bio of Marcus R. Sulzer. File 3: obituary for Marcus Sulzer, 1939; March 
1983 article about Elmer G. Sulzer named to UK journalism hall of fame; Louisville Times March 15, 1928 
Marcus R. Sulzer Urges Good Streets; Madison Courier Elmer Sulzer Gets New Post at Indiana U 7-9-
1952; 12-20-1949 Klein Pays Tribute to Former Madison Mayor. File 4: newspaper clippings, Gillespie 
Case newspaper clippings. 

Sutherland (1 file): Floyd – marriage license for James Newman and Judith Nighbert; birth certificates, 
obituary for S. L. Nighbert, 1948; obituary for Lulu Nighbert, 1943; John Sutherland services, Feb. 14, 
1935; Mrs. John Sutherland obituary, 1930; census records, death certificates. 

Suter (1 file): genealogy of Peter Suter. Obit for Peter Suter, 1912. 

Sutter (1 file): C. E. – 75-Year-Old Farmer Uses Mules July 22, 1972 Madison Courier. 

Sutton (2 files) – File 1: census records, Jeff. Co. marriages; Pension Roll of 1835. File 2: civil war veteran, 
Battle of Gaines’ Mill, Virginia (June 26th, 1862), family unit sheets, census records,  

Surber (2 files) – File 1: John – civil war military records. File 2: descendants of Alexander Henry Surber. 

Swan (1 file): Robert H. – obituary, 8-10-1932.  

Swearingen (1 file): family bible records, descendants,  

Sweeney (3 file) – File 1: Charles W. – interview with Major General Charles W. Sweeney, 1995. File 2: 
death of Charles Sweeney in 2004, July.  File 3: Elsie I. – Indianapolis Star Magazine April 16, 1970 profile 
of Elsie Sweeney.  

Swormstedt (1 file): obituary for Lorenzo D. Swormstedt, 1892. 

 

T 

Taff (2 files) – File 1: Andy – Hall of Fame honors, Nov. 24, 1992; obituary Harry G. Taffm 1955; 
Genealogy history of James Taaffe Senior and his descendants by Cecil Wayne Taff. File 2: notes in a 
letter.  

Tague (3 files) – File 1: marriage records in Jeff. Co., census records. File 2: correspondence; March 20, 
1913 Charles Tague obituary; Madison Courier Jan. 15, 1884 Little Rock, Ark. Tague drug store 
mentioned; Sept. 4, 1879 John R. Tague writing from Alaska; funeral record, obituary for John R. Tague, 
1916, census records, obituary for C. A. Tague (1928), 1899 Newt Tague obituary; Funeral of Anna 
Tague, 1923. File 3: Mary Tague obituary 1909, Madison Daily Democrat Sept. 26, 1893 Death of 
Elizabeth Zuck; marriage records, census records. 

Tait (2 files) – File 1: descendants of James Tait and Mary Fulton. File 2: copy.  



Talbot (1 file): early American Bio. 

Talbott (1 file): land purchase information. Newspaper article on a duel Aug. 29, 1879. 

Tarpy (1 file): 1891 obituary for Mary Tarpy; John Tarpy obituary (1881); Thomas Tarpy (1886); Bridget 
Golden (1894); funeral of Ellen O’Neal (1897). 

*Taylor (18 files) – File 1: correspondence and research notes. File 2: Cliff – Handel’s Messiah 
performances over after 26 years 12-2-1999. File 3: Civil War 6th Indiana Infantry list; census records. File 
4: biography of Gamaliel Taylor (b. 1785). File 5: Joseph C. – diary entries; family bible records. File 6: 
correspondence and research notes: Bushrod Taylor retires from railroad (May 12, 1924). File 7: 
marriage record for William Taylor and Nancy M. Hillis, 1838. File 8: Maude – Bio of teaching career; 
Canaan principle retires June 2, 1973. File 9: Bushrod – 1916 article on the Naval career of Bushrod 
Taylor in Indianapolis News. File 10: copy of file 9. File 11: Evening Courier April 23, 1883 obituary for 
Bushrod Taylor; family of Bushrod Taylor. File 12: marriage record for Percy Taylor and Emily Elles, 1838. 
File 13: Ann Cranston and Thomas Taylor genealogy, marriage record for Robert Taylor and ?, 1849; 
court records; research notes. File 14: John T. – Jan. 14, 1980 Paintings left by John Talton Taylor; 
obituary for John Taylor, 1943. File 15: Graham – newspaper article Graham Taylor Named by APBA for 
Top Award Jan. 4, 1968. File 16: Gamaliel – article about funeral 6-9-1914; obituary June 8, 1914. File 17: 
census records, Hanover Cemetery records. File 18: Feb. 9, 1853 William M. Taylor article. 

Taulman (1 file): marriage record for Evan L. Taulman and Laura Comstock, 1835.  

Temple (April 12, 1867 funeral of Capt. Temple. Alexander F. Temple, steamboat captain. 

Temperly (1 file): John – information about architect for temple in Madison.  

Terrel/Tyrrel (1 file): correspondence and research notes.  

*Tevis (4 files) – File 1: John W. – some info on descendants of Robert, the boatman. File 2: excerpt from 
Heads of Families at the First Census of the United States taken in the Year 1790 Maryland, 1907; 
research notes, lineage of Tevis family starting with Robert Tevis; pedigree chart. File 3: John W. – 2-21-
1941 John W. Tevis birthday celebration article; obit of Mrs. C. A. Tevis, 1914; obituary for John W. Tevis, 
1943; Tevis scrapbook records; History of the Mount Pleasant Baptist Church. File 4: Benjamin – 
biography, obituary for Graham G. Tevis (1981); Froman family connections; DAR application.  

Tewell (1 file): Family of Va-KY-Ohio and Jefferson CO., IN.  

Thacker (1 file): Illinois marriages Isaac Reed and Josephine Allen, 1860; census records; funeral of John 
W. Thacker (1922); obit for Mrs. John Thacker (1920).  

Thenis (1 file): pedigree chart, census records, death certificates.  

Thevenow (9 files) – File 1: Tommy -  10-25-1985 Big Celebration was planned to honor Tommy 
Thevenow, baseball. File 2: 10-24-1985 Babe helped with home run part 4/6 in article series;  Jan. 16, 
1928 obituary for Thomas Thevenow Sr. File 3: The Mirror Madison Indiana Oct. 15, 1964 Madison’s 



Tommy Thevenow won series for Cards. File 4: 10-23-1985 Yanks were favored to whip Cardinals 3/6 in 
series. File 5: 11-16-1985 Thevenow Fiels; Thevenow played key role for Cardinals 10-21-1985 1/6 in 
series. File 6: 10-22-1985 From Madison to ‘big city’ 2/6 in series. File 7:1-31-1927 Thevenow vital cog in 
Card’s Machine; undated article about baseball player; April 1, 1922 Thevenow Gets Chance For Tryout; 
11-26-1982 obit for Helen Thevenow; Jan. 22, 2001 article a proud day for the thevenows. File 8: 7-29-
1957 obituary for Tommy Thevenow. File 9: 10-26-1985 Thevenow arrived in Madison as ‘Silent 
Tommy’. 

Thinnes (1 file): reproduction photos, Mathias J. Thinnes obituary 1979, Cardula Mary Thinnes obituary 
1965, Mary Louise Thinnes obituary 1934, Obituary for Jacob Thinnes 1932, Caroline Roeder obituary 
1966.  

*Thom (2 files) – File 1: Joseph – clipping Marker on Soldier’s Grave, no date. Rev. war soldier. File 2: 
Elizabeth Craig Thom and descendants; pedigree chart for Lola Hale Case; Thom Family Bible records.  

Thomas (9 files) – File 1: Sarah – church record from microfilm. File 2: marriage record for James Thomas 
and Polley Westbrook, 1836. File 3: marriage record for Allen Thomas and Thomassin Duer, 1836. File 4: 
Leana and Leona Barnes, twins are 85 newspaper article Sept. 27, 1977. File 5: Sarah (Woollen) – will 
and vails funeral records. File 6: The Thomas Line beginning with John Thomas (b. 1777). File 7: 
descendants of Samuel Thomas (b. 1805). File 8: correspondence and notes. File 9: marriage record for 
Lewis Thomas and ?, no date; will of Benjamin Thomas; obituary for Esther A. Graham, 1922. 

Thomason (1 file): Gretchen – certificate of death, census records. 

Thomson (2 files) – File 1: Reginald Thomson: the man who flattened seattle. Son of Rev. Samuel 
Harrison Thomson. File 2: Rev. Samuel Harrison – excerpt from The Indianian, bio on Rev. Samuel 
Harrison Thomson, PH. D., LL. D., of Hanover College by Prof. I. B. Garritt, PH. D.; descendants of James 
Thomson  

Thompson (2 files) – File 1: obituary for John Thompson, 1956; obituary for Nellie Stewart, 1977; census 
records; will abstract list. File 2: obit for Shirley Nighbert, 1948; Nighbert – Sutherland – Thompson 
family connections.  

Thorn (2 files) – File 1: John Thorn bio. File 2: marriage record for John Thorn and E?ly Wilson, 1854; 
John Thorn records.  

Thorne (1 file): correspondence, descendants of John Thorne, Jefferson County marriages, census 
records, obituary for Emily Phillips (1928), 1910 obituary for Perry Phillips, obituary for Mrs. Scott 
Thorne (1938), obituary for Scott Thorne (1959), obituary for Roy Thorne (1967), Early American bio.  

Thornton (1 file): The Thornton Family Moves to Cass County by Mary Higgins Proffitt. 

Thurmen (1 file): marriage record for Joseph Thurmen and Mary Seymour, 1826. 



Tibbetts (3 files) – File 1: will of Dr. Samuel Tibbetts, bio of Dr. Samuel and Susanna Coombs Tibbetts. 
File 2: correspondence. File 3: census records and find a grave pages.  

Tilford (2 files) – File 1: correspondence. File 2: William – probate will info, census records, Newberry 
Library index, family unit sheet, Rev War records.  

Tilley (1 file): census records.  

*Tilton (3 files) – File 1: Feb. 25, 1895 Daily Democrat spotlight on Rebecca Tilton Berryhill, May 18, 
1880 A True Story of the Revolution (Col. Tilton mentioned), Mexican War soldiers, probate records. File 
2: Mark – biography. File 3: James – biography.  

Tobias (1 file): marriage record for Simeon Tobias and Mary Jane Trumbo, 1854.  

*Todd (6 files) – File 1: correspondence, pedigree charts, family unit sheets, Kemper family connections, 
census records. File 2: Muster Roll of Shotgun Guars, 1862 – Joseph Todd. File 3: family unit sheets, 
Abraham Todd Pioneer Madison Businessman 1795-1868, Will record of Elizabeth Ann B Todd Inskeep. 
File 4: Todd family info from Maryland, more on Abraham Todd. File 5: Ad for Todd and Kyle Sash, 
Blinds, Door and Lath Factory, and dealers in Lumber and Shingles (John W. Todd), scans from scrapbook 
with obituaries for Mary J. Faithfull, obit for Isaac Newton Todd (1891), excerpt from History of Jefferson 
County “The Baltimorians,” 1901 article clipping Early Day “Fifth Avenue,” Early American bio About Our 
Ancestors by Francis M. Smith (Elenor Lexington). File 6: Excerpt from Conquest of the Country 
Northwest of the River Ohio 1778-1783 and Life of Gen. George Rogers Clark. 

Tomlinson (1 file): Geo. W. – information on George Washington Tomlinson, son of Elijah.  

Toole (1 file): marriage record for Thomas E. Toole and Flora C. Hinds, 1889.  

Toombs (1 file): marriage RECORD FOR John D. Toombs and Martha Ann Bourman, 1835.  

Totten 91 file): Evans C. – obituary for Dr. Evan Churchill Totten, 1952; The Early Tottens of America; 
obituary for Mr. and Mrs. John C. Totten (1914 and 1897); Excerpt from Kentucky, A History pf the state 
by W. H. Perrin and G. C. Kniffin, 1887-page 864 John Totten MD; Genealogy and History of the Totten 
Family in the United States, 1992; excerpt from Biographical Sketches of Loyalists of the American 
Revolution, 1984; pedigree chart.  

Torline (1 file): Feb. 11, 1999 newspaper clipping about Junior High, downton renovations; 2-17-1999 
School must negotiate Brown Gym use; 4-28-1998 Martha Torline works and retires from Jefferson 
Superior Court offices of Judge Fred Hoying.  

Townsend (2 files) – File 1: Madison Daily Evening Courier 9-24-1862 Funeral of Isaac C. Townsend; 
MDEC 8-26-1963 obit for Henry M. Townsend; casualty list from June 10, 1864 6th regiment; 1-16-1864 
funeral of John R. Townsend; MDEC 1-15-1864 Mr. P. Townsend arrives on train; MDEC 12-29-1963 Mr. 
Purnel Townsend goes to Chattanooga to get son’s remains; census records. File 2: Townsend family unit 
sheets.  



Trout (1 file):John – drawings. 

Troutman (1 file): list of Troutman marriages.  

Trenkley (1 file): marriage record for Lewis Trenkley and Caroline Schmidlapp, 1845. 

Trester (1 file): family bible records.  

Trinkle (3 files) – File 1: family unit sheets, George Trinkle information; obituaries, census records; court 
records. File 2: Mattie – 99th birthday celebration 4-1-1974; obituary 1-15-1979; in the paper on 6-9-
1982 and 6-7-1983; 100th birthday 3-28-1975. File 3: Jefferson county marriage records, obituary for 
Charles A. Trinkle. 

Troxwell (1 file): Judge – March 12, 1880 obituary. 

Truitt (1 file): letter. 

*Trow (1 file): William – Madison Daily Herald Articles: June 28, 1890; August 30, 1890; September 4, 
1890; September 11, 1890; December 31, 1890; February 17, 1891; March 26, 1891. Obituary of William 
Trow July 9, 1889; death of William Trow JR Aug. 9, 1881. Obit of John Trow 1887. 1883 clipping 
marriage trow and Ross.  

Trowbridge (1 file): family unit sheets. 

Tucker (1 file): marriage record for Ephraim Tucker and Nancy Smith, 1854.  

Tudor (1 file): Early American bio, Descendants of John Tudor. 

Tull (7 files) – File 1: original records in sleeve; family history beginning in Tudor England; family unit 
sheets, pedigree charts; census records. File 2: original records; Kenneth Tull information; Clarence Tull 
information; Paul and Cecil Tull information. File 3: Handy Sr. – copies of Maryland Deeds. File 4: Tull 
family history by Delia Tull Volz. File 5: original records, research notes, family in KY info; wwill rec ords. 
File 6: Paul E. – records and obituary. File 7: census records.  

Turner (5 files) – File 1: Turner Story by Betty Turner (b.1866); Cemetery Records; family unit sheets; 
obit of James Turner Madison Daily Herald 1923; Obit for Eugene George; census records. File 2: Anna 
Goss – Feb. 27, 1977 Zodiac didn’t deny doctor her calling; 6-4-1981 in paper. File 3: Madison Land 
records; census records, military records, family descendants chart. File 4: Charles Turner and Galaspie 
Warram family history, 1981; obit for Selma Distel, 1994; Shelby Turner obit, 1959; William T. Turner 
obit, 1959; George Distell obit, 1988; Josephine Turner obit, 1991. File 5: marriage record for James 
Turner and Nancy Birch, 1835.  

Turpin (1 file): census record for Henrietta Turpin.  

Twell (1 file): newspaper clipping July 17, 1917.  



Tuttle (3 files) – File 1: information on the Charles Tuttle family; marriage for charles and Sophia Hentz; 
obituary for Sophia Tuttle, 1940; Obituary for Charles Tuttle, 1928; obituary for Patricia Tuttle, 1991; 
obituary for Robert Tuttle, 1978. File 2: lineage of Edward Pratt Tuttle, Early American bio. File 3: 
Catherine – obituary (1890). 

Twining (1 file): family bio of Rev. William Twining.  

Tyre(e) (2 files) – File 1: James Andrew Tyree and Ida V. Williams family information; Cosby family 
connection, death record for Laura Cole; census records; Harper family connection. File 2: marriage 
record for James Tyre and Mallie O’Loughlin, 1865.  

 
U 

Understeller (1 file): Nicholas Understellar biography.  

Underwood (5 files) – File 1: Five generations in the paper May 3, 1984; marriage record for George 
Underwood (father is John) and Sabina Reed, 1820. File 2: short bio on John Underwood, marriage 
record for Nathan Underwood and Darcas Johnson, 1826; family of John and Priscilla Underwood. File 3: 
Elizabeth Underwood biography and the founders of Madison. File 4: copy of file 3. File 5: deed record 
list.  

Urbanik (1 file): Jan. 16, 1982 newspaper article on family moving from Poland in 1966.  

 

 

V 

Vail (7 files) – File 1: April 28, 1893 Vail will in the paper; no date newspaper notices death of Cornelius 
Vail; obituary on Apr. 25, 1893; History of Madison by Dana M. Vail, 1970; Citizen of the Week 6-11-1964 
Dana Vail; obituary for Harry Leonard Vail, 1945; no date Vail Store write up; Vail sells to Gans, 11-7-
1945. File 2: Daily Courier Nov. 30, 1866 J. J. Vail mentioned came to Madison in “March, 1817, dead;” 
They Say and DO in the Country July 26, 1938. File 3: obituary for Frank P. Vail, original business card Vail 
Furniture; obituary George C. Vail, 1920; history of 620 W 2nd St home; advertisement for Vail Memorial 
Funeral Home from the paper on 8-19-1959; obit for Rosetta Vail, 1886; Frank Vail poem in the paper 
January 1912, First Tennis Club in Madison, no date. File 4: bio on Harry Vail. File 5: tribute to Hester 
Anna Mitchell; obituary for Dana Vail, 1973; image of Dana Vail home 516 West St. File 6: spread about 
Joe D. Vail, transport pilot. File 7: March 19, 1972 newspaper article. 

Vallilee (1 file): 1911 obituary for Mark Vallilee. 

Van Buren (1 file): obituary 1906 for J. F. Van Buren.  



Vanderbilt (1 file): Dennis – death notice for D. Vanderbilt (1846 May 6) in the Republican Banner; 
Madison Daily Courier May 19, 1879 An Old Citizen’s Log Book; Plough Manufactory ad in the 
Republican Banner April 1, 1846; Republican Banner April 15, 1846 Dissolution of partnership; probate 
records. 

*Vandivier (1 file): family bible records; Pennsy Cuts Madison’s Lone Rail Link, no date article; family bio, 
article on Courthouse lighting.  

Van Norman (1 file): correspondence.  

*Vanosdol (2 files) – File 1: bio for Jacob Vanosdol, Article Feb 24, 1888 Soldiers’ Reunion GAR 
Encapment Angus D. Vanosdol mentioned; obituary for Mamie Vanosdol, 1910; March 25, 1904 Col. 
Vanosdol; Feb. 17, 1888 highlight on Argus D. Vanosdol; July 18, 1890 Capt. Vanosdol has obsidian from 
Yellowstone Park; The Low Dutch Company/Low Dutch Colony in Kentucky. File 2: correspondence and 
notes.  

Van Pelt (1 file): Edward C. Van Pelt shoots and kills attorney Charles Tindall Aug. 27, 1911.  

Vanwinkle (1 file): marriage record for David Vanwinkle and daughter of John Taylor, no date. 

*Vawter (14 files) – File 1: marriage record for David Vawter and Lucinda Glover, 1823. File 2: lineage of 
Orrin Marshall, excerpt from Indiana Baptist History, reminiscences of Col. John Vawter, 150 anniversary 
of Madison 8-19-1959 Vawter and Irwin families. File 3: April 3, 1899 Madison Courier The Vawters 
article – family history by Milton S. Vawter. File 4: Vauter’s Episcopal Church in Essex Co., VA, copies of 
original documents – letter from John M. Vawter, Calloway deed, other deeds. File 5: Account of John 
Vawter. File 6: Jennie Vawter Papers, 1825 – 1918. File 7: They Say and Do in the County article March 
25, 1939. File 8: original marriage record for David and Lucinda Vawter, 1820, Copy of File 7, Bio of 
Milton S. Vawter. File 9: Jesse – biography of Elder Jesse Vawter, Philemon Vawter, Elder William 
Vawter, and image of home on Michigan Hill. File 10: Jesse – bio on Deacon Jesse R. Vawter. File 11: 
Jesse – Papers of Nora Schwab on Jesse Vawter. File 12: Philemon – will record for Philemon Vawter. File 
13: Richard – obituary for Richard Beverly Vawter, son of Beverly and Elizabeth Crawford Vawter, 1907. 
File 14: articles from Lenora Schwab, Jefferson County teacher and historian.  

Vayhinger (1 file): from Taylor University, Monroe Culla Johnson Vayhinger Collection, 1883 – 1939. 

Venable (1 file): marriage record for Henry Venable and Martha Alice Anna Martin, 1834. 

*Vernon (6 files) – They Say and Do in the Country 11-11-1938; Image from the Madison Courier of Mr. 
and Mrs. Dale Vernon 4-24-1978. File 2: DAR application, descendant of Ralph Cotton. File 3: 
Vernon/Tinsley – affiliate family biographies, family history. File 4: Richard – reproduction image of a 
painting of Richard Vernon; Sketch of the life of Pleasant R. Vernon; manufacturer of Dulcimer article 7-
24-1935. File 5: reproduction image of photograph of Richard Vernon, 1871; article copies about the 
dulcimer. File 6: Graham – obituary, 1970.  

Verry (1 file): John W. – obituary, 1886; Schofield house purchased by Mrs. Schofield from The Verrys.  



Vestal (1 file): - family unit sheets, excerpt from Seventeenth Century Colonial Ancestors of Members of 
the National Society Colonial Dames XVII Century 1915 – 1975 compiled by Mary Louis Marshall Hutton, 
1976; The Gregory House Charles Town Jefferson County, West Virginia; excerpt from Our Family 
Heritage by Minnie Speer Boone, 1956; descendants of William Vestal I; excerpt from Encyclopedia of 
American Quaker Genealogy by William Wade Hinshaw Volume, 1969.  

Vogel (1 file): affiliate families: Buhlig, Kaiser – descendants list. 

Voll (1 file): John – Registration affidavit of alien enemy.  

Volz (1 file): original birth certificate for Kenneth Frederick Jackson, b. march 2, 1925; original report 
card for Mauricine Hermann at Gregg School in Indianapolis; Courier Journal Louisville Feb. 12, 1967 
Madison Rallies Landmark Savers highlights Mr. Horace Volzon board of Historic Madison Inc; birth 
certificate for Kenneth Nicholas Volz, 1942; letters.  

*Voris (4 files) – File 1: church records, notes from Indiana state Library, will of Albert Voris from Shelby 
Co. KY; Cornelius Voris information, family unit sheet for Gabriel Voris and Mary Todd. File 2: 
correspondence, Civil War 6th Reg. James Henderson Voris, reproduction of photograph. File 3: Brian – 
young ventriloquist June 28, 1977. File 4: descendants of William Scott, d. 1856 of Scotland. 

Voss (1 file): Dr. Janice – articles on astronaut on Endeavor. 

W 

Wade (2 files) – File 1: paternal line of Eugene Maury Wade. File 2: obituary for Martine Wade Nov. 18, 
1891; Patrick Wade May 12, 1923; Mary Wade April 16, 1934. Wade family beginning with Martin Wade 
and Ann Burns family. Obituary for John Wade, 1937. Descendants of John Wade. Jeff. Co. marriages.  

*Wagner (2 files) – File 1: Madison Weekly Courier Jan. 24, 1894 obituary and bio of mayor, Isaac 
Wagner; obituary for descendant of pioneer Madison home builder, Irby S. Wagner, 1933. Family Bible 
records from the bible of George Wagner. File 2: Isaac – obituary.  

Wainscott (1 file): information on Rue W Wainscott.  

Walden (1 files): marriage record for Charles Walden (1850 census listed as a Druggist) and Malinda 
Irwin, 1838.  

Waldren (1 file): correspondence and notes.  

*Wallace (5 files) – File 1: Joseph – family unit info. File 2: Lew – 4-2-1972 author of ben-hur, surprised 
over film success; Lew Wallace The Man and other article with James Whitcomb Riley; Original book, A 
Hoosier in the Mexican War, 1953; Traces Indiana publication Winter 1993. File 3: William John – 1972 
Ex-Sheriff, Mayor Wallace Admired. File 4: marriage record for John Wallace and Retta A. lawler, 1853. 
File 5: Wallace family life dates bible records. 



Wallis (3 files) – File 1: Don R. – article on the life and death of Madison Courier publisher, d. 1989. File 
2: marriage record for Samuel Wallis and Elizabeth Hay, 1824. File 3: Mary Good – 100th birthday. 2011.  

Walker (8 files) – File 1: Stephan and Harriett – family unit sheet, census records, obituary for Harriett 
Walker, 1922; article reminiscences in the paper of a mob Dec. 7, 1881.  File 2: marriage record for John 
Walker and Margaret Thompson, 1847. File 3: genealogical record for Isabelle Pennington Walker. File 4: 
Leonard – Hanover man builds steam tractor 5-29-1970. File 5: Professor’s family tree Indianapolis Star 
3-13-1977 (Ted Walker, Purdue). File 6: obituary for Judge Charles E. Walker, 1895. File 7: Lightkeeper 
Hangs up Lantern after 71 years on Ohio River Job 1943. File 8: marriage record for Lewellen F. Walker 
and Martha Ann Lotte, 1824.  

Walsh (1 file): Charles F. – Father Walsh writes of Ocean Voyage to Europe, May 17, 1938; Father Walsh 
Marks Jubilee of Ordination, 5-28-1969; Jubilarian is an avid traveler May 23, 1969.  

Walter (1 file): correspondence and notes.  

Walters (1 file): will abstract, census records, obituary for Henry G. Walter, 1920. 

Ward (4 files) – File 1: census records, marriage list, tract information. File 2: family unit sheet for 
Charles W Ward and Cynthia Ann Campbell. File 3: family unit of James Ward and Priscilla Tucker, and 
Land grant information for James. File 4: correspondence and notes.  

*Warden (1 file): information on Nathaniel and Sarah Ann Warden and family.  

Warfield (12 files) – File 1: correspondence and notes, Kentucky record list, Madison Weekly Courier 
Jan. 28, 1885 Death of Mrs. Lucy Gordon; Jefferson County early Newspaper items list; census records. 
File 2: marriage record for William Warfield and Maria Taylor, 1837. 

Warner (1 file): early American bio, funeral card for William Curtis Warner, family bible records.  

Warram (1 file): Nov. 28, 1902 Jeffersonville National Democrat page 2, Death notice for Miss Cora E. 
Warrem (19).  

Warren (1 file): descendants of Archibald Warren (b. 1825). 

Warriner (1 file): Early American Bio.  

Washer (1 file): Solomon – notes. 

*Washington (6 files) – File 1: biography of Mary Ball Washington, information on Lawrence Washinton, 
Genealogical information starting after the Norman invasion. File 2: John Washington bio, notes and 
correspondence, Barbados records, public records from London. File 3: R. – Will of Richard Washington, 
1724. File 4: proving John Washington of Barbados is John Washington of Surrey. File 5: Con’t File 4. File 
6: letter from Newberry Library, Chicago; descendants of John Washington, Surry CO. VA.  

Watson (7 files) – File 1: lineage of Edward Fentress. File 2: bio of Oliver Watson, EARLY American Bio. 
File 3: Ira - family unit sheets. File 4: newspaper article on Mae Watson in the Courier-Journal Dec. 20, 



2000, tiny doll maker. File 5: George – The Commercial Appeal, Memphis – Feb. 25, 1979, article on man 
murdered for cheering Jefferson Davis, killed by George Watson. File 6: Jim – retires from Madison 
County Club as bartender, Nov. 12, 1979. File 7: Early American Bio.  

*Watts (2 files) – File 1: John – marriage record for John Watts and Rutha Cox, 1824. File 2: letter from 
Mrs. Lois Mynne Drueke with notes.  

Waughtel (1 file): Unusual Case of Longevity, 1910, mentiones Nancy Waughtel (d. 4 Sep 1910) and 
family.  

Way (1 file): marriage record for Ira Way and Hannah Young, 1837.  

Wayne (4 files) – File 1: Early American Bio. File 2: Anthony – two original booklets, Anthony Wayne 
Expedition into the Northwast by Theodore Rooselvelt and Wayne’s Peace with the Indiana of the Old 
Northwest, 1795 by Dwight L. Smith. File 3: book excerpt, The Western Campaign of Anthony Wayne by 
Murray L. Holliday. File 4: three original booklets: Anthony Wayne by General John Watts de Peyster, 
1955; Anthony Wayne 1745-1796, 1954; General Anthony Wayne’s Expedition into the Indiana Country, 
1953. Indiana History Builletin for March 1970 Vol 47 Number 3.  

Weatherford (1 file): CD with John Wilbur Heazlitt’s birth certificate from New Albany, IN; John 
Weatherford Family Info.  

Weaver (1 file): original photo of William and Caroline Slack Weaver (buried in Illinois), reproduction 
photos, census records for William Weaver. 

Webb (3 files) – File 1: marriage record for Henry Webb and Bridgett Cummiskey, 1837. File 2: 
correspondence and notes. File 3: Thomas V. – Military records.  

Weber (4 files) - File 1: Battus – death certificate, military discharge records. File 2: images of Weber’s 
Union Brewery in Madison at Main and Vine, information on Peter Weber (Brewer), Webers in 
Springdale Cemetery; death notice and obit for Peter Weber, 1891; death notice for Christina Weber, 
1909; death notice for Charles Weber, brother of Peter, 1892; Madison Daily Courier Evening April 29, 
1891 mentions Charles Weber and Hebrew excursion. File 3: Harold – 13 years of weather records Jan. 
13, 1979; 14-year average temperature chart Jan. 26, 1980. File 4: Peter – family unit sheet, find a grave 
profile and death certificate for William Weber.  

Webster (4 files) – File 1: bio on Joseph P. Webster, early American bio. File 2: Claude Daniel – 
correspondence. File 3: Delia – articles related to the Underground Railroad agent. File 4: Delia – articles 
and book excerpts.  

Weeden (1 file): Early American Bio 

Wehner (2 files) – File 1: death certificate for George Wehner, descendants of George Wehner, 
information on St. Mary’s Church, Jefferson County marriages, land information, directory page. File 2: 
Five generations 11-14-1977. 



Wehrle (1 file): George – obituary, 1922. 

Weir (2 files) – File 1: descendnats of Walter Weir. File 2: marriage record for David Weir and Mary 
Pattison, 1846.  

Welch (1 file): family reunion articles: 9-13-1982, 8-18-1983, 8-18-1984; family bible records for the 
family of Samuel and Jane Cunningham Welsch; Rev. War veteran (Samuel);  

Wells (5 files) – File 1: correspondence, obituary for William Wells (1897), death notice for wife of Capt. 
Wm. H. Wells (1879), census records, militia enrollment Jeff. Co., will records, obituary for Benjamin F. 
Wells (1923), cemetery records, Aug. 24, 1932 response in the paper. File 2: John Louis – searching for a 
taxi birth, yearbook page, correspondence, birth certificates, death certificates, marriage record. File 3: 
Henry – Jeff Co. marriages, directory page, census records, death notice for Mrs. R. A. McIntire, 1881; 
obituary for Rachel McIntyre, 1881. File 4: William – Feb. 13, 1943 Governor, Congressman Open Bond 
Sale Drive; list of medals given to Paul Nelson Wells and bio. File 5: William – original booklet Death of 
Captain Wells, 1954. 

*Welsh (1 file): descendants beginning with John Welsh (b. 1520). 

Welschbillig (1 file): Trying to track down Nicholas and Frances Welchbillig who came to the US in 1857 
and settled in Jeff. Co. Family information, obituary for son, John. Census records. 

Wenninder (1 file): Mary – registration affidavit of alien female.  

Wenzler (1 file): cemetery records, marriage record for Kanin Wensler and Catherine Gould, 1859, 
obituary for William Wenzler (1929), descendancy chart beginning with Jacob Wenzler.  

Wesbecker (1 file): family unit of John and Mary Wesbecker.  

West (1 file): will abstract, early Jeff. Co. marriages, cemetery records.  

Westington (1 file): services held for Dr. Mars Westington (1954), obit for Mars Westington (1954), 
Funeral for Mrs. Daisy Westington (1956), Obituary for Daisy Westington Dec. 1956), death notice for T. 
P. Westington (1941).  

Wheatley (1 file): Joseph – pension for Rev. War. 

Wetzel (1 file): William – former druggist, obituary 1970; bio in the paper 11-19-1970; honored by 
masonic orders 10-10-1957; original program from honors.  

Wharton (1 file): W. G. Wharton land info in the paper Jan. 30, 1851 Daily Courier; Our Friend Wharton 
mention in the same paper; Feb. 3, 1851 Daily Courier W. G. Wharton Special Notices; biography of 
William G. Whatron, death notice for William G. Wharton Sr. July 19, 1861; Ad for Planet restaurant and 
saloon Wm. Mosser. 

Whedon (1 file): Americus – no date clipping of honor given to Capt. Americus Whedon (maybe 8-17-
1915); 4-30-1910 Mrs. W. F. Whedon mentioned in paper; Madison Courier 11-19-1921 Obituary.  



Whitaker (1 file): John – 14-page biography.  

Whipple (1 file): bio of John H., bio for Sylvester, death notice for Elizabeth Whipple (wife of Henry). 

*White (9 files) – File 1: Etta Crozier – family bible records, family bio, affiliate families: Bitterman, 
Crozier, Cordery, Suggett, Johnson, Cave. File 2: John C. – Civil War Veteran obituary 1933.File 3: David – 
death announcement in the paper, 1874; biography. File 4: census info for Wiley White. File 5: James – 
excerpt from Memoirs of the Lower Ohio Valley; obituary for Alex White, 1884; obituary for James B. 
White (1885); obit and bio of Miss Lide White (March 5, 1967). File 6: marriages from Jeff. Co., Early Tax 
lists of Jeff. Co., obituary for Ira Scarff, 1953; obituary for Joseph Richard Scarff (1970). File 7: obit for 
Kate White, 1930; obit for James White (1844); reproduction photos; obituary for Miss Katherine 
Hopkins White (1930); obituary for James White (1932); Obit for James White (1883). File 8: White – 
Ryker – looking for documentation of William White and Rachel Ryker marriage. File 9: Richard White 
family information, census records, marriage records, early newspaper items, directory pages. 
Newspaper ad for White Boat and Canoe Co.; Jan. 6, 1889 obit for Richard White; Jan. 3, 1899 obit for 
Mrs. Elizabeth M. White; Jan. 25, 1889 Richard White – Daily Herald; Madison Daily Herald Aug. 30, 1926 
obit for Sarah Connett; Daily Herald Jan. 26, 1915 A. M. Connett; obit for Susan Wooden Dec. 7, 1889 
Daily Courier; Aug. 28, 1917 obit for Mary Wooden – Daily Herald; obit for Theodore Scarff Dec. 9, 1910; 
obit for Mrs. Anna Carr Jan. 7, 1897; Charles Connett 1942; John White, civil war vet obit (1933). 

Whiteis (1 file): correspondence and notes. 

Whiteside (1 file): marriage record for Newton Whiteside and Priscilla Denica, 1827. 

Whitney (2 files) – File 1: Gordon – obituary, 2005. File 2: Sophronia – wife of Benjamin Franklin Baker, 
newspaper article, no date.  

Whitsitt (3 files) – File 1: marriage record for Allen H. Whitsitt and Maryjane Harrod, 1847. File 2: 
marriage record for Joseph Whitsitt and Elvira Foster, 1834. File 3: marriage record for S. Whitsitt and 
Elizabeth Wells, 1838; census records; marriage record for Wesley Whitsitt and Leuraney Wells, 1832. 

Wickersham (1 file): Bernadette – article clipping humor, How to avoid being a bridesmaid, June 2005. 

Wickliffe (1 file): information on the Webster-Preston Conspiracy, Robert Wickliffe, pro-slavery attorney 
in KY. 

Widerin (1 file): George and Christian military records.  

Wier (1 file): marriage record for Walter Wier and Lizzie E. Elliott, 1858.  

Wilber (1 file): Shadrack – obituary, 1882; will in the Evening Courier Nov. 13, 1882; biography.  

*Wildman (1 file): family bible records, Smitha-Taylor-Robins-Wildman family chart in the newspaper 
Sept. 28, 1937. 



Wiley (17 files) – File 1: Joseph Wiley family and descendants. File 2: land and tax records, family unit 
sheets. File 3: family unit sheets, notes and correspondence. File 4: Harvey – original booklet – Address 
by the Honorary President; Nov. 16, 1908 Dr. Wiley article in the Madison Courier “enemy of white 
flour” millers unhappy; Wiley historical marker “father of the FDA.” File 5: image of Dr. Wiley and 
brother, Ulrich; Little Mother of Mine by Dr. Wiley; original letter from Wiley (Good Housekeeping). File 
6: newspaper article about Wiley’s wife, Anna, jailed for women’s voting rights protest Nov. 16, 1917. 
File 7: Harvey W. – obituary. File 8: Harvey – bulletin of Hanover College Aug, 1956; newspaper article 
Apr. 28, 1935. File 9: Madison Courier March 5, 1941 biography. File 10: newspaper article on stamp 
issue, 7-20-1956. File 11: American Heritage Feb/Mar 1996 excerpt. File 12: 3-5-1941 Madison Courier 
article Aided Pure Food Cause; excerpt from Maxwell History and Genealogy. File 13: July 30, 1930 Life 
of Dr. Harvey W. Wiley, other articles (copies). File 14: Father of the Pure Food and Drugs Act from Good 
Housekeeping; Forgotten Hoosiers excerpt. File 15: COPY bulletin of Hanover College Aug, 1956. File 16: 
Maxwell-Wiley family information. 

Wilhite (1 file): marriage record for W.H. Wilhite and Louisa COffman,1825.  

Wise (1 file): photos from 1993 newspapers.  

Wilkerson (1 file): article Father and Son team 11-11-1976. 

Wilkins (1 file): descendants of John and Sarah Webb Wilkins. 

Willhoite (1 file): John – (1745-1837) His descendants in Kentucky and Elsewhere. 

*Williams (10 files) – File 1: bible records. File 2: descendants of William and Mary Williams. File 3: 
descendants and family of Diantha Jackson and John W. Williams, Joseph Williams Grantor deed 
records. File 4: correspondence. File 5: Jane – honor to Jane Williams Madison Courier 9-25-1973. File 6: 
C. Gilmore – funeral notice. File 7: Carole – miniatures, newspaper article 12-7-1978. File 8: 
Remembrance – correspondence, notes, Robert Williams family, biography, Rev. War vet. File 9: copies 
of letters, information on David and Ann Williams; copy of letter. File 10: marriage record for Hannah 
Ramsey and ? McWilliams, 182?. File 11:  

Willliamson (2 files) – File 1: marriage record for William Williamson and Pamelia Jane Black, 1937. File 
2: Daily Courier April 13, 1856. 

Willick (2 files) – File 1: St. Josephs cemetery record, census records, directory pages, obituary for 
Barbara Willich (1910), Obituary for Andrew Willick (1912). File 2: descendancy chart beginning with 
Andrew WIllick; Dec. 21, 1861 war happenings in the paper mentions Col. Willich. 

*Wilson (15 files) – File 1: marriage record for George B. Wilson and Lindaretta Stewart, 1834. File 2: 
marriage record for John Wilson and Angeline Robinson, 1834. File 3: Orwood - Wilson Retires at Pearl 
1-7-1970 Madison Courier article – Pearl Packing Company. File 4: Nathaniel – Marriage record for 
Nathaniel Wilson and Susannah Woodill, 1826. File 5: Isaac – obituary, Jan. 4, 1909. File 6: marriage 
record for William W. Wilson and Mary Ann Hardsough, 1834. File 7: C. R. – 10-23-1982; Doc Willson 
used the Courier as teaching aid Oct. 13, 1984; Doc had great birthday March 12, 1983; Feb. 12, 1966 



Here’s Man Who Switched, Teaching to Selling Shoes. File 8: marriage record for Catherine Crane and 
John Wilson, no date. File 9: original Wilson’s Cave Park pamphlet, Madison Courier June 19m 1922 
Rustic retreat article. File 10: William H. – 1869 Mary Graves living with William H. Taylor. File 11: Carl B. 
– information on Ruby E. Brown Wilson Mellon. File 12: census records, marriage record for John 
Salisbury and Susie Wilson, 1895; obit for Ebenezer Wilson, 1916; family unit sheets. File 13: Jefferson 
County records list, death notice for James Wilson (1873), Obit for Sarah Wilson (1898), Madison 
Directory pages. File 14: 1937 obit for Sarah Wilson, 1951 obit for Oliver Wilson, 1918 obit for Casper 
Wilson. File 14: Arbuckle – correspondence. File 15: family of Charles T. Wilson and Nancy Wilson, letter 
with notes from James Naugent to Susie Cardinal.  

Winchester (1 file) – Philander – excerpt from the Lakewood Story, Excerpt from History of the Western 
Reserve, excerpt from Cuyahoga County and the City of Cleveland, obituary for Philander Winchester 
Madison Weekly Courier May 21, 1879, Detroit directory page, index of deeds, biography, information 
on family with Eliza Gilman Calkins, excerpt from Narratives of the Sufferings of Lewis and Milton Clarke, 
Sons of a soldier of the Revolution, During a Captivity of More than Twenty Years among the 
Slaveholders of Kentucky, One of the So Called Christian States of North America, 1846 . 

Windle (9 files) – File 1: John T. – articles: Madison Courier June 13, 1981. File 2: Madison Courier 6-15-
1981 (A Night of Praise and Thanks Ann, John Windle given tributes during HMI testimonial dinner. File 
3: obituary for John T. Windle (1987), article from the Indianapolis Star Dec. 22, 1998 about Ann Windle; 
Article John Windle Is Winner of Community Service Award, 1-19-1965. File 4: John T. – clippings: HMI to 
receive portrait (Oct. 14, 1975); Windle renamed to Trust advisory board (10-20-1976); Windle to 
receive honor (Madison Courier 5-15-1976). File 5: Louisville Courier Journal article 6-13-1981 Windle to 
80 today. File 6: Excerpt from Indiana Lives: Hawkins and McClarren bio of John T. Windle; Nov. 13, 1982 
article Windle to receive first annual award of Historical Society; 5-29-1984 Madison, Windle subjects. 
File 7: 6-14-1978 John Windle is named to Indiana Academy; 11-27-1979 Windle pewter collection is on 
display at Hanover College. File 8: various newspaper images of Shrewsberry House. File 9: John and Ann 
– 11-18-1970 Madison Courier Welcom Wagon Club Names Windles ‘Couple of Decade’; 11-9-1972 
Windle honored by AASLH; 4-28-1971 At HMI Dinner; 9-18-1972 Windle Named VP of ‘Landmarks’; 5-24-
1973 National Trust names John Windle as advisor.  

Wingham (3 files) – File 1: copy of family bible records; repro. Photos; obit. For Henry Wingham (1946); 
Funeral rites for Effie Wingham (1966); family unit sheets. File 2: image in the paper of the family of Ira 
and Abbie Smith Wingham, 1950 (in the paper on Nov. 7, 1985); clipping Wingham family reunion 1986. 
File 3: no date article on Canip Creek area of Trimble Co, KY; Family trees for the Wingham Famillies; 
correspondence and notes; obit for Alvin Boldery (1954); obituary for Paul Wykoff (1972); obit for Keith 
Wingham (1996);obit for William Kudwig (1974); obit. For Goldine Ludwig (1985); obit for James P. 
Wingham (1933); Funeral of Margaret Wingham (1923); Funeral for Mrs. Avery Wingham (1923); obit. 
For Jasper Mikesell (1972); obit. For Nancy Mikesell (1965).  

Wingate (1 file): B. – copy of correspondence, 1861.  



Winge (1 file): 1942 funeral for Augusta Winge; obit. For George Winge (1954); obituary for William 
Winge (1928); obit. For Charlotte Winge (1925); death of Catherine Gagan (1944). 

Winkel (1 file): John Winkle family and documents, marriage records, cert. of death for Mary Winkel, 
Joseph Winkel family and documents, reproduction image of Winkel house.  

Winkle (1 file): Mathias – searching for the obit of Mathias Winkel, 1882; Find a Grave page; other 
Winkel death notices.  

Winters (1 file): family unit sheets. 

Winterstein (1 file): John Coykendall married Anna Winterstein, family information.  

Wise (3 files) – File 1: David E. – notes on Lucinda Wise Hughes Laurence and David E Wise. Census 
records, family unit sheets. File 2: correspondence and notes. File 3: Madison Courier Nov. 8, 1873 
Thomas Wise biography; obit for Pearl Wise (1904); excerpt from the Vawter Family in America entry for 
Julia Wise (m. Matthew Wise); family unit sheets; A Speculation on the WISE Family William Wise and 
Elizabeth Ross family. 

*Withers (1 file): Quinn-Withers family information, family notes.  

*Witherspoons (1 file): family lineage/descendants beginning with Thomas Witherspoon and wife, 
Jennet (he died in 1860 in Scotland), includes Ralston family connection.  

*Wilkins 

Wolf (2 files) – File 1: correspondence and notes, obit for Lillie Abigail Lyon (1954), reproduction images, 
obit. For Clara Stanton, Obit for Glenn Lyon, descendants of Willibrord Leinenweber (b. 1695), family 
history of Casper and Elizabeth Wolf. File 2: Sophie Steurer – Time magazine Dec. 15, 1980 spotlight on 
Sophie Wolf at Ellis Island; newspaper family Tree article Madison Courier Aug 1986 
Wolff/Wolfe/Linenweber/Rose/Burk family.  

Wolfanger (1 file): Lehman Family connection, Madison directory pages, cemetery records Jeff. Co., 
census records, death notice for Catherine Wolfanger (1887). 

*Wood (5 files) – File 1: census records. File 2: Family bible records, Levi B. Wood family. File 3: Five 
generations in the paper 11-27-1985; Reunion image in the paper 8-26-1970. File 4: marriage record for 
Eurodastas B. Wood and Eliza A. H. Cunliffe, 1845. File 5:Five generations, no date; obituary for Stella 
Wood, 1986. 

*Woodburn (2 files) – Eleanor Woodburn married Charles Louis Shrewsbury Nov. 13, 1839, information 
on Shrewsbury, info on Isaac Woodburn (b. 1767); Bio of John Woodburn, son of Isaac Woodburn and 
Eleanor Bowles Woodburn. File 2: marriage record for Culver Woodburn and Rhoda Hubbard, 1832. 

Wooden (1 file): Blankenship/Marshall/Hendricks family connections, correspondence and notes, 
census records, family unit sheets, obituary for Elizabeth Blankenship (1888).  



Woodfill (30 files) – Most are for Samuel Woodfill -  File 1: early newspaper items list, Jefferson county 
records for cemetery and marriages, census information, correspondence and notes, newspaper article 
Madison Courier Oct. 10, 1972 Wedding at the Salvation Army. File 2: marriage record for Gabriel 
Woodfill and Elenor Pulliam, 1824. File 3: marriage record for Daniel Woodfill and Julia Ann French, 
1823. File 4: marriage record for William Woodfill and Hannah Stiver, 1824. File 5: correspondence and 
notes. File 6: Samuel F. – Dec. 23, 1923 article Sergt. Woodfill flees to Fort Thomas; original 1938 letter 
from California to Capt. Samuel Woodfill; newspaper article Nov. 17, 1970 Medal Of Honor Display 
Exhibited at Courthouse. File 7: Oct. 12, 1967 Major Woodfill Earned Medal of Honor 49 Years Ago. File 
8: excerpt from My Experiences in the World War Vol. 2, Pershing, John J., 1933; article 7-3-1942 Hossier 
World War Hero Welcomed Back to Service as Major at 59 (Indianapolis Star); 8-29-1951 War Hero Gets 
Aid to Pay off Debt On Home (Madison Courier. File 9: excerpt, The Outstanding Soldier of the A.E.F. by 
Martin Blumenson American History Illustrated Vol. 1 No 10 Feb 1967 P.4-54; Newspaper clipping More 
about Woodfills Madison Courier Nov. 11, 1972; information on a mural of Samuel Woodfill fighting in 
Cunel, France. File 10: clippings: 7-12-1921 Sergeant Samuel Woodfill Jefferson County’s Distinguished 
World War Soldier; 11-7-1921 Samuel Woodfill How He Did It; Herald Nov. 5, 1921 Pres. Harding and the 
Home Greet, Sergeant Woodfill, the hero of the war. File 11: 7-20-1955 Article Interest Grows in 
Woodfill Fund as $586 Reached; Aug. 3, 1955 Woodfill Fund soars to $718.40 At Final Count; Woodfill 
Body will Be Taken to Arlington 8-13-1955; Woodfill Plan of Interest to Entire Nation 8-19-1955. File 12: 
Earl Wilson Pays Tribute to Samuel Woodfill 8-15-1955; Woodfill Stone to be Located at the Courthouse 
10-3-1955; 9-29-55 Monument arrives; 9-30-1955 Inscription selected. 7-5-1955 Grave Marker for 
Woodfill. File 13: Woodfill Body in Washington for Reburial Oct. 15, 1955; Oct. 18, 1955 Madison Courier 
Last tribute; Chicago Tribune Oct. 28, 1955 about Samuel Woodfill’s visit to Chicago. File 14: Woodfill to 
be buried in Jefferson County in Aug. 1951. File 15: Group Named to Help Select Woodfill Stone 7-22-
1955; Plans Underway to dedicate Woodfill Stone 11-1-1955; Earl Wilson Pays Tribute to Major Samuel 
Woodfill 8-15-1955; Proper Honor For Great Hero 8-13-1955Woodfill will be taken to Arlington 8-13-
1955. File 16: Oct. 17, 1955 Fly to Arlington and Woodfill Laid to Rest. File 16: 11-11-1985 Maj. Woodfill 
Remembered. File 17: Samuel Woodfill stabs Allen Custer and is sent to the reformatory – 1910 census 
for James Woodfill in Alaska; 1900 census for Samuel Woodfill. File 18: original photos, modeling for 
mural. File 19: March 7, 1898 Allen Custer cut by Sam Woodfill; descendants of John Samuel Woodfill; 
What Really Happened to WWII Hero Samuel Woodfill. File 20: 8-16-1917 Letter from Samuel Woodfill; 
Two letter from France, no date; May 9, 1919 Video at the Little Grand Theatre; Hand to Hand combat 
June 29, 1919 Madison Courier; 7-29-1929 War hero Works at Mill. File 21: excerpt from History of 
Taylor County, Iowa by Frank E. Crosson, 1910 bio on Daniel Mitchell Woodfill. File 22: Correspondence 
and article clippings. File 23: clippings of stone memorial and reburial. File 24: newspaper clippings 
about reburial. File 25: articles on stone fund. File 26: July 1, 1955 Woodfill Grave Still Unmarked in 
Cemetery. File 27: clippings. File 28: 2 colorful new flags grace Woodfill marker 6-30-1962. File 29: 
Reburial clippings. File 29: article clippings. File 30: Marker fund clippings.  

Woods (2 file) – File 1: information on Roy Woodsm census info, marriage record for Shirley and Rosa 
Jones Woods, 1909. File 2: lineage of Albert Simpson.  

Woodward (1 file): census records, jeff co records, directory pages.  



*Woolen (4 files) – File 1: correspondence. File 2: correspondence. File 3: Levin J. – original notes for 
biography. File 4: full bio.  

*Woolford (2 files) -File 1: Bessie – original book, and newspaper clippings. File 2: family bible records.  

Wray (1 file): James – 1906 article on engineer’s death.  

Wright (1 file):  C. H. – biography, obituary, 1889; Wright family reunion 9-8-1985; death notice of 
Geogiana Wright, 1873.  

Worthington (1 file): note.  

Wunderlich (2 files) – File 1: Barbara – registration affidavit of alien female. File 2: Adolph – registration 
affidavit of alien enemy.  

Wurtz (1 file): Sally – article about framer, no date.  

Wykoff (2 files) – File 1: information on Harry Wykoff, information on Nancy Wykoff, Benham Family 
connection. File 2: correspondence and notes.  

Wyman (1 file): Tom – MHS student talks about Pease Corps, no date; Loreans making big progress 12-
29-1972.  

Wymond (1 file): descendants of Charles and Mary Louise Roberts Wymond. 

Wyne (1 file): family unit sheets, descendants of unkown Wyne. Clipping 9-12-1953. 

 

X 

 

Y 

Yater (3 files) – File 1: George – A Flood of Memories: AN eyewitness account of the 1937 flood by 
George Yater: Yeater Cousins newsletter. File 2: George David – Shirley Pell yater Truros citizen of the 
year; list of paintings by George Yater. File 3: bio on George David Yater, 1-26-1971 Madison Courier 
spread; Cape Cod Life 1986-87 Issue No. 6 Winter Tree’s Place A Oreleans Gallery; The Intense world of 
artis Yater by Cindy Nickerson; Weathering Change George Yater’s Constant VisionLincoln-Mercury 
Times Nov-Dec 1953 Between the Cliffs and the River; obituary, 1993. 

Yates (2 files) – File 1: William – probate records and census records. File 2: William – copy of will.  

Yost (1 file): Pennsylvania records, family unit sheets, Charles Yost bio from California; John N. and Isaac 
Yost go to California in 1873; Shook Family connection; census records. 



*Young (3 files) – family bible records. File 2: marriage record for Amos Young and Sarah Millan, 1854. 
File 3: census records, Jeffersonville land entries, probate record.  

Yunker (4 files) – File 1: German maps and family unit sheets, obituary for Mary Kalb (1935), Funeral of 
S.C. Yunker (1938), article Prized doll collection needs a home Sept. 6, 1976, obituary for Georgine 
Wilson (1976), Article Library board turns down Wilson doll collection (Aug. 4, 1976), article Historical 
society to feature Wilson doll collection in exhibit (no date). File 2: The Gustav “Gus” Yunker family; will 
of Fidel Yunker, The Fidel (Junker) Yunker Family. File 3: notes and Ponderings, article on the Pearl 
Packing Co. (which the offices were in the Yunker House), article Society is given gift (Yunker family 
donation) no date, Anthony and Ursula Rudolf Yunker descendants in the US. File 4: Ancestors of Josef 
Junker, obituary for Emma Lothspeich (1943), obituary for August Yunker (President of Pearl Packing 
Co.), obituary for Kathryn Yunker (1943), obituary for Leo J. Yunker (1969), descendancy chart for 
Sylvester Yunker, deed for John Yunker, obituary for Sylvester Yunker (1898), obituary for Mrs. Neil 
Bungham Yunker (1959), family unit sheets, will of Hieronimus Stickler, Mary Kalb and John Yunker real 
estate record, obituary for Magdalena Yunker (1915), obituary for Robert August Yunker (1952),  

 
Z 

Zapp (1 file): correspondence with notes, reproduction photos, family chart, Bertha Zapp diploma.  

Zeck (1 file): family unit sheets. 

*Zenor (1 file): David – family bible records. 

Zepf (2 files) – File 1: Jacob – registration affidavit for alien enemy\. File 2: Mary – registration affidavit 
for alien female. 

Zimmerer (2 files) – Laura – Registration affidavit for alien female. File 2: John – registration affidavit for 
alien enemy.  

Zizaks (1 file): 7-23-1985 Transplant heritage here article.  

Zucks (1 file): John A Zuck bio, and article chosen cashier of branch bank 8-22-1900 

 

  

 

 


